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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for

FOR: Chlorination Equipment Parts

TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2011)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., December 22, 2010
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

 10 ea. UNIT *

Capital Controls Ecometrics, Series 480 Gas Chlorinator.  100 ppd Cylinder PRICE 3,275.00

1. Mount, Automatic Switchover, Model 481C5 TOTAL 32,750.00 No Bid

6 ea. UNIT

Capital Controls Advance Series 200 Gas Chlorinator 500 ppd, PRICE 6,870.00

2. Ton Container Mount, Righ-hand oriented, automatic switchover Model 203 TOTAL 41,220.00 No Bid

3 ea. UNIT

Capital Controls Advance Series 480, 3" Remote Meter Panel, 100 ppd PRICE 365.00

3. Part #RM02C7 TOTAL 1,095.00 No Bid

3 ea. UNIT

Capital Controls Advance Series 200, 6" Remot Meter Panel, 500 ppd PRICE 766.00

4. Part #RM008C TOTAL 2,298.00 No Bid

1 ea. UNIT

Capital Controls Ecometrics, Series 480, Chlorine Vacuum Regulator, 100 ppd PRICE  

5. With Rate Valve TOTAL 1,203.00 No Bid

4 ea. UNIT

Capital Controls Ecometrics, Series 480, Chlorine Vacuum Regulator, 100 ppd PRICE 911.00

6. Plugged TOTAL 3,644.00 No Bid

1 ea. UNIT

Capital Controls Advance Series 200, Chlorine Vacuum Regulator, Ton PRICE

7. Mounted, 500 ppd with Rate Valve TOTAL 2,527.00 No Bid

4 ea. UNIT

Capital Controls Advanced Series 200, Chlorine Vacuum Regulator, PRICE 2,056.00

8. Ton Mounted, 500 ppd Plugged TOTAL 8,224.00 No Bid

1 ea. UNIT

Capital Controls Automatic Switchover Module, Chlorine, 500 ppd Max PRICE

9. Part #AS-500C TOTAL 517.00 No Bid

18 ea. UNIT

Capital Controls O-Ring Ejector, 100 ppd 20-140 psi max back pressure PRICE 540.00

10. Part #EJ-100C TOTAL 9,720.00 No Bid

9 ea. UNIT

Capital Controls O-Ring Ejector, 500 ppd 20-140 psi max back pressure PRICE 754.00

11. Part #EJ-500C TOTAL 6,786.00 No Bid

 UNIT

18 ea. PRICE 294.00

12. 0-200 psi gauge, 2 inch dial with protective diaphragm Part #A-201-1 TOTAL 5,292.00 No Bid
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UNIT

8 ea. PRICE 6,875.00  

13. Capital Controls Robo-Control Model 2000 TOTAL 55,000.00 No Bid

 UNIT

8 ea. PRICE 5,886.00

14. Capital Controls Model NXT 3000 Vacuum Regulator, 500 ppd kit TOTAL 47,088.00 No Bid

UNIT

8 ea. PRICE N/A  

15. Safe Control Module (complete control module) Part #13897 TOTAL  No Bid

UNIT *

8 ea. PRICE 6,875.00 5,500.00

16. Robo-Control Model 2000-C, 1-Ton Automatic Control for cylinder valves TOTAL 55,000.00 44,000.00

8 ea. UNIT

Chlorine Sensor, 100 ppm, Part #LD001 for Robo-Control Model 2000-C & PRICE 615.00 492.00

17. 2000-U TOTAL 4,920.00 3,936.00

8 ea. UNIT

Sulfur dioxide sensor, 100 ppm, Part #LD003 for Robo-Control Model 2000-C PRICE 615.00 492.00

18. & 2000-U TOTAL 4,920.00 3,936.00

UNIT

4 ea. PRICE 335.00 268.00

19. Battery Pack 18/10 volt, 4500 mAH, NimH, Part# BA018 TOTAL 1,340.00 1,072.00

UNIT

8 ea. PRICE 12.50 10.00

20. Fuse (package of 5) Part #FS001 TOTAL 100.00 80.00

 UNIT

8 ea. PRICE 6,875.00 5,500.00

21. Robo-Control Model 2000-U, 1 ton automatic control for cylinder valves TOTAL 55,000.00 44,000.00

 4 ea. UNIT  

SLA Battery pack 12-5  (5 Amp) PRICE 60.00 48.00

22. Part # BAO 12-7 TOTAL 240.00 192.00

4 ea. UNIT

SLA Battery pack 12  (7 Amp) PRICE 60.00 48.00

23. Part #BAO 12-7 TOTAL 240.00 192.00
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5 ea. UNIT *

100 foot feel, schedule 80, NSF approved, clear polyethylene flexible PRICE 85.00  

24. tubing 3/8 inch TOTAL 425.00 No Bid

5 ea. UNIT

100 foot feel, schedule 80, NSF approved, clear polyethylene flexible PRICE 137.00  

25. tubing 1/2 inch TOTAL 685.00 No Bid

5 ea. UNIT

100 foot feel, schedule 80, NSF approved, clear polyethylene flexible PRICE 195.00  

26. tubing 5/8 inch TOTAL 975.00 No Bid

 UNIT

50 ea. PRICE 3.35  

27. 3/8 inch thread to hose connectors TOTAL 167.50 No Bid

 UNIT

50 ea. PRICE 4.10  

28. 1/2 inch thread to hose connectors TOTAL 205.00 No Bid

 UNIT

50 ea. PRICE 6.25  

29. 5/8 inch thread to hose connectors TOTAL 312.50 No Bid

UNIT

60 ea. PRICE 298.00  

30. Filter, Specialty for CL2, Part #R1398 TOTAL 17,880.00 No Bid

 UNIT

2 ea. PRICE 4,255.00  

31. Capital Controls Regulator, Vacuum Chlorine 8000PPD, Part #VR8000C1 TOTAL 8,510.00 No Bid

UNIT

2 ea. PRICE 4,983.00  

32. Capital Controls Regulator, Vacuum Sulfur Dioxide 8000PPD, Part #VR8000S1 TOTAL 9,966.00 No Bid

TOTAL AMOUNT ITEMS 1-32 TOTAL 378,250.00 97,408.00

AWARD AMOUNT 256,490.00 97,408.00
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LS  

Chlorination equipment major components replacement allowance (vacuum  *

regulators, gas flowmeters and chlorine supply indicators, ejector and UNIT

diffusers the estimated usage per year is $10,000 PRICE

33. Parts and Material cost plus TOTAL 20% N/A

  See

PRICE  

Price List Catalog Number LIST 005.8001-34 N/A

PRICE  

List  

Discount Off Price List (%) % 5% N/A

   

  

Multiplier for Discount DISCOUNT .95 N/A

   

 EFF.  

Effective Date of Price List DATE Nov. 2010

EXTENSION 1 256,490.00 97,408.00

EXTENSION 2 256,490.00 97,408.00

EXTENSION 3 256,490.00 97,408.00

Net 2%

Terms 30 days 10 days

 

Delivery Days

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

CL2 Equipment Co. Demandstar

Enviro-Pump of SA SAWS Website
Global Treat, Inc.

 Macaulay Controls Co.

Robo-Control  
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