
09-2070
 

F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAAnnual Contract for
FOR: General Digging Tools & Ladders
TIME & (Date of Award through September 30, 2010)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., September 9, 2009  
ITEM NO DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

GROUP 1   SHOVELS
500 ea. UNIT     
Shovel, round point, blade type forged, closed back or solid shank, design forward PRICE 19.70 24.00 23.89 No Bid
turned step, blade size 8 3/4" x 11 1/2" TOTAL 9,850.00 12,000.00 11,945.00  
Manufacturer MFG. Ames Ames Ames  

1. Part Number PART # 1303900 1303900 1303900
200 ea. UNIT     
Shovel, square point, blade type extra thick 14 gauge blade, closed back blade PRICE 19.90 24.50 24.19  
or solid shank design forward turned step, weight 4.7 pounds, blade size 9 3/4" x 11-1/2" TOTAL 3,980.00 4,900.00 4,838.00 No Bid
Manufacturer MFG. Ames Ames Ames  

2. Part Number PART # 1303500 1303500 1303500
200 ea. UNIT     
Shovel, drain spade, blade type forged, solid back, blade design forward turned step, PRICE 35.85 44.00 43.59  
blade size 5 1/2" x 16" TOTAL 7,170.00 8,800.00 8,718.00 No Bid
Manufacturer MFG. Ames Ames Ames  

3. Part Number PART # 1231100 1231100 1231100  
*  

TOTAL GROUP 1 TOTAL 21,000.00 25,700.00 25,501.00 No Bid
GROUP 2   MISCELLANEOUS DIGGING TOOLS      
60 ea. UNIT
Bar, digging, San Angelo, pencil point, weight 14 lbs. PRICE 19.45 23.00 22.29 No Bid
size 1" hex, length 60", Ames Part #1174800 or Union Tools 30664 TOTAL 1,167.00 1,380.00 1,337.40  
Manufacturer MFG. Union Tools Union Union Tools  

1. Part Number PART # 30664 30664 30664
100 ea. UNIT     
Rake, type Bow Head, size 14" with 14 teeth (3" in length), PRICE 30.50 37.00 36.95  
style one piece forged steelhead, handle wooden, 60" in length TOTAL 3,050.00 3,700.00 3,695.00 No Bid
Manufacturer MFG. Ames Ames Ames  

2. Part Number PART # 1876800 1876800 1876800
40 ea. UNIT     
Bar, Crow, size 26 pounds, wedge point 66" long, 1 1/2" stock PRICE 41.20 48.00 47.41  
Warren Wedge Point #40, Ames Part #1162500 TOTAL 1,648.00 1,920.00 1,896.40 No Bid
Manufacturer MFG. Ames Ames Ames  

3. Part Number PART # 1162500 1162500 1162500
30 ea. UNIT     
Hoe, type Cotton, head size 6 1/2" x 7 x 5", handle size 54" PRICE 13.20 16.40 15.94  
 60" in length, Ames Part #1857400 TOTAL 396.00 492.00 478.20 No Bid
Manufacturer MFG. Ames Ames Ames  

4. Part Number PART # 1857400 1857400 1857400
25 ea. UNIT     
Lute, Asphalt, blade head size 36", material alumimum, PRICE 28.40 35.00 34.48  
heavy duty brace riveted to lute head Ames Part #63036C, Kraft #GG-836 TOTAL 710.00 875.00 862.00 No Bid
Manufacturer MFG. Ames Ames Ames  

5. Part Number PART # 63036C 63036C 63036C
25 ea. UNIT     
Moil Point, size 1 1/4" x 6" x 18", Tamco Part #4014-018, PRICE 24.80 26.00 22.95  
Vulcan Part #1024, Brunner & Lay A41018 TOTAL 620.00 650.00 573.75 No Bid
Manufacturer MFG. Tamco Vulcan Brunner&Lay  

6. Part Number PART # 4014-018 1024 A41018
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P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAAnnual Contract for
FOR: General Digging Tools & Ladders
TIME & (Date of Award through September 30, 2010)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., September 9, 2009  
ITEM NO DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY A

la
m

o 
Ir

on
 W

or
ks

94
3 

A
T&

T 
Ce

nt
er

 P
kw

y
Sa

n 
A

nt
on

io
, T

X
 7

82
19

Su
nb

el
t M

ill
 S

up
pl

y
77

15
 G

ris
so

m
 R

d.
Sa

n 
A

nt
on

io
, T

X
 7

82
51

To
ol

 M
ar

t, 
In

c.
10

56
8 

Se
nt

in
el

Sa
n 

A
nt

on
io

, T
X

 7
82

17

Py
ra

m
id

 S
ch

oo
l P

ro
du

ct
s

65
10

 N
or

th
 5

4t
h 

St
re

et
Ta

m
pa

, F
L 

33
61

0-
19

08

W
hi

te
 C

ap
 S

up
pl

y
10

50
0 

Br
oa

dw
ay

, S
ui

te
 2

00
Sa

n 
A

nt
on

io
, T

X
 7

82
17

25 ea. UNIT     
Cutter, Asphalt, Size 1 1/4" x 6", Tamco Part #4064-012 PRICE 60.40 65.00 54.95  
Vulcan Part #1046 TOTAL 1,510.00 1,625.00 1,373.75 No Bid
Manufacturer MFG. Tamco Vulcan Vulcan  

7. Part Number PART # 4064-012 1046 1046
100 ea. UNIT     
Pick, Type Railroad Head, Mfg. Kulkoni Part #RP7 PRICE 12.35 10.50 13.95  
Item No. 6223 TOTAL 1,235.00 1,050.00 1,395.00 No Bid
Manufacturer MFG. Kulkoni Kulkoni Kulkoni  

8. Part Number PART # RP7 RP7 RP7
150 ea. UNIT     
Handle, Type Pick, 6 eye, size 36", used for #6 railroad PRICE 8.00 7.95 6.50  
pick head, Flame Seal, Part #751-365, Burney-Ivory Handle Co. #220-19 TOTAL 1,200.00 1,192.50 975.00 No Bid
Manufacturer MFG. Seymour Kulkoni Flame Seal  

9. Part Number PART # 220-19 P46 731-365
20 ea. UNIT     
Handle, Sledge Hammer, size 36", capacity of 12 pounds, PRICE 4.80 24.50 5.71  
Burney-Ivory Handle Co., Part #001-09, Ames Part #12, Union Tools 30584 TOTAL 96.00 490.00 114.20 No Bid
Manufacturer MFG. Seymour Union Union Tools  

10. Part Number PART # 001-09 30584 30584
*  

TOTAL GROUP 2 TOTAL 11,632.00 13,374.50 12,700.70 No Bid
GROUP 3 UNIT   *  
 
25 ea. PRICE 100.00 115.00 107.67 115.00
Ladder, Type Step, size 6', material fiberglass, Werner #7308, Louisville #FS1406HD or TOTAL 2,500.00 2,875.00 2,691.75 2,875.00
Manufacturer MFG. Louisville Werner Werner Werner

1. Part Number PART # FS1406HD 7306 7306 2457306
 UNIT     
10 ea. PRICE 137.00 149.00 145.96 164.00
Ladder, Type Step, Size 8', Material Fiberglass, Werner #7308, Louisville #FS1408HD TOTAL 1,370.00 1,490.00 1,459.60 1,640.00
Manufacturer MFG. Louisville Werner Werner Werner

2. Part Number PART # FS1408HD 7308 7308 2457308
25 ea. UNIT     
Ladder, Type Extension, Size 20', Material Aluminum, Werner #D520-2, Louisville # PRICE 229.00 261.00 255.40 242.00
AE1220HD TOTAL 5,725.00 6,525.00 6,385.00 6,050.00
Manufacturer MFG. Louisville Werner Werner Werner

 Part Number PART # AE1220HD D520-2 D520-2 245D520-2
15 ea. UNIT     
15 ea. PRICE 296.00 375.00 367.56 348.00
Ladder, Type Extension, Size 28', Material Aluminum, Werner #D528-2, Louisville #AE1228HD TOTAL 4,440.00 5,625.00 5,513.40 5,220.00
Manufacturer MFG. Louisville Werner Werner Werner

4. Part Number PART # AE1228HD D528-2 D528-2 245D528-2
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 UNIT   
25 ea. PRICE 237.00 155.00 93.61 144.00
Ladder, Type Single, Size 10', Material Aluminum, Werner D510-1 TOTAL 5,925.00 3,875.00 2,340.25 3,600.00
Manufacturer MFG. Werner Werner Werner Werner

5. Part Number PART # 510-1 510-1 D510-1 510-1
 

TOTAL GROUP 3 TOTAL 19,960.00 20,390.00 18,390.00 19,385.00
    

Net Net Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

 

Delivery Days 10 days 1-7 days 10 days  
 

*DENOTES LOW BIDDER  
 

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
 
Alamo Iron Works Demandstar
Baytech Supply SAWS Website
Fastenal Industrial & Construction Supplies
Grainger
HD Supply
Industrial Supply Solutions, Inc.
MSC Industrial Direct Co., Inc.
Nations Rent
Pyramid School Products
Sunbelt Mill Supply
Tool Mart, Inc.
United Tool & Fasteners
White Cap Supply
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