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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSALAnnual Contract for

FOR: General Digging Tools & Ladders

TIME & (October 1, 2010 through September 30, 2011)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., August 5, 2010
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

GROUP 1 - SHOVELS

500 ea. UNIT      

Shovel, round point, blade type forged, closed back PRICE 22.70 23.38 25.00 22.54 29.21 NO BID

blade, design forward turned step, blade size 8 3/4" x 11 1/2" TOTAL 11,350.00 11,690.00 12,500.00 11,270.00 14,605.00

Manufacturer MFG. Ames Ames Ames Ames Ames 

1. Part Number PART # 1303900 1303900 1303900 1303900 1303900

200 ea. UNIT

Shovel, square point, blade type extra thick 14 gauge, blade PRICE 23.00 23.67 25.00 23.22 29.53 NO BID

design forward turned steop, weight 4.7 pounds TOTAL 4,600.00 4,734.00 5,000.00 4,644.00 5,906.00

Manufacturer MFG. Ames Ames Ames Ames Ames 

2. Part Number PART # 1303500 1303500 1303500 1303500 49345

200 ea. UNIT

Shovel, drain spade, blade type forged, solid back, blade PRICE 37.60 38.67 38.00 37.96 52.49 NO BID

design forward turned steop, blade size 5 1/2" x 16" TOTAL 7,520.00 7,734.00 7,600.00 7,592.00 10,498.00

Manufacturer MFG. Ames Ames Ames Ames Union

3. Part Number PART # 123110 123110 123110 123110 47110

*

TOTAL GROUP 1 TOTAL 23,470.00 24,158.00 25,100.00 23,506.00 31,009.00 NO BID

GROUP 2 - MISCELLANEOUS DIGGING TOOLS  

50 ea. UNIT

Bar, digging, San Angelo, pencil point, weight 14 lbs. PRICE 19.44 20.10 18.61 20.30 22.95 NO BID

size 1" hex, length 60", Ames Part #1174800 TOTAL 972.00 1,005.00 930.50 1,015.00 1,147.50

Manufacturer MFG. Truper Union Union Ames Union

1. Part Number PART # 30103 30664 30664 1174800 30664

100 ea. UNIT

Rake, type Bow Head, size 14" with 14 teeth (3" in length), PRICE 26.55 22.15 21.74 23.71 24.55

style one piece forged steelhead, handle wooden, 60" in length TOTAL 2,655.00 2,215.00 2,174.00 2,371.00 2,455.00 NO BID

Manufacturer MFG. Truper Union Union Ames Union

2. Part Number PART # 31391/33126 63141 63141 1876800 63141

40 ea. UNIT

Bar, Crow, size 26 pounds, wedge point 66" long, 1 1/2" stock PRICE 33.47 42.60 34.88 38.11 44.76

Warren Wedge Point #40, Ames Part #1162500 TOTAL 1,338.80 1,704.00 1,395.20 1,524.40 1,790.40 NO BID

Manufacturer MFG. Truper Ames Ames Ames Ames

3. Part Number PART # 30160 1162500 1162500 1162500 1162500

20 ea. UNIT

Hoe, type Cotton, head size 6 1/2" x 7 x 5", handle size 54" PRICE 13.88 16.10 15.71 17.13 17.82

 60" in length, Ames Part #1857400 TOTAL 277.60 322.00 314.20 342.60 356.40 NO BID

Manufacturer MFG. Truper Union Ames Ames Union

4. Part Number PART # 33574 71112 1857400 1857400 71112

25 ea. UNIT

Lute, Asphalt, blade head size 36", material alumimum, PRICE 26.79 34.40 34.45 37.58 42.08

heavy duty brace riveted to lute head Ames Part #63036C TOTAL 669.75 860.00 861.25 939.50 1,052.00 NO BID

Manufacturer MFG. Truper Ames Ames Ames Ames

5. Part Number PART # 33104 63036C 63036C 63036C 63036C

25 ea. UNIT

Moil Point, size 1 1/4" x 6" x 18", Tamco Part #4014-018, PRICE 38.39 28.10 18.95 18.61 22.09

Vulcan Part #1024 TOTAL 959.75 702.50 473.75 465.25 552.25 NO BID

Manufacturer MFG. Tamco Vulcan Tamco Brunner & Lay Tamco

6. Part Number PART # 4014-018H 1024 4014-018 A41018 4014-018
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSALAnnual Contract for

FOR: General Digging Tools & Ladders

TIME & (October 1, 2010 through September 30, 2011)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., August 5, 2010
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY M
S
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25 ea. UNIT

Cutter, Asphalt, Size 1 1/4" x 6", Tamco Part #4064-012 PRICE 63.95 70.10 47.76 47.37 55.75

Vulcan Part #1046 TOTAL 1,598.75 1,752.50 1,194.00 1,184.25 1,393.75 NO BID

Manufacturer MFG. Tamco Vulcan Tamco Vulcan Tamco

7. Part Number PART # 4014-018H 1046 4064-012 1046 4064-012

100 ea. UNIT

Pick, Type Railroad Head, Mfg. Kulkoni Part #RP7 PRICE 11.24 10.47 13.75 9.74 13.61

Item No. 6223 TOTAL 1,124.00 1,047.00 1,375.00 974.00 1,361.00 NO BID

Manufacturer MFG. Tamco Kulkoni Kulkoni Kulkoni Truper

8. Part Number PART # 31735 RP7 RP7 RP7 TR31735

10 ea. UNIT

Hammer, Sledge Size 15" 4 pounds, Hickory Handle, Plumb #11529NN PRICE 8.03 10.63 10.07 8.97 13.95

Stanley #56-804 TOTAL 80.30 106.30 100.70 89.70 139.50 NO BID

Manufacturer MFG. Truper Ames Kulkoni Stanley Plumb

9. Part Number PART # 30915 1196900 N/A 56-804 11529NN

20 ea. UNIT

Hammer, Sledge Size 36", 10 pounds, Hickory Handle, Stanley#56-810, PRICE 19.60 18.60 18.10 19.74 20.56

Union Tools 30582 TOTAL 392.00 372.00 362.00 394.80 411.20 NO BID

Manufacturer MFG. Truper Union Union Tools Union Union

10. Part Number PART # 30919 30582 30587 30582 30582

20 ea. UNIT

Hammer, Sledge Size 36", 16 pounds, Hickory Handle, Stanley #56-816 PRICE 29.39 32.50 31.05 32.84 34.20

Union Tools 30586 TOTAL 587.80 650.00 621.00 656.80 684.00 NO BID

Manufacturer MFG. Truper Union Union Tools Union Union

11. Part Number PART # 30922 30586 30586 30586 30586

150 ea. UNIT

Handle, Type Pick, 6 eye, Size 36", used for #6 railroad pick hand, Flame Seal, PRICE 6.09 7.67 6.33 6.72 10.94

Part #751-365, Burney Ivory Handle Co. #220-19 TOTAL 913.50 1,150.50 949.50 1,008.00 1,641.00 NO BID

Manufacturer MFG. Truper Seymour Kulkoni Burney Ivory Handle Ames

12. Part Number PART # 30809 220-19 N/A 220-19 2036900

20 ea. UNIT

Handle, Sledge Hammer, Size 36", Capacity of 12 pounds, Burney Ivory Handle PRICE 5.48 5.27 20.95 5.90 23.85

Co., Part #001-09, Ames Part #12 Union Tools 30584 TOTAL 109.60 105.40 419.00 118.00 477.00 NO BID

Manufacturer MFG. Truper Seymour Union Tools Burney Ivory Handle Union

13. Part Number PART # 30813 001-09 30584 001-09 30584

*

TOTAL GROUP 2 TOTAL 11,678.85 11,992.20 11,170.10 11,083.30 13,461.00 NO BID

GROUP 3 - LADDERS  

25 ea. UNIT      

Ladder, Type Step, size 6', material fiberglass, Werner #7306, Louisville PRICE 101.00 106.50 110.00 95.40 172.00

#FS1406HD TOTAL NO BID 2,525.00 2,662.50 2,750.00 2,385.00 4,300.00

Manufacturer MFG. Louisville Louisville Werner Werner Werner

1. Part Number PART # FS1406HD FS1406HD 7306 7306 7306

10 ea. UNIT

Ladder, Type Step, Size 8', Material Fiberglass, PRICE 138.00 144.10 149.00 126.60 232.64

Werner #7308, Louisville #FS1408HD TOTAL NO BID 1,380.00 1,441.00 1,490.00 1,266.00 2,326.40

Manufacturer MFG. Louisville Louisville Werner Werner Werner

2. Part Number PART # FS1408HD FS1408HD 7308 7308 7308

B
ID

 N
O

T
 T

A
B

U
L
A

T
E

D

IN
C

O
M

P
L
E

T
E

 B
ID

G
R

O
U

P
 N

O
T

 T
A

B
U

L
A

T
E

D
 

B
ID

D
IN

G
 I

T
E

M
 N

O
T

 

A
P

P
R

O
V

E
D

B
ID

 N
O

T
 T

A
B

U
L

A
T

E
D

 

N
O

T
 A

P
P

R
O

V
E

D

G
R

O
U

P
 2

 N
O

T
 T

A
B

U
L

A
T

E
D

IN
C

O
M

P
L

E
T

E

B
ID

 N
O

T
 T

A
B

U
L
A

T
E

D

C
O

N
D

IT
IO

N
A

L
 B

ID

B
ID

 N
O

T
 T

A
B

U
L

A
T

E
D

N
O

T
 A

P
P

R
O

V
E

D

2



F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 10-2070

 

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSALAnnual Contract for

FOR: General Digging Tools & Ladders

TIME & (October 1, 2010 through September 30, 2011)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., August 5, 2010
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY M
S
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25 ea. UNIT

Ladder, Type Extension, Size 20', Material Aluminum PRICE 237.00 244.80 270.00 246.00 407.57

Werner #D520-2, Louisville #AE1220HD TOTAL NO BID 5,925.00 6,120.00 6,750.00 6,150.00 10,189.25

Manufacturer MFG. Louisville Louisville Werner Werner Werner

3. Part Number PART # AE1220HD AE1220HD D520-2 D520-2 D520-2

15 ea. UNIT

Ladder, Type Extension, Size 28', Material Aluminum, PRICE 310.00 319.50 390.00 355.20 586.27

Werner #D528-2, Louisville #AE1228HD TOTAL NO BID 4,650.00 4,792.50 5,850.00 5,328.00 8,794.05

Manufacturer MFG. Louisville Louisville Werner Werner Werner

4. Part Number PART # AE1228HD AE1228HD D528-2 D528-2 D528-2

30 ea. UNIT

Ladder, Type Single, Size 10', Material Aluminum, PRICE 182.90 185.00 160.00 165.60 238.42

Werner D510-1 TOTAL NO BID 5,487.00 5,550.00 4,800.00 4,968.00 7,152.60

Manufacturer MFG. Werner Werner Werner Werner Werner

5. Part Number PART # 510-1 510-1 510-1 510-1 510-1

*

TOTAL GROUP 3 TOTAL NO BID 19,967.00 20,566.00 21,640.00 20,097.00 32,762.30

2% Net Net Net Net Net Net

Terms 20 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

Delivery Days

 

*DENOTES LOW BIDDER  

 

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

  

Alamo Iron Works MSC Industral Supply Demandstar

Alaron Supply Co. Municipal Water Works Supply SAWS Website

Applied Industrial Technologies NE Distribution

Baytech Supply, Inc. Pyramid School Products

CMC Construction Services Sunbelt Mill Supply

Fastenal Industrial & Constructions Supplies Tool Mart, Inc.

Grainger United Tool & Fasteners

HD Supply USA Blue Book

Industrial Supply Solutions

B
ID

 N
O

T
 T

A
B

U
L

A
T

E
D

 

N
O

T
 A

P
P

R
O

V
E

D

 

B
ID

 N
O

T
 T

A
B

U
L
A

T
E

D

IN
C

O
M

P
L
E

T
E

 B
ID

G
R

O
U

P
 N

O
T

 T
A

B
U

L
A

T
E

D
 

B
ID

D
IN

G
 I

T
E

M
 N

O
T

 A
P

P
R

O
V

E
D

 

 

 

B
ID

 N
O

T
 T

A
B

U
L
A

T
E

D

C
O

N
D

IT
IO

N
A

L
 B

ID

3


