
04-2070A
 

F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAAnnual Contract for
FOR: General Digging Tools & Ladders
TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2005)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., October 7, 2003  
ITEM NO DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

550 ea. UNIT *        
Shovel, round point, blade type forged, closed back PRICE 21.00 21.55 23.56 27.67 ** **   
blade, design forward turned step, blade size 8 3/4" x 11 1/2" TOTAL 11,550.00 11,852.50 12,958.00 15,218.50 NOT NOT  No Bid
Manufacturer MFG. Ames  Ames Ames APPROVED APPROVED   

1. Part Number PART # 1303900 1303900 1303900
350 ea. UNIT *        
Shove, square point, blade type extra thick 14 gauge, blade PRICE 15.00 16.25 17.81 20.91 ** ** 14.98  
design forward turned steop, weight 4.7 pounds TOTAL 5,250.00 5,687.50 6,233.50 7,318.50 NOT NOT 5,243.00  No Bid
Manufacturer MFG. Ames  Ames Ames APPROVED APPROVED Ames  

2. Part Number PART # 1309500 1309500 1309500 1309500
300 ea. UNIT   *      
Shovel, drain spade, blade type forged, solid back, blade PRICE 33.00 32.49 27.66 ** ** ** 34.23  
design forward turned steop, blade size 5 1/2" x 16" TOTAL 9,900.00 9,747.00 8,298.00 NOT NOT NOT 10,269.00 No Bid
Manufacturer MFG. Ames  Union Tools APPROVED APPROVED APPROVED Ames  

3. Part Number PART # 1231100  47110    1231100  
80 ea. UNIT *        
Bar, digging, San Angelo, pencil point, weight 14 lbs. PRICE 12.50 13.46 ** 13.62 ** **   
size 1" hex, length 60", Ames Part #1174800 TOTAL 1,000.00 1,076.80 NOT 1,089.60 NOT NOT No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer MFG. Ames  APPROVED Ames APPROVED APPROVED   

4. Part Number PART # 1160300  1174800
135 ea. UNIT *        
Rake, type Bow Head, size 14" with 14 teeth (3" in length), PRICE 17.50 17.76 ** 22.22 ** **   
style one piece forged steelhead, handle wooden, 60" in length TOTAL 2,362.50 2,397.60 NOT 2,999.70 NOT NOT No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer MFG. Ames  APPROVED Ames APPROVED APPROVED    

5. Part Number PART # 1886700  1886700
70 ea. UNIT  *       
Bar, Crow, size 26 pounds, wedge point 66" long, 1 1/2" stock PRICE 26.00 25.25 29.94 31.36 **    
Warren Wedge Point #40, Ames Part #1162500 TOTAL 1,820.00 1,767.50 2,095.80 2,195.20 NOT No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer MFG. Ames  Ames Ames APPROVED    

6. Part Number PART # 1162500 1162500 1162500
30 ea. UNIT *        
Hoe, type Cotton, head size 6 1/2" x 7 x 5", handle size 54" PRICE 12.50 12.49 ** 16.00 **    
 60" in length, Ames Part #1857400 TOTAL 375.00 374.70 NOT 480.00 NOT No Bid No Bid  No Bid
Manufacturer MFG. Ames  APPROVED Ames APPROVED    

7. Part Number PART # 1857400  1857400
25 ea. UNIT *        
Lute, Asphalt, blade head size 36", material alumimum, PRICE 31.95 32.63 ** 40.25 **    
heavy duty brace riveted to lute head Ames Part #63036C TOTAL 798.75 815.75 NOT 1,006.25 NOT No Bid  No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer MFG. Ames  APPROVED Ames APPROVED    

8. Part Number PART # 63036C  63036C
25 ea. UNIT  *       
Moil Point, size 1 1/4" x 6" x 18", Tamco Part #4014-018, PRICE 22.00 18.95 19.73 ** **    
Vulcan Part #1024 TOTAL 550.00 473.75 493.25 NOT NOT No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer MFG. Vulcan  Tamco APPROVED APPROVED    

9. Part Number PART # 1024 4014-018
25 ea. UNIT  *       
Cutter, Asphalt, Size 1 1/4" x 6", Tamco Part #4064-012 PRICE 54.00 39.95 45.52 ** **     
Vulcan Part #1046 TOTAL 1,350.00 998.75 1,138.00 NOT NOT  No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer MFG. Vulcan  Tamco APPROVED APPROVED    

10. Part Number PART # 1046 4064-012
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80 ea. UNIT   *      
Pick, Type Railroad Head, Mfg. Kulkoni Part #RP7 PRICE 7.00 7.21 6.39 ** **    
Item No. 6223 TOTAL 560.00 576.80 511.20 NOT NOT No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer MFG. Kulkoni  Kulkoni APPROVED APPROVED    

11. Part Number PART # RP7 RP7
100 ea. UNIT  *       
Handle, Type Pick, 6 eye, size 36", used for #6 railroad PRICE 6.25 5.55 5.74 ** **    
pick head, Flame Seal, Part #751-365 TOTAL 625.00 555.00 574.00 NOT NOT No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer MFG. Brunen Ivory  Brunen Ivory APPROVED APPROVED    

12. Part Number PART # 220-19 220-19
25 ea. UNIT   *      
Handle, Sledge Hammer, size 36", capacity of 12 pounds, PRICE 6.40 4.64 3.34 8.40 ** **   
Burney-Ivory Handle Co., Part #001-09, Item #6470 TOTAL 160.00 116.00 83.50 210.00 NOT NOT No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer MFG. Ames  Brunen Ivory Ames APPROVED APPROVED   

13. Part Number PART # 12 001-09 12
25 ea. UNIT   *      
Ladder, Type Step, size 6', material fiberglass, Werner #6206 PRICE 70.00 65.71 62.77 ** ** 109.00 79.25 113.28
Davidson #486-06, Part #7682 TOTAL 1,750.00 1,642.75 1,569.25 NOT NOT 2,725.00 1,981.25 2,832.00
Manufacturer MFG. Ames  Davidson APPROVED APPROVED Werner Werner Louisville Ladder

14. Part Number PART # 371506 486-06 #89408348 6206 FS 1306
25 ea. UNIT   *      
Ladder, Type Extension, size 20', material Aluminum, PRICE ** 129.50 127.82 ** ** 193.14 139.53 164.86
Werner #D1520-2, Davidson #546-20, Item #7683 TOTAL NOT 3,237.50 3,195.50 NOT NOT 4,828.50 3,488.25 4,121.50
Manufacturer MFG. APPROVED  Davidson APPROVED APPROVED Werner Werner Louisville Ladder

15. Part Number PART # 546-20 89407100 D1520-2 AE2220
15 ea. UNIT   *      
Ladder, Type extension, size 28', material Aluminum, PRICE ** 186.01 179.04 ** ** 284.71 200.32 241.14
Werner #D1528-2, Davidson #546-28, Item #7685 TOTAL NOT 2,790.15 2,685.60 NOT NOT 4,270.65 3,004.80 3,617.10
Manufacturer MFG. APPROVED  Davidson APPROVED APPROVED Werner Werner Louisville Ladder

16. Part Number PART # 546-28 89407126 D1528-2 AE 2228
25 ea. UNIT   *      
Ladder, Type single, size 10', material Aluminum, Werner PRICE ** 65.25 61.18 ** ** 88.21  79.63
D1510-1, Louisville, Item #7686 TOTAL NOT 1,631.25 1,529.50 NOT NOT 2,205.25 No Bid 1,990.75
Manufacturer MFG. APPROVED  Louisville APPROVED APPROVED Werner  Louisville Ladder

17. Part Number PART # AE2110 89407035 AE2110
Additional sizes and items can be purchased as listed below:
Manufacturer Michigan Ames, Werner AIW     
Price Sheet 103 Catalog N     
Date 6/1/03 9/1/04     
Discount 25% 20% 39%     

1% Net Net Net Net Net Net Net
Terms 20 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

Delivery Days 10 days 7 days 15 days   3-4 days 7-10 days 10 days
 

*DENOTES LOW BIDDER  
** SUBMITTAL FOR EQUALS WERE NOT RECIVED ON THESE ITEMS AND WERE NOT APPROVED

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
 
Sunbelt M&M Industrial Supply Demandstar 
AIW MSC Ind. Supply SAWS Website
Grainger Industrial Supply
Royall Matthiessen PPG/Monarch Paint Co

 Tool Tech Nations Rent
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