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UNIT
300 ft. (Lawson #14733) PRICE 8.54 8.38 9.27 9.40 10.80 NO BID
1. 4" DI Pipe, "Fastite" Joint TOTAL 2,562.00 2,514.00 2,781.00 2,820.00 3,240.00
UNIT
3,000 ft. (Lawson #14734) PRICE 8.97 9.98 9.734 9.87 11.34 NO BID
2. 6" DI Pipe, "Fastite" Joini TOTAL 26,910.00 29,940.00 29,202.00 29,610.00 34,020.00
UNIT
3,000 ft. (Lawson #14735) PRICE 11.19 11.20 12.144 12.31 14.15 NO BID
3. 8" DI Pipe, "Fastite" Joint TOTAL 33,570.00 33,600.00 36,432.00 36,930.00 42,450.00
UNIT
2,500 ft. (Lawson #14729) PRICE 18.52 18.54 20.095 20.37 23.41 NO BID
4. 12" DI Pipe, "Fastite" Joint TOTAL 46,300.00 46,350.00 50,237.50 50,925.00 58,525.00
UNIT
2,000 ft. (Lawson #14736) PRICE 26.60 26.35 28.871 29.26 33.64 NO BID
5. 16" DI Pipe, "Fastite" Joint TOTAL 53,200.00 52,700.00 57,742.00 58,520.00 67,280.00
UNIT
100 ft. (Lawson #14730) PRICE 36.40 35.39 39.531 40.07 46.05 NO BID
6. 20" DI Pipe, :"Fastite" Joini TOTAL 3,640.00 3,539.00 3,953.10 4,007.00 4,605.00
UNIT
100 ft. (Lawson #14731) PRICE 45.80 44.45 55.476 50.34 57.86 NO BID
7. 24" DI Pipe, "Fastite" Joint TOTAL 4,580.00 4,445.00 5,547.60 5,034.00 5,786.00
NO BID
TOTAL FOR ITEMS 1-7 TOTAL 170,762.00 173,088.00 185,895.20 187,846.00 215,906.00
Net Net Net 2% 0%
Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 20 days 20 days
Delivery Days 7-10 days 7-10 days 30 days
1
BID INVITATIONS WERE MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY
Act Pipe & Supply Morrison Supply Demandstar
American Ductile Iron Pipe Municipal Water Works Supply SAWS Website

Cascade Water Works
Ferguson
HD Supply Waterworks

PMI Steel Pipe
US Pipe & Foundry
Williams Supply Co.




