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GROUP 1 - American Darling Fire Hydrant Parts %
20 set UNIT
Bolt & nut set, barrel, material plated steel, used for 5 1/4", PRICE 59.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
1. 8 each/set, Model B62B, Part 54-62-39-7 TOTAL 1,195.20
15 ea. UNIT
bolt & nut set, base, material rustproof steel, used for 5 1/4' PRICE 4.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
2. Model B62B, Part 54-62-39 TOTAL 67.20
20 ea. UNIT
coupling, breakable rod, material gray iron, used for 5 1/4 PRICE 33.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
3. Brand B62B, Part #54-62-29-30 TOTAL 663.60
30 set UNIT
Coupling, cotter pins, size 8" x 15", Range A 8.50-9.37, material PRICE 7.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
4. stainless steel used for 5 1/4" & 6", 2 each set Brand B62B, Part #54-62-29-31 TOTAL 223.80
UNIT
2ea. PRICE 29.13 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
5. Coupling, rod, material cast iron, used for 5" brand B50E TOTAL 58.26
UNIT
5ea. PRICE 32.87 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
6. Cover, housing, used for gray iron, brand B-62-B, part #62-¢ TOTAL 164.35
25 ea. UNIT
Flange, breakable, material cast iron, used for 5-1/4", brand B-84-B PRICE 29.13 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
7. Part# 84-29-15 TOTAL 728.25
2ea. UNIT
Flange, breakable, material gray iron, used for 5-1/4", brand B-62-t PRICE 32.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
8. Part #62-29-15 TOTAL 64.24
15 ea. UNIT
Gasket, barrel, material composition rubber, used for 6", Model B84B PRICE 4.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
9. Part #60-84-38-1 TOTAL 63.75
15 ea. UNIT
Gasket, barrel, material composition rubber, used for 5-1/4", Model B62B PRICE 4.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
10. Part #54-62-38-1 TOTAL 63.75
UNIT
2ea. PRICE 1111 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
11. Gasket, barrel, material rubber, used for 5", Model B50B, Part #50-29-2( TOTAL 22.22
UNIT
5ea. PRICE 4.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
12. Gasket, cover, material fiber, used for 5-1/4", Model B-84-B, Part #54-84-1 TOTAL 21.25
10 set UNIT
Gasket, drain ring, material composition rubber, used for 5-1/4", 2 each/se PRICE 7.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
13. Model B-84-B, Part #84-38 TOTAL 79.30
UNIT
2ea. PRICE 4.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
14. Gasket, drain ring, used for 5", model B-50-E TOTAL 9.52
5ea. UNIT
Gasket, housing, material composition rubber, used for 5-1/4", PRICE 3.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
15. Model B-84-B, Part #6-84-14 TOTAL 19.90
UNIT
2ea. PRICE 17.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
16. Gasket, seat, used for 5", Model B-50-B TOTAL 34.92
UNIT
5ea. PRICE 4.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
17. Gasket, steamer, material rubber, used for 5-1/4", Model B-84-B, Part#6-84-2 TOTAL 21.25
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30 ea. PRICE 147.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
18. Kit, breakaway 1985 and old, used for 5-1/4" includes 8 bolts, Model B62E TOTAL 4,411.50
UNIT
3ea. PRICE 221.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
19. Kit, extension, size 12", used for 5 1/4", Model B62E TOTAL 665.88
UNIT
30 ea. PRICE 183.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
20. Kit, extension, size 12", used for 5 1/4", Model B84B-25( TOTAL 5,514.30
UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 132.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
21. Kit, extension, size 6", used for 5 1/4", Model B84B-25( TOTAL 2,652.00
UNIT
80 ea. PRICE 90.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
22. Kit, fire hydrant, traffic, used for 5 1/4", includes 8 bolts, Model B84B-25( TOTAL 7,248.00
25 ea. UNIT
Kit, traffic repair quick fix, used for 5 1/4", includes flange, Model B62B PRICE 137.31 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
23. Part #B55204-KIT TOTAL 3,432.75
UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 83.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
24. Lever, drain, used for 5 1/4", Model B84B, Part #84-31 TOTAL 833.40
UNIT
5ea. PRICE 92.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
25. Lever, drain, used for 6", Model B84B, Part #1205¢ TOTAL 460.40
10 ea. UNIT
Nut, operating, material bronze B763, Alloy 844, used for 5 1/4", PRICE 109.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
26. Model B84B, Part #54-84-1 TOTAL 1,095.40
UNIT
2ea. PRICE 3.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
27. Nut, segment bolt, used for 5", Model B-50-E TOTAL 7.92
UNIT
5ea. PRICE 15.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
28. Nut, travel stop, used for 5 1/4", Model B84B, Part #84-30-0€ TOTAL 79.40
40 ea. UNIT
Overhaul Kit, fire hydrant, used for fire hydrant repair, Model B-84-B PRICE 109.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
29. MFG Part #03KIT 1 051 TOTAL 4,387.60
UNIT
45 ea. PRICE 99.13 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
30. Overhaul Kit, fire hydrant, size 5 1/4", Model B-62-B N.S., Mfg Part #03KIT 1 05! TOTAL 4,460.85
UNIT
30 ea. PRICE 99.13 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
31. Overhaul Kit, fire hydrant, size 5 1/4", Model B-62-B O.S., Mfg. Part #03KIT 1 05! TOTAL 2,973.90
UNIT
45 ea. PRICE 109.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
32. Overhaul Kit, free hydrant, size 5 1/4", Model B-84-B, Mfg. Part #03KIT 1 05 TOTAL 4,936.05
5ea. UNIT
Pin, coupling, kit used for 5", Model B-50-B, A-159621-5 H525 62/H60( PRICE 4.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
33. 84 F/1-1/4 SQ TOTAL 21.25
UNIT
5ea. PRICE 4.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
34. Pin, rod coupling, used for 5", Model B-50-B TOTAL 21.25
UNIT
1ea. PRICE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
35. O-Ring cover, material Buna N, used for 5 1/4", Model B-84-B, Part #6-84-2-! TOTAL 4.25
UNIT
1ea. PRICE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
36. O-Ring drain, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model B62B, Part #54-62-3' TOTAL 182.56
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5ea. PRICE 175.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
37. O-Ring, drain, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model B-84-B, Part #6-84-3. TOTAL 876.90
UNIT
5ea. PRICE 4.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
38. 0O-Rign housing, material Buna N, used for 5 1/4", Model B-84-B, Part #6-84-2- TOTAL 21.25
UNIT
2ea. PRICE 7.94 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
39. O-Ring inside seat, material Buna N, used for 5 1/4", Model B62B, Part #54-62-36-: TOTAL 15.88
UNIT
35ea. PRICE 4.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
40. 0O-Ring nozzle, used for 5 1/4", Model B84B, Part #84-20-4 TOTAL 148.75
UNIT
5ea. PRICE 7.94 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
41. O-Ring seat, material Buna N, used for 5 1/4", Model B-84-E TOTAL 39.70
UNIT
5ea. PRICE 1111 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
42. O-Ring seat, material Buna N, used for 6", Model B-84- TOTAL 55.55
UNIT
5ea. PRICE 3.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
43. Screw, pipe, material stal, used for 5 1/4", Model B62B, Part #54-62-5- TOTAL 15.90
UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 140.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
44, Seal, hydrant seat, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model B-84-B, Part #84-35-0: TOTAL 2,805.00
UNIT
30 ea. PRICE 144.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
45. Seat, hydrant, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model B62B, Part #62-35-OF TOTAL 4,335.00
UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 144.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
46. Seat, hydrant, material bronze B763 Alloy844, used for 6", Model B84B, Part #60-84-35-0. TOTAL 1,444.60
UNIT
2ea. PRICE 56.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
47. Valve, bottom, material cast iron, used for 6", Model B-84-B, Part #6-84-4. TOTAL 112.70
UNIT
15 ea. PRICE 47.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
48. Valve, hydrant, material rubber, used for 5 1/4", Model B62B, Part #54-62-4. TOTAL 714.45
UNIT
5ea. PRICE 55.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
49. Valve, hydrant, material rubber, used for 6", Model B84B, Part #60-84-4 TOTAL 277.80
UNIT
2ea. PRICE 47.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
50. Valve, main, used for 5 1/4", Model B84B, Part #B56637 TOTAL 95.26
UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 4.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
51. Washer, thrust, material nylatron, used for 5 1/4", Model B62B, Part #54-62-4- TOTAL 95.20
* No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
TOTAL GROUP I TOTAL 57,943.36
GROUP 2 - Clow Fire Hydrant Parts UNIT *
10 ea. PRICE 1.01 1.08 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
1. Bearing, operating nut thrust, used for 5 1/4", brand medallion, Part #M- TOTAL 10.10 10.80
2ea. UNIT
Bolt & Nut set, safety flange, material zinc plated steel, used for 5 1/4", brand medallior PRICE 1.15 10.45 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
2. Part #M-46 TOTAL 2.30 20.90
UNIT
2ea. PRICE 19.08 20.25 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
3. Cap, weather, material cast iron, used for 5 1/4", brand medallion, Part#M-2 TOTAL 38.16 40.50
20 ea. UNIT
Coupling, safety stem, material steel tubing used for 5 1/4", brand Medallion, PRICE 23.24 24.69 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
4. Part #M-10/M-220-2349 TOTAL 464.80 493.80
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7ea. PRICE 3.31 3.75 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
5. Facing, drain valve, material rubber, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-16/T160080 TOTAL 23.17 26.25
UNIT
5 set PRICE 177.14 177.22 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
6. Flange, safety, material ductile iron, used for 5 1/4", Brand Medallion, Part #M-46/1-160-080: TOTAL 885.70 886.10
UNIT
100 ea. PRICE 98.64 90.47 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
7. Kit, breakaway, size 5 1/4", used for breakflange repair, Model F2500, Part #R162054! TOTAL 9,864.00 9,047.00
UNIT
50 ea. PRICE 238.59 244.65 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
8. Kit, extension, size 12", used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #R162066% TOTAL 11,929.50 12,232.50
UNIT
15 ea. PRICE 201.88 209.53 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
9. Kit, extension, size 6", used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #R162066¢ TOTAL 3,028.20 3,142.95
UNIT
75 ea. PRICE 98.76 90.47 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
10. Kit, safety flange, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #R162065% TOTAL 7,407.00 6,785.25
UNIT
2ea. PRICE 65.19 65.22 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
11. Nut, operating, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-! TOTAL 130.38 130.44
UNIT
2ea. PRICE 0.51 0.55 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
12. Nut, thrust o-ring, material NBR, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-2¢ TOTAL 1.02 1.10
UNIT
2ea. PRICE 111 1.20 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
13. Nut, thrust setscrew, material stainless steel, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-5¢ TOTAL 2.22 2.40
UNIT
125 ea. PRICE 90.24 45.37 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
14. Overhaul Kit, fire hydrant, size 5 1/4", Model Medallion, 02KIT, 1 05. TOTAL 11,280.00 5,671.25
UNIT
5ea. PRICE 0.41 0.45 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
15. Pin, drain valve facing, material stainless steel, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-1 TOTAL 2.05 2.25
5ea. UNIT
Pin, safety coupling, material stainless steel, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion PRICE 2.21 2.36 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
16. Part, #M-11/T0400891 TOTAL 11.05 11.80
5ea. UNIT
Pin, safety coupling cotter, material stainless steel, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion PRICE 0.61 0.66 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
17. Part #M-9 TOTAL 3.05 3.30
UNIT
5ea. PRICE 4.33 4.62 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
18. Pin, upper stem, material stainless steel, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-¢ TOTAL 21.65 23.10
UNIT
2ea. PRICE 105.44 107.50 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
19. O-Ring, drain, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-5¢ TOTAL 210.88 215.00
UNIT
5ea. PRICE 1.61 1.72 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
20. O-Ring, drain, material N B R, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-5: TOTAL 8.05 8.60
UNIT
5ea. PRICE 3.61 3.85 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
21. O-Ring, operating nut, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-1/T-240-081¢ TOTAL 18.05 19.25
UNIT
25 ea. PRICE 3.41 3.64 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
22. O-Ring, seat lower, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-20/T-240-131¢ TOTAL 85.25 91.00
UNIT
15 ea. PRICE 171 1.83 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
23. O-Ring, safety flange, material N B R, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-4 TOTAL 25.65 27.45
UNIT
100 ea. PRICE 75.39 75.43 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
24. O-Ring, seat, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-19/F-160080% TOTAL 7,539.00 7,543.00
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60 ea. PRICE 4.93 5.25 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
25. O-Ring, seat upper, material NBR, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-18/T-240-072. TOTAL 295.80 315.00
UNIT
5ea. PRICE 0.41 0.45 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
26. O-Ring, stem, material NBR used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-3: TOTAL 2.05 2.25
10 ea. UNIT
Screw, cap hold down, material zinc plated steel used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion PRICE 0.41 0.45 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
27. Part #M-25/T-040-0890 TOTAL 4.10 4.50
UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 74.92 76.42 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
28. Stem, upper, used for 5 1/4", Brand Medallion, Part #M-7 TOTAL 749.20 764.20
UNIT
7ea. PRICE 85.79 80.27 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
29. Valve, lower plate, material brass, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-24/M160080. TOTAL 600.53 561.89
UNIT
70 ea. PRICE 30.14 30.15 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
30. Valve, main, material rubber used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-21/T-160-080 TOTAL 2,109.80 2,110.50
UNIT
55 ea. PRICE 98.35 98.40 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
31. Valve, upper plate, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-17/F-160-080: TOTAL 5,409.25 5,412.00
2ea. UNIT
Washer, lower valve plate lock, material stainless steel, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallior PRICE 1.31 1.40 INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
32. Part #M-22 TOTAL 2.62 2.80
* INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
TOTAL GROUP 2 TOTAL 62,164.58 55,609.13
GROUP 3 - Mueller Fire Hydrant Parts
UNIT *
2ea. PRICE 13.82 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid 12.90 INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
1. Cap, weather, open right, used for 5 1/4", Brand Centurion, Part #A-2/14281¢ TOTAL 27.64 25.80
UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 34.28 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid 32.00 INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
2. Coupling, safety stem, material stainless steel, used for 5 1/4", Brand Centurion, Part #A-25/19035! TOTAL 685.60 640.00
UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 38.02 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid 35.50 INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
3. Flange, safety, used for 5 1/4", Brand Centurion, Part #A-28/175211-! TOTAL 760.40 710.00
UNIT
55 ea. PRICE 4.25 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid 3.70 INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
4. Flange, safety bolt & nut, used for 5 1/4", Brand Centurion, Part #A-2¢ TOTAL 233.75 203.50
UNIT
30 ea. PRICE 8.09 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid 7.10 INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
5. Gasket, bonnet, used for 5 1/4", Model Centurion, Part #10/198357 TOTAL 242.70 213.00
UNIT
40 ea. PRICE 313.61 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid 293.20 INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
6. Kit, main repair used for 5 1/4", Model improve: TOTAL 12,544.40 11,728.00
UNIT
150 ea. PRICE 102.49 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid 105.40 INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
7. Kit, safety flange repair used for 5 1/4", Model Centurions & improved NS, Part #A30 TOTAL 15,373.50 15,810.00
UNIT
2ea. PRICE 28.71 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid 26.80 INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
8. Nut, hold down used for 5 1/4", Model Centurion, Part #A-£ TOTAL 57.42 53.60
UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 90.36 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid 84.50 INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
9. Nut, operating, used for 5 1/4", Brand open right/1988 or later, Model Centurion, Part#A-1/14781« TOTAL 903.60 845.00
UNIT
1ea. PRICE No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
10. Nut, operating weather cap, used for 5 1/4", Model 107, Part #H-11( TOTAL 44.45 41.50
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UNIT
100 ea. PRICE 75.56 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid 77.40 INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
11. Overhaul Kit, size 5 1/4", Model Centurion, Part #01KIT 1 05: TOTAL 7,556.00 7,740.00
UNIT
25 ea. PRICE 5.21 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid 4.50 INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
12. Pin, Clevis, used for 5 1/4", Model centurion, Part #A-30/19523% TOTAL 130.25 112.50
UNIT
35ea. PRICE 0.83 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid 0.73 INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
13. Pin, Cotter, used for 5 1/4", Model Centurion, Part #A-28 TOTAL 29.05 25.55
UNIT
1ea. PRICE No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
14. Pin, Screw, used for 5 1/4", Model 107, Part #H-111 TOTAL 24.56 21.60
UNIT
1ea. PRICE No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
15. Pin, Stem, used for 5 1/4", Model Centurion, Part #A-33/195347 TOTAL 4.24 3.73
UNIT
5ea. PRICE 2.13 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid 1.73 INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
16. Plug, Oil Filler, used for 5 1/4", Model Centurion, Part #A-7 TOTAL 10.65 8.65
UNIT
5ea. PRICE 3.78 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid 3.33 INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
17. O-Ring, Bonnet, used for 5 1/4", Model Centurion, Part #A-E TOTAL 18.90 16.65
UNIT
25 ea. PRICE 3.78 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid 3.33 INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
18. O-Ring, Bottom Seat, used for 5 1/4", Model Centurion, Part #A-44/14289% TOTAL 94.50 83.25
UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 3.78 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid 3.33 INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
19. O-Ring, top seat, used for 5 1/4", Model Centurion, Part #A-39-195032 TOTAL 75.60 66.60
UNIT
60 ea. PRICE 125.68 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid 117.50 INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
20. Ring, seat, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model Centurion, Part A-43/14276: TOTAL 7,540.80 7,050.00
UNIT
1ea. PRICE No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
21. Screw, drain valve, used for 5 1/4", Model Standard, Part #1« TOTAL 0.83 0.73
UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 45.12 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid 66.10 INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
22. Valve, Main, material rubber, used for 5 1/4", Model Centurion, Part #A-45/19291. TOTAL 902.40 1,322.00
UNIT
35ea. PRICE 86.73 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid 81.10 INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
23. Valve, upper plate, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model Centurion, Part, #A-36/18405! TOTAL 3,035.55 2,838.50
* No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
TOTAL GROUP 3 TOTAL 50,296.79 49,560.16
GROUP 4 - M&H FIRE HYDRANT PARTS UNIT *
15 ea. PRICE 99.63 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid 75.50 79.63
1. Kit, breakaway, used for 5 1/4", Model 12¢ TOTAL 1,494.45 1,132.50 1,194.45
UNIT
2ea. PRICE 5.09 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid 2.31 3.25
2. O-Ring, weatherproof, material rubber, used for 5 1/4", Model 129, Part #3( TOTAL 10.18 4.62 6.50
* No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid
TOTAL GROUP 4 TOTAL 1,504.63 1,137.12 1,200.95
GROUP 5 - U.S. PIPE FIRE HYDRANT PARTS
2ea. UNIT *
Facing, drain valve, material rubber, used for 5 1/4", Year 1994 and on, Metropolitan 250 M-9: PRICE 5.63 No Bid 4.50 6.08 No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
1. Part #39 TOTAL 11.26 9.00 12.16
UNIT
5ea. PRICE 15.31 No Bid 22.80 30.78 No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
2. Gasket, standpipe ring, used for 5 1/4", Model H-205, Part #HR6! TOTAL 76.55 114.00 153.90
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5ea. PRICE 225.00 No Bid 309.00 309.00 No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
3. Kit, extension, size 12", used for 5 1/4", Model 250, Part #M9¢ TOTAL 1,125.00 1,545.00 1,545.00
20 ea. UNIT
Kit, traffic repair, used for 5 1/4" fire hydrant, Brand Metropolitan, Model 250 M-9: PRICE 93.38 No Bid 114.00 153.90 No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
4. (Yr. 94 & after), Part #658665 TOTAL 1867.6 2,280.00 3,078.00
UNIT
5ea. PRICE 34.69 No Bid 27.75 28.89 No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
5. Nut, operating, material cast iron, used for 5 1/4", Model sentinel, Part #: TOTAL 173.45 138.75 144.45
UNIT
25 ea. PRICE 106.56 No Bid 380.00 513.00 No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
6. Overhaul, kit, size 5 1/4", Model Metropolitan 250, Part #07KIT 1 525 05: TOTAL 2664 9,500.00 12,825.00
2ea. UNIT
Pin, top plate, material steel (shear proof), used for 5 1/4", Brand Year 1994 and on, PRICE 5.19 No Bid 4.15 5.60 No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
7. Model Metropolitan 250 M-94, Part #34 TOTAL 10.38 8.30 11.20
2ea. UNIT
Ring, seat, material bronze, used for 5 /14", Brand Year 1994 and on, Model Metropolital PRICE 175.88 No Bid 149.50 201.83 No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
8. 250 M-94, Part #42 TOTAL 351.76 299.00 403.66
5ea. UNIT
O-Ring, seat, material rubber, used for 5 1/4", Brand Year 1994 and on Model Metropolital PRICE 9.00 No Bid 7.20 9.72 No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
9. 250 M-94, Part #43 TOTAL 45.00 36.00 48.60
UNIT
2ea. PRICE 3.09 No Bid 2.05 35.84 No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
10. Screw, hold down nut, material stainless steel, used for 5 1/4", Model Sentinel, Part #. TOTAL 6.18 4.10 71.68
5ea. UNIT
Valve, main, material rubber, used for 5 1/4" Yar 1994 and on, Model Metropolitan 250 M-9¢ PRICE 45.13 No Bid 36.10 48.74 No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
11 Part #44 TOTAL 225.65 180.50 243.70
UNIT
5ea. PRICE 50.00 No Bid 86.75 117.11 No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
12. Valve, main, material rubber Buna-S, used for 5 1/4", Model H-205 USP hydrant, Part #H-4 TOTAL 250.00 433.75 585.55
5ea. UNIT
Valve, upper plate, material bronze, used for 5 1/4" Year 1994 and on, Model Metropolita PRICE 1.63 No Bid 130.00 175.50 No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
13. 250 M-94, Part #35 TOTAL 8.15 650.00 877.50
* No Bid No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE
TOTAL GROUP 5 TOTAL 6,814.98 15,198.40 20,000.40
GROUP 6 - Kennedy Fire Hydrant Parts UNIT *
10 ea. PRICE 4111 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
1. Coupling, stem break, material cast iron, used for 5 1/4", Brand K84A, Part #K811 TOTAL 411.10
UNIT
5ea. PRICE 44.05 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
2. Coupling, stem break, used for 5 1/4", Brand K11, Part #K112: TOTAL 220.25
UNIT
2ea. PRICE 9.19 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
3. Facing, drain valve, material Buna N, used for 5 1/4", Model K81A, Part #K813 TOTAL 18.38
UNIT
5ea. PRICE 12.01 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
4. Gasket, seat ring, material copper asbestos, used for 5 1/4", Model K11, Part #K113 TOTAL 60.05
UNIT
5ea. PRICE 10.25 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
5. Gasket, standpipe, used for 5 1/4", Model K11, Part #K112¢ TOTAL 51.25
UNIT
125 ea. PRICE 103.45 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
6. Kit, collision, used for 5 1/4", Model K81A, Part #K-8149/1585C00R1X81Z TOTAL 12,931.25
UNIT
15 ea. PRICE 202.39 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
7. Kit, extension, size 12", Model K81A TOTAL 3,035.85
UNIT
1ea. PRICE No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
8. Kit, extension, size 6", Model K81A TOTAL 205.53
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UNIT
5ea. PRICE 56.63 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
9. Nozzle, remover tool, size 2 1/2" wrench hose, used for 5 1/4", Brand K81A, Part #K-8148/331037 TOTAL 283.15
UNIT
1ea. PRICE No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
10. Nut, operating stem, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model K81A, Part #K810 TOTAL 92.36
UNIT
60 ea. PRICE 88.64 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
11. Overhaul Kit, size 5 1/4", Model guardian K81A, Part #05KIT 1 05 TOTAL 5,318.40
UNIT
5ea. PRICE 1.39 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
12. Pin, cotter, material stainless steel, used for 5 1/4", Mode K81A, Part #K-8117/44301( TOTAL 6.95
UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 7.14 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
13. Pin, drain valve, material steel, used for 5 1/4", Model K81, Part #K813 TOTAL 71.40
UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 4.85 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
14. O-Ring, lower, material Buna N, used for 5 1/4", Model Guardian, Part #K813! TOTAL 97.00
UNIT
5ea. PRICE 3.46 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
15. 0O-Ring, material Buna N, used for 5 1/4", Model K81A, Part #K811: TOTAL 17.30
UNIT
15 ea. PRICE 4.85 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
16. 0O-Ring, material Buna N, used for 5 1/4", Model K81A, Part #K8126/ TOTAL 72.75
UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 134.01 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
17. Ring, seat, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model K11, Part #K113. TOTAL 1,340.10
UNIT
30 ea. PRICE 120.56 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
18. Ring, seat, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model K81A, Part #K812i TOTAL 3,616.80
15 set UNIT
Ring, standpipe breaking (2 Per), material cast iron, used for 5 1/4", Model Guardial PRICE 24.01 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
19. KB81A, Part #K811¢ TOTAL 360.15
UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 13.00 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
20. O-Ring, weather seal, material Buna N, used for 5 1/4", Model K11, Part #K110. TOTAL 130.00
UNIT
15 ea. PRICE 74.68 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
21. Valve, main, material neoprene, used for 5 1/4", Model K81, Part #K813 TOTAL 1,120.20
UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 83.88 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
22. Valve, drain, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model K81A, Part #K813 TOTAL 838.80
UNIT
15 ea. PRICE 83.88 No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
23. Valve, drain, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model K81A, Part #K8136/331614 TOTAL 1,258.20
* No Bid INCOMPLETE No Bid No Bid INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE
TOTAL GROUP 6 TOTAL 31,557.22
GROUP 7 - Waterous Fire Hydrant Parts UNIT *
10 ea. PRICE 89.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 86.15
1. Kit, traffic repair, used for 5 1/4", Model Pacer, Part #K528/AFTER June 198! TOTAL 893.80 861.50
UNIT
lea. PRICE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2. Pipe, lower standpipe, Brand Pacet TOTAL 365.63 344.12
* No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL GROUP 7 TOTAL 1,259.43 1,205.62
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Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days
Delivery Day: 5-20 days 15 days 56 days 10-15 days
*DENOTES LOW BIDDER
BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP B
Act Pipe & Supply Metro Service Consultants Demandstar
American Cast Iron Pipe Moore Supply SAWS website
American Darling Valvt Morrison Supply Co.
Big Country Waterworks Supply Mueller co.
Empirewest, Inc Municipal Water Works Supply
Ferguson PMI Steel Pipe
HD Supply Quality Hydrant
Hydraflo, Inc Sheffey & Assoc.
Kennedy Valve William Supply Co.




