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ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY oo T =a < wn o o Xdo wao wn a0
Item | 2 ea. UNIT *
Repair and Preventative Maintenance Kit PRICE 56.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1. Part #LM| RPM-450F1 TOTAL 112.40
4ea. UNIT
Repair and Preventative Maintenance Kit PRICE 63.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2. Part #LMI RPM-460F1 TOTAL 252.60
10 ea. UNIT
Repair and Preventative Maintenance Kit PRICE 61.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3. Part #LM| RPM-490F1 TOTAL 610.50
2 ea.
LMI Metering Pump Series A941 UNIT
EPU Assembly with strok adjustment and disc. PRICE 205.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4. Part #LMI 31915 TOTAL 411.60
2 ea. a) a)
LMI Metering Pump Series A951 UNIT L L
EPU Assembly with stroke adjustment and disc. PRICE 205.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid = =
5. Part #.M131911 TOTAL 411.60 i W i W
Tea. D 2
LMI Metering Pump Series A971 UNIT m Ll m L
EPU Assembly with stroke adjustment and disc. PRICE No Bid No Bid No Bid < EI < EI
6. Part #LMI 31917 TOTAL 205.80 . =S
7 ea. = O = O
LMI Metering Pump Series B911, B921 UNIT % O % O
EPU and Spacer Assembly with stroke adjustment PRICE 285.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid — pz — Z
7. Part #LMI 31927CE TOTAL 2,000.95 - -
3ea. = =
LMI Metering Pump Series C911, C921 UNIT L||_J L||_J
EPU and Spacer Assembly with strok adjustment PRICE 437.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid - -
8. Part #LMI 32534CE TOTAL 1,312.50
12 ea. UNIT
LMI 4 Function Valve, 1/4" OD Tubing PVDF PRICE 171.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid
9. Part #LMI 36275 & 38794 TOTAL 2,062.20
12 ea. UNIT
LMI 4 Function Valve, 3/8" OD Tubing PVDF PRICE 171.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid
10. Part #LMI 36276 & 38794 TOTAL 2,062.20
2 ea. UNIT
LMI 4 Function Valve, 1/2" OD Tubing PVDF PRICE 171.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11. Part #LM1 36277 & 38794 TOTAL 343.70
8 ea. UNIT
LMI 4 Function Valve, Valve ASM, 4FV3/8" PVC, PRICE 51.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid
12. HYP, Diaphragm, Key #17, Part #LMI37868 TOTAL 410.40
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40 ea. UNIT
LMI 1/4" 250" x 1/2" NPT OD Hose Connectors PRICE 20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
13. Part #LM1 28381 TOTAL 800.00
40 ea. UNIT
LMI 3/8" .375 x 1/2" NPT OD Hose Connectors PRICE 20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
14. Part #LM1 26114 TOTAL 800.00
12 ea. UNIT
LMI Seal and ring kit 1/2" ball PRICE 28.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid
15. Part #LMI 25197 TOTAL 340.20
12 ea. UNIT
LMI Seal and ring kit 3/8" ball PRICE 20.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid
16. Part #LMI 10930 TOTAL 248.40
UNIT a) a)
250 ft. PRICE/FT. 5.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid L L
17. Kynar Tubing PVDF 1/4" OD TOTAL 1,437.50 = =
UNIT i w i w
250 ft. PRICE/FT. 5.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid O - O -
18. Kynar Tubing PVDF 3/8" OD TOTAL 1,437.50 m Ll m L
3ea. UNIT < EI < EI
Flux pump tube sel PRICE 1,150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid = S = S
19. 60" PVDF container pump (custom fabricated) TOTAL 3,450.00 = ) = )
3ea. UNIT % O % O
Flux pump tube sel PRICE 3,375.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid = pz — Pz
20. 87" PVDF container pump (custom fabricated) TOTAL 10,125.00 - -
3ea. UNIT = =
Flux pump tube sel PRICE 3,450.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid L||_J L||_J
21. 118" PVDF container pump (custom fabricated) TOTAL 10,350.00 - -
2 ea. UNIT
Flux pump drive PRICE 699.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
22. 120 VAC TEFC constant speed TOTAL 1,398.00
24 ea. UNIT
Acid resistant gauge snubber (Gauge Guard) witt PRICE 108.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid
23. PTFE diaphragm TOTAL 2,598.00
UNIT
12 ea. PRICE 245.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24, Acid resistant pulsation dampner TOTAL 2,950.80
2 ea. UNIT
Bulk tank ultrasonic level indicator Sending unit PRICE 772.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
25. Ryan Herco LU30-5004 TOTAL 1,544.00
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6 ea. UNIT
Bulk tank signal converter (Relay Control) PRICE 394.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
26. Ryan Herco LC52-1001 TOTAL 2,367.00
12 ea. UNIT
Pressure gauge 0-60 psi 2 1/2" dial Dura life Plus PRICE 79.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid
27. Ashcroft Std. Bottom connection TOTAL 958.20
12 ea. UNIT
Pressure gauge 0-200 psi 2 1/2" dial Dura Std. PRICE 79.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid
28. bottom connection TOTAL 958.20 B B
< <
TOTAL ITEMS 1-28 TOTAL 51,959.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid = w = w
Miscellaneous (Other Items Not Listed UNIT a E a E
PRICE < | < |
Price List Catalog Number TOTAL 2008 No Bid No Bid No Bid — a — a
UNIT [ E - E
PRICE o Q 0 9
Discount Off Price List (%) TOTAL Various No Bid No Bid No Bid Z LZ) Pz LZ)
UNIT — = — =
PRICE S S
Effective Date of Price List TOTAL 7/1/08 No Bid No Bid No Bid L L
REPAIR OF LMI METERING PUMPS UNIT = =
STANDARD LABOR RATE PRICE/ 75.00 No Bid
Approximately 150 hours HOUR 11,250.00 No Bid No Bid
Overtime Labor Rate for repair with prior UNIT
approval of SAWS PRICE/ 100.00 No Bid
Approximately 8 hours HOUR 800.00 No Bid No Bid
UNIT
PRICE/
Pickup and delivery of pumps TRIP 95 .00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Item 11 5ea. UNIT *
ProMinent Gamma/L Metering Pump Model #Gala PRICE 1,051.00 1,018.80 1,190.00 1,132.00
1. 0713npb260ud112000, 1.8 GPH, 145 psig TOTAL 5,255.00 5,094.00 5,950.00 5,660.00 No Bid 8
5 ea. UNIT ':: =
ProMinent Gamma/L Metering Pump Model #Gala PRICE 1,099.00 829.80 960.00 922.00 Jw =z
2. 1005npb2600d112000, 1.1 GPH, 145 psig TOTAL 5,495.00 4,149.00 4,800.00 4,610.00 No Bid g "'EJ o
5 ea. UNIT < E 'E
ProMinent Gamma/L Metering Pump Model #Gala PRICE 1,099.00 817.20 960.00 908.00 Fo O
3. 1602nph200ud112000, 0.55 GPH, 253 psig TOTAL 5,495.00 4,086.00 4,800.00 4,540.00 No Bid '5 i w
5ea. UNIT ZwQ
ProMinent Gamma/L Metering Pump Model #Gala PRICE 1,099.00 1,018.80 1,190.00 1,132.00 = 8 %
4. 1008nph260ud112000, 1.6 GPH, 145 psig TOTAL 5,495.00 5,094.00 5,950.00 5,660.00 No Bid E
UNIT =
10 ea. PRICE 125.00 106.20 131.00 118.00
5. Gala 1005, Spare Parts Kit #1001724, 1.1 GPH TOTAL 1,250.00 1,062.00 1,310.00 1,180.00 No Bid
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UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 111.00 112.50 146.00 125.00
6. Gala 0713, Spare Parts Kit #1001726, 2.9 GPH TOTAL 1,110.00 1,125.00 1,460.00 1,250.00 No Bid
UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 111.00 99.90 126.00 111.00
7. Gala 1602, Spare Parts Kit #1001723, .55 GPH TOTAL 1,110.00 999.00 1,260.00 1,110.00 No Bid
UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 111.00 106.20 131.00 118.00 (£
8. Gala 1008, Spare Parts Kit #1001725, 1.8 GPH TOTAL 1,110.00 1,062.00 1,310.00 1,180.00 No Bid (@)
ac=
0
TOTAL ITEMS 1-8 TOTAL 26,320.00 22,671.00 26,840.00 25,190.00 No Bid i E
Miscellaneous (Other Items Not Listed UNIT 55
PRICE Quote Prograr [Sa ]
Price List Catalog Number TOTAL 2008 vV 1.027 No Bid |<£ %
UNIT
= =
PRICE ou
Discount Off Price List (%) TOTAL Various 10% No Bid Z s
UNIT = —
PRICE =0
Effective Date of Price List TOTAL Jan. 2008 May 14, 2008 No Bid '-,'_J P4
REPAIR OF LMI METERING PUMPS UNIT - ﬂ
STANDARD LABOR RATE PRICE/ 75.00 120.00 (@)
Approximately 150 hours HOUR 11,250.00 18,000.00 No Bid @)
Overtime Labor Rate for repair with prior UNIT
approval of SAWS PRICE/ 100.00 150.00
Approximately 8 hours HOUR 800.00 1,200.00 No Bid
UNIT
PRICE/
Pickup and delivery of pumps TRIP 95 .00 250.00 No Bid
Net Net 0% 0% Net 0%
Terms 30 days 30 days 20 days 20 days 30 days 20 days
Delivery Days 14 days 14 days
1
BIDS WERE MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
Enviro-Pump of SA Demandstar
Industrial Systems, Inc. SAWS Website

Macaulay Controls Co.
Odessa Pumps & Equip.
Peerless Equipment Co.
Progressive Pumps & Controls
Prominent Fluid Controls
Pumps & Controls

Pumps Unlimited

Sendero South Co.

Smith Pump Co.




