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ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY T 0w 2 ™ U N o;m X~auwm
Price/SqYd 2.05 2.16
300 pallets 50 SqYd/Pallet 102.50 108.00 No Bid No Bid
ITEM1 |St. Augustine Raleigh TOTAL 30,750.00 32,400.00
UNIT 3.02 3.80
25 pallets PRICE 151.00 190.00 No Bid No Bid
Buffalograss 609 TOTAL 3,775.00 4,750.00
UNIT 2.05 2.20
25 pallets PRICE 102.50 110.00 No Bid No Bid
Bermuda Common TOTAL 2,562.50 2,750.00
No Bid No Bid
SUB-TOTAL ITEM 1 TOTAL 37,087.50 39,900.00
Size Pieces 16"'x24" 16"x24"
150 pieces Price/Piece 1.25 0.98 No Bid No Bid
ITEM 2 St. Augustine Raleigh TOTAL 187.50 147.00
Size Pieces 16" 24" 16" 24"
150 pieces Price/Piece 1.90 1.27 No Bid No Bid
Buffalograss 609 TOTAL 285.00 190.50
Size Pieces 16" x 24" 16" x 24"
150 pieces Price/Piece 1.25 1.00 No Bid No Bid
Bermuda Common TOTAL 187.50 150.00
No Bid No Bid
SUB-TOTAL ITEM 2 TOTAL 660.00 487.50
No Bid No Bid
TOTALITEMS1&?2 TOTAL 37,747.50 40,387.50
VARIETY PRICE/
SQ.YD. & N/A N/A No Bid No Bid
Bermuda Baby PALLET
PRICE/
SQ.YD. & 2.05 2.30 No Bid No Bid
Bermuda Tifway 41¢ PALLET 102.50 115.00
PRICE/
SQ.YD. & 2.70 3.10 No Bid No Bid
Buffalograss Prairie PALLET 135.00 155.00
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PRICE/
SQ.YD. & 2.05 N/A No Bid No Bid
St. Augustine Common PALLET 102.50
PRICE/
SQ.YD. & 2.58 3.00 No Bid No Bid
St. Augustine Floratam PALLET 129.00 150.00
PRICE/
SQ.YD. & 2.99 2.90 No Bid No Bid
St. Augustine Del Mar PALLET 149.50 145.00
PRICE/
SQ.YD. & 2.58 2.90 No Bid No Bid
St. Augustine Palmetto PALLET 129.00 145.00
PRICE/
SQ.YD. & 3.55 3.90 No Bid No Bid
Emerald Zoysia PALLET 177.50 195.00
PRICE/
SQ.YD. & 2.80 3.20 No Bid No Bid
El Torrc PALLET 139.75 160.00
PRICE/
SQ.YD. & 3.55 4.20 No Bid No Bid
Z0rro PALLET 177.50 210.00
OTHER PRODUCTS % Discount
Off Vendor No Bid No Bid
Trees Listed Price 10% 10%
% Discount
Off Vendor No Bid No Bid
Shrubs Listed Price 10% 10%
% Discount
Off Vendor No Bid No Bid
Flowers Listed Price 10% 10%
% Discount
Off Vendor No Bid No Bid
Plants Listed Price 10% 10%
ITEM 3
Standard 22.50 60.00 34.00 25.00
Planting Services requeted by SAWS staff (labor rate Overtime 33.75 90.00 51.00 35.00
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7:00 am - 4:00 py 8:00 am - 5:00 pm | 8:00 am - 5:00 pm | 8:00 am - 5:00 pm
Mon.-Fri. Mon. -Fri. Mon. -Fri. Mon. -Fri.
7:00 am - 2:00 p| 9:00 am - 5:00 pm | 9:00 am - 3:00 pm | 9:00 am - 12:00 pm
Business Hours Saturday Saturday Saturday Saturday
Net Net Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days
Delivery Days 2 days
1

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY

Garden Center SAWS Website
Horton Horticulture, Inc

Maldonado Nursery & Landscape

Milberger Landscape

R&C Landscape, LLC




