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ITEM1 |HYDRAULIC HOSES (To include 1,2, All, and 4 Wire Spiral)
A Price Discount
1. Manufacturer DISCOUNT NRP Jones Parker Gates Aeroquip
1.2 All x.38
2. Discount off price list DISCOUNT 28% 70% 4 wine x.50 67%
PRICE
3. Price list identification LIST No. 208 PL4400 35096-00 A-Prov-PL0O01-E3
4, Effective date of price list DATE Feb. 1, 2008 July 2009 Sept. 9, 2008 QOct. 1, 2008
Column of price list on which discount is based PRICE
5. (I.e., wholesale, jobber, retail) LIST Jobber Retail List Jobber
HYDRAULIC HOSE FITTINGS, GERRULES, COUPLINGS AND ADAPTERS
B. Price Discount
1. Manufacturer DISCOUNT NRP Jones Parker Gates Aeroquip
2. Discount off price list DISCOUNT 30% 70% x.50 61,63,67
PRICE
3. Price list identification LIST No. 208 PL4300/PL4400 35096-00 A-Prov-PL001-E3
4, Effective date of price list DATE Feb. 1, 2008 July 2009 Sept. 9, 2008 QOct. 1, 2008
Column of price list on which discount is based PRICE
5. (I.e., wholesale, jobber, retail) LIST Jobber Retail List Jobber
.24 steel
Adapter (Inventory Item #14997) Plug Square Male Head Male 1/4 inch PRICE 0.68 0.49 .60 brass 1.15
Parker Hercules APG
C. MISCELLANEQUS O RINGS, SEALS AND CYLINDER KITS PRICE N/A 0.00 X.52 x.80
Faster & Pioneer
Dixon Quick Couplers Parker x.5846 Dixon
D. HYDRAULIC QUICK COUPLERS RANGING FROM 1/4 INCH TO 1 1/4 INCH |PRICE X.45 X.30 X.72 X.55
Seal Fast Noshok Dynamic Dixon
E. PRESSURE GUAGES RANGING FROM VACUUM TO PSI 10,000 PRICE X.65 X.85 X.60 X.55
F. BALL VALVES RANGING FROM 500 TO 7500 PSI PRICE Direct Purchase Inc. Parker Apollo & Anchor Dixon
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500 TO 2000 PSI X.80
LIST PRICE MULTIPLIER PRICE N/A X.30 Apollo X.55
2000 TO 7500 PSI X.57
LIST PRICE MULTIPLIER PRICE X.54 X.75 Anchor X.55
INVENTORY #17059 VALVE BALL 1 IN 5075 PSI B PRICE 47.25 69.99 95.21
INVENTORY #17093 VALVE BALL CARBON STEEL BALL 1/2N PRICE 21.60 42.328 28.57
INVENTORY #17062 VALVE BALL 1/2 IN 7250 PSI PRICE 21.60 31.7946 40.54
INVENTORY #32451 VALVE BALL 3/4 IN 5800 PSI PRICE 39.15 54.9138 79.78
G. AIR HOSES PSI 500 PRICE 1.98 1.22 1.0349 1.48
99.00 61.00 51.75 74.00
50 ft MFG.STK GA 1/4" 1/4" Gorilla Terminator 2245-4168662
a). 1/4 IN-AIR HOSE MFG.HOSE Gates Goodyear Gates Thermoid
PRICE 2.09 151 1.1864 1.96
104.50 75.50 59.32 98.00
50 ft MFG.STK GA 3/8" 3/8" Gorilla Terminator 2245-4248662
b). 3/8 IN-AIR HOSE MFG.HOSE Gates Goodyear Gates Thermoid
PRICE 1.74 2.08 0.9829 2.74
87.00 104.00 49.15 137.00
50 ft MFG.STK GA 1/2" 1/2" Gorilla Terminator 2245-4328662
C). 1/2 IN-AIR HOSE MFG.HOSE Gates Goodyear Gates Thermoid
PRICE 3.38 2.80 1.9139 3.48
169.00 140.00 95.70 174.00
50 ft MFG.STK GA 3/4" 3/4" Gorilla Terminator 2245-4488662
d). 3/4 IN-AIR HOSE MFG.HOSE Gates Goodyear Gates Thermoid
PRICE 42.14 1.50 154.8688 47.12
421.40 15.00 1,548.69 471.20
10 ea. MFG.STK ARTO750-50JH 3/4" Rd Horizon Premoflex SFAHO075
e). 3/4 IN 1D AIR HOSE 50 ft ASSEMBLY PSI 300 MFG.HOSE Flextech Goodyear 315 PS1 Gates Thermoid
TOTAL ITEM G 880.90 395.50 1,804.59 954.20
H. AIR COUPLERS PRICE 0.56 1.20 0.6809 1.10
112.00 240.00 136.18 220.00
200 ea. MFG.STK 727 H2C 727 DCP21
a). 727 M Style MFG.HOSE Milton Parker Milton Dixon
PRICE 0.59 1.48 0.722 1.27
29.50 74.00 36.10 63.50
50 ea. MFG.STK 728 H3C 728 DCP20
b). 728 M Style Female Thread 1/4 IN MFG.HOSE Milton Parker Milton Dixon
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PRICE 6.07 8.71 7.678 11.17
60.70 87.10 76.78 111.70
10 ea. MFG.STK 153 410-N 153 D201
C). 153 Standard Blow Gun MFG.HOSE Milton Parker Milton Dixon
PRICE 2.45 6.23 3.07 4.68
122.50 311.50 153.50 234.00
50 ea. MFG.STK 715 B23 715 DC20
d). 715 1/4 IN NPT Female Thread MFG.HOSE Milton Parker Milton Dixon
PRICE 17.49 22.46 18.6138 25.44
437.25 561.50 465.35 636.00
25 ea. MFG.STK S-1144 14F11BB 1144 F03-02M
e). 1144 Mini Air Line Filters MFG.HOSE Milton Parker Milton Dixon
TOTAL ITEMH 761.95 1,274.10 867.91 1,265.20
I AIR FITTINGS TO INCLUDE TXDOT APPROVED AIR BRAKE FITTINGS PRICE 1.82 2.69 2.8852 2.68
MFG.STK 36.40 53.80 57.70 53.60
20 ea. 968-42 68PMT-42 1868x4 1868x4
a). 1868X4 Union Male Connector 1/4 IN MFG.HOSE Coronet Parker Weatherhead Weatherhead
PRICE 2.81 6.06 5.1079 4.75
56.20 121.20 102.16 95.00
20 ea. MFG.STK 962-4 62PMT-4 1862x4 1862x4
b). 1862X4 Both Sides Connector 1/4 IN MFG.HOSE Coronet Parker Weatherhead Weatherhead
PRICE 5.68 7.85 8.148 7.57
113.60 157.00 162.96 151.40
20 ea. MFG.STK 969-1-42 169PMT-6-2 1869x6x2S 1869x6x2S
C). 1869X6X2S 3/8IN x 1 IN Swivel MFG.HOSE Coronet Parker Weatherhead Weatherhead
PRICE 251 5.18 4.4712 4.16
50.20 103.60 89.42 83.20
20 ea. MFG.STK 969-62 169PMTNS-6-4 1869x4 1869x4
d). 1869X4 Mill Elbow MFG.HOSE Coronet Parker Weatherhead Weatherhead
TOTAL ITEMI 256.40 435.60 412.25 383.20
J. AIR BRAKE NYLON TUBING PRICE 0.22 0.26 0.305 0.30
44.00 52.00 61.00 60.00
200 ft. MFG.STK 634-4 BK 1120-4A-Blk GA4NABTA NT10004BK-100
a). NT10004BK 1/4 inch MFG.HOSE Coronet Parker Gates Weatherhead
PRICE 0.44 0.48 0.57 0.80
44.00 48.00 57.00 80.00
100 ft. MFG.STK 634-6 BK 1120-6B-Blk GALNRBTA NT10006BK-100
b). NT10006BK 3/8 inch MFG.HOSE Coronet Parker Gates Weatherhead
PRICE 0.60 0.61 0.94 1.10
60.00 61.00 94.00 110.00
100 ft. MFG.STK 634-8 BK 1120-8B-Blk GABNABTA NT10008BK-100
C). NT10008BK-1/2 inch MFG.HOSE Coronet Parker Gates Weatherhead
TOTAL ITEMJ 148.00 161.00 212.00 250.00
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K. CLEAR BRAIDED TUBING PRICE 0.40 0.67 0.3736 0.47
120.00 201.00 112.08 141.00
300 ft. MFG.STK K3150-06 K3150-06 K3150-06 BPVC06
K3150-06 3/8" MFG.HOSE Kuriyama Kuriyama Kuriyama Kuriyama
PRICE 0.73 1.30 0.6552 0.84
73.00 130.00 65.52 84.00
100 ft. MFG.STK K3150-10 K3150-10 K3150-10 BPVC10
K3150-10 5/8" MFG.HOSE Kuriyama Kuriyama Kuriyama Kuriyama
PRICE 1.32 2.28 1.2082 1.66
264.00 456.00 241.64 332.00
200 ft. MFG.STK K3150-16 K3150-16 K3150-16 BPVC16
K3150-16 1" MFG.HOSE Kuriyama Kuriyama Kuriyama Kuriyama
TOTAL ITEM K 457.00 787.00 419.24 557.00
L. TANK HOSE PRICE 7.04 13.80 7.0839 8.93
704.00 1,380.00 708.39 893.00
100 ft. MFG.STK T605AA250 2 1/2" Flexwing 2 1/2 Longhorn T605AA250
a). TANK HOSE 2 1/2 Inches Rubber with Wire Helix MFG.HOSE Kuriyama Goodyear Gates Kuriyama
M. DISCHARGE HOSES (LAY FLAT) PRICE 30.05 53.36 37.9634 52.50
150.25 266.80 189.82 262.50
5ea. MFG.STK BluenF200 2" Primeline 2" Spiroflex Blue
a). Discharge Hose 2 IN x 50 FT w/male & female camlocks MFG.HOSE Kuriyama Goodyear Goodyear Kuriyama
PRICE 86.95 157.40 120.6696 113.39
260.85 472.20 362.01 340.17
3ea. MFG.STK BluenF300 3" Primeline 3" Spiroflex Blue
b). Discharge Hose 3 IN x 100 FT w/male & female camlocks layflat discharge MFG.HOSE Kuriyama Goodyear Goodyear Kuriyama
PRICE 72.53 124.32 79.923 131.88
3ea. 217.59 372.96 239.77 395.64
Discharge Hose 4 IN, 1D 50 feet blue w/male & female camlocks layflat MFG.STK Bluenf400 4" Primeline 4" Spiroflex Blue
C). discharge punch lok and band-it MFG.HOSE Kuriyama Goodyear Goodyear Kuriyama
PRICE 154.75 245.69 193.8990 290.06
2 ea. 309.50 491.38 387.80 580.12
Discharge Hose 6 IN, 1D 50 feet blue w/male & female camlocks layflat MFG.STK Bluenf600 6" Primeline 6" Spiroflex Blue
d). discharge punch lok and band-it MFG.HOSE Kuriyama Goodyear Goodyear Kuriyama
TOTAL ITEM M 938.19 1,603.34 1,179.39 1,578.43
N. VACUUM HOSES PRICE 8.06 13.38 11.52
32.24 No Bid 53.52 46.08
4 ea. MFG.STK 15COWSC4 11/2 Tiger Tail Genesis
a). Vacuum Hose 1 1/2 inches 4 feet assembly PVC w/end cuffs MFG.HOSE Flexaust Flexhaust Flexhaust
PRICE 12.59 26.76 17.98
50.36 No Bid 107.04 71.92
4ea. MFG.STK 150COWSC8 11/2 Tiger Tail Genesis
b). Vacuum Hose 1 1/2 inches 8 feet assembly PVC w/end cuffs MFG.HOSE Flexaust Flexhaust Flexhaust
TOTAL ITEMN 82.60 No Bid 160.56 118.00
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0. SUCTION HOSES PRICE 125.93 201.36 197.4484 200.22
755.58 1,208.16 1,184.69 1,201.32
6 ea. MFG.STK 2" Plicord 2" Barracuda T202AA200
a). Suction Hose 2 inches layflat 50 feet long w/male & female camlocks MFG.HOSE Goodyear Gates Kuriyama
PRICE 256.35 293.90 330.6184 313.83
2,050.80 2,351.20 2,644.95 2,510.64
8ea. MFG.STK 3" Plicord 3" Barracuda T202AA300
b). Suction Hose 3 inches NPT Threaded Ends; 50 feet long black EPDM tube MFG.HOSE Goodyear Gates Kuriyama
PRICE 88.79 102.03 121.0034 124.21
70 ea. 6,215.30 7,142.10 8,470.24 8,694.70
Suction Hose 3 inches NPT Threaded Ends; 15 feet long black EPDM tube MFG.STK T202AA315 3x15 Plicord 3" Barracuda T202AA300x15
C). punch lok and band-it MFG.HOSE Kuriyama Goodyear Gates Kuriyama
PRICE 495.73 558.48 520.4584 580.34
5 ea. 2,478.65 2,792.40 2,602.29 2,901.70
Suction Hose 3 inches NPT Threaded Ends; 100 feet long black EPDM tube MFG.STK T202AA3100 3 x 100 Plicord 3" Barracuda T202AA300X100
d). punch lok and band-it MFG.HOSE Kuriyama Goodyear Gates Kuriyama
PRICE 169.93 267.82 196.767 238.71
1,359.44 2,142.56 1,574.14 1,909.68
8ea. MFG.STK T202AA420 4" Plicord 4" Barracuda T202AA400
e). Suction Hose 4 Inches w/male & Female camlocks material rubber 20 feet MFG.HOSE Kuriyama Goodyear Gates Kuriyama
PRICE 381.75 411.29 562.509 566.67
6 ea. 2,290.50 2,467.74 3,375.05 3,400.02
Suction Hose 6 inches w/male & female camlocks material rubber; 20 feet MFG.STK T202AA620 6" Plicord 6" Barracuda T202AA600
f). long punch lok and band-it MFG.HOSE Kuriyama Goodyear Gates Kuriyama
TOTAL ITEM O 15,150.27 18,104.16 19,851.36 20,618.06
P. HYDRANT HOSES (PSI 112) PRICE 44.09 82.66 89.27 76.30
2 ea. 88.18 165.32 178.54 152.60
Hydrant Hose (Mill Hose) 1 1/2 inches x 50 feet NST thread brass male/swival MFG.STK SIMD150 M15-50KAF M15 M15-50KAF
a). female material poly woven rubber lined single jacket punch lok and band-it MFG.HOSE Kuriyama Dixon Dixon Dixon
PRICE 51.72 90.59 91.57 90.59
2 ea. 103.44 181.18 183.14 181.18
Hydrant Hose (Mill Hose) 2 inches x 50 feet NPSH thread brass male/swivel MFG.STK SIMD250 M20-50KAS M20 M20-50KAS
b). female material poly woven rubber lined single jacket punch lok and band-it MFG.HOSE Kuriyama Dixon Dixon Dixon
PRICE 74.42 126.79 165.73 117.04
3ea. 223.26 380.37 497.19 351.12
Hydrant Hose (Mill Hose) 2 1/2 inches x 50 feet NST thread brass male/swivel MFG.STK SIMD2550 M25-50KAF M25 M25-50KAF
C). female material poly woven rubber lined single jacket punch lok and band-it MFG.HOSE Kuriyama Dixon Dixon Dixon
PRICE 80.68 138.63 177.64 138.63
2 ea. 161.36 277.26 355.28 277.26
Hydrant hose (Mill Hose) 3 inches X 50 feet NPSH Thread Brass Male/Swival MFG.STK SIMD350 M30-50KAS M30 M30-50KAS
d). female material poly woven rubber lined single jacket MFG.HOSE Kuriyama Dixon Dixon Dixon
PRICE 125.05 477.37 265.50 262.42
4 ea. 500.20 1,909.48 1,062.00 1,049.68
Hydrant hose (Mill Hose) 4 inches X 50 feet NPSH Thread brass male/swivel MFG.STK SIMDA450 N/A M40 M40-50vVC
e). female material polyster rubber lined single jacket punch lok and band-it MFG.HOSE Kuriyama Dixon Dixon
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Q. FIRE HOSE NOZZLES PRICE 55.33 73.76 71.38 69.55
331.98 442.56 428.28 417.30
6 ea. MFG.STK BFN150NST BFN150NST BFN150NST BFN150NST
a). Fire Nozzle Brass 1 1/2 Inch NST thread w/rubber bumper Part#BFN150NST MFG.HOSE Dixon Dixon Dixon Dixon
PRICE 127.46 169.96 164.44 160.24
764.76 1,019.76 986.64 961.44
6 ea. MFG.STK BFN200 BFN200 BFN200 BFN200
b). Fire Nozzle brass 2 Inch NPSH thread w/rubber bumper Part#BFN200 MFG.HOSE Dixon Dixon Dixon Dixon
PRICE 122.50 163.33 161.31 154.00
735.00 979.98 967.86 924.00
6 ea. MFG.STK BFN250NST BFN250NST BFN250NST BFN250NST
C). Fire Nozzle brass 2 1/2 Inch NST thread w/rubber bumper Part #BFN250NST MFG.HOSE Dixon Dixon Dixon Dixon
TOTAL ITEM Q 1,831.74 2,442.30 2,382.78 2,302.74
R. FIRE HOSES (PSI 135) PRICE 107.19 140.29 138.30 134.75
535.95 701.45 691.50 673.75
5 ea. MFG.STK A315-50 A515-50 A315-50RBF A315-50RBF
a). Fire Hose 1 1/2 Inch x 50 feet NST thread brass male/swival female MFG.HOSE Dixon Dixon Dixon Dixon
PRICE 186.20 255.92 249.34
558.60 767.76 748.02
3ea. MFG.STK N/A A325-50RBF A325-50RBF
b). Fire Hose 2 1/2 Inches x 50 feet NST thread brass male/swival female MFG.HOSE Dixon Dixon Dixon
TOTAL ITEMR 535.95 701.45 691.50 673.75
S. GARDEN HOSE PRICE 35.44 69.48 28.56 47.32
18 ea. 637.92 1,250.64 514.08 851.76
Garden Hose 3/4 inch, ID 175 PSI 50 feet long male/female 3/4" garden hose MFG.STK ARTWOT75MF 3/4"x 50" Horizon CGWH-1250 ACWT750BK50MF
a). thread MFG.HOSE Flex-Tech Goodyear Flextech Flextech
PRICE 26.82 49.82 22.34 32.09
670.50 1,245.50 558.50 802.25
25 ea. MFG.STK ARTWO062550MF 5/8"x 50" Horizon CGWH-1050 ACWO0625BK50MF
b). Garden Hose 5/8 inch ID 175 PSI 50 feet long male/female 3/4" garden hose thread MFG.HOSE Flex-Tech Goodyear Flextech Flextech
PRICE 63.03 115.42 84.71 77.23
5 ea. 315.15 577.10 42355 386.15
Contractor Water Hose 1 inch 175 PSI material rubber w/rugged truck tire core MFG.STK ARTW1000-50MF 1"x 50" Horizon 1" Adaptaflex ART1000-50MF
C). 50 feet long male/female 1 inch NST thread MFG.HOSE Flex-Tech Goodyear Gates Flextech
PRICE 2.20 3.56 1.64 2.55
39.60 64.08 29.52 45.90
18 ea. MFG.STK 30-063 71GH-12-12 12GHM-12MP BAT776
d). Connector for gardenhose 3/4 inch brass male GHT x male NPT MFG.HOSE Midland Parker Dixon Dixon
TOTAL ITEM S 1,663.17 3,137.32 1,525.65 2,086.06
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T. NOZZLES FOR HOSES PRICE 13.19 20.12 17.02 18.98
92.33 140.84 119.14 132.86
7 ea. MFG.STK BN6 BN6 BN6 BN6
a). Brass Nozzle, 3/4" 6 inches long MFG.HOSE Dixon Dixon Dixon Dixon
PRICE 17.83 23.77 23.00 2241
178.30 237.70 230.00 224.10
10 ea. MFG.STK BN10 BN10 BN10 BN10
b). Brass Nozzle, 1" 8 inches long MFG.HOSE Dixon Dixon Dixon Dixon
TOTAL ITEM T 270.63 378.54 349.14 356.96
u. CLEAR VINYL TUBING PRICE 0.10
N/A 10.00 N/A No Bid
100 ea. MFG.STK K010-02-03
a). Clear Vinyl Tubing 1/8 IN ID & 3/16 IN OD MFG.HOSE Kuriyama
PRICE 0.06 0.10 0.08 0.0905
30.00 50.00 40.00 45.25
500 ea. MFG.STK K0500204 K010-02-04 K010-0204 CPVC0204
b). Clear Vinyl Tubing 1/8 IN ID & 1/4 IN OD MFG.HOSE Kuriyama Kuriyama Kuriyama Kuriyama
PRICE 0.09 0.15 0.12 0.1487
15.30 25.50 20.40 25.28
170 ea. MFG.STK K0500406 K010-04-06 K010-0406 CPVC0406
C). Clear Vinyl Tubing 1/4 IN ID & 3/8 OD MFG.HOSE Kuriyama Kuriyama Kuriyama Kuriyama
PRICE 0.09 0.35 0.12 0.1487
1,233.00 4,795.00 1,644.00 2,037.19
13,700 ea. MFG.STK K0500406 K3150-04 K010-0406 CPVC0406
d). Clear PVC Vinyl Tubing 1/4 inch 1/4 1D & 3/8 OD MFG.HOSE Kuriyama Kuriyama Kuriyama Kuriyama
PRICE 0.08 0.17 0.07 0.1274
8.00 17.00 7.00 12.74
100 ea. MFG.STK K0500305 E-43-0100 K010-0304 CPVC0304
e). Clear Poly Tubing 3/16 IN ID 1/4 OD MFG.HOSE Kuriyama Parker Kuriyama Kuriyama
PRICE 0.21 0.35 0.22 0.2837
63.00 105.00 66.00 85.11
300 ea. MFG.STK K0500609 K010-06-09 K010-0609 CPVC0609
f). Clear Vinyl Tubing 3/8 IN ID & 9/16 IN OD MFG.HOSE Kuriyama Kuriyama Kuriyama Kuriyama
PRICE 0.16 0.26 0.43 0.3187
96.00 156.00 258.00 191.22
600 ea. MFG.STK K0500810 K010-08-10 K010-0810 CPVC0810
9). Clear Vinyl Tubing 1/2 IN ID & 5/8 IN OD MFG.HOSE Kuriyama Kuriyama Kuriyama Kuriyama
PRICE 0.29 0.57 0.43 0.4149
116.00 228.00 172.00 165.96
400 ea. MFG.STK K0501013 K010-08-12 K010-1012 CPVC1012
h). Clear Vinyl Tubing 5/8 IN ID & 3/4 IN OD MFG.HOSE Kuriyama Kuriyama Kuriyama Kuriyama
PRICE 0.45 0.78 0.63 0.4779
945.00 1,638.00 1,323.00 1,003.59
2,100 ea. MFG.STK K0501216 K010-12-16 K010-1216 CPVC1216
i). Clear Vinyl Tubing 3/4 IN ID & One IN OD MFG.HOSE Kuriyama Kuriyama Kuriyama Kuriyama
TOTAL ITEM U 2,506.30 7,024.50 3,530.40 3,566.34
GRAND TOTAL ITEMS A-U TOTAL 27,393.14 40,738.42 36,570.33 37,858.88
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TABULATION OF BIDS L 2 g S % g
S © "~ © © = ©
T =~ L5 ~ ?ti ~ = ~
proposaL  Annual Contract for 5 Ix 8 . X E & X S gx
o o ) >= = Er-a ®2F
FOR! Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water, Fuel & Industrial I 29 2,9 T8 g oS¢
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ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY < ':r % = % % < m % % E‘ %
EMERGENCY REQUEST (after hours)
FLAT HOURLY RATE
(From 5:01 PM to 6:59 AM) PRICE 25.00 0.00 95.00 25.00
Minimum Charge for after hours PRICE 25.00 0.00 0.00 25.00
FOR INSTALLATION OF EACH FITTING ON LENGTH OF HOSE PRICE N/C 0.00 0.00 0.00
DELIVERY AND SERVICE
DELIVERY
a). Delivery Days DAYS 2-3 days 2 days 3 days 1 day
8:00 am - 5:00 pm M-Fri.|  8:00 am - 6:00 pm 8:00 am - 5:00 pm 8:00 a.m.
BUSINESS 8:00 am - 2:00 pm Mon. - Fri. Mon. - Fri. 5:00 p.m.
b). Business Hours HOURS Saturday Mon-Fri
Net 1% 2% Net
Terms 30 days 20 days 20 days 30 days
BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
Alamo City Hydraulics SAWS Website

Awustin Distributing
San Antonio Belting & Pulley
Taylor Made Hose




