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P. 0. BOX 2449 g z >
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TABULATION OF BIDS =3 & %D - 2 :, S e R ©n S
. Q% z Ex z = > 2 x B 2
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for 2 g e a S H T A = 3 g e gEE
FOR: Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel § S .g .g 3 .g -“u; % .g % E .g 2 5 .g
S 58 g 3£ S g8 ake¢ T5¢E
TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) g3 E =1 (=1 TS g 2 538 8
=24 < =< 53 < £5< a0 <
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 24, 2005 g SO 8 £ s= =g =3 o z 3 o 292 2
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY < O Qt (‘/)q (‘/)q @) a (‘/)q [i‘“ % (‘/}q < m (‘/}q 2 l; (‘/}q
NORTHEAST SERVICE CENTER 8
ITEM 1 HYDRAULIC AND AIR HOSES - NESC Unit Price
A. Additional Estimated Usage =$2,500 Total .298 - Gates
Price Discount MFG.STK 0.337 - Milton
1. Discount off price list MFG. No Bid 0.371 - Weatherhead .38% - Flextral
Unit Price
Total
MFG.STK
2. Price list identification MFG. No Bid 35096-00 Flaxtral List Guide
Unit Price
Total
MFG.STK
3. Effective date of price list MFG. No Bid Nov. 15,2004 Feb. 1, 2005
Unit Price
Column of price list on which discount is based Total
MFG.STK
4. (Le.. wholesale, jobber, retail) MEG. n n No Bid List Retail
B. FITTINGS, COUPLINGS AND ADAPTERS Unit Price % %
Additional Estimated Usage = $6000 Total fu fu
Price Discount MFG.STK A 62 A 62
1. Discount off price list MFG. Ll T L o No Bid Various .38%
Unit Price |<_( 6 |<_( 6
Total = | = Milton 8x937 Breco/
MFG.STK 2 P 2 % Gates 39496-000
2. Price list identification MFG. |<£ — |<£ — No Bid Weatherhead Ind-00-04 Midland Metals
Unit Price — L = L
L L
Total O s O s Jan. 1, 2005
MFG.STK Z - Z -
3. Effective date of price list MFG. 9 O 9 O No Bid Feb. 1, 2005 Feb. 1, 2005
Unit Price mZ mZ
Total ﬂ ﬂ
Column of price list on which discount is based MFG.STK @) @)
4 (Le., wholesale, jobber, retail) MFG. o [m] No Bid Jobber - Cost Retail
C. 1 and 2 Wire Hoses Unit Price
SAE 100R1, Type AT (1 Wire Hoses) Total
BY THE FOOT MFG.STK
GATES MFG.
Unit Price 0.98 1.32
130 Total 127.40 171.60
4G1 MFG.STK 4G1 AX-04
a). GATES MFG. No Bid Gates Flextral
Unit Price 1.08 1.50
70 Total 75.60 105.00
6G1 MFG.STK 6G1 AX-06
b). GATES MFG. No Bid Gates Flextral
Unit Price 1.23 2.18
35 Total 43.05 76.30
8G1 MFG.STK 8G1 AX-08
). GATES MFG. No Bid Gates Flextral
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DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 24, 2005 g SO 8 £ s= =g SRR z 3 o 22 =
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY < U Qt (5,)“ (5,)“ U a (5,)“ [i‘“ % (‘/}q < m (‘/}q 2 l; (‘/}q
Unit Price 1.99 2.80
10 Total 19.90 28.00
12G1 MFG.STK 12G1 AX-12
d). GATES MFG. No Bid Gates Flextral
SAE 100R2, AT/EN 853 2SN (2 Wire Hoses) Unit Price
BY THE FOOT Total
MFG.STK
GATES MFG.
Unit Price 1.23 1.67
25 Total 30.75 41.75
AG2 MFG.STK AG2 EX-04
a). GATES MFG. No Bid Gates Flextral
Unit Price 1.44 1.97
75 Total 108.00 147.75
6G2 MFG.STK 6G2 EX-06
b). GATES MFG. %) %) No Bid Gates Flextral
Unit Price Z Z 1.65 2.15
195 Total o o 32175 41925
8G2 MFG.STK e R 8G2 EX-08
o). GATES MFG. [a NS [(a NS No Bid Gates Flextral
FITTINGS (FOR 1 AND 2 WIRE HOSES) Unit Price E E E E
EACH Total S (Lﬁ S (Lﬁ
MFG.STK O o
MFG. g ) g n
Unit Price = E = E 1.61 2.03
16 Total = w = w 25.76 32.48
6G-GMP MFG.STK % = % = 6G-GMP E06-06MP
a). GATES MFG. a |5 a |5 No Bid Gates Flextral
Unit Price E = E > 1.80 2.28
12 Total o o 21.60 27.36
8G-8MP MFG.STK L L 8G-8MP E08-08MP
b). GATES MFG. 8 8 No Bid Gates Flextral
Unit Price 2.82 3.58
8 Total 22.56 28.64
8G-10FJX MFG.STK 8G-10F JX E08-10FJ
). GATES MFG. No Bid Gates Flextral
Unit Price 5.02 6.77
8 Total 40.16 54.16
10G-12FJX MFG.STK 10G-12F JX E10-12F)
d). GATES MFG. No Bid Gates Flextral
Unit Price 10.73 13.62
8 Total 85.84 108.96
12G-12FJX 90M MFG.STK 12G-12FJX 90M E12-12FJ90
e). GATES MFG. No Bid Gates Flextral
Unit Price 4.68 7.33
8 Total 37.44 58.64
12G-16MJ MFG.STK 12G-16MJ E12-16MJ
). GATES MFG. No Bid Gates Flextral
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ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY < U Qt (‘/)q (‘/)q U a (‘/)q [i‘“ % (‘/}q < m (‘/}q 2 l; (‘/}q
D. A 11 Hoses Unit Price
SAE 100 RS, Type All Total
(Must meet SAE J1402 and DOTFMVSS 106-74) MFG.STK
BY THE FOOT MFG.
Unit Price 1.74 2.11
10 Total 17.40 21.10
6C5C MFG.STK 6C5C GLO06
a). GATES MFG. No Bid Gates Dayco
Unit Price 1.83 2.23
10 Total 1830 22.30
8C5C MFG.STK 8C5C GLO8
b). GATES MFG. No Bid Gates Dayco
Unit Price 2.78 3.49
10 Total 1) ) 27.80 34.90
12¢5C MFG.STK Z Z 12C5C GL12
0. GATES MFG. o o No Bid Gates Dayco
FITTINGS (For A Il Hoses) Unit Price R R
EACH Total [a NP [aNP)
MFG.STK T M
e 58 58
Unit Price 2 2 3.55 4.74
20 Total é-f %) g %) 71.00 94.80
6C5-4RMP MFG.STK [ E [ E 6C5-4RMP 2R06-04MP
a). GATES MFG. =W = W No Bid Gates Flextral
Unit Price % = % = 3.77 5.20
20 Total a |5 a |5 75.40 104.00
8C5-8RMP MFG.STK o> o> 8C5-4RMP 2R08-08MP
b). GATES MFG. %) %) No Bid Gates Flextral
Unit Price L L 7.82 7.60
20 Total 8 8 156.40 152.00
12C5-12RMP MFG.STK 12C5-12RMP 2R12-12MP
). GATES MFG. No Bid Gates Flextral
Unit Price 3.00 5.55
20 Total 60.00 111.00
6C5-6RFIX MFG.STK 6C5-6RFJX 2R06-06F)
d). GATES MFG. No Bid Gates Flextral
Unit Price 3.78 7.12
20 Total 75.60 142.40
8C5-8RFISX MFG.STK 8C5-8RFJSX 2R08-08F)
e). GATES MFG. No Bid Gates Flextral
Unit Price 8.57 10.51
20 Total 171.40 210.20
12C5-12RFIX MFG.STK 12C5-12RFJX 2R12-12F)
). GATES MFG. No Bid Gates Flextral
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ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY < O Qt (‘Aq (‘Aq @) a (‘Aq [i‘“ % (‘Aq < m (‘Aq 2 l; (‘Aq
E. 4 Wire Spiral Hoses Unit Price
BY THE FOOT Total
SAE 100R12, Type AT MFG.STK
GATES MFG.
Unit Price 4.22 7.44
15 Total 63.30 111.60
12C12M MFG.STK 12C12M NX-12
a). GATES MFG. No Bid Gates Flextral
Unit Price 5.48 10.60
26 Total 142.48 275.60
16C12M MFG.STK 16C12M NX-16
b). GATES MFG. No Bid Gates Flextral
Unit Price 9.40 13.55
5 Total 47.00 67.75
20C12M MFG.STK 20C12M NX-20
). GATES MFG. on on No Bid Gates Flextral
Fitting for 4 Wire Sprial Hose Unit Price pd Z
To include GS Couplings, Gerrules Total 9 9
MFG.STK e R
GATES MFG. 0o 0o
Unit Price M M 9.00 11.42
10 Total S (Lﬁ S (Lﬁ 90.00 114.20
16GS-16FJX+16GS1F-4 MFG.STK 2 2 16GS-16FJX+16GS1F-4 N16-16FJ
a). GATES MFG. é-f 73} é-f n No Bid Gates Flextral
Unit Price ~ E ~ E 12.91 0.00
10 Total = w = w 129.10 0.00
12GS-16MB+12GS1F-4 MFG.STK % = % = 12GS-16MB+12GS1F-4 No Quote
b). GATES MFG. a |5 a |5 No Bid Gates Flextral
Unit Price o = o = 9.93 13.37
10 Total %)) %) 99.30 133.70
16GS-16MJ+16GS1F-4 MFG.STK L L 16GS-16MJ+16GS1F-4 N16-16MJ
). GATES MFG. 8 8 No Bid Gates Flextral
Unit Price 21.51 27.60
10 Total 215.10 276.00
16GS-16FJX90M+16GS1F-4 MFG.STK 16GS-16FJX90M+16GS1F-4 N16-16FJ90
d). GATES MFG. No Bid Gates Flextral
Unit Price 14.24 19.21
10 Total 142.40 192.10
12GS-12FL45+12GS1F-4 MFG.STK 12GS-12FL45+12GS1F-4 N12-12FL45
e). GATES MFG. No Bid Gates Flextral
Unit Price 17.89 22.72
10 Total 178.90 227.20
20GS-20FJX+20GS1F-4 MFG.STK 20GS-20FJX+20GS1F-4 N20-20FJ
). GATES MFG. No Bid Gates Flextral
Unit Price 16.40 20.82
10 Total 164.00 208.20
20GS-20FL+20GS1F-4 MFG.STK 20GS-20FL+20GS1F-4 N20-20FL
2). GATES MFG. No Bid Gates Flextral
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ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY < U Qt (‘Aq (‘Aq U a (‘Aq [i‘“ % (‘Aq < m (‘Aq 2 l; (‘Aq
Unit Price 29.06 52.80
10 Total 290.60 528.00
20 GS-20FJX 90+20GS1F-4 MFG.STK 20 GS-20FJX 90+20GS1F-4 N20-20FJ90
h). GATES MFG. No Bid Gates Flextral
Unit Price 24.24 32.69
10 Total 242.40 326.90
20GS-20FL 90M+20GS1F-4 MFG.STK 20GS-20FL 90M+20GS1F-4 N20-20FL90
i). GATES MFG. No Bid Gates Flextral
AIR HOSES PS 500 Unit Price
BY THE FOOT Total
MFG.STK
GATES MFG.
Unit Price 0.93 1.09
500 Total 465.00 545.00
1/4" - Terminator MFG.STK 1/4" - Terminator 1/4 Gorilla
a). GATES MFG. on on No Bid Gates Goodyear
Unit Price Z Z 1.05 1.35
500 Total o o 525.00 675.00
3/8" - Terminator MFG.STK ) ':( ) ':( 3/8" - Terminator 3/8 Gorilla
b). GATES MFG. [(a NS [(a NS No Bid Gates Goodyear
Unit Price M M 1.37 1.87
500 Total g (Lﬁ g (Lﬁ 685.00 935.00
1/2" - Terminator MFG.STK 2 2 1/2" - Terminator 1/2 Gorilla
©). GATES MFG. g (75} g w No Bid Gates Goodyear
Unit Price — E — E 1.84 2.52
500 Total = w = w 920.00 1,260.00
3/4" - Terminator MFG.STK g = g = 3/4" - Terminator 3/4 Gorilla
d). GATES MFG. a I5 a I5 No Bid Gates Goodyear
G. AIR COUPLERS Unit Price o = o =
EACH Total %) %))
MFG.STK % %
MILTON MFG. a a
Unit Price 0.69 0.68
15 Total 10.35 10.20
727 MFG.STK 727 B-B2M2-S
a). MILTON MFG. No Bid Milton Breco
Unit Price 8.50 8.92
10 Total 85.00 89.20
1816 MFG.STK 1816 B-4CM4-S
b). MILTON MFG. No Bid Milton Breco
Unit Price 2.10 234
10 Total 21.00 23.40
1817 MFG.STK 1817 B-B4M4-S
). MILTON MFG. No Bid Milton Breco
Unit Price 0.74 0.63
12 Total 8.88 7.56
728 MFG.STK 728 B-B2F2-S
d). MILTON MFG. No Bid Milton Breco
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ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY < U f"— (‘/)q (‘/)q U a (‘/)q [i‘“ % (‘/}q < m (‘/}q 2 l;l‘ (‘/}q
Unit Price 7.70 12.42
10 Total 77.00 124.20
153 MFG.STK 153 153
e). MILTON MFG. No Bid Milton Milton
Unit Price 3.10 3.27
50 Total 155.00 163.50
715 MFG.STK 715 B-2CF-2-B
). MILTON MFG. No Bid Milton Breco
Unit Price 20.60 23.90
40 Total 824.00 956.00
1144 MFG.STK 1144 MF-100
2). MILTON MFG. No Bid Milton Breco
H. AIR FITTINGS Unit Price
EACH Total
MFG.STK
WEATHERHEAD MFG. 1) 1)
Unit Price Z Z 1.74 0.86
25 Total o o 4350 2150
1868X4 MFG.STK e R 1868X4 38-073
a). WEATHERHEAD MFG. 0o oo No Bid Weatherhead Midland Metals
Y L = =
Unit Price [ [ 3.07 1.71
25 Total g O <O 76.75 42.75
L = w
1862X4 MFG.STK O O 1862X4 620400
b). WEATHERHEAD MFG. é-f %) é-f %) No Bid Weatherhead Midland Metals
Unit Price [ E [ E 4.81 1.41
25 Total = w = w 120.25 35.25
1869X6X2S MFG.STK g = g = 1869X6X2S 38-094
o). WEATHERHEAD MFG. a I5 a I5 No Bid Weatherhead Midland Metals
Unit Price o> o> 2.69 1.17
25 Total ) ) 67.25 29.25
1869X4 MFG.STK L L 1869X4 38-091
d). WEATHERHEAD MFG. 8 8 No Bid Weatherhead Midland Metals
L AIR NYLON TUBING Unit Price
BY THE FOOT Total
MFG.STK
WEATHERHEAD MFG.
Unit Price 0.11 0.11
100 Total 11.00 11.00
NT10002BK-100 MFG.STK NT10002BK-100 4246-02207
a). WEATHERHEAD MFG. No Bid Weatherhead St. Gobain
Unit Price 0.18 0.22
100 Total 18.00 22.00
NT10004BK-100 MFG.STK NT10004BK-100 4246-04106
b). WEATHERHEAD MFG. No Bid Weatherhead St. Gobain
Unit Price 0.37 0.32
100 Total 37.00 32.00
NT10006BK-100 MFG.STK NT10006BK-100 3250-06104
). WEATHERHEAD MFG. No Bid Weatherhead St. Gobain
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ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY < O Qt (‘,}“ (5,)“ @) a (5,)“ li‘“ % (5,)“ < m (5,)“ 2 l; (5,)“
Unit Price 0.57 0.54
100 Total 57.00 54.00
NT10008BK-100 MFG.STK NT10008BK-100 3250-08104
d). WEATHERHEAD MFG. No Bid Weatherhead St. Gobain
Unit Price
Total
MFG.STK 80.00 Serv Call
EMERGENCY REQUEST PLAT HOURLY RATE MFG. No Bid 25.00 80.00
Unit Price
Total
MFG.STK
FOR INSTALLATION OF EACH FITTING OF HOSE MFG. %) %) No Bid 0.00 0.00
Unit Price Z Z
Total 9 9
= =
MFG.STK L < L <
Delivery Days MFG. a &) a &) No Bid 3 days 1-7 days
Unit Price [ [ 8:00 am - 5:00 pm 8:00 am - 5:00 pm
< <
Total 3 8 3 8
MFG.STK 2 2 Mon.-Fri.
Business Hours/Days per week MFG. g [0} g w No Bid Mon.-Fri. 24 hr on call 7 days/wk
iy iy
Ll Ll
Subtotal = w = w 16,169.67 18,270.65
o= o=
NORTHWEST SERVICE CENTER a |5 a |5
ITEM 11 HYDRAULIC AND AIR HOSES - NWSC Unit Price o = o = * wn
A. Additional Estimated Usage = $2,500 Total %) %) %
MFG.STK % % Parker =
. . . <
L Price Di MFG. a a 70% No Bid 8 S
Unit Price ==
< =
Total . 8
MFG.STK 2 &
2. Price list identification MFG. PL4400 No Bid ﬁ =
Unit Price = E
Total % =
MFG.STK a5
3. Effective date of price list MFG. May 3, 2004 No Bid E Z
i Pri ©n
Unit Price m
Total 8
Column of price list on which discount is based MFG.STK
4. (Le., wholesale, jobber, retail) MFG. Retail No Bid
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— (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) Y é % % g % = 5 % a3 % 23 %
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 24, 2005 EE S é‘}: z §§ z 28 s
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY < O A »n »nn U = v wn < v N 2 <+
Unit Price
Total
MFG.STK
FITTINGS COUPLINGS AND ADAPTERS MFG.
B. Additional Estimated Usage = $6,000 Unit Price
Price Discount Total
MFG.STK
1. Discount off price list MFG. 70% No Bid
Unit Price
Total
MFG.STK
2. Price list identification MFG. %) %) PL4400 No Bid %)
Unit Price Z Z Z
Total 9 9 9
= = =
. o MFG.STK R R . R
3. Effective date of price list MFG. B (&) B &) May 3, 2004 No Bid B [S)
Unit Price = E = E = E
Total 5 (@] 5 (@] 5 O
Column of price list on which discount is based MFG.STK ) E ) E - E
4. (Le., wholesale, jobber, retail) MFG. g %) g %) Retail No Bid g %)
C. 1 and 2 Wire Hoses Unit Price [ E [ E [ E
SAE 100R1, Type AT (1 Wire Hoses) Total = w = w = w
o o o
MFG.STK > = > = > =
The Gates Rubber Co. MFG. = = =
Unit Price 9 ) 9 ) 1.29 9 )
mZ mZ - mZ
130 Total o o 167.70 N
4G1 MFG.STK % % 421-4 %
a). GATES MF.G. : a a Parker No Bid a
Unit Price 1.35
70 Total 94.50
6G1 MFG.STK 421-6
b). GATES MFG. Parker No Bid
Unit Price 1.53
35 Total 53.55
8G1 MFG.STK 421-8
). GATES MFG. Parker No Bid
Unit Price 2.64
10 Total 26.40
12G1 MFG.STK 421-12
d). GATES MFG. Parker No Bid
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— (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) Y é % % é % = 5 % a3 % 23 %
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 24, 2005 E : Sz S % T3 %3 z 72
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY < O A »n wnn O S wn = % ) < % ) 2 l:r wn
SAE 100R2, AT/EN 853 2SN (2 Wire Hoses) Unit Price
Total
MFG.STK
The Gates Rubber Co. MFG.
a). Unit Price 1.54
25 Total 38.50
AG2 MFG.STK 3014
GATES MFG. Parker No Bid
Unit Price 1.77
75 Total 132.75
6G2 MFG.STK 301-6
b). GATES MFG. Parker No Bid
Unit Price 2.02
o WFasTI 2 2 e 2
o). GATES MFG. o o Parker No Bid O
FITTINGS (For 1 and 2 Wire Hoses) Unit Price R R B
Total B O B ) B &)
MFGSTK T T T
The Gates Rubber Co. MFG. < O < O < O
- = w = w = w
Unit Price ) o ) o 243 - o
16 Total g %) g %) 38.88 g %)
6G-6MP MFG.STK [ E [ E 10143-6-6 = E
a). GATES MFG. = w = w Parker No Bid = w
Unit Price % = % = 2.79 g =
12 Total a I5 a I5 33.48 a I5
8G-8MP MFG.STK m =z m =z 10143-8-8 m =
b). GATES MFG. %) %) Parker No Bid )
Unit Price % % 3.87 %
8 Total A A 30.96 A
8G-10FJX MFG.STK 10643-10-8
). GATES MFG. Parker No Bid
Unit Price 6.36
8 Total 50.88
10G-12FJX MFG.STK 10643-12-10
d). GATES MFG. Parker No Bid
Unit Price 14.08
8 Total 112.64
12G-12FJX 90M MFG.STK 13943-12-12
e). GATES MFG. Parker No Bid
Unit Price 7.84
8 Total 62.72
12G-16MJ MFG.STK 10343-16-12
). GATES MFG. Parker No Bid
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P. 0. BOX 2449 g z >
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 2 S % g g & = £ Z
TABULATION OF BIDS 2 x _%‘) o 2 T 2 e R % S
. Q% z Ex z = > 2 x B 2
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for 2 g e a S H T A = 3 g e gEE
FOR: Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel § S .g .g 3 .g -“u; % .g % E .g 2 5 .g
- g gée S g8 AE S T5¢E
TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) g3 E =1 (=1 TS g 2 538 8
=A< < B< 53 < E£S < S5 <
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 24, 2005 g SO 8 £ s= =g =3 o z 3 o 292 2
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY < U Qt (‘,}“ (5,)“ U a (5,)“ [i‘“ % (‘/}q < m (‘/}q 2 l; (‘/}q
D. A 11 Hoses Unit Price
SAE 100R5, Type AIl (Must meet SAE J1402 Total
and DOTFMVSS 106-74) MFG.STK
The Gates Rubber Co. MFG.
Unit Price 2.58
10 Total 25.80
6C5C MFG.STK 201-6
a). GATES MFG. Parker No Bid
Unit Price 2.71
10 Total 27.10
8C5C MFG.STK 201-8
b). GATES MFG. Parker No Bid
Unit Price 4.30
10 Total %) %) 43.00 %)
12C5C MFG.STK Z Z 201-12 pd
o). GATES MFG. o o Parker No Bid O
FITTINGS (For A I Hoses) Unit Price R R B
Total [al'S) [l [al'S)
MFG.STK g g g
The Gates Rubber Co. MFG. < O < O No Bid < O
- = = 1w T
Unit Price ) o ) o 3.46 - o
20 Total g %) g ) 69.20 g )
6C5-4RMP MFG.STK [ E [ E 20120-4-6 [ E
a). GATES MFG. = w = w Parker No Bid = w
Unit Price % = % = 5.17 g =
20 Total a I5 a I5 103.40 a I5
8C5-8RMP MFG.STK m = oM = 20120-8-8 m =
b). GATES MFG. ) ) Parker No Bid )
Unit Price L L 9.84 L
20 Total 8 8 196.80 8
12C5-12RMP MFG.STK 20120-12-12
). GATES MFG. Parker No Bid
Unit Price 3.78
20 Total 75.60
6C5-6C5-6RFIX MFG.STK 20620-6-6
d). GATES MFG. Parker No Bid
Unit Price 5.07
20 Total 101.40
8C5-R-8RFISX MFG.STK 20620-8-8
). GATES MFG. Parker No Bid
Unit Price 11.92
20 Total 238.40
12C5-12RFJX MFG.STK 20620-12-12
). GATES MFG. Parker No Bid
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEN z k)
P. 0. BOX 2449 g z >
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 k S % g g & = & =z
TABULATION OF BIDS 2 z _%“ 2 x :, x &b < x n S
PRI 5 =2x A S 2~ B e
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for 2 g e a S H T A = 3 g e gEE
FOR: Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel § S .g .g 3 .g -“u; % .g % E .g 2 5 .g
- g 3£ S g8 AE S T5¢E
TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) g3 E =1 (=1 TS g 2 538 8
=A< < B< 53 < E£S < S5 <
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 24, 2005 g SO 8 £ s= =g =3 o z 3 o 292 2
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY < O Qt (‘/)q (‘/)q @) a (‘/)q [i‘“ % (‘/}q < m (‘/}q 2 l; (‘/}q
E. 4 Wire Spiral Hoses Unit Price
SAE 100R12, Type AT Total
MFG.STK
The Gates Rubber Co. MFG.
Unit Price 6.01
15 Total 90.15
12C12M MFG.STK 772TC-12
a). GATES MFG. Parker No Bid
Unit Price 7.27
26 Total 189.02
16C12M MFG.STK 772TC-16
b). GATES MFG. Parker No Bid
Unit Price 13.84
5 Total %) %) 69.20 %)
20C12M MFG.STK pd Z 772TC-20 pd
o). GATES MFG. o o Parker No Bid o
Fitting for 4 Wire Sprial Hose Unit Price \ E \ E \ E
To include GS Couplings, Gerrules Total [m)] O [m] O )] (@)
MFG.STK g g g
The Gates Rubber Co. Stock No. MFG. < O <O < O
= = = 1w T
Unit Price D o - o 13.75 - o
10 Total g ) g %) 137.50 g )
16GS-16FIX+16GS1F-4 MFG.STK [ E [ E 10671-16-16 [ E
a). GATES MFG. = w = w Parker No Bid = w
Unit Price % = % = 15.03 g =
10 Total a I5 a I5 150.30 a I5
12GS-16MB+12GS1F-4 MFG.STK m = m > 10571-16-12 o =
b). GATES MFG. o o Parker No Bid on
Unit Price L L 18.90 L
10 Total 8 8 189.00 8
16GS-16MJ+16GS1F-4 MFG.STK 10371-16-16
). GATES MFG. Parker No Bid
Unit Price 34.87
10 Total 348.70
16GS-16FJX90M+16GS1F-4 MFG.STK 13971-16-16
d). GATES MFG. Parker No Bid
Unit Price 19.14
10 Total 191.40
12GS-12FL45+12GS1F-4 MFG.STK 11771-12-12
). GATES MFG. Parker No Bid
Unit Price 27.45
10 Total 274.50
20GS-20FJX+20GS1F-4 MFG.STK 10671-20-20
f). GATES MFG. Parker No Bid
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g oy
P. 0. BOX 2449 g z >
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 k S % g g & = & =z
TABULATION OF BIDS 3 @ - T 2 o X I
i S 2 = B
PRI s =Sx Z2 > S 2% 2
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for RS} F = @ El e 5 = 3 s E g & F
= I N N N 2 N
FOR Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel § S .g .g 3 .g -“u; 2 .g o E .g :O: 5 .g
S . x O 3 % o s g8 AE ¢ 9 g 5
TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) > 9 o g =1 O g S e Z & Y 8
T £m = = N o & 20
. =@ 2 < < 53 < £5< s 2 <
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 24, 2005 g SO 8 £ s= =g SRR z 3 o 22 =
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY < U Qt (‘/)q (‘/)q U a (‘/)q li‘“ % (‘/)q < m (‘/)q 2 l; (‘/)q
Unit Price 27.94
10 Total 279.40
20GS-20FL+20GS1F-4 MFG.STK 11571-20-20
g). GATES MFG. Parker No Bid
Unit Price 49.38
10 Total 493.80
20 GS-20FJX 90+20GS1F-4 MFG.STK 13971-20-20
h). GATES MFG. Parker No Bid
Unit Price 33.88
10 Total 338.80
20GS-20FL 90M+20GS1F-4 MFG.STK 11971-20-20
i). GATES MFG. Parker No Bid
AIR HOSES PS 500 Unit Price
Total
MFG.STK
F. The Gates Rubber Co. Stock No. MFG. %) %) No Bid %)
Unit Price zZ zZ 1.06 Z
500 Total o o 530.00 o
1/4" - Terminator MFG.STK e R 1/4" Gorilla e
a). GATES MFG. [l [al'S) GoodYear No Bid [al'S)
- ul = ul = =
Unit Price = L_L = L_L 1.30 = L_L
500 Total < O < O 650.00 < O
. = w = w } = w
3/8" - Terminator MFG.STK oo o 3/8" Gorilla o
b). GATES MFG. g %) g %) GoodYear No Bid g %)
Unit Price = E = E 1.87 [ E
500 Total = w = w 935.00 = w
1/2" - Terminator MFG.STK % = % = 1/2" Gorilla % =
<). GATES MFlG. : a I5 a I5 GoodYear No Bid a I5
Unit Price m = m = 2.44 m =
500 Total ) ) 1,220.00 )
3/4" - Terminator MFG.STK % % 3/4" Gorilla %
d). GATES MF.G. : A A GoodYear No Bid A
AIR COUPLERS Unit Price
Total
MFG.STK
G. Milton Stock No. MFG.
Unit Price 0.88
15 Total 13.20
727 MFG.STK H2C
a). MILTON MFG. Parker No Bid
Unit Price 9.84
10 Total 98.40
1816 MFG.STK 16
b). MILTON MFG. Parker No Bid
Unit Price 2.65
10 Total 26.50
1817 MFG.STK 2F
o). MILTON MFG. Parker No Bid
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TABULATION OF BIDS 3 @ - T 2 o X I
= S 2 3 B
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PROPOSAL Annual Contract for RS} F = A s & e 5 = RS g & F
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FOR Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel E S e de 'ﬂé g S P g g £ 5
Date of Award through December 31, 2005 Ss%8 § 3¢ S5 £ 8 358
TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, ) g cg =1 =1 (=1 TS g & = 538 8
. =AM < B< 83 < g3 < S5 <
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 24, 2005 g SO 8 £ s= =g SRR z 3 o 22 =
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY < O Qt (5,3 (5,3 @) a (5,3 li‘“ % (5,3 < m (5,3 2 l; (5,3
Unit Price 1.09
12 Total 13.08
728 MFG.STK H3C
d). MILTON MFG. Parker No Bid
Unit Price 4.78
10 Total 47.80
153 MFG.STK B20-3B
). MILTON MFG. Parker No Bid
Unit Price 6.36
50 Total %) %) 318.00 %)
715 MFG.STK pd Z B33 Z
0. MILTON MFG. o o Parker No Bid o
Unit Price e R 22.33 e
40 Total B &) B [S) 893.20 B [S)
1144 MFG.STK = T 14F11BB T
<O <O i <O
2). MILTON i MF.G. . | 8 | 8 Parker No Bid | 8
H. AIR FITTINGS Unit Price ) o - o ) o
Total g (] g (%] g (]
MFG.STK [ E [ E [ E
Weatherhead MFG. = w = w = W
Unit Price o= o= 1.95 o=
Z = Z = Z =
25 Total 9 o 9 o 48.75 9 o
1868X4 MFG.STK m = m = 68MT-4-2 m =
a). Weatherhead MFG. %) N Parker No Bid o
Unit Price % % 4.32 %
25 Total A A 108.00 A
1862X4 MFG.STK 62PMT-4
b). Weatherhead MFG. Parker No Bid
Unit Price 5.70
25 Total 142.50
1869X6X2s MFG.STK 169MT-6-2
). Weatherhead MFG. Parker No Bid
Unit Price 3.38
25 Total 84.50
1869X4 MFG.STK 169MTNS-4-2
d.) Weatherhead MFG. Parker No Bid
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PROPOSAL Annual Contract for 2 g e a S H T A = 3 g e gEE
FOR: Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel § S .g .g 3 .g -“u; % .g % E .g 2 5 .g
5% 8 S g =R aE¢ B85
TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) g cg é é § é = [5 =1 & = 538 8
. =~ S4 < 24 < ER
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 24, 2005 g SO 8 £ s= =g SRR z 3 o 22 =
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY < U Qt (‘/)q (‘/)q U a (‘/)q [i‘“ % (‘/}q < m (‘/}q 2 l; (‘/}q
L AIR NYLON TUBING Unit Price
Total
MFG.STK
Weatherhead MFG.
Unit Price 0.16
100 Total 16.00
NT10002BK-100 MFG.STK %) %) PTF-2A-BLK
a.) Weatherhead MFG. % % Parker No Bid
Unit Price = = 021
100 Total 5 5 21.00
NT1000 MFG.STK & & PFT-4A-BLK *
b.) Weatherhead MFG. E E Parker No Bid Z
Unit Price & & 0.40 g
100 Total P o 40.00 e
NT1000 MFG.STK 2 2 PFT-6B-BLK g0
) Weatherhead MFG. = = Parker No Bid ';: LGL
Unit Price 5 5 0.55 S
100 Total z z 55.00 7]
NT1000 MFG.STK 4 4 PFT-6B-BLK & i
d) Weatherhead MFG. g g Parker No Bid 5u
Unit Price a a z —
Total E E [2Ne}
MFG.STK 3 3 ©z
EMERGENCY REQUEST PLAT HOURLY RATE MFG. 2 2 0.00 No Bid 8
Unit Price ﬁ ﬁ a
Total [ =
MFG.STK % %
FOR INSTALLATION OF EACH FITTING OF HOSE MFG. a a 0.00 No Bid
Unit Price E E
Total * *
MFG.STK
Delivery Days MFG. one day No Bid
Unit Price
Total
MFG.STK 8am to 6 pm
Business Hours/Days per week MFG. Monday-Friday No Bid

Subtotal

18,630.26
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. Q% z Ex z = > 2 x B 2
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for 2 g e a S H T A = 3 g e gEE
FOR: Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel § S .g .g 3 .g -“u; % .g % E .g 2 5 .g
S 58 g 3£ S g8 ake¢ T5¢E
TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) g cg é é § é = [5 =1 & = 538 8
. £ a8 53 < £E5 < £32<
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 24, 2005 g SO 8 £ s= =g SRR z 3 o 22 =
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY < O Qt (‘Aq (‘Aq @) a (‘Aq [i‘“ % (‘Aq < m (‘Aq 2 l; (‘Aq
ITEM 111 SOUTH CENTRAL SERVICE CENTERS Unit Price
A. HYDRAULIC AND AIR HOSES - NESC Total
Addition Estimated Usage =$2500 MFG.STK
Price Discount MFG.
Unit Price
Total .298 - Gates
MFG.STK 75% Hyd Hose 0.337 - Milton
1. Discount off price list MFG. 63% Hyd Fitt 33-50% 70% 0.371 - Weatherhead .38%
Unit Price
Total
MFG.STK Ryco Hyd Flextral
2. Price list identification MFG. Coupl ic Sys LP0913 Parker 35096-00 List Guide
Unit Price
Total March 1, 2005
MFG.STK
3. Effective date of price list MFG. Sept. 13, 2004 Sept. 13,2004 May 3, 2004 Nov. 15,2004 Feb. 1, 2005
Unit Price
Total
Column of price list on which discount is based MFG.STK List
4. (Le., wholesale, jobber, retail) MFG. List List Price Retail List Retail
FITTINGS, COUPLINGS AND ADAPTERS Unit Price
Total
Addition Estimated Usage = $5000 MFG.STK
B. Price Discount MFG.
Unit Price
Total 32% Air Hose, 40% 54% Dixon
MFG.STK Air Couplers, 61% Air Weatherhead
1. Discount off price list MFG. Fittings, 61% Air NylonTubeing 75-80% 70% Various .38%
Unit Price
Total Flex Tech, Milton Dixon DPL105 Milton 8x937
MFG.STK Midland Metals Weatherhead/Aeroquip Gates 39496-000 Flextral
2. Price list identification MFG. Midland Metals A-PROV-PC002-E2 Parker Weatherhead Ind-00-04 List Guide
Unit Price
Total Jan. 1, 2005, Dixon 01/01/05
MFG.STK Feb. 1, 2005, Jan 1, 2005 Weatherhead/Aeroquip Jan. 1, 2005
3. Effective date of price list MFG. Jan. 1, 2005 12/01/04 May 3, 2004 Feb. 1, 2005 Feb. 1, 2005
Unit Price
Total
Column of price list on which discount is based MFG.STK List, List
4. (Le., wholesale, jobber, retail) MFG. List, List List Price Retail Jobber-Cost Retail
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SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 k S % g g & = & =z
TABULATION OF BIDS =3 & %D - 2 ':, S e R n S
. Q% z Ex z = > 2 x B 2
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for 2 g e a S H T A = 3 g e gEE
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TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) = E cg é é § é = N é = & é g3 é
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ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY < O Qt (‘/)q (‘/)q @) a (‘/)q [i‘“ % (‘/}q < m (‘/}q 2 l; (‘/}q
C. 1 and 2 Wire Hoses Unit Price
SAE 100R1, Type AT (1 Wire Hose) Total
MFG.STK
GATES MFG.
Unit Price 0.85 0.84 1.29 0.98 1.32
Total 110.50 109.20 167.70 127.40 171.60
130 MFG.STK T14A 57TMBI-1/4 421-4 4G1 AX-04
a). 4G1 MFG. Ryco Complamatic Parker Gates Flextral
Unit Price 0.91 0.91 1.35 1.08 1.50
Total 63.70 63.70 94.50 75.60 105.00
70 MFG.STK T16A 57TMBI1-3/8 421-6 6G1 AX-06
b). 6G1 MFG. Ryco Complamatic Parker Gates Flextral
Unit Price 1.04 1.07 1.53 1.23 2.18
Total 36.40 37.45 53.55 43.05 76.30
35 MFG.STK T18A 57TMBI-1/2 421-8 8G1 AX-08
). 8G1 MFG. Ryco Complamatic Parker Gates Flextral
Unit Price 1.73 1.73 2.64 1.99 2.80
Total 17.30 17.30 26.40 19.90 28.00
10 MFG.STK T112A 57TMBI1-3/4 421-12 12G1 AX-12
d). 12G1 MFG. Ryco Complamatic Parker Gates Flextral
SAE 100R2, AT/EN 853 2SN (2 Wire Hoses) Unit Price
Total
MFG.STK
The Gates Rubber Co. MFG.
Unit Price 1.01 1.10 1.54 1.23 1.67
Total 25.25 27.50 38.50 30.75 41.75
25 MFG.STK T24A 57BM2-1/4 301-4 4G2 EX-04
a). 4G2 MFG. Ryco Complamatic Parker Gates Flextral
Unit Price 1.13 1.26 1.77 1.44 1.97
75 Total 84.75 94.50 132.75 108.00 147.75
6G2 MFG.STK T26A 57TMB2-3/8 301-6 6G2 EX-06
b). GATES MFG. Ryco Complamatic Parker Gates Flextral
Unit Price 1.27 1.44 2.02 1.65 2.15
195 Total 247.65 280.80 393.90 321.75 419.25
8G2 MFG.STK T28A 57TMB2-1/2 301-8 8G2 EX-08
). GATES MFG. Ryco Complamatic Parker Gates Flextral




F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

05-0281B

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEN z ko)
P. 0. BOX 2449 g z >
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 k S % g g & = & =z
TABULATION OF BIDS - & %D - 2 ':, S e R n S
. Q% z Ex z = > 2 x B 2
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for 2 g e a S H T A = 3 g e gEE
FOR: Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel § S .g .g 3 .g -“u; % .g % E .g 2 5 .g
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ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY < O Qt (‘/)q (‘/)q @) a (‘/)q [i‘“ % (‘/}q < m (‘/}q 2 l; (‘/}q
FITTINGS (For 1 and 2 Wire Hoses) Unit Price
The Gates Rubber Co.Stock No. Total
MFG.STK
MFG.
Unit Price 1.21 1.72 243 1.61 2.03
16 Total 19.36 27.52 38.88 25.76 3248
6G-6MP MFG.STK 603V GCO01-6x6 10143-6-6 6G-6MP E06-06MP
a). GATES MFG. 1 ic Sys Complamatic Parker Gates Flextral
Unit Price 145 2.07 2.79 1.80 2.28
12 Total 17.40 24.84 33.48 21.60 27.36
8G-8MP MFG.STK 803V GCO01-8x6 10143-8-8 8G-8MP E08-08MP
b). GATES MFG. 1 ic Sys Complamatic Parker Gates Flextral
Unit Price 2.07 2.67 3.87 2.82 3.58
8 Total 16.56 21.36 30.96 22.56 28.64
8G-10FJX MFG.STK 827V GC09-8x10 10643-10-8 8G-10FJIX E08-10FJ
). GATES MFG. 1 ic Sys Complamatic Parker Gates Flextral
Unit Price 3.55 4.76 6.36 5.02 6.77
8 Total 28.40 38.08 50.88 40.16 54.16
10G-12FJX MFG.STK 1021V GC09-10x12 10643-12-10 10G-12FJX E10-12F)
d). GATES MFG. 1 ic Sys Complamatic Parker Gates Flextral
Unit Price 7.68 9.68 14.08 10.73 13.62
8 Total 61.44 77.44 112.64 85.84 108.96
12G-12FJX 90M MFG.STK 12651V GC26-12x12 13943-12-12 12G-12FJX 90M E12-12FJ90
). GATES MFG. 1 ic Sys Complamatic Parker Gates Flextral
Unit Price 3.70 5.06 7.84 4.68 7.33
8 Total 29.60 40.48 62.72 37.44 58.64
12g-16MJ MFG.STK 1233V GC08-12x16 10343-16-12 12g-16MJ El12-16MJ
f). GATES MFG. 1 ic Sys Complamatic Parker Gates Flextral
D. A II Hoses Unit Price
SAE 100R5, Type Al Total
(Must meet SAE J1402 and DOTFMVSS 106-74) MFG.STK
The Gates Rubber Co. MFG.
Unit Price 1.08 1.67 2.58 1.74 2.11
10 Total 10.80 16.70 25.80 17.40 21.10
6C5C MFG.STK T55 58BMA-6 201-6 6C5C GLO06
a). GATES MFG. Ryco Complamatic Parker Gates Dayco
Unit Price 115 1.78 2.71 1.83 2.23
10 Total 11.50 17.80 27.10 18.30 2230
8C5C MFG.STK T56 58MBA-8 201-8 8C5C GLO08
b). GATES MFG. Ryco Complamatic Parker Gates Dayco
Unit Price 1.55 2.60 4.30 2.78 3.49
10 Total 15.50 26.00 43.00 27.80 34.90
12C5C MFG.STK T510 58MBA-12 201-12 12C5C GL12
). GATES MFG. Ryco Complamatic Parker Gates Dayco
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ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY < O Qt (‘/)q (‘/)q @) a (‘/)q [i‘“ % (‘/}q < m (‘/}q 2 l; (‘/}q
FITTINGS (For A II Hoses) Unit Price
The Gates Rubber Co. Stock No. Total
MFG.STK
MFG.
Unit Price 5.08 2.40 3.46 3.55 4.74
20 Total 101.60 48.00 69.20 71.00 94.80
6C5-4RMP MFG.STK 600R-1 6R5-4MP 20120-4-6 6C5-4RMP 2R06-04MP
a). GATES MFG. 1 ic Sys Complamatic Parker Gates Flextral
Unit Price 5.08 3.70 5.17 3.77 5.20
20 Total 101.60 74.00 103.40 75.40 104.00
8C5-8RMP MFG.STK 803R-1 8R5-8MP 20120-8-8 8C5-8RMP 2R08-08MP
b). GATES MFG. 1 ic Sys Complamatic Parker Gates Flextral
Unit Price 7.56 6.97 9.84 7.82 7.60
20 Total 151.20 139.40 196.80 156.40 152.00
12C5-12RMP MFG.STK 1203R-2 12R5-12MP 20120-12-12 12C5-12RMP 2R12-12MP
). GATES MFG. 1 ic Sys Complamatic Parker Gates Flextral
Unit Price 4.63 3.84 3.78 3.00 5.55
20 Total 92.60 76.80 75.60 60.00 111.00
6C5-6RFIX MFG.STK 627R-1 6R5-6F) 20620-6-6 6C5-6RFIX 2R06-06F]
d). GATES MFG. 1 ic Sys Complamatic Parker Gates Flextral
Unit Price 5.01 4.96 5.07 3.78 7.12
20 Total 100.20 99.20 101.40 75.60 142.40
8C5-8RFJSX MFG.STK 824R-1 8R5-8FJ 20620-8-8 8C5-8RFISX 2R08-08FJ
). GATES MFG. 1 ic Sys Complamatic Parker Gates Flextral
Unit Price 9.10 9.02 11.92 8.57 10.51
20 Total 182.00 180.40 238.40 171.40 210.20
12C5-12RFIX MFG.STK 1221R-2 12R5-12F) 20620-12-12 12C5-12RFIX 2R12-12FJ
f). GATES MFG. 1 ic Sys Complamatic Parker Gates Flextral
Unit Price
E. 4 Wire Sprial Hoses Total
SAE 100R12, Type AT MFG.STK
The Gates Rubber Co. Stock No. MFG.
Unit Price 3.55 3.79 6.01 422 7.44
15 Total 53.25 56.85 90.15 63.30 111.60
12C12M MFG.STK HI1212A RC12-3/4 772TC-12 12C12M NX-12
a). GATES MFG. Ryco Complamatic Parker Gates Flextral
Unit Price 4.53 4.66 7.27 5.48 10.60
26 Total 117.78 121.16 189.02 142.48 275.60
16C12M MFG.STK H1216A RC12-1 772TC-16 16C12M NX-16
b). GATES MFG. Ryco Complamatic Parker Gates Flextral
Unit Price 7.11 7.21 13.84 9.40 13.55
5 Total 35.55 36.05 69.20 47.00 67.75
20C12M MFG.STK H1220A RCI12-1 1/4 772TC-20 20C12M NX-20
). GATES MFG. Ryco Complamatic Parker Gates Flextral
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Fitting for 4 Wire Sprial Hose Unit Price
To include GS couplings, gerrules Total
MFG.STK
MFG.
Unit Price 7.70 8.34 13.75 9.00 11.42
10 Total 77.00 83.40 137.50 90.00 114.20
16GS-16FIX+16GS1F-4 MFG.STK 4H16-E616 GW09-16x16 10671-16-16 16GS-16FIX+16GS1F-4 N16-16F]
a). GATES MFG. Coupl ic Sys Complamatic Parker Gates Flextral
Unit Price 11.98 11.21 15.03 12.91 0.00
10 Total 119.80 112.10 150.30 129.10 0.00
12GS-16MB+12GS1F-4 MFG.STK 4H12-E572 GW11-16x16 10571-16-12 12GS-16MB+12GS1F-4 No Quote
b). GATES MFG. Coupl ic Sys Complamatic Parker Gates Flextral
Unit Price 13.95 12.18 18.90 9.93 13.37
10 Total 139.50 121.80 189.00 99.30 133.70
16GS-16MJ+16GS1F-4 MFG.STK 4H16-E516 GW08-16x16 10371-16-16 16GS-16MJ+16GS1F-4 N16-16MJ
). GATES MFG. Coupl ic Sys Complamatic Parker Gates Flextral
Unit Price 19.51 21.16 34.87 21.51 27.60
10 Total 195.10 211.60 348.70 215.10 276.00
16GS-16FJX 90M+16GS1F-4 MFG.STK 4H16-E616 GW26-16x16 13971-16-16 16GS-16FJX 90M+16GS1F-4 N16-16FJ90
d). GATES MFG. Coupl ic Sys Complamatic Parker Gates Flextral
Unit Price 10.86 11.28 19.14 14.24 19.21
10 Total 108.60 112.80 191.40 142.40 192.10
12GS-12FL45+12GS1F-4 MFG.STK 4H12-EG42 GW50-12x12 11771-12-12 12GS-12FL45+12GS1F-4 NI12-12FL
). GATES MFG. Coupl ic Sys Complamatic Parker Gates Flextral
Unit Price 15.20 16.20 27.45 17.89 22.72
10 Total 152.00 162.00 274.50 178.90 227.20
20GS-20FJX+20GS1F-4 MFG.STK 4H20-E620 GW09-20x20 10671-20-20 20GS-20FJX+20GS1F-4 N20-20FJ
f). GATES MFG. Coupl ic Sys Complamatic Parker Gates Flextral
Unit Price 16.52 18.77 27.94 16.40 20.82
10 Total 165.20 187.70 279.40 164.00 208.20
20GS-20FL+20GS1F-4 MFG.STK 4H20-EG40 GW47-20x20 11571-20-20 20GS-20FL+20GS1F-4 N20-20FL
g). GATES MFG. Coupl ic Sys Complamatic Parker Gates Flextral
Unit Price 32.29 30.13 49.38 29.06 52.80
10 Total 322.90 301.30 493.80 290.60 528.00
20GS-20FJX 90+20GS1F-4 MFG.STK 4H20-E677 GW26-20x20 13971-20-20 20GS-20FJX 90+20GS1F-4 N20-20FJ90
h). GATES MFG. Coupl ic Sys Complamatic Parker Gates Flextral
Unit Price 22.75 24.57 33.88 24.24 32.69
10 Total 227.50 245.70 338.80 242.40 326.90
20GS-20FL 90M+20GS1F-4 MFG.STK 4H20-EG80 GW53-20x20 11971-20-20 20GS-20FL 90M+20GS1F-4 N20-20FL90
1). GATES MFG. Coupl ic Sys Complamatic Parker Gates Flextral
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F. AIR HOSES PS 500 Unit Price
The Gates Rubber Co. Stock No. Total
MFG.STK
MFG.
Unit Price 0.21 0.86 1.06 0.93 1.09
500 Total 105.00 430.00 530.00 465.00 545.00
1/4" - Terminator MFG.STK RT-0250-RL 2245-4168662 1/4" Gorilla 1/4" - Terminator 1/4 Gorilla
a). GATES MFG. Flex Tech Thermoid Goodyear Gates Goodyear
Unit Price 0.23 1.05 1.30 1.05 1.35
500 Total 115.00 525.00 650.00 525.00 675.00
3/8" - Terminator MFG.STK RT-0375-RL 2245-4248662 3/8" Gorilla 3/8" - Terminator 3/8 Gorilla
b). GATES MFG. Flex Tech Thermoid Goodyear Gates Goodyear
Unit Price 0.38 1.47 1.87 1.37 1.87
500 Total 190.00 735.00 935.00 685.00 935.00
1/2" - Terminator MFG.STK RT-0500-RL 2245-4328662 1/2" Gorilla 1/2" - Terminator 1/2 Gorilla
). GATES MFG. Flex Tech Thermoid Goodyear Gates Goodyear
Unit Price 0.42 1.97 2.44 1.84 2.52
500 Total 210.00 985.00 1,220.00 920.00 1,260.00
3/4" - Terminator MFG.STK RT-0750-RL 2245-4488662 3/4" Gorilla 3/4" - Terminator 3/4 Gorilla
d). GATES MFG. Flex Tech Thermoid Goodyear Gates Goodyear
G. AIR COUPLERS Unit Price
Milton Stock No. Total
MFG.STK
MFG.
Unit Price 0.58 0.70 0.88 0.69 0.68
15 Total 8.70 10.50 13.20 10.35 10.20
727 MFG.STK 727 DCP21 H2C 727 B-B2M2-S
a). Milton MFG. Milton Dixon Parker Milton Breco
Unit Price 7.14 7.58 9.84 8.50 8.92
10 Total 71.40 75.80 98.40 85.00 89.20
1816 MFG.STK 1816 DC9 16 1816 B-4CM4-S
b). Milton MFG. Milton Dixon Parker Milton Breco
Unit Price 1.76 1.96 2.65 2.10 2.34
10 Total 17.60 19.60 26.50 21.00 23.40
1817 MFG.STK 1817 DCP17 2F 1817 B-B4M4-S
). Milton MFG. Milton Dixon Parker Milton Breco
Unit Price 0.62 0.80 1.09 0.74 0.63
12 Total 7.44 9.60 13.08 8.88 7.56
728 MFG.STK 728 DCP20 H3C 728 B-B2F2-S
d). Milton MFG. Milton Dixon Parker Milton Breco
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ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY < O Qt (‘Aq (‘Aq @) a (‘Aq [i‘“ % (‘Aq < m (‘Aq 2 l; (‘Aq
Unit Price 5.80 7.67 4.78 7.74 12.42
10 Total 58.00 76.70 47.80 77.40 124.20
153 MFG.STK 153 D201 B20-3B 153 153
). Milton MFG. Milton Dixon Parker Milton Milton
Unit Price 2.60 2.94 6.36 3.10 3.27
50 Total 130.00 147.00 318.00 155.00 163.50
715 MFG.STK 715 DC20 B33 715 B-2CF2-B
1). Milton MFG. Milton Dixon Parker Milton Breco
Unit Price 17.31 20.53 2233 20.60 23.90
40 Total 692.40 821.20 893.20 824.00 956.00
1144 MFG.STK 1144 F00-02M 14F11BB 1144 MF-100
g). Milton MFG. Milton Dixon Parker Milton Breco
H. AIR FITTINGS Unit Price
Weather Stock No. Total
MFG.STK
MFG.
Unit Price 118 1.55 1.95 1.74 0.86
25 Total 29.50 38.75 48.75 43.50 21.50
1868X4 MFG.STK 680402 1868x4 68PMT-4-2 1868X4 38-073
a). Weatherhead MFG. Midland Metals Weatherhead Parker Weatherhead Midland Metals
Unit Price 1.76 2.74 432 3.07 1.71
25 Total 44.00 68.50 108.00 76.75 42.75
1862X4 MFG.STK 620400 1862x4 62PMT-4 1862X4 620400
b). Weatherhead MFG. Midland Metals Weatherhead Parker Weatherhead Midland Metals
Unit Price 3.26 4.30 5.70 4.81 1.41
25 Total 81.50 107.50 142.50 120.25 35.25
1869X6X2S MFG.STK 6906025 1869x6x25 169PMT-6-2 1869X6X2S 38-094
). Weatherhead MFG. Midland Metals Weatherhead Parker Weatherhead Midland Metals
Unit Price 2.44 2.41 3.38 2.69 1.17
25 Total 61.00 60.25 84.50 67.25 29.25
1869X4 MFG.STK 6904025 1869x4 169PMTNS-4-2 1869X4 38-091
d). Weatherhead MFG. Midland Metals Weatherhead Parker Weatherhead Midland Metals
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L AIR NYLON TUBING Unit Price
Weather Stock No. Total
MFG.STK
MFG.
Unit Price 0.1602 0.11 0.16 0.11 0.11
100 Total 16.0200 11.00 16.00 11.00 11.00
NT10002BK-100 MFG.STK 38-950 NT10002BK-100 PFT-2A-Blk NT10002BK-100 4246-02207
a). Weatherhead MFG. Midland Metals Weatherhead Parker Weatherhead St. Gobain
Unit Price 0.312 0.23 0.21 0.18 0.22
100 Total 31.200 23.00 21.00 18.00 22.00
NT10004BK-100 MFG.STK 38-952 NT10004BK-100 PFT-4A-Blk NT10004BK-100 4246-04106
b). Weatherhead MFG. Midland Metals Weatherhead Parker Weatherhead St. Gobain
Unit Price 0.5031 0.62 0.40 0.37 0.32
100 Total 50.310 62.00 40.00 37.00 32.00
NT10006BK-100 MFG.STK 38-960 NT10006-BK100 PFT-6B-Blk NT10006BK-100 3250-06104
). Weatherhead MFG. Midland Metals Weatherhead Parker Weatherhead St. Gobain
Unit Price 0.663 0.85 0.55 0.57 0.54
100 Total 66.30 85.00 55.00 57.00 54.00
NT10008BK-100 MFG.STK 38-965 NT10008BK-100 PFT-8B-Blk NT10008BK-100 3250-08104
d). Weatherhead MFG. Midland Metals Weatherhead Parker Weatherhead St. Gobain
Unit Price
Total
MFG.STK one hour min. charge 80.00 Serv Call
EMERGENCY REQUEST FLAT HOURLY RATE MFG. 0.00 25.00 0.00 25.00 80.00
Unit Price
FOR INSTALLATION OF EACH FITTING ON Total
LENGTH OF HOSE MFG.STK
DELIVERY AND SERVICE MFG. 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Unit Price
Total
MFG.STK
Delivery Days MFG. 3 days 1 day 1 day 3 days 1-7 days
Unit Price
Total 7:30 am - 5:30 pm 8:00 am - 5:00 pm 8:00 am - 6:00 pm 8:00 am - 5:00 pm 8:00 am - 5:00 pm
MFG.STK Mon-Fri Mon-Fri Mon - Fri Mon.-Fri. Mon.-Fri.
Business Hours MFG. 8:00 am - 12:00 pm Sat. 24 hrs serv 7 days a wk
Subtotal 13,724.86 16,107.33 18,630.26 16,170.07 18,270.65
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ITEM 1V MOBILE UNIT Unit Price
A. Addition Estimated Usage =$5000 Total
Price Discount MFG.STK
1. Discount off price list MFG.
Unit Price
Total
MFG.STK
Labor Rate per hour MFG. 55.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 62.50
Unit Price
Total
MFG.STK
Flat Rate after hours MFG. 82.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 80.00
Unit Price
Total
MFG.STK
Minimum Hour charge MFG. 55.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1 hr.
Unit Price
Total
MFG.STK
Fuel Surcharge MFG. 0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.00
Unit Price
Total
MFG.STK 16.00
Mileage Charge MFG. .10/mile No Bid No Bid No Bid outside 1604
HYDRAULIC HOSES & FITTINGS Unit Price
Addition Estimated Usage =$625 Total
MFG.STK
A. Price Discount MFG.
Unit Price
Total
MFG.STK 75% Hyd Hose
1. Discount off price list MFG. 63% Hyd Fitt No Bid No Bid No Bid .38%
Unit Price Flextral
Total
MFG.STK Ryco Hyd
2. Price list identification MFG. Coupl ic Sys No Bid No Bid No Bid List Guide
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Unit Price
Total
MFG.STK March 1, 2005
3. Effective date of price list MFG. Sept. 13, 2004 No Bid No Bid No Bid Feb. 1, 2005
Unit Price
Total
Column of price list on which discount is based MFG.STK List
4. (Le., wholesale, jobber, retail) MFG. List No Bid No Bid No Bid Retail
FITTINGS, COUPLINGS AND ADAPTERS Unit Price
Addition Estimated Usage =$1250 Total
MFG.STK
B. Price Discount MFG.
Unit Price
Total 32% Air Hose, 40%
MFG.STK Air Couplers, 61% Air
1. Discount off price list MFG. Fittings, 61% Air NylonTubeing No Bid No Bid No Bid .38%
Unit Price
Total Flex Tech, Milton
MFG.STK Midland Metals Breco/
2. Price list identification MFG. Midland Metals No Bid No Bid No Bid Midland Metals
Unit Price
Total Jan., 1, 2005
MFG.STK Feb. 1, 2005, Jan 1, 2005
3. Effective date of price list MFG. Jan., 1, 2005 No Bid No Bid No Bid Feb. 1, 2005
Unit Price
Total
Column of price list on which discount is based MFG.STK List, List
4. (Le., wholesale, jobber, retail) MFG. List, List No Bid No Bid No Bid Retail
C. 1 and 2 Wire Hoses Unit Price
SAE 100R1, Type AT (1 Wire Hoses) Total
BY THE FOOT MFG.STK
GATES MFG.
Unit Price 0.85 1.32
130 Total 110.50 171.60
4G1 MFG.STK T14A AX-04
a). GATES MFG. Ryco No Bid No Bid No Bid Flextral
Unit Price 0.91 1.50
70 Total 63.70 105.00
6G1 MFG.STK T16A AX-06
b). GATES MFG. Ryco No Bid No Bid No Bid Flextral
Unit Price 1.04 2.18
35 Total 36.40 76.30
8G1 MFG.STK T18A AX-08
). GATES MFG. Ryco No Bid No Bid No Bid Flextral
Unit Price 1.73 2.80
10 Total 17.30 28.00
12G1 MFG.STK T112A AX-12
d). GATES MFG. Ryco No Bid No Bid No Bid Flextral
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SAE 100R2, AT/EN 853 2SN (2 Wire Hoses) Unit Price
BY THE FOOT Total
MFG.STK
GATES MFG.
Unit Price 1.01 1.67
25 Total 25.25 41.75
AG2 MFG.STK T24A EX-04
a). GATES MFG. Ryco No Bid No Bid No Bid Flextral
Unit Price 1.13 1.97
75 Total 84.75 147.75
6G2 MFG.STK T26A EX-06
b). GATES MFG. Ryco No Bid No Bid No Bid Flextral
Unit Price 1.27 2.15
195 Total 247.65 419.25
8G2 MFG.STK T28A EX-08
). GATES MFG. Ryco No Bid No Bid No Bid Flextral
FITTINGS (FOR 1 AND 2 WIRE HOSES) Unit Price
EACH Total
MFG.STK
MFG.
Unit Price 1.21 2.03
16 Total 19.36 32.48
6G-GMP MFG.STK 603V E06-06MP
a). GATES MFG. 1 ic Sys No Bid No Bid No Bid Flextral
Unit Price 1.45 2.28
12 Total 17.40 27.36
8G-8MP MFG.STK 803V E08-08MP
b). GATES MFG. 1 ic Sys No Bid No Bid No Bid Flextral
Unit Price 2.07 3.58
8 Total 16.56 28.64
8G-10FJX MFG.STK 827V EO08-10FIX
). GATES MFG. 1 ic Sys No Bid No Bid No Bid Flextral
Unit Price 3.55 6.77
8 Total 28.40 54.16
10G-12FIX MFG.STK 1021V E10G-12F]
d). GATES MFG. 1 ic Sys No Bid No Bid No Bid Flextral
Unit Price 7.68 13.62
8 Total 61.44 108.96
12G-12FJX 90M MFG.STK 12651V E12-12FJ90
). GATES MFG. 1 ic Sys No Bid No Bid No Bid Flextral
Unit Price 3.70 7.33
8 Total 29.60 58.64
12G-16MJ MFG.STK 1233V E12-16MJ
f). GATES MFG. 1 ic Sys No Bid No Bid No Bid Flextral
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ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY < O Qt (5,)“ (5,)“ @) a (5,)“ li‘“ % (5,)“ < m (5,)“ 2 l; (5,)“
D. A II Hoses Unit Price
SAE 100 RS, Type All Total
(Must meet SAE J1402 and DOTFMVSS 106-74) MFG.STK
BY THE FOOT MFG.
Unit Price 1.08 2.11
10 Total 10.80 21.10
6C5C MFG.STK TS5 GL06
a). GATES MFG. Ryco No Bid No Bid No Bid Dayco
Unit Price 1.15 223
10 Total 11.50 223
8Cs5C MFG.STK T56 GLO08
b). GATES MFG. Ryco No Bid No Bid No Bid Dayco
Unit Price 1.55 3.49
10 Total 15.50 34.9
12C5C MFG.STK T510 GLI12
). GATES MFG. Ryco No Bid No Bid No Bid Dayco
FITTINGS (For A II Hoses) Unit Price
EACH Total
MFG.STK
MFG.
Unit Price 5.08 4.74
20 Total 101.60 94.80
6C5-4RMP MFG.STK 600R-1 2R06-04MP
a). GATES MFG. 1 ic Sys No Bid No Bid No Bid Flextral
Unit Price 5.08 520
20 Total 101.60 104.00
8CS5-8RMP MFG.STK 803R-1 2R08-08MP
b). GATES MFG. 1 ic Sys No Bid No Bid No Bid Flextral
Unit Price 7.56 7.60
20 Total 151.20 152.00
12C5-12RMP MFG.STK 1203R-2 2R12-12MP
). GATES MFG. 1 ic Sys No Bid No Bid No Bid Flextral
Unit Price 4.63 5.55
20 Total 92.60 111.00
6C5-6RFIX MFG.STK 627R-1 2R06-06F]
d). GATES MFG. 1 ic Sys No Bid No Bid No Bid Flextral
Unit Price 5.01 7.12
20 Total 100.20 142.40
8CS5-8RFISX MFG.STK 824R-1 2R08-08FJ
). GATES MFG. 1 ic Sys No Bid No Bid No Bid Flextral
Unit Price 9.10 10.51
20 Total 182.00 210.20
12C5-12RFJX MFG.STK 1221R-2 2R12-12F]
f). GATES MFG. 1 ic Sys No Bid No Bid No Bid Flextral
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E. 4 Wire Spiral Hoses Unit Price
BY THE FOOT Total
SAE 100R12, Type AT MFG.STK
GATES MFG.
Unit Price 3.55 7.44
15 Total 71.00 148.80
12C12M MFG.STK HI1212A NX-12
a). GATES MFG. Ryco No Bid No Bid No Bid Flextral
Unit Price 4.53 10.60
26 Total 117.78 275.60
16C12M MFG.STK H1216A NX-16
b). GATES MFG. Ryco No Bid No Bid No Bid Flextral
Unit Price 7.11 13.55
5 Total 106.65 203.25
20C12M MFG.STK H1220A NX-20
). GATES MFG. Ryco No Bid No Bid No Bid Flextral
Fitting for 4 Wire Sprial Hose Unit Price
To include GS Couplings, Gerrules Total
MFG.STK
GATES MFG.
Unit Price 7.70 11.42
10 Total 77.00 114.20
16GS-16FJX+16GS1F-4 MFG.STK 4H16-E616 N16-16F]
a). GATES MFG. Coupl ic Sys No Bid No Bid No Bid Flextral
Unit Price 11.98 0.00
10 Total 119.80 0.00
12GS-16MB+12GS1F-4 MFG.STK 4H12-E572
b). GATES MFG. Coupl ic Sys No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Unit Price 13.95 13.37
10 Total 139.50 133.70
16GS-16MJ+16GS1F-4 MFG.STK 4H16-E516 N16-16MJ
). GATES MFG. Coupl. ic Sys No Bid No Bid No Bid Flextral
Unit Price 19.51 27.60
10 Total 195.10 276.00
16GS-16FJX90M+16GS1F-4 MFG.STK 4H16-E616 N16-16FJ90
d). GATES MFG. Coupl. ic Sys No Bid No Bid No Bid Flextral
Unit Price 10.86 19.21
10 Total 108.60 192.10
12GS-12FL45+12GS1F-4 MFG.STK 4H12-EG42 N12-12FL45
). GATES MFG. Coupl ic Sys No Bid No Bid No Bid Flextral
Unit Price 15.20 22.72
10 Total 152.00 227.20
20GS-20FJX+20GS1F-4 MFG.STK 4H20-H620 N20-20FJ
f). GATES MFG. Coupl ic Sys No Bid No Bid No Bid Flextral
Unit Price 16.52 20.82
10 Total 165.20 208.20
20GS-20FL+20GS1F-4 MFG.STK 4H20-EG40 N20-20FL
2). GATES MFG. Coupl ic Sys No Bid No Bid No Bid Flextral
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Unit Price 3229 52.80
10 Total 322.90 528.00
20 GS-20FJX 90+20GS1F-4 MFG.STK 4H20-E677 N20-20FJ90
h). GATES MFG. Coupl ic Sys No Bid No Bid No Bid Flextral
Unit Price 22.75 32.69
10 Total 227.50 326.90
20GS-20FL 90M+20GS1F-4 MFG.STK 4H20-EG80 N20-20FL90
1). GATES MFG. Coupl ic Sys No Bid No Bid No Bid Flextral
F AIR HOSES PS 500 Unit Price
BY THE FOOT Total
MFG.STK
GATES MFG.
Unit Price 0.21 1.09
500 Total 105.00 545.00
1/4" - Terminator MFG.STK RT-0250-RL 1/4 - Gorilla
a). GATES MFG. Flex Tech No Bid No Bid No Bid Goodyear
Unit Price 0.23 1.35
500 Total 115.00 675.00
3/8" - Terminator MFG.STK RT-0375-RL 3/8 - Gorilla
b). GATES MFG. Flex Tech No Bid No Bid No Bid Goodyear
Unit Price 0.38 1.87
500 Total 190.00 935.00
1/2" - Terminator MFG.STK RT-0500-RL 1/2 - Gorilla
). GATES MFG. Flex Tech No Bid No Bid No Bid Goodyear
Unit Price 0.42 2.52
500 Total 210.00 1,260.00
3/4" - Terminator MFG.STK RT-0750-RL 3/4 - Gorilla
d). GATES MFG. Flex Tech No Bid No Bid No Bid Goodyear
G. AIR COUPLERS Unit Price
EACH Total
MFG.STK
MILTON MFG.
Unit Price 0.58 0.68
15 Total 8.70 10.20
727 MFG.STK 727 B-B2M2-S
a). MILTON MFG. Milton No Bid No Bid No Bid Breco
Unit Price 7.14 8.92
10 Total 71.40 89.20
1816 MFG.STK 1816 B-4CM4-S
b). MILTON MFG. Milton No Bid No Bid No Bid Breco
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Unit Price 1.76 2.34
10 Total 17.60 23.40
1817 MFG.STK 1817 B-B4M4-S
). MILTON MFG. Milton No Bid No Bid No Bid Breco
Unit Price 0.62 0.63
12 Total 7.44 7.56
728 MFG.STK 728.00 B-B2F2-S
d). MILTON MFG. Milton No Bid No Bid No Bid Breco
Unit Price 5.80 12.42
10 Total 58.00 124.20
153 MFG.STK 1.53 153
). MILTON MFG. Milton No Bid No Bid No Bid Milton
Unit Price 2.60 3.27
50 Total 130.00 163.50
715 MFG.STK 715 B-2CF2-B
). MILTON MFG. Milton No Bid No Bid No Bid Breco
Unit Price 17.31 23.90
40 Total 692.40 956.00
1144 MFG.STK 1144 MF-100
2). MILTON MFG. Milton No Bid No Bid No Bid Breco
H. AIR FITTINGS Unit Price
EACH Total
MFG.STK
WEATHERHEAD MFG.
Unit Price 1.18 0.86
25 Total 29.50 21.50
1868X4 MFG.STK 680402 38-073
a). WEATHERHEAD MFG. Midland Metals No Bid No Bid No Bid Midland Metals
Unit Price 1.76 1.71
25 Total 44.00 42.75
1862X4 MFG.STK 620400 620400
b). WEATHERHEAD MFG. Midland Metals No Bid No Bid No Bid Midland Metals
Unit Price 3.26 1.41
25 Total 81.50 3525
1869X6X2S MFG.STK 6906025 38-094
). WEATHERHEAD MFG. Midland Metals No Bid No Bid No Bid Midland Metals
Unit Price 2.44 1.17
25 Total 61.00 29.25
1869X4 MFG.STK 6904025 38-091
d). WEATHERHEAD MFG. Midland Metals No Bid No Bid No Bid Midland Metals
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L AIR NYLON TUBING Unit Price
BY THE FOOT Total
MFG.STK
WEATHERHEAD MFG.
Unit Price 0.1602 0.11
100 Total 16.02 11.00
NT10002BK-100 MFG.STK 38-950 4246-02207
a). WEATHERHEAD MFG. Midland Metals No Bid No Bid No Bid St. Gobain
Unit Price 0.312 0.22
100 Total 31.20 22.00
NT10004BK-100 MFG.STK 38-952 4246-04106
b). WEATHERHEAD MFG. Midland Metals No Bid No Bid No Bid St. Gobain
Unit Price 0.5031 0.32
100 Total 50.31 32.00
NT10006BK-100 MFG.STK 38-960 3250-06104
). WEATHERHEAD MFG. Midland Metals No Bid No Bid No Bid St. Gobain
Unit Price 0.663 0.54
100 Total 66.30 54.00
NT10008BK-100 MFG.STK 38-965 3250-08104
d). WEATHERHEAD MFG. Midland Metals No Bid No Bid No Bid St. Gobain
SUBTOTAL 7,326.21 11,880.85
TOTAL BID ITEM AWARDED 21,051.07 18,630.26 16,169.67
Unit Price
Total
MFG.STK 0.01 NET
TERMS MFG. 20 DAYS 30 DAYS
* DENOTES LOW BIDDER
BID INVITATIONS WERE MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
Alan Hydraulics & Machinery GHX dba SA Belting Taylor Made Hose Demandstar
Austin Dist. & Mfg. Corp. Hydraulic Supply & Services TX Industrial & Rubber =~ SAWS Website

Capitol Bearing Serv. Masthead Hose & Supply
EG Hendrix NAPA Auto Parts

Eldorado Hose & Gaskets San Antonio Belting & Pulley
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