F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

04-0281

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEN 2 2
P. 0. BOX 2449 g 5
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 - g 58 % 2 -
TABULATION OF BIDS .- 5 2E ERP ER
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for E 2 >:< _§ = E E’ ?g é % o >:<
Fox Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel TEs g ; g g 3¢ 585
mes  (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) S £ 8 EXES 2 § 2 s § E
DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 16, 2004 £x < g2 < < F< S sz
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY é m (2 2 8 m (c/“) (c/c) 8 a (c/c) g S\W (2
ITEM1 |HYDRAULIC AND AIR HOSES - NESC UNIT * .298 Hyd Hose
A. Price Discount PRICE .337 Fitt Bulk 75% Hyd Hose
1. Discount off price list TOTAL 371 Fitt Single 63% Hyd Fitt No Bid No Bid
UNIT
PRICE Ryco
2. Price list identification TOTAL 35096-00 Couplamatic No Bid No Bid
UNIT
PRICE 04/01/04
3. Effective date of price list TOTAL Nov. 15, 2004 09/13/04 No Bid No Bid
UNIT
Column of price list on which discount is based PRICE List
4. (I.e., wholesale, jobber, retail) TOTAL List Price Retail No Bid No Bid
FITTINGS, COUPLINGS AND ADAPTERS UNIT Air Hose 50%, Air Coup 45%
B. Price Discount PRICE Air Fitt 54%, Air
1. Discount off price list TOTAL Various Air Nyl Tubing 54% No Bid No Bid
UNIT Flex Tech
PRICE Milton
2. Price list identification TOTAL Midland Metals No Bid No Bid
UNIT 01/01/04
PRICE 08/01/03
3. Effective date of price list TOTAL 01/01/03 No Bid No Bid
UNIT List
Column of price list on which discount is based PRICE Ind. Price
4, (L.e., wholesale, jobber, retail) TOTAL List No Bid No Bid
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEN

& &
P. O. BOX 2449 g Z
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 - § RS & g o
TABULATION OF BIDS . 5 2 oé ® .%" 2 ® 2 Q
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for E E >:< _§ = é E’ ?g é % o >:<
FOR: Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel ‘i‘ § i) § i .g -g 8 .g E) a k)
mes  (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) S £ 8 EXES 2 § 2 s §§
oATE: 3:00 p.m., November 16, 2004 £x < g SaT T Zs S <
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY é m (2 2 8 m (C/G) (5/3) 8 a (C/G) g S\\ (2
1 and 2 Wire Hoses PRICE
MFG.STK
C. SAE 100R1, Type AT (1 Wire Hoses) MFG.HOSE *
PRICE 0.98 0.67
MFG.STK 4G1 TI14A
a). 4G1 MFG.HOSE Gates Ryco No Bid No Bid
PRICE 1.23 0.82
MFG.STK 8G1 TI8A
b). 8G1 MFG.HOSE Gates Ryco No Bid No Bid
PRICE 1.99 1.36
MFG.STK 12G1 TI112A
c). 12G1 MFG.HOSE Gates Ryco No Bid No Bid
PRICE
MFG.STK
SAE 100R1, Style E7, Type AT MFG.HOSE
PRICE 1.23 0.80
MFG.STK 4G2 T24A
a). AG2 MFG.HOSE Gates Ryco No Bid No Bid
PRICE 1.44 0.89
MFG.STK 6G2 T26A
b). 6G2 MFG.HOSE Gates Ryco No Bid No Bid
PRICE 1.65 1.01
MFG.STK 8G2 T28A
c). 8G2 MFG.HOSE Gates Ryco No Bid No Bid
PRICE
MFG.STK
FITTINGS (FOR 1 AND 2 WIRE HOSES) MFG.HOSE
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04-0281

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEN g z
P. 0. BOX 2449 g 5
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 w g 58 3 g e
TABULATION OF BIDS . & 3 =& & 2 & RS
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for E E >:< _§ = é E’ ?g é % o >:<
Fox Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel TEs g § g g 3¢ 585
mes  (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) S £ 8 EXES 2 § 2 s §§
DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 16, 2004 £x < g2 < < F< S sz
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY é m (2 2 8 m (C/G) (C/G) 8 a (C/G) g S\W (2
PRICE 1.61 1.21
MFG.STK 6G-6MP 603U
a). 6G-GMP MFG.HOSE Gates Couplamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 1.80 1.45
MFG.STK 8G-8MP 8.03U
b). 8G-8MP MFG.HOSE Gates Couplamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 2.82 2.07
MFG.STK 8G-10FJX 8.27U
c). 8G-10FJX MFG.HOSE Gates Couplamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 5.02 3.55
MFG.STK 10G-12FJX 10210
d). 10G-12FJX MFG.HOSE Gates Couplamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 10.73 7.68
MFG.STK 12G-12FJX90M 1265U
e). 12G-12FJX 90M MFG.HOSE Gates Couplamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 4.68 3.70
MFG.STK 12G-16MJ 1233U
f). 12G-16MJ MFG.HOSE Gates Couplamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE
SAE 100 R5, Type All MFG.STK
D. (Must meet SAE J1402 and DOTFMVSS 106-74) MFG.HOSE
FITTINGS (For A II Hoses) PRICE 1.74 1.09
MFG.STK 6CS5C T56
a). 6C5-4RMP MFG.HOSE Gates Ryco No Bid No Bid
PRICE 1.83 1.25
MFG.STK 8CSC T58
b). 8C5-8RMP MFG.HOSE Gates Ryco No Bid No Bid
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEN g 2
P. O. BOX 2449 g Z
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 - g 58 % 2 -
TABULATION OF BIDS . 5 = oé x %" 2 x § Q
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for E E >:< _§ = é E’ ?g é % o >:<
For. Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel TEs g § g g O£ pR-R
mes  (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) S £ 8 EXES 2 § 2 s §§
DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 16, 2004 £x < g AT T ES S <
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY é m (C,“) 2 8 m (C/“) (C/“) 8 a (C/“) g S\ﬁ (2
PRICE 2.78 1.46
MFG.STK 12C5C T510
c). 12C5-12RMP MFG.HOSE Gates Ryco No Bid No Bid
FITTINGS (For A II Hoses) PRICE 3.94 5.08
MFG.STK 6C5-4RMP 600R-1
a). 6C5-4RMP MFG.HOSE Gates Couplamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 4.19 5.08
MFG.STK 8C5-8RMP 803R-1
b). 8C5-8RMP MFG.HOSE Gates Couplamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 8.69 7.56
MFG.STK 12C5-12RMP 1203R-2
c). 12C5-12RMP MFG.HOSE Gates Couplamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 3.33 4.63
MFG.STK 6C5-6RFJX 627R-1
d). 6C5-6RFIX MFG.HOSE Gates Couplamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 4.21 451
MFG.STK 8C5-8RFJSX 824R-1
e). 8C5-8RFJSX MFG.HOSE Gates Couplamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 9.52 9.10
MFG.STK 12C5-12RFJX 1221R-2
f). 12C5-12RFJX MFG.HOSE Gates Couplamatic No Bid No Bid
4 Wire Spiral Hoses PRICE
MFG.STK
SAE 100R12, Type AT MFG.HOSE
PRICE 4.22 3.35
MFG.STK 12C12M HI1212A
a). 12C12M MFG.HOSE Gates Ryco No Bid No Bid
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEN g 2
P. O. BOX 2449 g Z
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 w g 58 3 g e
TABULATION OF BIDS . 5 = aé x %" 2 x _c_q) Q
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for E 2 >:< _§ = E E’ ?g é % o >:<
For. Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel TEs g i g g O£ pR-R
mes  (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) S £ 8 EXES 2 § 2 s § E
DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 16, 2004 £x < g AT T ES S <
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY é m (2 2 8 m (C/“) (C/“) 8 a (C/“) g S\ﬁ (2
PRICE 5.48 427
MFG.STK 16C12M HI1216A
b). 16C12M MFG.HOSE Gates Ryco No Bid No Bid
PRICE 9.40 6.71
MFG.STK 20C12M H1220A
c). 20C12M MFG.HOSE Gates Ryco No Bid No Bid
Fitting for 4 Wire Sprial Hose PRICE 5.09 7.70
MFG.STK 16GS-16FJX 4H16-E616
a). 16GS-16FJX MFG.HOSE Gates Couplamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 10.07 11.98
MFG.STK 12GS-16MB 4H12-E572
b). 12GS-16MB MFG.HOSE Gates Couplamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 6.02 13.95
MFG.STK 16GS-16MJ 4H16-E516
C). 16GS-16MJ MFG.HOSE Gates Couplamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 17.60 19.51
MFG.STK [ 16GS-16FJX90M 4H16-E676
d). 16GS-16FJX 90M MFG.HOSE Gates Couplamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 11.40 10.86
MFG.STK 12GS-12FL45M 4H12-EG42
e). 12GS-12FL45 MFG.HOSE Gates Couplamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 11.62 15.20
MFG.STK 20GS-20FJX 4H20-EG20
f). 20GS-20FJX MFG.HOSE Gates Couplamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 10.13 16.52
MFG.STK 20GS-20FL 4H20-EG20
g). 20GS-20FL MFG.HOSE Gates Couplamatic No Bid No Bid
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEN g 2
P. O. BOX 2449 g Z
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 - g 58 % 2 -
TABULATION OF BIDS . 5 = oé x %" 2 x § Q
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for E E >:< _§ = é E’ ?g é % o >:<
For. Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel TEs g § g g O£ pR-R
mes  (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) S £ 8 EXES 2 § 2 s §§
DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 16, 2004 £x < g AT T ES S <
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY é m (2 2 8 m (C/“) (C/G) 8 a (2 g S\\ (2
PRICE 22.79 32.29
MFG.STK 20GS-20FJX90 4H20-EG77
h). 20 GS-20FJX 90 MFG.HOSE Gates Couplamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 17.97 22.75
MFG.STK 20GS-20FLYOM 4H20-EG20
D). 20GS-20FL 90M MFG.HOSE Gates Couplamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE
MFG.STK
F. AIR HOSES MFG.HOSE
PRICE 0.93 0.15
MFG.STK Terminator RT-0125-RL
a). 1/4" - 319MB MFG.HOSE Gates Flex Tech No Bid No Bid
PRICE 1.05 0.17
MFG.STK Terminator RT-0375-RL
b). 3/8" - 319MB MFG.HOSE Gates Flex Tech No Bid No Bid
PRICE 1.37 0.26
MFG.STK Terminator RT-0500-RL
C). 1/2" - 319MB MFG.HOSE Gates Flex Tech No Bid No Bid
PRICE 1.84 0.46
MFG.STK Terminator RT-0750-RL
d). 3/4" - 319MB MFG.HOSE Gates Flex Tech No Bid No Bid
PRICE
MFG.STK
G. AIR COUPLERS MFG.HOSE
PRICE 1.38 1.06
MFG.STK S-727 S727
a). S727 MFG.HOSE Milton Milton No Bid No Bid
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEN g 2
P. O. BOX 2449 g Z
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 - g 58 % 2 -
TABULATION OF BIDS . 5 2 oda) ® .%" 2 ® 2 Q
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for E E >:< _§ = é E’ ?g é % o >:<
For. Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel TEs g § g g O£ pR-R
mes  (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) S £ 8 EXES 2 § 2 s §§
DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 16, 2004 £x < g AT T ES S <
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY <:£ m (2 2 8 m (C/G) (C/G) 8 a (C/G) g S\\ (2
PRICE 8.20 6.31
MFG.STK S-1816 S1816
b). S1816 MFG.HOSE Milton Milton No Bid No Bid
PRICE 2.10 1.62
MFG.STK S-1817 S1817
C). S1817 MFG.HOSE Milton Milton No Bid No Bid
PRICE 1.48 1.14
MFG.STK S-728 $728
d). S728 MFG.HOSE Milton Milton No Bid No Bid
PRICE 7.40 5.70
MFG.STK $-153 S153
e). S153 MFG.HOSE Milton Milton No Bid No Bid
PRICE 3.10 2.39
MFG.STK S-715 S715
f). S715 MFG.HOSE Milton Milton No Bid No Bid
PRICE 19.90 15.32
MFG.STK S-1144 S1144
g). S1144 MFG.HOSE Milton Milton No Bid No Bid
PRICE
MFG.STK
H. AIR FITTINGS MFG.HOSE
PRICE 1.58 1.18
MFG.STK 1868X4 680402
a). 1868X4 MFG.HOSE | Weather Head Midland Metal No Bid No Bid
PRICE 2.80 1.76
MFG.STK 1862X4 620400
b). 1862X4 MFG.HOSE [ Weather Head Midland Metal No Bid No Bid
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEN g z
P. O. BOX 2449 g Z
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 - g 58 % 2 -
TABULATION OF BIDS . 5 2 oé ® .%" 2 ® 2 Q
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for E E >:< _§ = é E’ ?g é % o >:<
For. Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel TEs g § g g O£ pR-R
mes  (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) S £ 8 EXES 2 § 2 s § E
DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 16, 2004 £x < g AT T ES S <
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY é m (2 2 8 m (C/G) (C/G) 8 a (C/G) g S\ﬁ (2
PRICE 4.07 3.08
MFG.STK 1869X6X25 6906025
c). 1869X6X2S MFG.HOSE | Weather Head Midland Metal No Bid No Bid
PRICE 2.45 2.30
MFG.STK 1869X4 6904025
d). 1869X4 MFG.HOSE [ Weather Head Midland Metal No Bid No Bid
PRICE
MFG.STK
I AIR NYLON TUBING MFG.HOSE
PRICE 0.17 15.11
MFG.STK PT23003 38-950
a). PT23003 MFG.HOSE | Weather Head Midland Metal No Bid No Bid
PRICE 0.22 30.64
MFG.STK PT23004 38-952
b). PT23004 MFG.HOSE [ Weather Head Midland Metal No Bid No Bid
PRICE 0.28 84.04
MFG.STK PT23005 38-960
C). PT23005 MFG.HOSE | Weather Head Midland Metal No Bid No Bid
PRICE 0.57 114.68
MFG.STK PT23008 38-965
d). PT23008 MFG.HOSE [ Weather Head Midland Metal No Bid No Bid
UNIT
PRICE
EMERGENCY REQUEST PLAT HOURLY RATE TOTAL 10.00 No Change No Bid No Bid
UNIT
PRICE
FOR INSTALLATION OF EACH FITTING OF HOSE TOTAL 0.00 No Change No Bid No Bid




F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

04-0281

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEN g 2
P. O. BOX 2449 g Z
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 - g 58 % 2 -
TABULATION OF BIDS . 5 = aé x %" 2 x _c_q) Q
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for E 2 >:< _§ = E E’ ?g é % o >:<
For. Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel TEs g i g g O£ pR-R
mes  (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) S £ 8 EXES 2 § 2 s § E
DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 16, 2004 £x < g AT T ES S <
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY é m (2 2 8 m (C/G) (C/“) 8 a (C/“) g S\ﬁ (2
UNIT
PRICE
Delivery Days TOTAL 3 days 3 days No Bid No Bid
UNIT 8:00 am - 7:30 am - 5:30 pm
PRICE 5:00 pm Mon.-Fri.
Business Hours/Days per week TOTAL M-Fri. 8:00 am - 12:00 pm Sat. No Bid No Bid
UNIT
NORTHWEST SERVICE CENTER PRICE
ITEMII |HYDRAULIC HOSES & FFITINGS TOTAL
UNIT *
A. Price Discount PRICE Hydro Hose 75%
1. Discount off price list TOTAL No Bid Hydro Fittings 63% No Bid 70%
UNIT
PRICE Ryco Hydraulics
2. Price list identification TOTAL No Bid Couplamatic No Bid Parker
UNIT
PRICE 04/01/04
3. Effective date of price list TOTAL No Bid 09/13/04 No Bid 09/15/04
UNIT
Column of price list on which discount is based PRICE List
4, (I.e., wholesale, jobber, retail) TOTAL No Bid Retail No Bid Retail
UNIT
PRICE
FITTINGS COUPLINGS AND ADAPTERS TOTAL
UNIT Air Hose 50%, Air
B. Price Discount PRICE Couplings 45%, Air Fitt 54%
1. Discount off price list TOTAL No Bid Air Nylon Tube 54% No Bid 70%
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SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 - § RS & g o
TABULATION OF BIDS . 5 = aé x %" 2 x _c_q) Q
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FOR: Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel ‘i‘ § i) § i .g -g 8 .g E) a k)
mes  (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) S £ 8 EXES 2 § 2 s § E
oATE: 3:00 p.m., November 16, 2004 £x < g SaT T Zs S <
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY é m (C,‘S 2 8 m (C/G) (C/G) 8 a (C/G) g S\\ (c/g
UNIT Flex Tech
PRICE Milton, Midland
2. Price list identification TOTAL No Bid Metals, Midland Metals No Bid Parker
UNIT
PRICE 01/01/04, 08/01/03
3. Effective date of price list TOTAL No Bid 01/01/03, 01/01/03 No Bid 09/15/04
UNIT
Column of price list on which discount is based PRICE List, Industrial
4, (L.e., wholesale, jobber, retail) TOTAL No Bid List, List No Bid Retail
PRICE
C. 1 and 2 Wire Hoses MFG.STK
SAE 100R1, Type AT (1 Wire Hoses) MFG.HOSE
PRICE 0.67 1.31
MFG.STK T-14A 421-4
a). 4G1 MFG.HOSE No Bid Ryco No Bid Parker
PRICE 0.82 1.55
MFG.STK T18A 421-8
b). 8G1 MFG.HOSE No Bid Ryco No Bid Parker
PRICE 1.36 2.68
MFG.STK T112A 421-12
c). 12G1 MFG.HOSE No Bid Ryco No Bid Parker
PRICE 0.80 1.57
SAE 100R2, AT/EN 853 2SN (2 Wire Hoses) MFG.STK T24A 3014
a). 4G2 MFG.HOSE No Bid Ryco No Bid Parker
PRICE 0.89 1.79
MFG.STK T26A 301.6
b). 6G2 MFG.HOSE No Bid Ryco No Bid Parker

10
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ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY é m (2 2 8 m (2 (C/“) 8 a (C/“) g S\ﬁ (2
PRICE 1.01 2.05
MFG.STK T28A 301-8
c). 8G2 MFG.HOSE No Bid Ryco No Bid Parker
PRICE 1.21 247
FITTINGS (For 1 and 2 Wire Hoses) MFG.STK 603V 10143-6-6
a). 6G-6MP MFG.HOSE No Bid Couplamatic No Bid Parker
PRICE 1.45 2.83
MFG.STK 803U 10143-8-8
b). 8G-8MP MFG.HOSE No Bid Couplamatic No Bid Parker
PRICE 2.07 3.93
MFG.STK 826V 10643-10-8
c). 8G-10FJX MFG.HOSE No Bid Couplamatic No Bid Parker
PRICE 3.55 6.46
MFG.STK 1021V 10643
d). 10G-12FJX MFG.HOSE No Bid Couplamatic No Bid Parker
PRICE 7.68 14.31
MFG.STK 12651V 13943-12-12
e). 12G-12FJX 90M MFG.HOSE No Bid Couplamatic No Bid Parker
PRICE 3.70 7.97
MFG.STK 1233V 10343-16-12
f). 12G-16MJ MFG.HOSE No Bid Couplamatic No Bid Parker
D. A II Hoses PRICE
SAE 100RS5, Type AII (Must meet SAE J1402 MFG.STK
and DOTFMVSS 106-74) MFG.HOSE
PRICE 1.09 2.62
MFG.STK T56 201.6
a). 6C5C MFG.HOSE No Bid Ryco No Bid Parker

11
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ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY é m (2 2 8 m (C/G) (C/G) 8 a (C/G) g S\\ (2
PRICE 1.25 2.76
MFG.STK T58 201.8
b). 8C5C MFG.HOSE No Bid Ryco No Bid Parker
PRICE 1.46 4.37
MFG.STK T510 201-12
c). 12C5C MFG.HOSE No Bid Ryco No Bid Parker
FITTINGS (For A II Hoses) PRICE 5.08 3.52
MFG.STK 600R-1 20120-4-6
a). 6C5-4RMP MFG.HOSE No Bid Couplamatic No Bid Parker
PRICE 5.08 5.26
MFG.STK 803R-1 20120-8-8
b). 8C5-8RMP MFG.HOSE No Bid Couplamatic No Bid Parker
PRICE 7.56 10.00
MFG.STK 1203R-2 20120-12-12
c). 12C5-12RMP MFG.HOSE No Bid Couplamatic No Bid Parker
PRICE 4.63 3.84
MFG.STK 627R-1 20620-6-6
d). 6C5-6C5-6RFIX MFG.HOSE No Bid Couplamatic No Bid Parker
PRICE 451 5.15
MFG.STK 824R-1 20620-8-8
e). 8C5-R-8RFJISX MFG.HOSE No Bid Couplamatic No Bid Parker
PRICE 9.10 12.12
MFG.STK 1221R-2 20620-12-12
f). 12C5-12RFJX MFG.HOSE No Bid Couplamatic No Bid Parker
E. 4 Wire Spiral Hoses PRICE
MFG.STK
SAE 100R12, Type AT MFG.HOSE

12




04-0281
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEN g 2
P. O. BOX 2449 g Z
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 - g 58 % 2 -
TABULATION OF BIDS . 5 = aé x %" 2 x _c_q) 5
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for E 2 >:< _§ = E E’ ?g é % o >:<
For. Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel TEs g i g g O£ pR-R
mes  (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) S £ 8 EXES 2 § 2 s §§
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ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY é m (2 2 8 m (C/“) (C/“) 8 a (C/“) g S\ﬁ (2
PRICE 3.35 6.00
MFG.STK HI1212A 772TC-12
a). 12C12M MFG.HOSE No Bid Ryco No Bid Parker
PRICE 427 7.39
MFG.STK HI1216A 772TC-16
b). 16C12M MFG.HOSE No Bid Ryco No Bid Parker
PRICE 6.71 14.07
MFG.STK H1220A 772TC-20
c). 20C12M MFG.HOSE No Bid Ryco No Bid Parker
Fitting for 4 Wire Spiral Hose PRICE 7.70 13.98
MFG.STK 4H16-E616 10671-1616
a). 16GS-16FJX MFG.HOSE No Bid Couplamatic No Bid Parker
PRICE 11.98 28.50
MFG.STK 4H12-E572 10571-16-12
b). 12GS-16MB MFG.HOSE No Bid Couplamatic No Bid Parker
PRICE 13.95 19.21
MFG.STK 4H16-E516 10371-16-16
c). 16GS-16MJ MFG.HOSE No Bid Couplamatic No Bid Parker
PRICE 19.51 35.45
MFG.STK 4H16-E676 13971-16-16
d). 16GS-16FJX 90M MFG.HOSE No Bid Couplamatic No Bid Parker
PRICE 10.86 19.45
MFG.STK 4H12-EG42 11771-12-12
e). 12GS-12FL45 MFG.HOSE No Bid Couplamatic No Bid Parker
PRICE 15.20 27.90
MFG.STK 4H20-E620 10671-20-20
f). 20GS-20FJX MFG.HOSE No Bid Couplamatic No Bid Parker
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04-0281
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEN g z
P. 0. BOX 2449 g 5
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 - g 58 % 2 -
TABULATION OF BIDS . & 3 =& & 2 & RS
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for E E >:< _§ = é E’ ?g é % o >:<
Fox Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel TEs g § g g 3¢ 585
mes  (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) S £ 8 EXES 2 § 2 s § E
DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 16, 2004 £x < g2 < < F< S sz
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY é m (2 2 8 m (C/“) (2 8 a (2 g S\\ (2
PRICE 16.52 28.41
MFG.STK 4H20-EG20 11571-20-20
2). 20GS-20FL MFG.HOSE No Bid Couplamatic No Bid Parker
PRICE 32.29 50.20
MFG.STK 4H20-EG77 13971-20-20
h). 20GS-20FJX 90 MFG.HOSE No Bid Couplamatic No Bid Parker
PRICE 22.75 34.44
MFG.STK 4H20-EG80 11971-20-20
D). 20GS-20FL 90M MFG.HOSE No Bid Couplamatic No Bid Parker
F. AIR HOSES PRICE 0.15 2.15
MFG.STK RT-0125-RL 213-4
a). 1/4"-319 MB MFG.HOSE No Bid Flex Tech No Bid Parker
PRICE 0.17 2.53
MFG.STK RT-0375-RL 213-6
b). 3/8"-319 MB MFG.HOSE No Bid Flex Tech No Bid Parker
PRICE 0.26 2.76
MFG.STK RT-0500-RL 213-8
c). 1/2" - 319MB MFG.HOSE No Bid Flex Tech No Bid Parker
PRICE 0.46 3.99
MFG.STK RT-0750-RL 213-12
d). 3/4"-319MB MFG.HOSE No Bid Flex Tech No Bid Parker
G. AIR COUPLERS PRICE 1.06 0.89
MFG.STK S727 H2C
a). S727 MFG.HOSE No Bid Milton No Bid Parker
PRICE 6.31 10.02
MFG.STK S1816 16
b). S1816 MFG.HOSE No Bid Milton No Bid Parker
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEN g 2
P. O. BOX 2449 g Z
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 - § RS & g o
TABULATION OF BIDS . 5 = oé x %" 2 x § Q
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for E E >:< _§ = é E’ ?g é % o >:<
FOR: Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel ‘i‘ § i) § i .g -g 8 .g E) a k)
mes  (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) S £ 8 EXES 2 § 2 s § E
oATE: 3:00 p.m., November 16, 2004 £x < g SaT T Zs S <
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY é m (2 2 8 m (C/“) (2 8 a (2 g S\\ (2
PRICE 1.62 2.70
MFG.STK S1817 2F
c). S1817 MFG.HOSE No Bid Milton No Bid Parker
PRICE 1.14 1.00
MFG.STK S728 H3C
d). S728 MFG.HOSE No Bid Milton No Bid Parker
PRICE 5.70 4.86
MFG.STK S153 B20-3B
e). S153 MFG.HOSE No Bid Milton No Bid Parker
PRICE 2.39 6.47
MFG.STK S715 B33
f). S715 MFG.HOSE No Bid Milton No Bid Parker
PRICE 15.32 21.50
MFG.STK S1144 14F11BB
g). S1144 MFG.HOSE No Bid Milton No Bid Parker
H. AIR FITTINGS PRICE 1.18 1.98
MFG.STK 680402 68PMT-4-2
a). 1868X4 MFG.HOSE No Bid Midland Metal No Bid Parker
PRICE 1.76 4.39
MFG.STK 620400 62PMT-4
b). 1862X4 MFG.HOSE No Bid Midland Metal No Bid Parker
PRICE 3.08 5.80
MFG.STK 6906025 169PMT-6-2
c). 1869X6X2S MFG.HOSE No Bid Midland Metal No Bid Parker
PRICE 2.30 3.44
MFG.STK 6904025 169PMTNS-4-2
d). 1869X4 MFG.HOSE No Bid Midland Metal No Bid Parker
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04-0281

F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEN g 2
P. O. BOX 2449 g Z
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 - g 58 % 2 -
TABULATION OF BIDS . 5 = oé x %" 2 x § Q
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for E E >:< _§ = é E’ ?g é % o >:<
For. Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel TEs g § g g O£ pR-R
mes  (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) S £ 8 EXES 2 § 2 s § E
DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 16, 2004 £x < g AT T ES S <
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY é m (2 2 8 m (C/“) (2 8 a (C/“) g S\ﬁ (2
L AIR NYLON TUBING PRICE 15.11 0.21
MFG.STK 38-950 NB-3-025
a). PT23003 MFG.HOSE No Bid Midland Metal No Bid Parker
PRICE 30.64 0.28
MFG.STK 38-952 NB-4-035
b). PT23004 MFG.HOSE No Bid Midland Metal No Bid Parker
PRICE 84.04 0.40
MFG.STK 38-960 NB-5-040
c). PT23005 MFG.HOSE No Bid Midland Metal No Bid Parker
PRICE 114.68 0.85
MFG.STK 38-965 NB-8-062
d). PT23008 MFG.HOSE No Bid Midland Metal No Bid Parker
UNIT
PRICE
EMERGENCY REQUEST FLAT HOUR RATE TOTAL No Bid No Charge No Bid No Charge
UNIT
FOR INSTALLATION OF EACH FITTING PRICE
ON LENGTH OF HOSE TOTAL No Bid No Charge No Bid No Charge
DELIVERY AND SERVICE UNIT
PRICE
a). Delivery Days TOTAL No Bid 3 days No Bid 2 days
UNIT 7:30 am - 5:30 pm 8:00 am -
PRICE Mon.-Fri. 6:00 pm
b). Business Hours TOTAL No Bid 8:00 am-12:00 pm Sat. No Bid Mon-Fri
ITEM IIT |SOUTH CENTRAL SERVICE CENTERS UNIT
HYDRAULIC HOSES & FITTINGS PRICE
A. Price Discount TOTAL
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04-0281

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEN g 2
P. O. BOX 2449 g Z
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 - g 58 % 2 -
TABULATION OF BIDS . 5 = oé x %" 2 x § Q
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for E 2 >:< _§ = E E’ ?g é % o >:<
For. Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel TEs g i g g O£ pR-R
mes  (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) S £ 8 EXES 2 § 2 s § E
DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 16, 2004 £x < g AT T ES S <
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY é m (2 2 8 m (C/“) (C/“) 8 a (C/“) g S\ﬁ (2
UNIT * .298 Hyd Hose
PRICE .337 Fitt Bulk Hyd Hose 75%
1. Discount off price list TOTAL .371 Fitt Single Hyd Fittings 63% 24-61% No Bid
UNIT
PRICE Ryco Hydraulics
2. Price list identification TOTAL 35096-00 Complamatic LP0913 No Bid
UNIT
PRICE 04/01/04
3. Effective date of price list TOTAL Nov. 15, 2004 09/13/04 Sept. 13, 2004 No Bid
UNIT
Column of price list on which discount is based PRICE List
4, (L.e., wholesale, jobber, retail) TOTAL List Price Retail List No Bid
FITTINGS, COUPLINGS AND ADAPTERS UNIT
PRICE
B. Price Discount TOTAL
UNIT Air Hose 50%, Air
PRICE Couplings 45%, Air Fitt 54%
1. Discount off price list TOTAL Various Air Nylon Tube 54% 54 +074% No Bid
UNIT Flex Tech, Milton
PRICE Midland Metal
2. Price list identification TOTAL Midland Metal No Bid
UNIT 01/01/04
PRICE 08/01/03 05/01/04 Aeroquip
3. Effective date of price list TOTAL 01/01/03, 01/01/03 01/01/04 Dixon No Bid
UNIT List
Column of price list on which discount is based PRICE Ind. Price
4, (L.e., wholesale, jobber, retail) TOTAL List, List List No Bid
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04-0281

F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEN g 2
P. O. BOX 2449 g Z
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 - g 58 % 2 -
TABULATION OF BIDS . 5 = oé x %" 2 x _c_q) Q
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for E 2 >:< _§ = E E’ ?g é % o >:<
For. Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel TEs g i g g O£ pR-R
mes  (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) S £ 8 EXES 2 § 2 s §§
DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 16, 2004 £x < g AT T ES S <
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY é m (C,“) 2 8 m (C/“) (C/“) 8 a (C/“) g S\ﬁ (2
C. 1 and 2 Wire Hoses PRICE
MFG.STK
SAE 100R1, Type AT (1 Wire Hose) MFG.HOSE
PRICE 0.98 0.67 0.87
MFG.STK 4G1 T14A 57MB-1-1/4
a). 4G1 MFG.HOSE Gates Ryco Couplamatic No Bid
PRICE 1.23 0.82 1.17
MFG.STK 8G1 T18A 57MB-1-1/2
b). 8G1 MFG.HOSE Gates Ryco Couplamatic No Bid
PRICE 1.99 1.36 1.77
MFG.STK 12G1 T112A 57BM-1-3/4
c). 12G1 MFG.HOSE Gates Ryco Couplamatic No Bid
SAE 100R2, AT/EN 853 2SN (2 Wire Hoses) PRICE 1.23 0.80 1.13
MFG.STK 4G2 T24A 57MB-2-1/4
a). 4G2 MFG.HOSE Gates Ryco Couplamatic No Bid
PRICE 1.44 0.89 1.30
MFG.STK 6G2 T26A 57BM-2-3/8
b). 6G2 MFG.HOSE Gates Ryco Couplamatic No Bid
PRICE 1.65 1.01 1.48
MFG.STK 8G2 T28A 57BM-2-1/2
c). 8G2 MFG.HOSE Gates Ryco Couplamatic No Bid
FITTINGS (For 1 and 2 Wire Hoses) PRICE 1.61 1.21 1.77
MFG.STK 6G-6MP 603U GC01-6X6
a). 6G-6MP MFG.HOSE Gates Complamatic Couplamatic No Bid
PRICE 1.80 1.45 2.07
MFG.STK 8G-8MP 803U GCO01-8X8
b). 8G-8MP MFG.HOSE Gates Complamatic Couplamatic No Bid
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

04-0281

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEN g 2
P. 0. BOX 2449 g 5
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 - g 58 % 2 -
TABULATION OF BIDS . & 3 =& & 2 & RS
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for E 2 >:< _§ = E E’ ?g é % o >:<
Fox Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel TEs g ; g g 3¢ 585
mes  (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) S £ 8 EXES 2 § 2 s §§
DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 16, 2004 £x < g2 < < F< S sz
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY é m (C,“) 2 8 m (C/“) (C/“) 8 a (C/“) g S\ﬁ (2
PRICE 2.82 2.07 2.73
MFG.STK 8G-10FJX 826U GC09-8X10
c). 8G-10FJX MFG.HOSE Gates Complamatic Couplamatic No Bid
PRICE 5.02 3.55 4.89
MFG.STK 10G-12FJX 10210 GC09-10X12
d). 100G-12FJX MFG.HOSE Gates Complamatic Couplamatic No Bid
PRICE 10.73 7.68 9.93
MFG.STK 12G-12FJX90M 12651U GC26-12X12
e). 12G-12FJX 90M MFG.HOSE Gates Complamatic Couplamatic No Bid
PRICE 4.68 3.70 5.19
MFG.STK 12G-16MJ 12330 GC08-12X16
f). 12G-16MJ MFG.HOSE Gates Complamatic Couplamatic No Bid
D. A II Hoses PRICE
SAE 100R5, Type AIl MFG.STK
(Must meet SAE J1402 and DOTFMVSS 106-74) MFG.HOSE
PRICE 1.74 1.09 1.72
MFG.STK 6C5C T56 58MBA-3/8
a). 6C5C MFG.HOSE Gates Ryco Couplamatic No Bid
PRICE 1.83 1.25 1.83
MFG.STK 8C5C T58 58MBA-1/2
b). 8C5C MFG.HOSE Gates Ryco Couplamatic No Bid
PRICE 2.78 1.46 2.67
MFG.STK 12C5C T510 58MBA-3/4
c). 12C5C MFG.HOSE Gates Ryco Couplamatic No Bid
FITTINGS (For A II Hoses) PRICE 3.94 5.08 2.47
MFG.STK 6C5-4RMP 600R-1 6R5-4MP
a). 6C5-4RMP MFG.HOSE Gates Complamatic Couplamatic No Bid
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEN g 2
P. 0. BOX 2449 g 5
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 - g 58 % 2 -
TABULATION OF BIDS . & 3 =& & 2 & RS
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for E 2 >:< _§ = E E’ ?g é % o >:<
Fox Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel TEs g ; g g 3¢ 585
mes  (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) S £ 8 EXES 2 § 2 s §§
DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 16, 2004 £x < g2 < < F< S sz
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY é m (C,‘S 2 8 m (2 (C/“) 8 a (C/“) g S\W (2
PRICE 4.19 5.08 3.80
MFG.STK 8C5-8RMP 803R-1 8R5-8MP
b). 8C5-8RMP MFG.HOSE Gates Complamatic Couplamatic No Bid
PRICE 8.69 7.56 7.15
MFG.STK 12C5-12RMP 1203R-2 12R5-12MP
c). 12C5-12RMP MFG.HOSE Gates Complamatic Couplamatic No Bid
PRICE 3.33 4.63 3.94
MFG.STK 6C5-6RFJX 627R-1 6R5-6FJ
d). 6C5-6RFIX MFG.HOSE Gates Complamatic Couplamatic No Bid
PRICE 4.21 451 5.09
MFG.STK 8C5-8RFJSX 824R-1 8R5-8FJ
e). 8C5-8RFJSX MFG.HOSE Gates Complamatic Couplamatic No Bid
PRICE 9.52 9.10 9.25
MFG.STK 12C5-12RFJX 1221R-2 12R5-12FJ
f). 12C5-12RFJX MFG.HOSE Gates Complamatic Couplamatic No Bid
E. 4 Wire Sprial Hoses PRICE
MFG.STK
SAE 100R12, Type AT MFG.HOSE
PRICE 4.22 3.35 3.89
MFG.STK 12C12M HI1212A RCI12-3/4
a). 12C12M MFG.HOSE Gates Ryco Couplamatic No Bid
PRICE 5.48 427 4.78
MFG.STK 16C12M HI1216A RCI12-1
b). 16C12M MFG.HOSE Gates Ryco Couplamatic No Bid
PRICE 9.40 6.71 7.39
MFG.STK 20C12M H1220A RCI2-11/4
c). 20C12M MFG.HOSE Gates Ryco Couplamatic No Bid

20




04-0281
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEN g 2
P. O. BOX 2449 g Z
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 - g 58 % 2 -
TABULATION OF BIDS . 5 = aé x %" 2 x _c_q) Q
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for E 2 >:< _§ = E E’ ?g é % o >:<
For. Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel TEs g i g g O£ pR-R
mes  (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) S £ 8 EXES 2 § 2 s §§
DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 16, 2004 £x < g AT T ES S <
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY é m (C,“) 2 8 m (C/G) (C/“) 8 a (C/“) g S\\ (2
Fitting for 4 Wire Sprial Hose PRICE 5.09 7.70 8.55
MFG.STK 16GS-16FJX 4H16-E616 GW09-16X16
a). 16GS-16FJX MFG.HOSE Gates Complamatic Couplamatic No Bid
PRICE 10.07 11.98 11.52
MFG.STK 12GS-16MB 4H12-E572 IBA16MBI16
b). 12GS-16MB MFG.HOSE Gates Complamatic Aeroquip No Bid
PRICE 6.02 13.95 12.49
MFG.STK 16GS-16MJ 4H16-E516 GWO08-16X16
c). 16GS-16MJ MFG.HOSE Gates Complamatic Couplamatic No Bid
PRICE 17.60 19.51 21.70
MFG.STK | 16GS-16FJX90M 4H16-E676 GW26-16X16
d). 16GS-16FJX 90M MFG.HOSE Gates Complamatic Couplamatic No Bid
PRICE 11.40 10.86 11.57
MFG.STK 12GS-12F45 4H12-EG42 GW50-12X12
e). 12GS-12FL45 MFG.HOSE Gates Complamatic Couplamatic No Bid
PRICE 11.62 15.20 16.61
MFG.STK 20GS-20FJX 4H20-E620 GW09-20X20
f). 20GS-20FJX MFG.HOSE Gates Couplamatic No Bid
PRICE 10.13 16.52 19.24
MFG.STK 20GS-20FL 4H20-EG20 GW47-20X20
2). 20GS-20FL MFG.HOSE Gates Complamatic Couplamatic No Bid
PRICE 22.79 32.29 30.89
MFG.STK 20GS-20FJX90 4H20-E677 GW26-20X20
h). 20GS-20FJX 90 MFG.HOSE Gates Complamatic Couplamatic No Bid
PRICE 17.97 22.75 25.19
MFG.STK 20GS-20FL90M 4H20-EG80 GW53-20X20
D). 20GS-20FL 90M MFG.HOSE Gates Complamatic Couplamatic No Bid
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEN g 2
P. O. BOX 2449 g Z
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 - g 58 % 2 -
TABULATION OF BIDS . 5 = oé x %" 2 x § §
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for E 2 >:< _§ = E E’ ?g é % o >:<
For. Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel TEs g i g g O£ pR-R
mes  (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) S £ 8 EXES 2 § 2 s §§
DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 16, 2004 £x < g AT T ES S <
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY é m (2 2 8 m (C/G) (C/“) 8 a (C/“) g S\W (2
F. AIR HOSES PRICE 0.93 0.15 2.93
MFG.STK Terminator RT-0125-RL 1/4"-319MB
a). 1/4" - 319MB MFG.HOSE Gates Flex Tech Gates No Bid
PRICE 1.05 0.17 3.44
MFG.STK Terminator RT-0375-RL 3/8"-319MB
b). 3/8" -319MB MFG.HOSE Gates Flex Tech Gates No Bid
PRICE 1.37 0.26 1.79
MFG.STK Terminator RT-0500-RL H600808
c). 1/2" - 319MB MFG.HOSE Gates Flex Tech Boston No Bid
PRICE 1.84 0.46 2.49
MFG.STK Terminator RT-0750-RL H600812
d). 3/4" - 319MB MFG.HOSE Gates Flex Tech Boston No Bid
G. AIR COUPLERS PRICE 1.38 1.06 0.87
MFG.STK S-727 5,727.00 FD40-1014-04-04
a). S727 MFG.HOSE Milton Milton Aeroquip No Bid
PRICE 8.20 6.31 12.18
MFG.STK S-1816 S727 FD40-1001-08-08
b). S1816 MFG.HOSE Milton Milton Aeroquip No Bid
PRICE 2.10 1.62 1.90
MFG.STK S-1817 S1816 DCP17
c). S1817 MFG.HOSE Milton Milton Dixon No Bid
PRICE 1.48 1.14 1.09
MFG.STK S-728 S728 FD40-1013-04-04
d). S728 MFG.HOSE Milton Milton Aeroquip No Bid
PRICE 7.40 5.70 7.87
MFG.STK S-153 S153 D201
e). S153 MFG.HOSE Milton Milton Dixon No Bid
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEN g 2
P. O. BOX 2449 g Z
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 - g 58 % 2 -
TABULATION OF BIDS . 5 = oé x %" 2 x _c_q) g
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for E 2 >:< _§ = E E’ ?g é % o >:<
For. Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel TEs g i g g O£ pR-R
mes  (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) S £ 8 EXES 2 § 2 s § E
DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 16, 2004 £x < g AT T ES S <
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY é m (C,“) 2 8 m (C/“) (C/“) 8 a (C/“) g S\ﬁ (2
PRICE 3.10 2.39 6.14
MFG.STK S-715 S715 FD40-1000-04-04
f). S715 MFG.HOSE Milton Milton Aeroquip No Bid
PRICE 19.10 15.44 18.89
MFG.STK S-1144 S1144 F00-02M
2). S1144 MFG.HOSE Milton Milton Dixon No Bid
H. AIR FITTINGS PRICE 1.58 1.18 1.49
MFG.STK 1868X4 680402 1868X4
a). 1868X4 MFG.HOSE | Weather Head Midland Metal Weatherhead No Bid
PRICE 2.80 1.76 2.63
MFG.STK 1862X4 620400 1862X4
b). 1862X4 MFG.HOSE | Weather Head Midland Metal Weatherhead No Bid
PRICE 3.08 4.11
MFG.STK 6906025 1869X6X2S
c). 1869X6X2S MFG.HOSE Midland Metal Weatherhead No Bid
PRICE 2.45 2.30 2.30
MFG.STK 1869X4 6904025 1869X4
d). 1869X4 MFG.HOSE | Weather Head Midland Metal Weatherhead No Bid
L AIR NYLON TUBING PRICE 0.17 15.11 17.00
MFG.STK PT23003 38-950 PT23003BK-100
a). PT23003 MFG.HOSE | Weather Head Midland Metal Weatherhead No Bid
PRICE 0.22 30.64 22.00
MFG.STK PT23004 38-952 PT23004BK-100
b). PT23004 MFG.HOSE | Weather Head Midland Metal Weatherhead No Bid
PRICE 0.28 84.04 27.00
MFG.STK PT23005 38-960 PT23005BK-100
c). PT23005 MFG.HOSE | Weather Head Midland Metal Weatherhead No Bid
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEN g 2
P. O. BOX 2449 g Z
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 - g 58 % 2 -
TABULATION OF BIDS . 5 = aé x %" 2 x _c_q) 5
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for E E >:< _§ = é E’ ?g é % o >:<
For. Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel TEs g § g g O£ pR-R
mes  (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) S £ 8 EXES 2 § 2 s § E
DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 16, 2004 £x < g AT T ES S <
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY é m (C,“) 2 8 m (C/G) (C/G) 8 a (C/G) g S\\ (2
PRICE 0.57 114.68 54.00
MFG.STK PT23008 38-965 PT23008BK-100
d). PT23008 MFG.HOSE | Weather Head Midland Metal Weatherhead No Bid
UNIT
PRICE
EMERGENCY REQUEST FLAT HOURLY RATE TOTAL 10.00 No Charge 50.00 No Bid
UNIT
FOR INSTALLATION OF EACH FITTING ON PRICE
LENGTH OF HOSE TOTAL 0.00 No Charge 0.00 No Bid
DELIVERY AND SERVICE UNIT
PRICE
Delivery Days TOTAL 3 days 3 days 3 days No Bid
UNIT 8:00 am - 7:30 am - 5:30 pm 8:00 am -
PRICE 5:00 pm Mon-Fri 5:00 pm
Business Hours TOTAL M-Fri 8:00 am-12:00 pm Sat. Mon - Fri No Bid
ITEM IV (MOBILE UNIT SERVICE UNIT
PRICE
TOTAL
UNIT *
PRICE
Labor Rate per hour TOTAL No Bid 55.00 No Bid No Bid
UNIT
PRICE
Flat Rate after hours TOTAL No Bid 82.50 No Bid No Bid
UNIT
PRICE
Minimum Hour charge TOTAL No Bid One Hour No Bid No Bid
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04-0281

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEN g 2
P. O. BOX 2449 g Z
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 - g 58 % 2 -
TABULATION OF BIDS . 5 = oé x %" 2 x _c_q) Q
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for E E >:< _§ = é E’ ?g é % o >:<
For. Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel TEs g § g g O£ pR-R
mes  (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) S £ 8 EXES 2 § 2 s § E
DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 16, 2004 £x < g AT T ES S <
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY é m (2 2 8 m (2 (C/“) 8 a (C/“) g S\ﬁ (2
UNIT
PRICE
Fuel Surcharge TOTAL No Bid 0.00 No Bid No Bid
UNIT
PRICE
Mileage Charge TOTAL 0.00 No Bid No Bid
HYDRAULIC HOSES & FITTINGS UNIT
PRICE
A. Price Discount TOTAL
UNIT
PRICE Hyd Hose 75%
1. Discount off price list TOTAL No Bid Hyd Fittings 63% No Bid No Bid
UNIT
PRICE Ryco Hydraulics
2. Price list identification TOTAL No Bid Complamatic No Bid No Bid
UNIT
PRICE 04/01/04
3. Effective date of price list TOTAL No Bid 09/13/04 No Bid No Bid
UNIT
Column of price list on which discount is based PRICE List
4, (L.e., wholesale, jobber, retail) TOTAL No Bid Rental No Bid No Bid
FITTINGS, COUPLINGS AND ADAPTERS UNIT
PRICE
B. Price Discount TOTAL No Bid No Bid
UNIT Air Hose 50%, Air Coup 45%
PRICE Air Fittings 54%
1. Discount off price list TOTAL Air Nylon Tube 54% No Bid No Bid
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEN g 2
P. O. BOX 2449 g Z
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 - g 58 % 2 -
TABULATION OF BIDS . 5 = aé x %" 2 x _c_q) 5
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for E E >:< _§ = é E’ ?g é % o >:<
For. Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel TEs g § g g O£ pR-R
mes  (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) S £ 8 EXES 2 § 2 s § E
DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 16, 2004 £x < g AT T ES S <
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY é m (2 2 8 m (C/“) (C/“) 8 a (C/“) g S\\ (2
UNIT Flex Tech, Milton
PRICE Midland Metal
2. Price list identification TOTAL Midland Metal No Bid No Bid
UNIT 01/01/04
PRICE 08/01/03
3. Effective date of price list TOTAL 01/01/03, 01/01/03 No Bid No Bid
UNIT
Column of price list on which discount is based PRICE List, Industrial Price,
4. (L.e., wholesale, jobber, retail) TOTAL List, List No Bid No Bid
C. 1 and 2 Wire Hoses PRICE
MFG.STK
SAE 100R1, Type AT (1 Wire Hoses) MFG.HOSE
PRICE 0.67
MFG.STK T-14A
a). 4G1 MFG.HOSE No Bid Ryco No Bid No Bid
PRICE 0.82
MFG.STK T-18A
b). 8G1 MFG.HOSE No Bid Ryco No Bid No Bid
PRICE 1.36
MFG.STK T-112A
c). 12G1 MFG.HOSE No Bid Ryco No Bid No Bid
PRICE
MFG.STK
SAE 100R2, AT/EN 853 2SN (2 Wire Hoses) MFG.HOSE
PRICE 0.80
MFG.STK T24A
a). 4G2 MFG.HOSE No Bid Ryco No Bid No Bid
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEN g 2
P. O. BOX 2449 g Z
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 " g 58 3 g R
TABULATION OF BIDS . 5 = oé x %" 2 x § 5
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for E E >:< _§ = é E’ ?g é % o >:<
FOR: Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel ‘i‘ § i) § i .g -g 8 .g E) a k)
mes  (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) S £ 8 EXES 2 § 2 s § E
oATE: 3:00 p.m., November 16, 2004 £x < g SaT T Zs S <
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY é m (2 2 8 m (C/G) (C/G) 8 a (C/G) g S\W (2
PRICE 0.89
MFG.STK T26A
b). 6G2 MFG.HOSE No Bid Ryco No Bid No Bid
PRICE 1.01
MFG.STK T28A
c). 8G2 MFG.HOSE No Bid Ryco No Bid No Bid
FITTINGS (For 1 and 2 Wire Hoses) PRICE 1.21
MFG.STK 603V
a). 6G-6MP MFG.HOSE No Bid Complamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 1.45
MFG.STK 803V
b). 8G-8MP MFG.HOSE No Bid Complamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 2.07
MFG.STK 827V
c). 8G-10FJX MFG.HOSE No Bid Complamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 3.55
MFG.STK 1021V
d). 10G-12FJX MFG.HOSE No Bid Complamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 7.68
MFG.STK 12651V
e). 12G-12FJX 90M MFG.HOSE No Bid Complamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 3.70
MFG.STK 1233V
f). 12G-16MJ MFG.HOSE No Bid Complamatic No Bid No Bid
D. A II Hoses PRICE
SAE 100R5, Type AIl MFG.STK
(Must meet SAE J1402 and DOTFMVSS 106-74) MFG.HOSE
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEN g z
P. 0. BOX 2449 g 5
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 - g 58 % 2 -
TABULATION OF BIDS . & 3 =& & 2 & RS
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for E E >:< _§ = é E’ ?g é % o >:<
Fox Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel TEs g § g g 3¢ 585
mes  (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) S £ 8 EXES 2 § 2 s §§
DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 16, 2004 £x < g2 < < F< S sz
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY é m (c/g 2 8 m (5/3) (5/3) 8 a (5/3) g S\ﬁ (c/g
PRICE 1.09
MFG.STK T56
a). 6C5C MFG.HOSE No Bid Ryco No Bid No Bid
PRICE 1.25
MFG.STK T58
b). 8C5C MFG.HOSE No Bid Ryco No Bid No Bid
PRICE 1.46
MFG.STK T510
c). 12C5C MFG.HOSE No Bid Ryco No Bid No Bid
FITTINGS (For A II Hoses) PRICE 5.08
MFG.STK 600R-1
a). 6C5-4RMP MFG.HOSE No Bid Complamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 5.08
MFG.STK 803R-1
b). 8C5-8RMP MFG.HOSE No Bid Complamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 7.56
MFG.STK 1203R-2
c). 12C5-12RMP MFG.HOSE No Bid Complamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 4.63
MFG.STK 627R-1
d). 6C5-6RFIX MFG.HOSE No Bid Complamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 4.51
MFG.STK 824R-1
e). 8C5-8RFJSX MFG.HOSE No Bid Complamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 9.10
MFG.STK 1221R-2
f). 12C5-12RFJX MFG.HOSE No Bid Complamatic No Bid No Bid
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEN g 2
P. O. BOX 2449 g Z
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 - § RS & g o
TABULATION OF BIDS . 5 = oé x %" 2 x § 5
rrorosa.  Annual Contract for Sz >:< 8 i=fia 2 ?; o z g >:<
FOR: Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel ‘i‘ § i) § i .g -g 8 .g E) a k)
mes  (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) S £ 8 EXES 2 § 2 s § E
oATE: 3:00 p.m., November 16, 2004 £x < g SaT T Zs S <
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY é m (2 2 8 m (C/G) (C/G) 8 a (C/G) g S\\ (2
E. 4 Wire Spiral Hoses PRICE
MFG.STK
SAE 100R12, Type AT MFG.HOSE
PRICE 3.35
MFG.STK HI1212A
a). 12C12M MFG.HOSE No Bid Ryco No Bid No Bid
PRICE 4.27
MFG.STK H1216A
b). 16C12M MFG.HOSE No Bid Ryco No Bid No Bid
PRICE 6.71
MFG.STK H1220A
c). 20C12M MFG.HOSE No Bid Ryco No Bid No Bid
Fitting for 4 Wire Sprial Hose PRICE 7.70
MFG.STK 4H16-E616
a). 16GS-16FJX MFG.HOSE No Bid Complamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 11.98
MFG.STK 4H12-E572
b). 12GS-16MB MFG.HOSE No Bid Complamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 13.95
MFG.STK 4H16-E516
c). 16GS-16MJ MFG.HOSE No Bid Complamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 19.51
MFG.STK 4H16-E676
d). 16GS-16FJX 90M MFG.HOSE No Bid Complamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 10.86
MFG.STK 4H12-EG42
e). 12GS-12FL45 MFG.HOSE No Bid Complamatic No Bid No Bid
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEN g z
P. 0. BOX 2449 g 5
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 - g 58 % 2 -
TABULATION OF BIDS . & 3 =& & 2 & RS
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for E E >:< _§ = é E’ ?g é % o >:<
Fox Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel TEs g § g g 3¢ 585
mes  (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) S £ 8 EXES 2 § 2 s § E
DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 16, 2004 £x < g2 < < F< S sz
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY <:£ m (2 2 8 m (5/3) (C/G) 8 a (5/3) g S\ﬁ (2
PRICE 15.20
MFG.STK 4H20-E620
f). 20GS-20FJX MFG.HOSE No Bid Complamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 16.52
MFG.STK 4H20-EG20
2). 20GS-20FL MFG.HOSE No Bid Complamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 32.29
MFG.STK 4H20-E677
h). 20GS-20FJX 90 MFG.HOSE No Bid Complamatic No Bid No Bid
PRICE 22.75
MFG.STK 4H20-EG80
D). 20GS-20FL 90M MFG.HOSE No Bid No Bid No Bid
F. AIR HOSES PRICE 0.15
MFG.STK RT-0125-RL
a). 1/4" - 319MB MFG.HOSE No Bid Flex Tech No Bid No Bid
PRICE 0.17
MFG.STK RT-0375-RL
b). 3/8" - 319MB MFG.HOSE No Bid Flex Tech No Bid No Bid
PRICE 0.26
MFG.STK RT-0500-RL
o). 12" - 319MB MFG.HOSE No Bid Flex Tech No Bid No Bid
PRICE 0.46
MFG.STK RT-0750-RL
d). 3/4" - 319MB MFG.HOSE No Bid Flex Tech No Bid No Bid
G. AIR COUPLERS PRICE 1.06
MILTON MFG.STK 5727
a). 727 MFG.HOSE No Bid Milton No Bid No Bid
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEN g 2
P. O. BOX 2449 g Z
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 - g 58 % 2 -
TABULATION OF BIDS .- S 2E ER E
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for E E >:< _§ = é E’ ?g é % o >:<
For. Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel TEs g § g g O£ pR-R
mes  (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) S £ 8 EXES 2 § 2 s §§
DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 16, 2004 £x < g AT T ES S <
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY é m (2 2 8 m (c/“) (2 8 a (c/“) g S\W (2
PRICE 6.31
MFG.STK S1816
b). S1816 MFG.HOSE No Bid Milton No Bid No Bid
PRICE 1.62
MFG.STK S1817
0. S1817 MFG.HOSE No Bid Milton No Bid No Bid
PRICE 144
MFG.STK s728
d). $728 MFG.HOSE No Bid Milton No Bid No Bid
PRICE 5.70
MFG.STK S153
o). S153 MFG.HOSE No Bid Milton No Bid No Bid
PRICE 2.39
MFG.STK §715
. $715 MFG.HOSE No Bid Milton No Bid No Bid
PRICE 15.44
MFG.STK S1144
o). S1144 MFG.HOSE No Bid Milton No Bid No Bid
H. AIR FITTINGS PRICE 118
WEATHERHEAD MFG.STK 680402
). 1868X4 MFG.HOSE No Bid Midland Metal No Bid No Bid
PRICE 1.76
MFG.STK 620400
b). 1862X4 MFG.HOSE No Bid Midland Metal No Bid No Bid
PRICE 3.08
MFG.STK 6906025
0. 1869X6X2S MFG.HOSE No Bid Midland Metal No Bid No Bid
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEN g z
P. O. BOX 2449 g Z
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 - g 58 % 2 -
TABULATION OF BIDS . 5 3 Qf_, ® .%" 2 ® g Q
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for E 2 >:< _§ = E E’ ?g é % o >:<
For. Hose & Fittings Hydraulic, Air Water & Fuel TEs g i g g O£ pR-R
mes  (Date of Award through December 31, 2005) S £ 8 EXES 2 § 2 s § E
DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 16, 2004 £x < g AT T ES S <
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY é m (2 2 8 m (C/G) (C/“) 8 a (C/“) g S\W (2
PRICE 2.30
MFG.STK 6904025
d). 1869X4 MFG.HOSE No Bid Midland Metal No Bid No Bid
L. AIR NYLON TUBING PRICE 15.11
WEATHERHEAD MFG.STK 38-950
a). PT23003 MFG.HOSE No Bid Midland Metal No Bid No Bid
PRICE 30.64
MFG.STK 38-952
b). PT23004 MFG.HOSE No Bid Midland Metal No Bid No Bid
PRICE 84.04
MFG.STK 38-960
c). PT23005 MFG.HOSE No Bid Midland Metal No Bid No Bid
PRICE 114.68
MFG.STK 38-965
d). PT23008 MFG.HOSE No Bid Midland Metal No Bid No Bid
1% 0% Net
Delivery Days 20 days 30 days 30 days
Terms 3 days 3 days 3 days
*DENOTES LOW BIDDER
BID INVITATIONS WERE MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
Alan Hydraulics & Machinery GHX dba SA Belting Demandstar
Austin Dist. & Mfg. Corp. Hydraulic Supply & Services SAWS Website

Capitol Bearing Serv. NAPA Auto Parts
EG Hendrix TX Industrial & Rubber
Eldorado Hose & Gaskets
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