
04-0290
629 (Rev. 5/92)

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
FOR: Janitorial Supplies

TIME & Date of Award through December 31, 2005
DATE:   3:00 p.m., January 6, 2005

  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

ITEM 1. AIR FRESHNERS                          
a. METERED AIR FRESHNER, (26456) Price per Case $44.00 $48.00 $32.42 NO BID $33.60 $29.98 NO BID $38.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Size:  6.6 OZ, (12 per Case) Size 6.6 oz 6.6 oz 6.6 6.6 oz 7 oz 6.6 oz
Scent:  Passion Violet Scent Passion Violet Passion Violet Passion Violet Gala Garden Garden Potpourri
Brand:  Time Mist Brand TimeMist Time Mist TMS Hospeco Hospeco Aero
Product Code:  TMS 2962 Product Code TMS2962 TMS 2962 2962 HS-07907 7907 RR619
Manufacturer:  Waterbury Companies, Inc. Manufacturer Waterbury Waterbury Waterbury Hospeco Hospeco ABC
Estimated Qty  = 3 Cases/MO Qty per Case 12 12 12 12 12 12

Total Price for Year $1,584.00 $1,728.00 $1,167.12 $1,209.60 $1,079.28 $1,368.00
b. METERED AIR FRESHNER,  (19527) Price per Case $44.00 $48.00 $32.42 NO BID $33.60 $29.98 NO BID $38.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Size:  6.6 OZ, (12 per Case) Size 6.6 oz 6.6 oz 6.6 6.6 oz 7 oz 6.6 oz
Scent:  Bay Berry Scent Bay Berry Bay Berry Bay Berry Very Berry Apple Bay Berry
Brand:  Time Mist Brand TimeMist Time Mist TMS Hospeco Hospeco Aero
Product Code:  TMS 2521 Product Code TMS2521 TMS 2521 2521 HS-07901 7902 RA624
Manufacturer:  Waterbury Companies, Inc. Manufacturer Waterbury Waterbury Waterbury Hospeco Hospeco ABC
Estimated Qty = 3 Cases/MO Qty per Case 12 12 12 12 12 12

Total Price for Year $1,584.00 $1,728.00 $1,167.12 $1,209.60 $1,079.28 $1,368.00
c. METERED AIR FRESHNER, (38901) Price per Case $62.00 $48.00 $32.42 NO BID $33.60 $29.98 NO BID $38.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Size:  6.6 OZ, (12 per Case) Size 6.60 6.6 oz 6.6 6.6 oz 7 oz 6.6 oz
Scent:  Sea Mist Scent Sea Mist Sea Mist Sea Mist Tropical Tradewind Tropical Tradewind Ocean Breeze
Brand:  Time Mist Brand TimeMist Time Mist TMS Hospeco Hospeco Aero
Product Code:  TMS 4725 Product Code TMS 4725 TMS 4725 4725 HS-07908 7908 RQ639
Manufacturer:  Waterbury Companies, Inc. Manufacturer Waterbury Waterbury Waterbury Hospeco Hospeco ABC
Estimated Qty = 3 Cases/MO Qty per case 12 12 12 12 12 12

Total Price for Year $2,232.00 $1,728.00 $1,167.12 $1,209.60 $1,079.28 $1,368.00
d. AIR FRESHNER, WICK (9639) Price per Case $17.45 $18.00 $16.50 NO BID $21.47 $20.98 NO BID $24.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Size:   6.6 OZ, (12 per Case) Size 1.5 oz 1.5 oz 1.5 1.5 oz 1.5 oz 1.5
Scent:  all scents Scent n/a All Scents all All Scents Citrum or Cherry All Scents
Brand:  Fresh Products Brand Fresh Fresh FSH Fresh Fresh Fresh
Product Code:  101 Product Code FRS 1215MC FRESH 101 101 101 (1260694) 101 Fresh 101
Estimated Qty  = 10 Cases/MO Qty per Case 12 12 12 12 12 12

Total Price for Year $2,094.00 $2,160.00 $1,980.00 $2,576.40 $2,517.60 $2,880.00
Grand Total for Item 1 $7,494.00 $7,344.00 N/A $5,481.36 N/A $6,205.20 $5,755.44 N/A $6,984.00 N/A N/A N/A

ITEM 2. MOPS, BROOMS, & ACCESSORIES
a. MOP, DUST FRAME (10424) Price $3.90 NO BID $3.10 $2.99 NO BID $4.10 NO BID $1.88 NO BID

Size: 24"  x 5" Size 24x5 24 x 5 24 x 5 24 x 5 24 x 5
Part No:  UNS 1424 Part No. UNS1424 1424 1424 UNS1424 F245CH
Manufacturer:  UNISAN Manufacturer Unisan Unisan Unisan Unisan O'Dell
Estimated Qty  = 4/MO

Total Price for Year 187.20 $148.80 $143.52 $196.80 $90.24
b. CLIP (27508) Price $10.00 NO BID $7.50 $6.99 NO BID $21.00 NO BID $7.85 NO BID

Description:  12 Gauge zinc plated steel Brand Unisan Unisan Unisan U O'Dell
     hardware 180 degree swivel head with sliding Part No. UNS1490 1490 1490 UNS1490 H600
     sliding nylon lock 15" x 60" long double Manufacturer n/a Unisan Unisan Unisan O'Dell
     lacquered wood handle
Brand:  UNISAN
Part No:  UNS 1490
Estimated Qty = 4/MO

Total Price for Year $480.00 $360.00 $335.52 $1,008.00 $376.80
c. STEEL SPEED CHANGE MOP HANDLE (28477) Price $14.12 NO BID $10.60 $10.89 NO BID $14.00 NO BID $5.40 NO BID

Size:   Length 63-1/2" Size 63 1/2" 63 63 1/2 63 1/2 1" x 60"
Part No:  WHI 837 Part No. IMP837 837 837 IMP837WH C-8PM60
Manufacturer:  White Manufacturer Impact Impact/White White Impact Impact O'Dell
Estimated Qty = 2/MO

Total Price for Year $338.88 $254.40 $261.36 $336.00 $129.60
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449
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d. DISPOSABLE DUST MOPS (10423) Price $5.90 / $70.80 NO BID $5.15 $5.99 NO BID $7.25 NO BID $38.40 / case NO BID
Description:  Soft, open-twist blended cut- Size 24"x5" 24x5 24 x 5 24 x 5 24 x 5
     end yarn, Pre-treated Color White White White  White Natural
Size:  24" x 5" Brand Disposo-Treet II RBM Rubbermaid Castaway O'Dell
Color:  White Part No. ADT24W L153 L153 6153WHI DM245CH
Brand:  Castaway Manufacturer Golden Star RBM Rubbermaid Rubbermaid O'Dell
Part No:  L153 Qty per Case 12 / case 12 12 12 12
Manufacturer:  Rubbermaid
Estimated Qty = 12/MO

Total Price for Year $849.60 $741.60 $862.56 $1,044.00 $460.80
e. MOP HEAD (24737) Price per Case $90.45 NO BID $78.96 $80.98 NO BID $66.00 NO BID $65.52 NO BID

Description:  4 Ply Rayon Cut End 32 oz Size 4 ply rayon cut end 32 oz 32 oz 32 oz 32 oz
Manufacturer:  UNISAN Brand Unisan Rayon Unisan Amarillo O'Dell
Part No:  UNS 232R Part No. UNS 232R 232R 232R 01-6610 2332F
Qty:   (12 per case) Manufacturer n/a Unisan Unisan Amarillo O'Dell
Estimated Qty  = 2/MO (1 case every 6 mo) Qty per Case 12 / case 12 12 12 12

Total Price for Year $180.90 $157.92 $161.96 $132.00 $131.04
f. MOP HEAD (24739) Price $70.79 NO BID $60.25 $63.98 NO BID $60.00 NO BID $52.20 NO BID

Description:  4 Ply Rayon Cut End 24 oz Size 4 ply rayon cut end 24 oz 24 oz 24 oz 24 oz
Manufacturer:  UNISAN Brand n/a Rayon Unisan Amarillo O'Dell
Part No:  UNS 224R Part No. UNS224R 224R 224R 01-6608 2324F
Estimated Qty  = 18/MO (1 1/2 case per month) Manufacturer n/a Unisan Unisan Amarillo O'Dell

Qty per Case 12 / case 12 12 12 12
Total Price for Year $1,274.22 $1,084.50 $1,151.64 $1,080.00 $939.60

g. MOP HEAD (10425) Price per Case $49.10 NO BID $42.50 $45.98 NO BID $39.00 NO BID $36.48 NO BID
Description:  Cotton Size n/a 24 oz 24 oz 24 oz 24
Size:  24 oz Brand Unisan Unisan Unisan Amarillo O'Dell
Part No:  UNS 224C Part No UNS224C 224C 224C 01-6528 5324F
Qty  = (12 per case) Manufacturer Unisan Unisan Unisan Amarillo O'Dell
Estimated Qty  = 1/MO (1 case per yr) Qty per Case 12 / case 12 12 12 24

Total Price for Year $49.10 $42.50 $45.98 $39.00 $36.48
h. DUST MOP (10422) Price per Case $175.00 NO BID $41.50 $83.88 NO BID $112.00 NO BID $47.52 NO BID

Description:  Washable Size 5"x24" 24 x 5 24 x 5 24 x 5 24 x 5
Size:  24" X 5" (12 per case) Color yellow White White White Natural
Color:  White Brand Proline RBM Rubbermaid Tuftway O'Dell
Brand:  Tuftaway Part No. AQC 24PY K353 K353 K353 M245CH
Part No:  K353 Manufacturer Golden Star RBM Rubbermaid Rubbermaid O'Dell
Manufacturer:  Rubbermaid Qty per Case 12 / case 6 12 12 12
Estimated Qty  = 6/MO

Total Price for Year $1,050.00 $249.00 $503.28 $672.00 $285.12
i. MOP HEAD (24741) Price per Case $74.50 NO BID $62.50 $69.98 NO BID $96.00 NO BID $58.68 NO BID

Description:  Super Loop 4 Ply Cotton & Yarn Size 24 oz 24 oz 24 oz 24 oz 24 oz
Size:  24 oz Color Blue Blue Blue Blue Blue
Color:  Blue Brand n/a Unisan Unisan Unisan O'Dell
Part No:  UNS 502BL Part No. UNS502BL 5 oz BL 502BL UNS50ZBL 400M/Blue
Manufacturer:  UNISAN Manufacturer Unisan Unisan Unisan Unisan O'Dell
Estimated Qty:  4/MO Qty per Case 12 / case n/a 12 12 12

Total Price for Year $298.00 $250.00 $279.92 $384.00 $234.72
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS
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j. LOBBY UPRIGHT DUST PAN (24745) Price $15.94 NO BID $12.50 $9.99 NO BID $21.96 NO BID $7.35 NO BID
Material:  PLASTIC Brand Rubbermaid RBM Rubbermaid Rubbermaid O'Dell
Part No: RCP 2531 Part No. RCP2531 2531 2531 RCP 2531 LDP1
Manufacturer:  Rubbermaid Manufacturer Rubbermaid RBM Rubbermaid Rubbermaid O'Dell
Estimated Qty:   2/MO

Total Price for Year $382.56 $300.00 $239.76 $527.04 $176.40
k. SPONGE, SCRUBBING (10428) Price per Case $27.69 NO BID $36.50 $21.12 NO BID $46.08 NO BID $22.96 NO BID

Size:  3.6"L x 6.1" W (48 per case) Size 3.6 x 6.1 3x6 3.6" x 6.1 3.6 x 6.1 3.6 x 6.1
Color:  Yellow Color yellow yellow Yellow Yellow Yellow
Part No:  UNS CSI Part No. UNSCS1 CSI CS1 UNS CS1 CS1
Manufacturer:  UNISAN Manufacturer Unisan Unisan Unisan Unisan Unisan
Estimated Qty  = 16/MO (1 case every 3 mo) Qty per Case 48 48 48 48 48

Total Price for Year $110.76 $146.00 $84.48 $184.32 $91.84
Grand Total for Item 2 $5,201.22 N/A N/A $3,734.72 N/A N/A $4,069.98 N/A $5,603.16 N/A $2,952.64 N/A

ITEM 3: BOTTLES AND SPRAYERS
a. PLASTIC BOTTLE (24530) Price per Case $81.00 / .54 NO BID $50.00 / .52 $54.00 / .36 NO BID $65.00 / .65 NO BID NO BID

SIZE:  24 oz Size 24 oz 24 oz 24 oz 24 oz
PART NO:  UNS-24 Part No. UNS24 5024WG UNS 24 UNS24
MANUFACTURER:  UNISAN Manufacturer Unisan Impact/White Unisan Unisan
ESTIMATED QTY = 20/MO Qty per Case 150/cs 96 150 100

Total Price for Year $129.60 $124.80 $86.40 $156.00
b. TRIGGER SPRAYER (24528) Price per Case $130.00 / .65 NO BID $110.00 / 1.10 $96.00 / .48 NO BID $85.00 / .85 NO BID NO BID

Size:  8" Size 8" 8 1/8" 8 8"
Part No:  UNS 5910-8 Part No. uns5910-8 5680 5910-8 UNS 5910-8
Manufacturer:  UNISAN Manufacturer Unisan Impact Unisan Unisan
Estimated Qty  = 20/MO Qty per Case 200 100 200 100

Total Price for Year $156.00 $264.00 $115.20 $204.00
Grand Total for Item 3 $285.60 N/A N/A N/A $388.80 N/A $201.60 N/A $360.00 N/A N/A N/A

ITEM 4. FEMININE HYGIENE PRODUCTS
a. SANITARY NAPKINS MAXI PADS (248411) Price per Case $39.27 $40.00 NO BID $36.50 NO BID $33.50 $22.98 NO BID $62.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Size:  #4 Size 4 #4 #4 #4 4" #4
Brand:  GARDS Brand Gards Gards Hospeco Gards Hospeco Gards Guards
Product Code:  HOS 4-147 Product Code HOS4-147 HOS4-147 4-147 HS-4147 4-147 HOS4-147
Manufacturer:  HOSPECO Manufacturer HOSPECO HOSPECO Hospeco Hospeco Hospeco Hospeco
250 Packages Per Case Qty per Case 250 Pks/cs 250 / Pckg / case 250 250 250 250
Estimated Qty  = 1 cases/mo

Total Price for Year $471.24 $480.00 $438.00 $402.00 $275.76 $744.00
b. SANITARY NAPKIN, MAXI PADS (24843) Price per Case $47.30 $50.00 NO BID $38.50 NO BID $29.50 $24.95 NO BID $68.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Size:  #8 Size #8 #8 #8 #8 8" #8
Brand:  GARDS Brand Gards Gards Hospeco Gards Gards Guard 
Product Code:  HOS 8-248 Part no HOS 8-248 HOS8-248 8-147 HS-8248 8-2118 HOS8-248
Manufacturer:  HOSPECO Manufacturer HOSPECO HOSPECO Hospeco Hospeco Hospeco Hospeco
250 Packages Per Case Qty per Case 250/cs 250 pckg/ case 250 250 250 250
Estimated Qty = 1 CASE PER MONTH

Total Price for Year $567.60 $600.00 $462.00 $354.00 $299.40 $816.00
c. TAMPAX TAMPONS (24844) Price per Case $67.35 $68.00 NO BID $48.75 NO BID $58.95 $46.95 NO BID $72.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Brand:   Tampax Brand Tampax Tampax Tampax Tampax Tampax Tampax
Size:  500 Tampons per case Size n/a 500 / case 4" n/a n/a 500
Product Code: HOS TAMPAX Part one HOS TAMPAX HOS TAMPAX Hos Tampax HS-T500 T500 HosTampax
Estimated Qty  = 1 case every two months Qty per Case 500 / cs 500 / case 500 500 500 500

Total Price for Year $404.10 $408.00 $292.50 $353.70 $281.70 $432.00
Grand Total for Item 4 $1,442.94 $1,488.00 N/A $1,192.50 N/A $1,109.70 $856.86 N/A $1,992.00 N/A N/A N/A
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ITEM 5. DISINFECTANTS AND CLEANERS
a. NEUTRAL ALL-PURPOSE FLOOR CLEANER (24751) Price per Pack $18.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Description:  Non-dulling and rinse free, citrus Size 1 Gal
Brand:  Stride Brand Stride
Size:  1 gal containers (4 per pack) Product Code JW-3904
Product Code:  JW-3904 Manufacturer Johnson-Diversey

Manufacturer:  Johnson Diversey Qty per Case 4
Estimated Qty:  60 Gal/month (15 packs)

Total Price for Year $3,398.40
b. COMPLETE FLOOR FINISH Price $48.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID

METAL INTERLOCK FLOOR FINISH (10459) Size 5 gal
Size:  5 Gallon Envirobox Brand Complete
Product Code:  4651 Product Code JW-4651
Manufacturer:  Johnson Diversey Manufacturer Johnson-Diversey

Estimated Qty = 6 gal/month (1+ envirobox) Qty per Case 1  5 gal pail
Total Price for Year $731.25

c. STRIPPER, WAX HEAVY DUTY (10458) Price $42.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Size:  5 Gallon Pail Size 5 gal
Brand:  Mop 'N Strip Brand Mop N Strip
Product Code:  01121-005 Product Code CE-11210005
Manufactuarer: CELLO Manufacturer Cello
Estimated Qty  = 5 Pails/Month Qty per Case 1

Total Price for Year $2,526.00
d. SPRAY DISINFECTANT (24885) Price $69.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Size:  19 Oz Size 19 oz
Scent:  Original Scent Original
Brand:  Professional Lysol Brand Lysol
Product Code:  REC 04650 Product Code LG-4050
Manufacturer:  Reckett Benckiser Manufacturer Reckitt
Estimated Qty:  5 boxes/mo (12 per box) Qty per Box 12
DO NOT SUBSTITUTE

Total Price for Year $4,155.00
e. FOAMING DISINFECTANT CLEANER (24886) Price per Case $27.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Brand:  SUD-N-KLEEN Brand S'Gone
Product Code:  U17548 Product Code CE-5215M
Equal To:  S-GONE Manufacturer Cello
Estimated Qty:  8 cases/mo (12 per case) Qty per Case 12
DO NOT SUBSTITUTE

Total Price for Year $2,640.00
f. GENERAL PURPOSE CLEANER (25937) Price per Pack $30.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Scent:  Fresh Citrus Size 1 Gal
Size:  Pack (4 gal per Pack) Brand GP Forward
Brand:  G P Forward Product Code JW-4518
Product Code No:  4518 Manufacturer Johnson-Diversey

Manufacturer:  Johnson Diversey Qty per Pack 4  1 Gal
estimated Qty:  6 Gal/Mo  (1 1/2 Packs)
DO NOT SUBSTITUTE

Total Price for Year $541.80
g. SNAPBACK SPRAY BUFF (25936) Price per Pack $57.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Size:  PACK (4 gallons) Size 1 Gal
Brand:  SNAPBACK Brand Snapback
Product Code:  4116 Product Code JW-4116
Manufacturer:  Johnson Diversey Manufacturer Johnson-Diversey

Estimated Qty: 1 gal/every 2 months Qty per Pack 4  1 Gal
(2 PACKS PER YR)

Total Price for Year $114.50
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h. LIQUID BOWL CLEANER (24890) Price per Case $17.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Description:  Non-Acid Disinfectant Size Qt
Size:  1 Qt Brand NABC
Estimated Qty:  8 cases/mo (12 per case) Part No SP-7116

Manufacturer Spartan Chemical

Qty per Case 12
Total Price for Year $1,716.48

i1. LIQUID BOWL CLEANER (2327) Price per Case $16.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Description:  Acid Disinfectant Size Qt
Size:  1 Qt Brand ProBowl
Estimated Qty:  4 cases/Mo (12 per case) Part No CE-01675

Manufacturer Cello
Qty per Case 12

Total Price for Year $813.60
i2. LIQUID SOAP, HAND (24748) Price per case $22.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Description:  Color Pink contains Lanolin Scent Honey
Scent:  Honey Size 1 Gal
Size:  Case (6 Gallons per Case) Part No KS-91300
Part No:  Pink #1 Manufacturer Kimberly-Clark
Manufacturer:  MIC INDUSTRIES Qty per Case 4  1 Gal
Estimated Qty:  1 case per month

Total Price for Year $273.00
j. WATERLESS HAND CLEANING DISINFECTANT (9642) Price per Case $34.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Size:  4.25 oz Size 4.25 oz
Brand:  Purell Brand Purell
Part No:  9651-24 Part No GJ-9651-24
Qty Per Case:  24 Qty per Case 24
Estimated Qty:  19 case per mo

Total Price for Year $7,809.00
k. SOAP, DETERGENT GRANULAR LAUNDRY (10454) Price per Case $66.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Size:  32 oz Size 32 oz
Brand:  Tide Brand Tide
Manufacturer:  Proctor & Gamble Manufacturer Proctor & Gamble

Qty Per Case:  15 ea Qty per Case n/a
Estimated Qty:  29 cases per year

Total Price for Year $1,939.52
l. SOAP, HAND, PERSONAL (10780) Price per Case $39.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Size:  3.1 OZ Size 3.1 oz
Brand:  Ivory Brand Ivory #32136
Qty per Case:  100 ea Qty per Case 96
Estimated Qty:  3 cases per year

Total Price for Year $117.75
m. SOAP, HAND, solid (10779) Price per Case $45.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Size:  2-1/2 oz Size 2 1/2 oz.
Brand:  Safeguard Brand LG-DIA000197
Qty Per Case:  100 per case Qty per Case 100
Estimated Qty:  1 case per month

Total Price for Year $546.00
n. SOAP, HAND, EMERALD GREEN (10782) Price per box $27.48 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Size:  12 oz Size 800 ml
Brand:  GOJO Brand GoJo
Part No:  929F Part No GJ-929212
Qty Per Box:  12 per box qty per box 12
Estimated Qty = 3 BOXES PER MO

Total Price for Year $989.28
Grand Total for Item 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A $28,311.58 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
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ITEM 6 PAPER PRODUCTS
a. COVER, TOILET SEAT, 1/4 FOLD (24531) Price per Case $41.00 NO BID $52.69 $54.00 NO BID $47.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Part No: Part No RM-A 2600 Kry K5000 HS-QTR5M RM-A2600
Brand: Brand Acme Krystal Hospeco Acme
Qty Per Pack:   200 Qty per pack 200 25 25/200 200
Qty Per Case:  25 packs per case Qty per case 5000 250 5000 5000
Estimated Qty  = 17 cases per month

Total Price for Year $8,364.00 $10,748.76 $11,016.00 $9,588.00
b. MAT, Urinal Floor Disposable (16395) Price $45.00 / case NO BID $12.50 $37.00 NO BID $49.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Size:  17-1/2" x 20-1/2" x 1/4" Size 17 1/2" x 20 1/2" x 1/4" 17x20 17 1/2 x 20 x 1/4" 17.5 x 20.5 x 1/4"

Brand:  URIGUARD Brand Acme Impact Urigard Acme
Part No:  8600 Part No SCP-1047G4 1001 SP-8006 SCP-1047G4
Manufacturer:  Spartan Manufacturer Acme Impact Spartan  Acme
Estimated Qty = 7 boxes / mo (6 per box) Qty per case 6 / case 6 6 6

Total Price for Year $630.00 $1,050.00 $518.00 $686.00
c. TOILET PAPER (10786) Price per case $32.00 NO BID $41.50 $41.46 NO BID $34.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID

2 Ply 500 Sheet s Per Roll 4 1/2" x 4 1/2" Part No RRT 545 2200 TM-1610 RRT545
Brand:  Main Street Brand Lone Star Windsoft Main Street Lonestar
Manufacturer:  SCA Manufacturer Lone Star Windsoft SCA- Lonestar
Manufacturer Code No:  CP-1126 Mfg Code # n/a 2200 TM-1610 RRT545
Rolls per Case:  96 Rolls per Case 96 96 96 96
Sheet Size:  4 1/2 x 4 1/2 Sheet Size 4.5 x 4.5 4 1/2 x 4 1/2 4 1/2 x 4 1/2 4.5 x 4.5
Sheets Per Roll:  500 Sheets per Roll 500 500 500 500
Case Weight:  45 lb Case Weight 45 lb 40.5 44.1 lb 45 lb
Estimated Qty = 17 Cases per Month

Total Price for Year $6,528.00 $8,466.00 $8,457.84 $7,038.00
d. MULTIFOLD TOWELS (10784) Price per case $16.50 NO BID $33.50 $18.05 NO BID $18.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Manufactuarer Code:  KCC 01840 Mfg Code # PS-7500 4306 01840 MB-530 PS-7500 4306
Color:  Bleached White color White White Bleached White
Towel Size:  9.3 x 9.4 Towel Size 9.3 x 9.4 9x9 9 1/2 x 9 1/8 9.3 x 9.4
Towels Per Pack:  250 Towels Towels per Pack 250 250 250 250
Packs Per Case:  16 Packs Packs per Case 16 16 16 16

Manufacturer Name:  Kimberly-Clarke mfg name
Paper Craft Prime 
Source KCC SCA-

Papercraft 
Prime Source

Case Weight: Case Weight n/a 15.6 22.5 lb 17.1 lbs
Estimated Qty = 52 Cases per Month

Total Price for Year $10,296.00 $20,904.00 $11,263.20 $11,232.00
Grand Total for Item 6 N/A $25,818.00 N/A $41,168.76 N/A $31,255.04 N/A N/A $28,544.00 N/A N/A N/A

ITEM 7. TRASH CAN LINERS
a. BLACK CAN LINERS (10591) Price per case $21.25 NO BID $22.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.00

Capacity:  10 Gal Capacity 10 gal 10 Gal 10
Thickness in Mil:  .35 Mil Thickness in Mil .35 mil .35 0.35
Size:  24" x 24" Size 24" x 24" 24 x 24 24 x 24
Color:  Black color Black Black Black
Manufacturer:  Interplast Manufacturer Interplast Roupack UPC
Manufacturer Code No:  SL2424LTN/K Mfg Code # SL2424LTK PR232 2424LTB
Bags Per Roll:  50 Rolls Bags per Roll 50 50 50
Qty Per Roll:  20 Rolls Per Case Qty per Case 20 20 1000
Weight Capacity:  25 lb. (Dry) Weight Capacity 25 lb (dry) 25 25
Estimated Qty = 3 Cases/MO

Total Price for Year $765.00 $819.00 $648.00
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS
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b. BLACK CAN LINERS (10592) Price per Case $19.10 NO BID $21.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $27.50
Capacity:  55 to 60 Gal Capacity 60 Gal 55 55-60
Thickness in Mil:  1.5 mil Thickness in Mil 1.5 mil 1.5 1.5
Size:  38" x 58" Size 38 x 58 38 x 58 38 x 58
Color:  Black color Black Black Black
Manufacturer:  Interplast Manufacturer Interplast Roupack UPC
Manufacturer Code No:  SL3858150K Mfg Code # SL3858150K PR58150 5815B
Qty Per roll:  20 Bags Per Roll Bags per Roll 20 20 20
Roll Per Case: 5 Rolls per Case 5 5 5
Weight Capacity:  97 lb (dry) Weight Capacity 97 lbs (dry) 97 97
Estimated Qty = 22 Cases Per Month

Total Price for Year $5,042.40 $5,676.00 $7,260.00
c. BLACK CAN LINERS (10590) Price $11.30 NO BID $16.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.00

Capacity:  33 Gal Capacity 33 Gal 33 33
Thickness in Mil:  1.5 mil Thickness in Mil 1.5 mil 1.5 1.5
Size:  33" x 39" Size 33" x 39" 33 x 39 33 x 39
Color:  Black Color Black Black Black
Manufacturer:  Interplast Manufacturer Interplast Whitehall 4015K
Manufacturer Code No:  SL339150K Mfg Code # SL3339150K 1039 UPC
Qty Per roll:  20 Bags Per Roll Qty per Roll 20 10 20
Qty Per Case:  5 Rolls per Case Qty per Case 5 100 5
Weight Capacity:  97 lb (dry) Weight Capacity 97 lbs (dry) 97 97
Estimated Qty = 13 Cases per Month

Total Price for Year $1,762.80 $2,574.00 $2,808.00
Grand Total for Item 7 $7,570.20 N/A N/A $9,069.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A $10,716.00 N/A N/A

Terms Not Specified 1% - 20 days Not Specified 1% - 20 days Not Specified 1% - 20 days 0% Not Specified 1% - 20 days Not Specified 0% - Net 30 1% - 10 days
Delivery Days 15 Not Specified 5 - 7 7 14 1 - 2 21 3 - 5 7 - 21 Not Specified 21 5 - 20
 

  
*DENOTES LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS WERE MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Alamo Iron Works
All American Poly
Alternative Cleaning Technology
Cleaning Ideas
Ecolab, Inc.
Interboro Packaging Corporation
Janitorial Supplier.Com

Selig Industries
Unipak Corp

K-Stone Supplies & Repairs
Matera Paper Co
Pyramid School Producst
Sanivak / Davis
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