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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  
FOR: Biennial Contract for Joint Restraints
TIME & (Date of Award through May 31, 2011)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., April 9, 2009  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

A.  
Item 1 Pipe Restraining System for PVC Bell & Spigot Joints
Type I  UNIT

5 ea.    (SAWS #15266)     PRICE 23.99 23.99 25.00 26.40 23.87
1. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 4" used for PVC TOTAL 119.95 119.95 125.00 132.00 119.35

 UNIT
100 ea.   (SAWS #15262) PRICE 30.50 30.62 31.16 33.10 33.24

2. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 6" used for PVC TOTAL 3,050.00 3,062.00 3,116.00 3,310.00 3,324.00
 UNIT
175 ea.   (SAWS #15263) PRICE 47.82 48.74 49.25 52.25 53.90

3. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 8" used for PVC TOTAL 8,368.50 8,529.50 8,618.75 9,143.75 9,432.50
  UNIT
 5 ea. (SAWS #15260) PRICE 82.70 83.09 86.58 91.40 93.92
4. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 10" used for PVC TOTAL 413.50 415.45 432.90 457.00 469.60

 UNIT
150 ea.   (SAWS #15242) PRICE 91.80 92.11 93.74 99.50 102.70

5. Restraint, Type Slip on Joint, Size 12" used for PVC TOTAL 13,770.00 13,816.50 14,061.00 14,925.00 15,405.00
 UNIT
5 ea.    (SAWS #15261)     PRICE 217.11 219.39 225.62 238.10 266.04

6. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 16" used for PVC TOTAL 1,085.55 1,096.95 1,128.10 1,190.50 1,330.20
UNIT

5 ea. (SAWS #32427) PRICE 404.00 407.95 425.12 448.70 417.60
7. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 20" used for PVC TOTAL 2,020.00 2,039.75 2,125.60 2,243.50 2,088.00

UNIT
5 ea. (SAWS #15244) PRICE 479.11 477.22 497.31 524.90 523.00

8. Restraint, Type Slip on Joint, Size 24" used for PVC TOTAL 2,395.55 2,386.10 2,486.55 2,624.50 2,615.00
 *

 SECTION A, ITEM 1 BID TOTAL TOTAL 31,223.05 31,466.20 32,093.90 34,026.25 34,783.65
Ford

Mfr Brand Ford Ford Ford UFR1390-C EBAA
Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Part No. UFR1390-C-I UFR1390-C UFR1390-C-I for PVC 1500 Series

A.  
Item II Pipe Restraining System for Ductile Iron Bell & Spigot Joints TOTAL
  UNIT

5 ea.(SAWS #30161) PRICE 24.00 23.99 25.00 26.40 27.58
1. Restratint, Type Joint, Size 4" used for DI TOTAL 120.00 119.95 125.00 132.00 137.90

UNIT
100 ea. (SAWS #30162) PRICE 30.40 30.62 31.16 33.10 39.60

2. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 6" used for DI TOTAL 3,040.00 3,062.00 3,116.00 3,310.00 3,960.00
UNIT

175 ea. (SAWS #30163) PRICE 48.20 48.74 49.25 52.25 53.52
3. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 8" used for DI TOTAL 8,435.00 8,529.50 8,618.75 9,143.75 9,366.00

UNIT
5 ea. (SAWS #30164) PRICE 83.20 83.09 86.58 91.40 95.40

4. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 10" used for DI TOTAL 416.00 415.45 432.90 457.00 477.00
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  
FOR: Biennial Contract for Joint Restraints
TIME & (Date of Award through May 31, 2011)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., April 9, 2009  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY Fe
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UNIT
150 ea. (SAWS #30165) PRICE 91.90 92.11 93.74 99.50 116.98

5. Restraint, Type Slip on Joint, Size 12" used for DI TOTAL 13,785.00 13,816.50 14,061.00 14,925.00 17,547.00
UNIT

 5 ea. (SAWS #30166) PRICE 218.37 219.39 225.62 238.10 262.16
6. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 16" used for DI TOTAL 1,091.85 1,096.95 1,128.10 1,190.50 1,310.80

UNIT
5 ea. (SAWS #32428) PRICE 405.00 407.95 425.12 448.70 418.76

7. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 20" used for DI TOTAL 2,025.00 2,039.75 2,125.60 2,243.50 2,093.80
UNIT

5 ea. (SAWS #30168) PRICE 479.11 477.22 497.31 524.90 532.00
8. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 24" used for DI TOTAL 2,395.55 2,386.10 2,486.55 2,624.50 2,660.00

 *
 SECTION A, ITEM II BID TOTAL TOTAL 31,308.40 31,466.20 32,093.90 34,026.25 37,552.50

Ford
Mfr Brand Ford Ford Ford UFR-1390-C EBAA

Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Part No. UFR1390-C-I UFR1390-C UFR1390-C-I for DI 1700 Series
B.
Item I Mechanical Joint Wedge Action Restraint for PVC Pipe

UNIT
5 ea. (SAWS #15265) PRICE 17.70 18.01 18.57 19.60 18.46

1. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 4" used for PVC TOTAL 88.50 90.05 92.85 98.00 92.30
UNIT

200 ea.  (SAWS #15255) PRICE 22.00 22.40 22.75 24.15 22.60
2. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 6" used for PVC TOTAL 4,400.00 4,480.00 4,550.00 4,830.00 4,520.00

UNIT
300 ea.  (SAWS #15257) PRICE 31.00 31.12 31.60 33.50 33.42

3. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 8" used for PVC TOTAL 9,300.00 9,336.00 9,480.00 10,050.00 10,026.00
UNIT

 5 ea.  (SAWS #15246) PRICE 52.12 50.44 52.56 55.45 63.18
4. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 10" used for PVC TOTAL 260.60 252.20 262.80 277.25 315.90

UNIT
150 ea. (SAWS #15248) PRICE 53.11 54.15 55.10 58.45 65.76

5. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 12" used for PVC TOTAL 7,966.50 8,122.50 8,265.00 8,767.50 9,864.00
UNIT

5 ea.  (SAWS #15250) PRICE 113.22 114.04 117.64 124.15 140.72
6. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 16" used for PVC TOTAL 566.10 570.20 588.20 620.75 703.60

UNIT
5 ea.  (SAWS #30169) PRICE 178.51 177.97 185.46 194.70 216.36

7. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 20" used for PVC TOTAL 892.55 889.85 927.30 973.50 1,081.80
UNIT

5 ea.  (SAWAS 15258) PRICE 225.90 227.57 237.14 249.00 250.00
8. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 24" used for PVC TOTAL 1,129.50 1,137.85 1,185.70 1,245.00 1,250.00

 *
 SECTION B, ITEM I BID TOTAL TOTAL 24,603.75 24,878.65 25,351.85 26,862.00 27,853.60

Ford Ford EBAA
Mfr Brand Ford Ford UFR1500-C-I UFR-1500-C 2000 PV Series

Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Part No. UFR1500-C-I UFR1500-C L/Acc. for PVC L/Acc.
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  
FOR: Biennial Contract for Joint Restraints
TIME & (Date of Award through May 31, 2011)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., April 9, 2009  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY Fe
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B.
Item II Mechanical Joint Wedge Action Restraint for Ductile Iron Pipe

UNIT
5 ea. (SAWS #15253) PRICE 13.65 12.93 13.41 14.15 15.20

1. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 4" used for DI TOTAL 68.25 64.65 67.05 70.75 76.00
UNIT

200 ea. (SAWS #30170) PRICE 16.25 16.61 16.86 17.85 17.88
2. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 6" used for DI TOTAL 3,250.00 3,322.00 3,372.00 3,570.00 3,576.00

UNIT
300 ea. (SAWS #30171) PRICE 23.09 23.33 23.81 25.25 27.26

3. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 8" used for DI TOTAL 6,927.00 6,999.00 7,143.00 7,575.00 8,178.00
UNIT

5 ea.  (SAWS #30172) PRICE 34.00 33.73 35.14 37.10 40.32
4. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 10" used for DI TOTAL 170.00 168.65 175.70 185.50 201.60

UNIT
150 ea.  (SAWS #4612) PRICE 46.50 46.23 47.43 50.30 58.70

5. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 12" used for DI TOTAL 6,975.00 6,934.50 7,114.50 7,545.00 8,805.00
UNIT

5 ea.  (SAWS #15249) PRICE 91.32 92.45 94.88 100.15 107.10
6. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 16" used for DI TOTAL 456.60 462.25 474.40 500.75 535.50

UNIT
5 ea.  (SAWS #15251) PRICE 146.12 144.72 150.81 158.30 188.08

7. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 20" used for DI TOTAL 730.60 723.60 754.05 791.50 940.40
UNIT

5 ea.  (SAWS #15252) PRICE 197.50 198.56 206.91 217.20 258.50
8. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 24" used for DI TOTAL 987.50 992.80 1,034.55 1,086.00 1,292.50

*
SECTION B, ITEM II BID TOTAL TOTAL 19,564.95 19,667.45 20,135.25 21,324.50 23,605.00

Ford Ford EBAA
Mfr Brand Ford Ford UFR1400-D-I UFR1400 1100 Series

Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Part No. UFR1400-C-I UFR1400-D L/Acc. for DI L/Acc.
C. Compression Ring Pipe Restraining System for PVC Pipe to 
Item I Mechanical Joint Fittings

UNIT
35 ea.  (SAWS #30174) PRICE 41.20 34.49 27.91 No Bid No Bid

1. Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 6" used for PVC TOTAL 1,442.00 1,207.15 976.85
UNIT

35 ea.  (SAWS #30175) PRICE 57.75 49.16 42.73 No Bid No Bid
2. Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 8" used for PVC TOTAL 2,021.25 1,720.60 1,495.55

UNIT
25 ea.  (SAWS #15259) PRICE 105.25 96.22 93.24 No Bid No Bid

3. Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 12" used for PVC TOTAL 2,631.25 2,405.50 2,331.00
*

SECTION C, ITEM II BID TOTAL TOTAL 6,094.50 5,333.25 4,803.40 No Bid No Bid
Romac

Mfr Brand Romac Romac 6GR-DI
Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Part No. GRAP-IP Grip Ring 12GR-DI L/Acc.
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  
FOR: Biennial Contract for Joint Restraints
TIME & (Date of Award through May 31, 2011)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., April 9, 2009  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY Fe
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C. Compression Ring Pipe Restraining System for Ductile Iron Pipe to
Item II Mechanical Joint Fittings

UNIT
35 ea.  (SAWS #30176) PRICE 34.50 34.49 27.91 No Bid No Bid

1. Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 6" used for DI TOTAL 1,207.50 1,207.15 976.85
UNIT

35 ea.   (SAWS #30177) PRICE 49.15 49.16 42.73 No Bid No Bid
2. Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 8" used for DI TOTAL 1,720.25 1,720.60 1,495.55

UNIT
25 ea.  (SAWS #30178) PRICE 95.25 96.22 93.24 No Bid No Bid

3. Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 12" used for DI TOTAL 2,381.25 2,405.50 2,331.00
*

SECTION C, ITEM II BID TOTAL TOTAL 5,309.00 5,333.25 4,803.40 No Bid No Bid
Romac

Mfr Brand Romac Romac 6GR-DI
Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Part No. GRAP-DI Grip Ring 12GR-DI L/Acc.

D.
Item I Accessory Sets

30 ea.  (SAWS #9062) UNIT
Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 4", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands PRICE 8.25 7.81 8.55 8.40 8.52

1. and Gaskets TOTAL 247.50 234.30 256.50 252.00 255.60
750 ea.  (SAWS #9063) UNIT
Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 6", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands PRICE 10.60 9.97 10.79 10.65 10.88

2. and Gaskets TOTAL 7,950.00 7,477.50 8,092.50 7,987.50 8,160.00
500 ea.  (SAWS #9064) UNIT
Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 8", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands PRICE 12.87 12.12 13.25 13.00 12.98

3. and Gaskets TOTAL 6,435.00 6,060.00 6,625.00 6,500.00 6,490.00
20 ea.  (SAWS #9058) UNIT
Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 10", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands PRICE 16.96 15.63 17.69 16.75 16.56

4. and Gaskets TOTAL 339.20 312.60 353.80 335.00 331.20
200 ea.  (SAWS #9059) UNIT
Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 12", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands PRICE 18.57 17.11 19.17 18.30 18.14

5. and Gaskets TOTAL 3,714.00 3,422.00 3,834.00 3,660.00 3,628.00
30 ea.  (SAWS #9060) UNIT
Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 16", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands PRICE 41.17 39.20 42.89 42.00 41.58

6. and Gaskets TOTAL 1,235.10 1,176.00 1,286.70 1,260.00 1,247.40
1 ea.  (SAWS #15891) UNIT
Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 20", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands PRICE 79.05 73.78 82.38 80.70 82.30

7. and Gaskets TOTAL 79.05 73.78 82.38 80.70 82.30
1 ea.  (SAWS #9061) UNIT
Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 24", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands PRICE 86.55 80.77 90.17 88.40 87.42

8. and Gaskets TOTAL 86.55 80.77 90.17 88.40 87.42
 *

SECTION D, ITEM I BID TOTAL TOTAL 20,086.40 18,836.95 20,621.05 20,163.60 20,281.92
Serampore Sigma

Mfr Brand Sigma Gland Pack  DGP4 Tyler
Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Part No. Accessory DGP24 SIP Ind. #IMJAP
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  
FOR: Biennial Contract for Joint Restraints
TIME & (Date of Award through May 31, 2011)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., April 9, 2009  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY Fe
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0% Net Net 2% Net
Terms 20 days 30 days 30 days 20 days 30 days

Delivery Days 7-10 days 7-10 days 15-20 days 15 days 15 days
 
 
*DENOTES LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY
 
Act Pipe & Supply Demandstar
Cascade Water Works SAWS Website
Ferguson Waterworks
HD Supply Waterworks
Morrison Supply Co.
Municipal Water Works Supply
PMI Steel Pipe
William Supply Co.
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