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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  
FOR: Biennial Contract for Joint Restraints
TIME & (June 1, 2004 through May 31, 2006)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., September 2, 2004  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

A. Slip on Joint Restraints Systems
Item 1 Slip on double restraint, pipe bell joint (PVC)
Type I  UNIT *

100 ea.    (SAWS #4613)     PRICE 25.42 28.38 26.25 26.85 29.44
1. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 6" used for PVC TOTAL 2,542.00 2,838.00 2,625.00 2,685.00 2,944.00

 UNIT
175 ea.   (SAWS #4614) PRICE 39.83 42.13 42.10 43.53 47.71

2. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 8", used for PVC TOTAL 6,970.25 7,372.75 7,367.50 7,617.75 8,349.25
 UNIT
150 ea. PRICE 75.96 80.37 79.44 83.01 91.00

3. Restraint, Type Slip on Joint, Size 12" used for PVC TOTAL 11,394.00 12,055.50 11,916.00 12,451.50 13,650.00
  
 SECTION A, ITEM 1 BID  TOTAL TYPE 1 TOTAL 20,906.25 22,266.25 21,908.50 22,754.25 24,943.25
A.   
Item 2 Slip on Joint Restraints Systems  
Type I Slip on double restraint, pipe bell Joint (Ductile Iron UNIT *
 100 ea.    (SAWS #4613)     PRICE 25.42 16.86 31.50 32.23 29.44
1. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 6", used for DI TOTAL 2,542.00 1,686.00 3,150.00 3,223.00 2,944.00

 UNIT
175 ea.   (SAWS #4614) PRICE 39.83 25.08 42.34 43.78 47.71

2. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 8", used for DI TOTAL 6,970.25 4,389.00 7,409.50 7,661.50 8,349.25
 UNIT
150 ea. PRICE 75.96 50.00 91.58 95.70 91.00

3. Restraint, Type Slip on Joint, Size 12" used for D TOTAL 11,394.00 7,500.00 13,737.00 14,355.00 13,650.00
*

SECTION A, ITEM 2 BID TOTAL TYPE I TOTAL 20,906.25 13,575.00 24,296.50 25,239.50 24,943.25
B. Compression Ring Systems with follower gland 
Item 1 restraint (PVC) 

UNIT *
35 ea.   (SAWS #4622) PRICE 36.54 17.48 23.87 No Bid No Bid

1. Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 6", used for PVC TOTAL 1,278.90 611.80 835.45
UNIT

35 ea.  (SAWS #4623) PRICE 52.08 25.85 32.80 No Bid No Bid
2. Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 8", used for PVC TOTAL 1,822.80 904.75 1,148.00
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  
FOR: Biennial Contract for Joint Restraints
TIME & (June 1, 2004 through May 31, 2006)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., September 2, 2004  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY M
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UNIT
25 ea.  (SAWS #4624) PRICE 101.94 51.37 59.36 No Bid No Bid

3. Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 12", used for PVC TOTAL 2,548.50 1,284.25 1,484.00

*
SECTION B, ITEM 1 BID TOTAL TOTAL 5,650.20 2,800.80 3,467.45 No Bid No Bid

B. Compression Ring Systems with follower gland 
Item 2 restraint (Ductile Iron)

UNIT *
35 ea.   (SAWS #4622) PRICE 36.54 13.69 34.99 No Bid No Bid

1. Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 6", used for Ductile Iron TOTAL 1,278.90 479.15 1,224.65
UNIT

35 ea.   (SAWS #4623) PRICE 52.08 21.09 53.00 No Bid No Bid
2. Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 8", used for Ductile Iron TOTAL 1,822.80 738.15 1,855.00

UNIT
25 ea.   (SAWS #4624) PRICE 101.94 45.40 106.12 No Bid No Bid

3. Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 12", used for Ductile Iron TOTAL 2,548.50 1,135.00 2,653.00

*
SECTION B, ITEM 2 BID TOTAL TOTAL 5,650.20 2,352.30 5,732.65 No Bid No Bid

D.  
Item 1. Retainer Gland for PVC C-900

UNIT *
50 ea.  (SAWS #4111) PRICE 14.05 14.42 14.04 15.20 15.57

1. Restraint, Type Gland, Size 4", used for Ductile Iron TOTAL 702.50 721.00 702.00 760.00 778.50
UNIT

450 ea.  (SAWS #4112) PRICE 17.03 17.48 16.82 18.43 18.88
2. Restraint, Type Gland, Size 6", used for Ductile Iron TOTAL 7,663.50 7,866.00 7,569.00 8,293.50 8,496.00

UNIT
120 ea.  (SAWS #4113) PRICE 25.17 25.85 24.88 27.25 27.91

3. Restraint, Type Gland, Size 8", used for Ductile Iron TOTAL 3,020.40 3,102.00 2,985.60 3,270.00 3,349.20
UNIT

60 ea.  (SAWS #4108) PRICE 50.04 51.37 49.42 54.16 55.47
4. Restraint, Type Gland, Size 12", used for Ductile Iron TOTAL 3,002.40 3,082.20 2,965.20 3,249.60 3,328.20
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  
FOR: Biennial Contract for Joint Restraints
TIME & (June 1, 2004 through May 31, 2006)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., September 2, 2004  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY M
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UNIT
30 ea.   (SAWS #4109) PRICE 107.10 109.94 106.92 115.94 118.74

5. Restraint, Type Gland, Size 16", used for Ductile Iron TOTAL 3,213.00 3,298.20 3,207.60 3,478.20 3,562.20

*
SECTION D, ITEM 1 BID TOTAL TOTAL 17,601.80 18,069.40 17,429.40 19,051.30 19,514.10

D.
Item 2. Retainer Gland for Ductile Iron only

UNIT *
50 ea.   (SAWS #4111) PRICE 11.44 11.75 12.65 12.39 12.69

1. Restraint, Type Gland, Size 4" used for Ductile Iron TOTAL 572.00 587.50 632.50 619.50 634.50
UNIT

450 ea.   (SAWS #4112) PRICE 13.34 13.69 14.44 14.44 14.79
2. Restraint, Type Gland, Size 6" used for Ductile Iron TOTAL 6,003.00 6,160.50 6,498.00 6,498.00 6,655.50

UNIT
120 ea.   (SAWS #4113) PRICE 20.54 21.09 22.24 22.23 22.77

3. Restraint, Type Gland, Size 8", used for Ductile Iron TOTAL 2,464.80 2,530.80 2,668.80 2,667.60 2,732.40
UNIT

60 ea.   (SAWS #4108) PRICE 44.22 45.40 47.86 47.88 49.03
4. Restraint, Type Gland, Size 12", used for Ductile Iron TOTAL 2,653.20 2,724.00 2,871.60 2,872.80 2,941.80

UNIT
30 ea.   (SAWS #4109) PRICE 80.65 82.80 87.26 87.31 89.41

5. Restraint, Type Gland, Size 16", used for Ductile Iron TOTAL 2,419.50 2,484.00 2,617.80 2,619.30 2,682.30
 

  *
 SECTION D, ITEM 2 BID TOTAL TOTAL 14,112.50 14,486.80 15,288.70 15,277.20 15,646.50

Net Net Net Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

Delivery Days 3-15 days 7-10 days 7-10 days 7-28 days 5-10 days
 
 
BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY
 
Act Pipe Demandstar
Hughes III SAWS Website
Moore Supply
Morrison Supply
Municipal Pipe
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