
08-0743
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)  

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Lawn Maintenance Services for Various SAWS Locations
FOR: (Date of Award through December 31, 2009)
TIME &

DATE: 3:00 p.m., December 9, 2008  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

GROUP 1
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 29.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 28.80 27.50 55.00 65.00 60.00
38TH STATION MOWING 405.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 518.40 495.00 990.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 29.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 43.20 27.50 55.00 65.00 60.00
BAETZ MOWING 405.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 777.60 495.00 990.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 29.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 25.92 41.00 55.00 65.00 60.00
BROOKS CITY BASE MONITOR 1 MOWING 405.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 466.56 738.00 990.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 46.50 48.00 25.92 27.50 22.00 45.00 25.00
BROOKS CITY BASE MONITOR 2 MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 837.00 864.00 466.56 495.00 396.00 810.00 450.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 630.00 1,248.00 550.00 992.00 405.00 1,728.00 750.00 900.00 65.00 1,495.00
CATFISH FARM MOWING 11,340.00 22,464.00 9,900.00 17,856.00 7,290.00 31,104.00 13,500.00 16,200.00 1,170.00 26,910.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 70.00 29.25 40.00 46.50 48.00 28.80 41.00 22.00 65.00 60.00
CHAVANAUX E. LIFT MOWING 1,260.00 526.50 720.00 837.00 864.00 518.40 738.00 396.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 48.75 40.00 62.00 72.00 25.92 41.00 200.00 65.00 105.00
CIBOLO CANYON MOWING 405.00 877.50 720.00 1,116.00 1,296.00 466.56 738.00 3,600.00 1,170.00 1,890.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 135.00 156.00 200.00 155.00 315.00 482.40 195.00 700.00 225.00 372.00
DOS RIOS LAB MOWING 2,430.00 2,808.00 3,600.00 2,790.00 5,670.00 8,683.20 3,510.00 12,600.00 4,050.00 6,696.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 46.50 48.00 21.60 27.50 50.00 45.00 30.00
E. KELLY BLDG. #3780 MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 837.00 864.00 388.80 495.00 900.00 810.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 46.50 48.00 21.60 27.50 50.00 45.00 30.00
E. KELLY BLDG. #3000 MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 837.00 864.00 388.80 495.00 900.00 810.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 46.50 48.00 21.60 27.50 50.00 45.00 30.00
E. KELLY BLDG. #3200 MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 837.00 864.00 388.80 495.00 900.00 810.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 46.50 48.00 21.60 27.50 50.00 45.00 30.00
E. KELLY BLDG. #3440 MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 837.00 864.00 388.80 495.00 900.00 810.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 46.50 48.00 21.60 27.50 50.00 45.00 30.00
E. KELLY BLDG. #3507 MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 837.00 864.00 388.80 495.00 900.00 810.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 67.50 48.75 45.00 62.00 90.00 115.20 45.00 40.00 215.00 105.00
ENCINO BOOSTER MOWING 1,215.00 877.50 810.00 1,116.00 1,620.00 2,073.60 810.00 720.00 3,870.00 1,890.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 29.25 40.00 54.25 180.00 21.60 27.50 200.00 250.00 60.00
ENCINO PARK MOWING 405.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 3,240.00 388.80 495.00 3,600.00 4,500.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 65.00 117.00 75.00 77.50 60.00 86.40 330.00 200.00 250.00 572.00
ENCINO PARK #2 MOWING 1,170.00 2,106.00 1,350.00 1,395.00 1,080.00 1,555.20 5,940.00 3,600.00 4,500.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 46.50 24.00 21.60 27.50 90.00 65.00 30.00
EVANS MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 837.00 432.00 388.80 495.00 1,620.00 1,170.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 135.00 117.00 100.00 124.00 120.00 216.00 330.00 200.00 425.00 572.00
EVANS TANK MOWING 2,430.00 2,106.00 1,800.00 2,232.00 2,160.00 3,888.00 5,940.00 3,600.00 7,650.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 39.00 40.00 62.00 72.00 21.60 41.00 80.00 65.00 60.00
FALCON CENTER MOWING 405.00 702.00 720.00 1,116.00 1,296.00 388.80 738.00 1,440.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 29.25 40.00 62.00 72.00 21.60 41.00 55.00 65.00 60.00
FAWN STAND PIPE MOWING 405.00 526.50 720.00 1,116.00 1,296.00 388.80 738.00 990.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 29.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 21.60 41.00 22.00 65.00 60.00
FEATHERCREST MOWING 405.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 388.80 738.00 396.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)  

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Lawn Maintenance Services for Various SAWS Locations
FOR: (Date of Award through December 31, 2009)
TIME &

DATE: 3:00 p.m., December 9, 2008  
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18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 46.50 48.00 21.60 27.50 22.00 45.00 30.00
FIESTA MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 837.00 864.00 388.80 495.00 396.00 810.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 39.00 40.00 62.00 90.00 57.60 41.00 80.00 65.00 60.00
FISHER ROAD MOWING 405.00 702.00 720.00 1,116.00 1,620.00 1,036.80 738.00 1,440.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 360.00 624.00 500.00 310.00 1,080.00 1,728.00 550.00 900.00 490.00 572.00
FIVE PALM MOWING 6,480.00 11,232.00 9,000.00 5,580.00 19,440.00 31,104.00 9,900.00 16,200.00 8,820.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 29.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 17.28 41.00 50.00 65.00 60.00
FOSSIL RIDGE MOWING 405.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 311.04 738.00 900.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 29.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 21.60 41.00 50.00 65.00 60.00
FOSTER MEADOWS MOWING 405.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 388.80 738.00 900.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 135.00 312.00 150.00 124.00 180.00 129.60 385.00 200.00 65.00 572.00
FOSTER SITE MOWING 2,430.00 5,616.00 2,700.00 2,232.00 3,240.00 2,332.80 6,930.00 3,600.00 1,170.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 120.00 312.00 150.00 108.50 270.00 259.20 500.00 200.00 325.00 572.00
FOSTER TANK MOWING 2,160.00 5,616.00 2,700.00 1,953.00 4,860.00 4,665.60 9,000.00 3,600.00 5,850.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 29.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 25.92 41.00 50.00 65.00 60.00
FOX GROVE MOWING 405.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 466.56 738.00 900.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 46.50 48.00 21.60 27.50 50.00 45.00 30.00
FREEDOM ELEMENTARY MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 837.00 864.00 388.80 495.00 900.00 810.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 29.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 43.20 27.50 60.00 215.00 35.00
FURNISH ROAD (LOT) MOWING 405.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 777.60 495.00 1,080.00 3,870.00 630.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 180.00 234.00 150.00 170.50 108.00 86.40 195.00 22.00 590.00 572.00
GERONIMO MOWING 3,240.00 4,212.00 2,700.00 3,069.00 1,944.00 1,555.20 3,510.00 396.00 10,620.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 29.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 21.60 41.00 55.00 65.00 60.00
GLEN MOWING 405.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 388.80 738.00 990.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 46.50 48.00 21.60 27.50 50.00 45.00 60.00
GOLD CANYON MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 837.00 864.00 388.80 495.00 900.00 810.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 39.00 40.00 62.00 72.00 28.80 41.00 80.00 45.00 60.00
GOLDEN ALUMINUM MOWING 405.00 702.00 720.00 1,116.00 1,296.00 518.40 738.00 1,440.00 810.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 46.50 48.00 21.60 27.50 50.00 45.00 30.00
GOLDFIELD MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 837.00 864.00 388.80 495.00 900.00 810.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 29.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 21.60 41.00 110.00 65.00 60.00
GUILBEAU MOWING 405.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 388.80 738.00 1,980.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 70.00 195.00 350.00 155.00 270.00 360.00 204.00 200.00 225.00 572.00
GUS ECKERT TANK MOWING 1,260.00 3,510.00 6,300.00 2,790.00 4,860.00 6,480.00 3,672.00 3,600.00 4,050.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 46.50 48.00 17.28 27.50 22.00 125.00 30.00
HARRIS JR. HIGH SCHOOL LS MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 837.00 864.00 311.04 495.00 396.00 2,250.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 29.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 86.40 41.00 80.00 65.00 572.00
HART AVE. MOWING 405.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 1,555.20 738.00 1,440.00 1,170.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 67.50 97.50 55.00 93.00 72.00 64.80 204.00 200.00 215.00 572.00
HART AVE. (HOUSE) MOWING 1,215.00 1,755.00 990.00 1,674.00 1,296.00 1,166.40 3,672.00 3,600.00 3,870.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 70.00 29.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 21.60 41.00 22.00 125.00 60.00
HEATHERS COVE LIFT MOWING 1,260.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 388.80 738.00 396.00 2,250.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 29.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 57.60 41.00 55.00 65.00 60.00
HELOTES #3 MOWING 405.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 1,036.80 738.00 990.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
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P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
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18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 9.75 40.00 46.50 36.00 43.20 41.00 80.00 65.00 60.00
HELOTES BOOSTER MOWING 405.00 175.50 720.00 837.00 648.00 777.60 738.00 1,440.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 39.00 40.00 62.00 72.00 115.20 41.00 80.00 65.00 60.00
HELOTES STAND PIPE MOWING 405.00 702.00 720.00 1,116.00 1,296.00 2,073.60 738.00 1,440.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 155.00 260.00 300.00 310.00 300.00 216.00 330.00 250.00 490.00 572.00
HELOTES TANK MOWING 2,790.00 4,680.00 5,400.00 5,580.00 5,400.00 3,888.00 5,940.00 4,500.00 8,820.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 70.00 97.50 55.00 93.00 72.00 115.20 204.00 200.00 215.00 572.00
HENDERSON MOWING 1,260.00 1,755.00 990.00 1,674.00 1,296.00 2,073.60 3,672.00 3,600.00 3,870.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 29.25 40.00 62.00 60.00 21.60 41.00 50.00 65.00 60.00
HIDDEN HEIGHTS MOWING 405.00 526.50 720.00 1,116.00 1,080.00 388.80 738.00 900.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 39.00 40.00 62.00 72.00 259.20 41.00 80.00 65.00 60.00
HIDDEN SPRINGS MOWING 405.00 702.00 720.00 1,116.00 1,296.00 4,665.60 738.00 1,440.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 70.00 97.50 55.00 93.00 72.00 86.40 204.00 200.00 215.00 572.00
HIGHLAND MOWING 1,260.00 1,755.00 990.00 1,674.00 1,296.00 1,555.20 3,672.00 3,600.00 3,870.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 29.25 25.00 62.00 60.00 21.60 35.00 80.00 65.00 60.00
HIGHWAY 90 MOWING 405.00 526.50 450.00 1,116.00 1,080.00 388.80 630.00 1,440.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 225.00 156.00 325.00 217.00 360.00 230.40 305.00 200.00 490.00 572.00
HILDEBRAND MOWING 4,050.00 2,808.00 5,850.00 3,906.00 6,480.00 4,147.20 5,490.00 3,600.00 8,820.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 65.00 39.00 45.00 62.00 72.00 43.20 45.00 22.00 135.00 60.00
HILLCREST MOWING 1,170.00 702.00 810.00 1,116.00 1,296.00 777.60 810.00 396.00 2,430.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 90.00 9.75 25.00 46.50 48.00 21.60 27.50 22.00 45.00 30.00
HILLPOINT MOWING 1,620.00 175.50 450.00 837.00 864.00 388.80 495.00 396.00 810.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 65.00 78.00 45.00 93.00 120.00 86.40 204.00 200.00 125.00 572.00
HILLS BOOSTER MOWING 1,170.00 1,404.00 810.00 1,674.00 2,160.00 1,555.20 3,672.00 3,600.00 2,250.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 29.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 21.60 41.00 50.00 125.00 60.00
HILLS OF SHAENFIELD MOWING 405.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 388.80 738.00 900.00 2,250.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 90.00 156.00 250.00 108.50 150.00 172.80 285.00 200.00 225.00 572.00
HILLS TANK MOWING 1,620.00 2,808.00 4,500.00 1,953.00 2,700.00 3,110.40 5,130.00 3,600.00 4,050.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 29.25 25.00 54.25 60.00 21.60 27.50 50.00 45.00 60.00
HILL TOP MOWING 270.00 526.50 450.00 976.50 1,080.00 388.80 495.00 900.00 810.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 46.50 48.00 21.60 27.50 50.00 45.00 30.00
HOLLY HOCK MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 837.00 864.00 388.80 495.00 900.00 810.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 46.50 48.00 21.60 27.50 50.00 45.00 30.00
HORSESHOE BEND MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 837.00 864.00 388.80 495.00 900.00 810.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 135.00 312.00 125.00 155.00 150.00 360.00 200.00 200.00 240.00 572.00
HWY 151 MOWING 2,430.00 5,616.00 2,250.00 2,790.00 2,700.00 6,480.00 3,600.00 3,600.00 4,320.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 135.00 156.00 300.00 139.50 180.00 216.00 385.00 200.00 290.00 572.00
I-10 WEST TANK/RESERVOIR MOWING 2,430.00 2,808.00 5,400.00 2,511.00 3,240.00 3,888.00 6,930.00 3,600.00 5,220.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 29.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 28.80 41.00 80.00 125.00 60.00
INDIAN HILLS MOWING 405.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 518.40 738.00 1,440.00 2,250.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 270.00 195.00 290.00 139.50 240.00 144.00 41.00 200.00 380.00 572.00
INDIAN SPRINGS MOWING 4,860.00 3,510.00 5,220.00 2,511.00 4,320.00 2,592.00 738.00 3,600.00 6,840.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 67.50 97.50 55.00 93.00 72.00 144.00 204.00 50.00 215.00 572.00
INSPIRATION MOWING 1,215.00 1,755.00 990.00 1,674.00 1,296.00 2,592.00 3,672.00 900.00 3,870.00 10,296.00
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08-0743
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)  

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Lawn Maintenance Services for Various SAWS Locations
FOR: (Date of Award through December 31, 2009)
TIME &

DATE: 3:00 p.m., December 9, 2008  
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18 mows per year PRICE/ 125.00 117.00 120.00 108.50 90.00 115.20 204.00 200.00 375.00 572.00
INWOOD RESERVOIR MOWING 2,250.00 2,106.00 2,160.00 1,953.00 1,620.00 2,073.60 3,672.00 3,600.00 6,750.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 29.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 72.00 41.00 50.00 65.00 60.00
JOSEPHINE MOWING 405.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 1,296.00 738.00 900.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 70.00 117.00 100.00 93.00 60.00 115.20 220.00 100.00 275.00 572.00
JUDSON MOWING 1,260.00 2,106.00 1,800.00 1,674.00 1,080.00 2,073.60 3,960.00 1,800.00 4,950.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 25.00 39.00 40.00 62.00 72.00 28.80 41.00 50.00 65.00 60.00
LA SIERRA MOWING 450.00 702.00 720.00 1,116.00 1,296.00 518.40 738.00 900.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 46.50 48.00 28.80 27.50 22.00 65.00 30.00
LOS REYES #2 MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 837.00 864.00 518.40 495.00 396.00 1,170.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 70.00 117.00 55.00 62.00 60.00 57.60 204.00 250.00 215.00 105.00
MARTINEZ LOSOYA MOWING 1,260.00 2,106.00 990.00 1,116.00 1,080.00 1,036.80 3,672.00 4,500.00 3,870.00 1,890.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 46.50 48.00 43.20 27.50 50.00 65.00 30.00
MISSION ROAD MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 837.00 864.00 777.60 495.00 900.00 1,170.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 270.00 390.00 450.00 279.00 720.00 403.20 550.00 900.00 399.00 572.00
NESC LOT (7.65 ACRES) MOWING 4,860.00 7,020.00 8,100.00 5,022.00 12,960.00 7,257.60 9,900.00 16,200.00 7,182.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 90.00 195.00 250.00 155.00 90.00 288.00 235.00 80.00 325.00 472.00
NESC RECLAMATION MOWING 1,620.00 3,510.00 4,500.00 2,790.00 1,620.00 5,184.00 4,230.00 1,440.00 5,850.00 8,496.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 20.00 39.00 60.00  90.00 50.40 110.00 110.00 150.00  
NESC RECLAMATION SITE (OUTSIDE YARD) MOWING 360.00 702.00 1,080.00 No Bid 1,620.00 907.20 1,980.00 1,980.00 2,700.00 No Bid
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 46.50 48.00 21.60 35.00 50.00 45.00 30.00
QUINTANA ROAD MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 837.00 864.00 388.80 630.00 900.00 810.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 70.00 97.50 55.00 93.00 72.00 86.40 204.00 50.00 215.00 572.00
RAMSEY MOWING 1,260.00 1,755.00 990.00 1,674.00 1,296.00 1,555.20 3,672.00 900.00 3,870.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 90.00 117.00 190.00 93.00 180.00 86.40 204.00 50.00 265.00 572.00
RANCH TOWN #2 MOWING 1,620.00 2,106.00 3,420.00 1,674.00 3,240.00 1,555.20 3,672.00 900.00 4,770.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 39.00 40.00 62.00 72.00 57.60 41.00 80.00 45.00 60.00
RAVENSWOOD MOWING 405.00 702.00 720.00 1,116.00 1,296.00 1,036.80 738.00 1,440.00 810.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 46.50 48.00 21.60 27.50 22.00 45.00 30.00
RAY ELLISON MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 837.00 864.00 388.80 495.00 396.00 810.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 225.00 195.00 215.00 155.00 180.00 403.20 385.00 80.00 345.00 572.00
REDLAND STATION MOWING 4,050.00 3,510.00 3,870.00 2,790.00 3,240.00 7,257.60 6,930.00 1,440.00 6,210.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 70.00 117.00 55.00 93.00 360.00 216.00 204.00 200.00 215.00 105.00
RILLING ROAD MOWING 1,260.00 2,106.00 990.00 1,674.00 6,480.00 3,888.00 3,672.00 3,600.00 3,870.00 1,890.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 46.50 48.00 21.60 27.50 22.00 45.00 30.00
RITTIMAN EAST MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 837.00 864.00 388.80 495.00 396.00 810.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 70.00 97.50 55.00 93.00 60.00 43.20 80.00 200.00 215.00 572.00
RIVERSIDE MOWING 1,260.00 1,755.00 990.00 1,674.00 1,080.00 777.60 1,440.00 3,600.00 3,870.00 10,296.00
 PRICE/
ITEM DELTED MOWING
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 16.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 21.60 41.00 80.00 65.00 30.00
ROOSEVELT MOWING 405.00 292.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 388.80 738.00 1,440.00 1,170.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 70.00 19.50 55.00 46.50 48.00 28.80 60.00 90.00 215.00 30.00
RUIDOSA LOT MOWING 1,260.00 351.00 990.00 837.00 864.00 518.40 1,080.00 1,620.00 3,870.00 540.00
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Lawn Maintenance Services for Various SAWS Locations
FOR: (Date of Award through December 31, 2009)
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DATE: 3:00 p.m., December 9, 2008  
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18 mows per year PRICE/ 70.00 97.50 55.00 93.00 72.00 86.40 95.00 200.00 65.00 572.00
SAN FERNANDO MOWING 1,260.00 1,755.00 990.00 1,674.00 1,296.00 1,555.20 1,710.00 3,600.00 1,170.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 70.00 97.50 55.00 93.00 72.00 432.00 204.00 200.00 215.00 572.00
SAN GERONIMO MOWING 1,260.00 1,755.00 990.00 1,674.00 1,296.00 7,776.00 3,672.00 3,600.00 3,870.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 70.00 97.50 65.00 93.00 60.00 115.20 275.00 200.00 215.00 572.00
SASSE TANK MOWING 1,260.00 1,755.00 1,170.00 1,674.00 1,080.00 2,073.60 4,950.00 3,600.00 3,870.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 39.00 40.00 62.00 72.00 230.40 80.00 50.00 65.00 60.00
SCENIC VIEW MOWING 405.00 702.00 720.00 1,116.00 1,296.00 4,147.20 1,440.00 900.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 70.00 97.50 60.00 93.00 72.00 72.00 204.00 50.00 215.00 572.00
SERENE HILL MOWING 1,260.00 1,755.00 1,080.00 1,674.00 1,296.00 1,296.00 3,672.00 900.00 3,870.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 16.25 25.00 54.25 60.00 86.40 27.50 50.00 45.00 30.00
SEWANNE MOWING 270.00 292.50 450.00 976.50 1,080.00 1,555.20 495.00 900.00 810.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 195.00 250.00 139.50 108.00 216.00 440.00 200.00 365.00 572.00
SHIELDS TANK MOWING 405.00 3,510.00 4,500.00 2,511.00 1,944.00 3,888.00 7,920.00 3,600.00 6,570.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 39.00 40.00 62.00 72.00 21.60 45.00 40.00 65.00 60.00
SIMON TRACT BOOSTER MOWING 405.00 702.00 720.00 1,116.00 1,296.00 388.80 810.00 720.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 29.25 40.00 54.25 72.00 21.60 41.00 50.00 65.00 60.00
SONTERRA SOUTH MOWING 270.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,296.00 388.80 738.00 900.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 29.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 21.60 41.00 80.00 65.00 60.00
SOUTHSIDE ELEMENTARY MOWING 405.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 388.80 738.00 1,440.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 29.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 21.60 41.00 80.00 65.00 60.00
SOUTHTON MOWING 405.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 388.80 738.00 1,440.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 135.00 156.00 200.00 108.50 360.00 144.00 250.00 200.00 225.00 572.00
STAHL MOWING 2,430.00 2,808.00 3,600.00 1,953.00 6,480.00 2,592.00 4,500.00 3,600.00 4,050.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 135.00 9.75 40.00 46.50 48.00 21.60 41.00 80.00 65.00 60.00
STANDARD MOWING 2,430.00 175.50 720.00 837.00 864.00 388.80 738.00 1,440.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 20.00 16.25 25.00 54.25 60.00 21.60 27.50 50.00 45.00 30.00
STONE CREEK MOWING 360.00 292.50 450.00 976.50 1,080.00 388.80 495.00 900.00 810.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 20.00 9.75 25.00 46.50 48.00 21.60 27.50 50.00 45.00 30.00
STONE RIDGE MOWING 360.00 175.50 450.00 837.00 864.00 388.80 495.00 900.00 810.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 20.00 29.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 43.20 41.00 50.00 65.00 30.00
STREIH MOWING 360.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 777.60 738.00 900.00 1,170.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 70.00 29.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 21.60 41.00 80.00 65.00 30.00
SULFUR SPRINGS MOWING 1,260.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 388.80 738.00 1,440.00 1,170.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 20.00 29.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 21.60 41.00 50.00 65.00 30.00
SUMMIT OF STONE OAK MOWING 360.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 388.80 738.00 900.00 1,170.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 135.00 260.00 300.00 124.00 180.00 216.00 385.00 200.00 485.00 572.00
SUNSET HILL RESERVOIR MOWING 2,430.00 4,680.00 5,400.00 2,232.00 3,240.00 3,888.00 6,930.00 3,600.00 8,730.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 40.00 29.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 86.40 41.00 80.00 65.00 60.00
SW HIGH SCHOOL MOWING 720.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 1,555.20 738.00 1,440.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.00 29.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 28.80 41.00 80.00 65.00 60.00
SW MIDDLE SCHOOL MOWING 396.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 518.40 738.00 1,440.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 10.00 29.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 21.60 41.00 80.00 65.00 60.00
THREADNEEDLE MOWING 180.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 388.80 738.00 1,440.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 16.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 21.60 41.00 50.00 65.00 60.00
TIMBERWILDE MOWING 270.00 292.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 388.80 738.00 900.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 170.00 195.00 360.00 139.50 108.00 216.00 41.00 200.00 490.00 572.00
UNIVERSITY MOWING 3,060.00 3,510.00 6,480.00 2,511.00 1,944.00 3,888.00 738.00 3,600.00 8,820.00 10,296.00
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P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS
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FOR: (Date of Award through December 31, 2009)
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ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY Pa
ra

di
se

 L
aw

n 
&

 M
ai

nt
en

an
ce

23
35

5 
Ba

t C
av

e 
Rd

.
Sa

n 
A

nt
on

io
, T

X
 7

82
66

Ra
da

n,
 L

LC
92

3 
10

th
 S

t.,
 S

ui
te

 1
01

Fl
or

es
vi

lle
, T

X
 7

81
14

H
or

to
n 

H
or

tic
ul

tu
re

, I
nc

.
53

8 
Ev

er
es

t
Sa

n 
A

nt
on

io
, T

X
 7

82
09

G
re

en
Tr

ee
 L

aw
n 

Ca
re

 &
 

La
nd

sc
ap

in
g

48
07

 M
ac

ey
 T

ra
il

Sa
n 

A
nt

on
io

, T
X

 7
82

53

Ce
da

r S
ol

ut
io

ns
, L

LC
31

06
5 

Re
ta

m
a 

Ri
dg

e
Bu

lv
er

de
, T

X
 7

81
63

R 
&

 C
 L

an
ds

ca
pe

, L
LC

77
35

 M
on

te
go

 R
d.

Sa
n 

A
nt

on
io

, T
X

 7
82

50

Ci
ty

 W
id

e 
Sy

ste
m

s, 
In

c.
36

97
 H

ig
hp

oi
nt

, S
te

. 1
02

Sa
n 

A
nt

on
io

, T
X

 7
82

17

Ca
nt

u 
Co

nt
ra

ct
in

g,
 In

c.
33

96
 R

ab
el

 R
d.

Sa
n 

A
nt

on
io

, T
X

 7
82

21

L.
 M

ob
le

y 
Co

ns
tru

ct
io

n
99

14
 W

ay
w

ar
d 

W
in

d 
Co

ur
t

H
ou

sto
n,

 T
X

 7
70

64

Fa
irw

ay
 L

an
ds

ca
pe

 &
 N

ur
se

ry
, 

In
c.

28
48

 C
as

tro
vi

lle
 R

d.
Sa

n 
A

nt
on

io
, T

X
 7

82
37

-3
26

2

St
at

e 
W

id
e 

La
w

n 
La

nd
sc

ap
in

g 
Se

rv
ic

e
P.

O
. B

ox
 5

33
La

V
er

ni
a,

 T
X

 7
81

21

G
re

en
 G

ra
ss

 
53

33
 R

an
do

lp
h 

Bl
vd

.
Sa

n 
A

nt
on

io
, T

X
 7

82
33

P&
T 

La
w

n 
Se

rv
ic

e
28

41
 C

as
tro

vi
lle

 R
d.

Sa
n 

A
nt

on
io

, T
X

 7
82

37

18 mows per year PRICE/ 45.00 39.00 45.00 62.00 60.00 28.80 41.00 40.00 50.00 60.00
UNIVERSITY BOOSTER MOWING 810.00 702.00 810.00 1,116.00 1,080.00 518.40 738.00 720.00 900.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 29.25 40.00 54.25 72.00 21.60 41.00 80.00 65.00 60.00
UNIVERSITY OAKS MOWING 270.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,296.00 388.80 738.00 1,440.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 29.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 21.60 30.00 80.00 65.00 60.00
VALLEY HIGH MOWING 270.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 388.80 540.00 1,440.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 20.00 29.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 57.60 41.00 200.00 65.00 30.00
VALLEY RIDGE #1 TANK MOWING 360.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 1,036.80 738.00 3,600.00 1,170.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 46.50 48.00 28.80 27.50 22.00 45.00 30.00
VALLEY RIDGE #2 LIFT MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 837.00 864.00 518.40 495.00 396.00 810.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 20.00 9.75 25.00 46.50 48.00 21.60 27.50 22.00 45.00 60.00
VALLEY VISTA MOWING 360.00 175.50 450.00 837.00 864.00 388.80 495.00 396.00 810.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 20.00 29.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 21.60 41.00 50.00 65.00 572.00
VILLA ESPERANZA MOWING 360.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 388.80 738.00 900.00 1,170.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 70.00 107.25 55.00 93.00 84.00 129.60 204.00 200.00 215.00 572.00
VILLAGE GREEN #1 MOWING 1,260.00 1,930.50 990.00 1,674.00 1,512.00 2,332.80 3,672.00 3,600.00 3,870.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 85.00 39.00 40.00 62.00 72.00 216.00 41.00 100.00 45.00 60.00
VILLAGE GREEN #2 MOWING 1,530.00 702.00 720.00 1,116.00 1,296.00 3,888.00 738.00 1,800.00 810.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 20.00 19.50 40.00 46.50 60.00 28.80 41.00 80.00 65.00 60.00
VINEYARD MOWING 360.00 351.00 720.00 837.00 1,080.00 518.40 738.00 1,440.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 85.00 9.75 25.00 46.50 48.00 21.60 27.50 22.00 45.00 30.00
W. KELLY BLDG. #1540 MOWING 1,530.00 175.50 450.00 837.00 864.00 388.80 495.00 396.00 810.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 70.00 9.75 25.00 46.50 48.00 21.60 27.50 22.00 45.00 30.00
W. KELLY BLDG. #638 MOWING 1,260.00 175.50 450.00 837.00 864.00 388.80 495.00 396.00 810.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 145.00 39.00 45.00 62.00 84.00 86.40 45.00 80.00 225.00 60.00
WALDEN BOOSTER MOWING 2,610.00 702.00 810.00 1,116.00 1,512.00 1,555.20 810.00 1,440.00 4,050.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 90.00 97.50 55.00 93.00 72.00 57.60 204.00 22.00 215.00 572.00
WEST AVENUE MOWING 1,620.00 1,755.00 990.00 1,674.00 1,296.00 1,036.80 3,672.00 396.00 3,870.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 29.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 21.60 41.00 50.00 65.00 60.00
WEST CREEK MOWING 270.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 388.80 738.00 900.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 16.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 21.60 41.00 50.00 65.00 30.00
WEST CREEK PARK MOWING 270.00 292.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 388.80 738.00 900.00 1,170.00 540.00
 PRICE/
ITEM DELTED MOWING
18 mows per year PRICE/ 40.00 29.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 21.60 41.00 50.00 65.00 60.00
WILDERNESS OAK MOWING 720.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 388.80 738.00 900.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 45.00 39.00 55.00 62.00 84.00 21.60 204.00 50.00 125.00 60.00
WILDLAKE MOWING 810.00 702.00 990.00 1,116.00 1,512.00 388.80 3,672.00 900.00 2,250.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 29.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 21.60 41.00 50.00 65.00 60.00
WOOD GLEN MOWING 270.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 388.80 738.00 900.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 29.25 40.00 54.25 60.00 28.80 41.00 50.00 65.00 60.00
WOODED KNOLL MOWING 270.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 518.40 738.00 900.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 170.00 97.50 55.00 93.00 72.00 115.20 204.00 50.00 65.00 572.00
WOODLAWN MOWING 3,060.00 1,755.00 990.00 1,674.00 1,296.00 2,073.60 3,672.00 900.00 1,170.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 68.25 39.00 40.00 54.25 60.00 115.20 41.00 50.00 65.00 60.00
WOODS OF FAIR OAKS STATION #1 MOWING 1,228.50 702.00 720.00 976.50 1,080.00 2,073.60 738.00 900.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 72.80 39.00 40.00 62.00 72.00 86.40 41.00 50.00 65.00 60.00
WOODS OF FAIR OAKS STATION #2 MOWING 1,310.40 702.00 720.00 1,116.00 1,296.00 1,555.20 738.00 900.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 20.00 39.00 40.00 62.00 72.00 43.20 41.00 80.00 65.00 60.00
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WOODS OF SHAVANO E. MOWING 360.00 702.00 720.00 1,116.00 1,296.00 777.60 738.00 1,440.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
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18 mows per year PRICE/ 20.00 39.00 40.00 62.00 72.00 43.20 41.00 80.00 65.00 60.00
WOODS OF SHAVANO W. MOWING 360.00 702.00 720.00 1,116.00 1,296.00 777.60 738.00 1,440.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 20.00 29.25 40.00 54.05 60.00 21.60 41.00 80.00 65.00 60.00
WORTHAM OAK MOWING 360.00 526.50 720.00 972.90 1,080.00 388.80 738.00 1,440.00 1,170.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 20.00 9.75 25.00 46.50 48.00 43.20 27.50 50.00 65.00 30.00
ZARZAMORA MOWING 360.00 175.50 450.00 837.00 864.00 777.60 495.00 900.00 1,170.00 540.00
  *          
TOTAL GROUP 1 TOTAL 148,014.90 188,604.00 190,710.00 201,992.40 243,972.00 258,448.32 266,184.00 275,292.00 329,562.00 520,830.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 29.25 45.00 62.00 88.00 60.00 41.00 200.00 125.00 60.00
ALAMO RANCH MOWING 270.00 526.50 810.00 1,116.00 1,584.00 1,080.00 738.00 3,600.00 2,250.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 19.50 40.00 62.00 70.00 45.00 27.50 22.00 70.00 60.00
CITUS MOWING 270.00 351.00 720.00 1,116.00 1,260.00 810.00 495.00 396.00 1,260.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 90.00 312.00 300.00 527.00 147.00 410.00 440.00 200.00 250.00 572.00
GRISSON TANK MOWING 1,620.00 5,616.00 5,400.00 9,486.00 2,646.00 7,380.00 7,920.00 3,600.00 4,500.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00    40.00  41.00  90.00 572.00
GROWDEN RD. MOWING 270.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 720.00 No Bid 738.00 No Bid 1,620.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 60.00 78.00 45.00 77.50 88.00 125.00 41.00 50.00 70.00 60.00
H&C PLANT (CHILL TOWER) MOWING 1,080.00 1,404.00 810.00 1,395.00 1,584.00 2,250.00 738.00 900.00 1,260.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 85.00 9.75 55.00 54.25 70.00 165.00 41.00 200.00 350.00 60.00
HALL TANK MOWING 1,530.00 175.50 990.00 976.50 1,260.00 2,970.00 738.00 3,600.00 6,300.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 45.00 19.50 40.00 54.25 53.00 125.00 100.00 50.00 125.00 60.00
HEIGHTS OF STONE OAK MOWING 810.00 351.00 720.00 976.50 954.00 2,250.00 1,800.00 900.00 2,250.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 65.00 39.00 45.00 54.25 88.00 95.00 35.00 200.00 300.00 60.00
JEFFERSON TANK MOWING 1,170.00 702.00 810.00 976.50 1,584.00 1,710.00 630.00 3,600.00 5,400.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 35.00 29.25 45.00 54.25 106.00 95.00 45.00 200.00 350.00 60.00
LACKLAND TANK MOWING 630.00 526.50 810.00 976.50 1,908.00 1,710.00 810.00 3,600.00 6,300.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 35.00 29.25 45.00 54.25 88.00 95.00 41.00 50.00 60.00 60.00
LACKLAND TERRACE MOWING 630.00 526.50 810.00 976.50 1,584.00 1,710.00 738.00 900.00 1,080.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 45.00 78.00 45.00 54.25 88.00 95.00 41.00 50.00 60.00 60.00
LADY OF THE LAKE MOWING 810.00 1,404.00 810.00 976.50 1,584.00 1,710.00 738.00 900.00 1,080.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 20.00 9.75 25.00 54.25 59.00 45.00 27.50 50.00 60.00 60.00
LAGO VISTA MOWING 360.00 175.50 450.00 976.50 1,062.00 810.00 495.00 900.00 1,080.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 65.00 29.25 40.00 54.25 88.00 60.00 41.00 50.00 90.00 60.00
LANDA STATION MOWING 1,170.00 526.50 720.00 976.50 1,584.00 1,080.00 738.00 900.00 1,620.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.00 9.75 25.00 54.25 88.00 45.00 27.50 50.00 125.00 60.00
LEGEND HILL MOWING 396.00 175.50 450.00 976.50 1,584.00 810.00 495.00 900.00 2,250.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 54.25 59.00 45.00 27.50 50.00 125.00 60.00
LEGEND POINT MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 976.50 1,062.00 810.00 495.00 900.00 2,250.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 41.23 59.00 45.00 27.50 40.00 40.00 30.00
LIFT STATION MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 742.14 1,062.00 810.00 495.00 720.00 720.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 54.25 59.00 45.00 27.50 50.00 190.00 60.00
LINCOLN HEIGHTS MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 976.50 1,062.00 810.00 495.00 900.00 3,420.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 70.00 58.50 50.00 77.50 88.00 125.00 50.00 80.00 40.00 60.00
LINDBERGH PARK MOWING 1,260.00 1,053.00 900.00 1,395.00 1,584.00 2,250.00 900.00 1,440.00 720.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 70.00 39.00 125.00 93.00 106.00 165.00 80.00 100.00 90.00 60.00
LIONS MOWING 1,260.00 702.00 2,250.00 1,674.00 1,908.00 2,970.00 1,440.00 1,800.00 1,620.00 1,080.00
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)  

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Lawn Maintenance Services for Various SAWS Locations
FOR: (Date of Award through December 31, 2009)
TIME &

DATE: 3:00 p.m., December 9, 2008  
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18 mows per year PRICE/ 70.00 39.00 125.00 93.00 106.00 165.00 80.00 22.00 90.00 60.00
LOCKHILL MOWING 1,260.00 702.00 2,250.00 1,674.00 1,908.00 2,970.00 1,440.00 396.00 1,620.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 70.00 19.50 45.00 54.25 70.00 95.00 45.00 50.00 90.00 60.00
LONE STAR MOWING 1,260.00 351.00 810.00 976.50 1,260.00 1,710.00 810.00 900.00 1,620.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 67.50 39.00 55.00 54.25 106.00 330.00 204.00 100.00 280.00 60.00
LOST LANE TANK MOWING 1,215.00 702.00 990.00 976.50 1,908.00 5,940.00 3,672.00 1,800.00 5,040.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 20.00 9.75 25.00 54.25 88.00 45.00 27.50 50.00 90.00 60.00
LOVE'S COUNTRY STORE MOWING 360.00 175.50 450.00 976.50 1,584.00 810.00 495.00 900.00 1,620.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 46.50 59.00 45.00 27.50 50.00 90.00 30.00
LUBBOCK MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 837.00 1,062.00 810.00 495.00 900.00 1,620.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 20.00 9.75 25.00 54.25 59.00 45.00 27.50 50.00 90.00 60.00
MAMA'S MOWING 360.00 175.50 450.00 976.50 1,062.00 810.00 495.00 900.00 1,620.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 70.00 9.75 25.00 62.00 53.00 165.00 41.00 50.00 160.00 60.00
MARKET MOWING 1,260.00 175.50 450.00 1,116.00 954.00 2,970.00 738.00 900.00 2,880.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 20.00 9.75 25.00 54.25 59.00 45.00 41.00 40.00 45.00 30.00
MARSHALL LIFT MOWING 360.00 175.50 450.00 976.50 1,062.00 810.00 738.00 720.00 810.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 70.00 156.00 125.00 124.00 59.00 165.00 27.50 50.00 225.00 60.00
MARSHALL TANK MOWING 1,260.00 2,808.00 2,250.00 2,232.00 1,062.00 2,970.00 495.00 900.00 4,050.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 70.00 39.00 45.00 54.25 59.00 165.00 204.00 100.00 290.00 30.00
MCCULLOUGH MOWING 1,260.00 702.00 810.00 976.50 1,062.00 2,970.00 3,672.00 1,800.00 5,220.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 40.00 39.00 125.00 93.00 106.00 165.00 80.00 50.00 90.00 60.00
MEDICAL MOWING 720.00 702.00 2,250.00 1,674.00 1,908.00 2,970.00 1,440.00 900.00 1,620.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 75.00 39.00 125.00 93.00 106.00 165.00 80.00 50.00 90.00 60.00
MENGER MOWING 1,350.00 702.00 2,250.00 1,674.00 1,908.00 2,970.00 1,440.00 900.00 1,620.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 245.00 624.00 600.00 41.23 147.00 990.00 60.00 700.00 290.00 1,600.00
MICRON MOWING 4,410.00 11,232.00 10,800.00 742.14 2,646.00 17,820.00 1,080.00 12,600.00 5,220.00 28,800.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 35.00 19.50 40.00 155.00 59.00 95.00 60.00 110.00 125.00 60.00
MISSION DEL LAGO MOWING 630.00 351.00 720.00 2,790.00 1,062.00 1,710.00 1,080.00 1,980.00 2,250.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.00 9.75 40.00 124.00 59.00 45.00 175.00 80.00 190.00 60.00
MISSION FOUNDATION MOWING 396.00 175.50 720.00 2,232.00 1,062.00 810.00 3,150.00 1,440.00 3,420.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 50.00 9.75 40.00 124.00 106.00 45.00 60.00 50.00 60.00 60.00
MISSION TRAIL #1 MOWING 900.00 175.50 720.00 2,232.00 1,908.00 810.00 1,080.00 900.00 1,080.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.00 9.75 40.00 124.00 88.00 45.00 60.00 50.00 60.00 60.00
MISSION TRAIL #2 MOWING 396.00 175.50 720.00 2,232.00 1,584.00 810.00 1,080.00 900.00 1,080.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 95.00 156.00 500.00 170.50 147.00 577.00 275.00 1,000.00 225.00 1,200.00
MITCHELL LAKE MOWING 1,710.00 2,808.00 9,000.00 3,069.00 2,646.00 10,386.00 4,950.00 18,000.00 4,050.00 21,600.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 54.25 88.00 45.00 60.00 50.00 125.00 60.00
MONTE VIEJO MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 976.50 1,584.00 810.00 1,080.00 900.00 2,250.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 54.25 70.00 45.00 27.50 50.00 90.00 60.00
MONTICELLO MANOR MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 976.50 1,260.00 810.00 495.00 900.00 1,620.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 30.00 9.75 25.00 54.25 70.00 45.00 27.50 50.00 125.00 60.00
MOSS BLUFF MOWING 540.00 175.50 450.00 976.50 1,260.00 810.00 495.00 900.00 2,250.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 25.00 9.75 25.00 54.25 70.00 45.00 27.50 50.00 175.00 60.00
MOUNTAIN CLIMB MOWING 450.00 175.50 450.00 976.50 1,260.00 810.00 495.00 900.00 3,150.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 39.00 45.00 41.23 70.00 165.00 41.00 50.00 175.00 60.00
MUD CREEK MOWING 405.00 702.00 810.00 742.14 1,260.00 2,970.00 738.00 900.00 3,150.00 1,080.00
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18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 9.75 40.00 54.25 70.00 45.00 41.00 50.00 125.00 60.00
NEAR WEST LS MOWING 405.00 175.50 720.00 976.50 1,260.00 810.00 738.00 900.00 2,250.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 45.00 9.75 40.00 54.25 47.00 45.00 50.00 50.00 90.00 60.00
NELSON WOLFE (STADIUM) MOWING 810.00 175.50 720.00 976.50 846.00 810.00 900.00 900.00 1,620.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 50.00 19.50 55.00 54.25 106.00 165.00 192.50 50.00 125.00 60.00
NICKEL & DIME MOWING 900.00 351.00 990.00 976.50 1,908.00 2,970.00 3,465.00 900.00 2,250.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 102.00 39.00 125.00 93.00 106.00 165.00 41.00 50.00 125.00 60.00
NORTHRIDGE MOWING 1,836.00 702.00 2,250.00 1,674.00 1,908.00 2,970.00 738.00 900.00 2,250.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 160.00 78.00 175.00 124.00 70.00 45.00 245.00 70.00 265.00 60.00
OLIVER RANCH WELLS MOWING 2,880.00 1,404.00 3,150.00 2,232.00 1,260.00 810.00 4,410.00 1,260.00 4,770.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 41.23 70.00 45.00 27.50 50.00 125.00 30.00
PADRE MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 742.14 1,260.00 810.00 495.00 900.00 2,250.00 540.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.50 9.75 25.00 54.25 59.00 45.00 50.00 50.00 125.00 60.00
PALO ALTO MOWING 405.00 175.50 450.00 976.50 1,062.00 810.00 900.00 900.00 2,250.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.00 156.00 125.00 124.00 88.00 330.00 165.00 22.00 90.00 572.00
PEARSALL #1 MOWING 396.00 2,808.00 2,250.00 2,232.00 1,584.00 5,940.00 2,970.00 396.00 1,620.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 22.00 19.50 25.00 54.25 70.00 45.00 45.00 22.00 90.00 60.00
PEARSALL LANDFILL #2 MOWING 396.00 351.00 450.00 976.50 1,260.00 810.00 810.00 396.00 1,620.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 310.00 234.00 125.00 217.00 88.00 410.00 80.00 110.00 90.00 572.00
PINN ROAD MOWING 5,580.00 4,212.00 2,250.00 3,906.00 1,584.00 7,380.00 1,440.00 1,980.00 1,620.00 10,296.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 85.00 39.00 45.00 62.00 88.00 165.00 204.00 50.00 125.00 60.00
PIPESTONE MOWING 1,530.00 702.00 810.00 1,116.00 1,584.00 2,970.00 3,672.00 900.00 2,250.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 27.00 9.75 25.00 54.25 70.00 45.00 60.00 180.00 90.00 60.00
POLICY ACADEMY MOWING 486.00 175.50 450.00 976.50 1,260.00 810.00 1,080.00 3,240.00 1,620.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 54.25 70.00 45.00 45.00 50.00 90.00 60.00
POTRANCO #2 MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 976.50 1,260.00 810.00 810.00 900.00 1,620.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 85.00 9.75 25.00 54.25 70.00 45.00 27.50 50.00 90.00 60.00
PRESA MOWING 1,530.00 175.50 450.00 976.50 1,260.00 810.00 495.00 900.00 1,620.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 54.25 70.00 45.00 27.50 50.00 90.00 60.00
PRESWICK MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 976.50 1,260.00 810.00 495.00 900.00 1,620.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 54.25 70.00 45.00 27.50 50.00 125.00 60.00
QUAL CREEK HEIGHTS MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 976.50 1,260.00 810.00 495.00 900.00 2,250.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 40.00 29.25 45.00 54.25 88.00 165.00 41.00 50.00 90.00 60.00
RAINBOW HILLS #1 MOWING 720.00 526.50 810.00 976.50 1,584.00 2,970.00 738.00 900.00 1,620.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 40.00 29.25 45.00 54.25 88.00 165.00 41.00 50.00 90.00 60.00
RAINBOW HILLS #2 MOWING 720.00 526.50 810.00 976.50 1,584.00 2,970.00 738.00 900.00 1,620.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 55.00 9.75 40.00 54.25 70.00 45.00 41.00 50.00 125.00 60.00
RANCH @ IRON HORSE MOWING 990.00 175.50 720.00 976.50 1,260.00 810.00 738.00 900.00 2,250.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 19.50 50.00 62.00 112.00 125.00 204.00 50.00 125.00 60.00
SHAENWEST MOWING 270.00 351.00 900.00 1,116.00 2,016.00 2,250.00 3,672.00 900.00 2,250.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 54.25 59.00 45.00 60.00 50.00 90.00 60.00
SOLONO RIDGE MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 976.50 1,062.00 810.00 1,080.00 900.00 1,620.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 30.00 19.50 40.00 46.50 59.00 45.00 27.50 200.00 125.00 60.00
TINKER TANK MOWING 540.00 351.00 720.00 837.00 1,062.00 810.00 495.00 3,600.00 2,250.00 1,080.00
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18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 39.00 55.00 62.00 106.00 165.00 204.00 110.00 90.00 60.00
TOYOTA #250 MOWING 270.00 702.00 990.00 1,116.00 1,908.00 2,970.00 3,672.00 1,980.00 1,620.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 15.00 9.75 25.00 54.25 70.00 45.00 27.50 50.00 90.00 60.00
WALGREENS MOWING 270.00 175.50 450.00 976.50 1,260.00 810.00 495.00 900.00 1,620.00 1,080.00
18 mows per year PRICE/ 70.00 9.75 50.00 54.25 70.00 125.00 41.00 110.00 190.00 60.00
WESTOVER TANK MOWING 1,260.00 175.50 900.00 976.50 1,260.00 2,250.00 738.00 1,980.00 3,420.00 1,080.00
  *
TOTAL FOR GROUP 2 TOTAL 59,202.00 53,878.50 81,450.00 91,272.06 96,660.00 148,986.00 89,568.00 112,824.00 157,590.00 154,764.00

 
2% 5% 1% Net Net Net 1% Net Net 6%

Terms 20 days 20 days 20 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 20 days 30 days 30 days 20 days

 
Delivery Days 10 days 30 days 10 days
 
 

BIDS WERE MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Cantu Contracting, Inc. Landscaping by Design SAWS Website
Cedar Solutions Lawn Patrol
City Wide Janitorial P&T Lawn Service
Fairway Landscape & Nursery Paradise Lawn & Maintenance
Gil's Cut Rite Lawn Care Powell's Mowing
Green Grass, Inc. R&C Landscape
GreenTree Lawn Care & Landscape Radan, LLC
Horton Horticulture, Inc. River City Landscape, Inc.
John & Ernie, Inc. Statewide Lawn & Landscaping
L. Mobley Construction
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