
07-7066  
 

F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Lawn Maintenance
FOR: Secondaries and Lift 
TIME & (January 1, 2008 through December 31, 2008)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 8, 2007  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

 UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 50.00

 Mow Acequia Park TOTAL 600.00 No Bid
 UNIT
 12 mows/year PRICE 40.00
 Mow Afton Oaks TOTAL 480.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 40.00

 Mow Air Force Village 1 TOTAL 480.00 No Bid
UNIT

12 mows/year PRICE 40.00
Mow Air Force Village 2 TOTAL 480.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 40.00
Mow Alamodome TOTAL 480.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 200.00
Mow Albertsons TOTAL 2,400.00 No Bid

  UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 40.00
Mow Apollo and 99th TOTAL 480.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 50.00
Mow Austin Tank TOTAL 600.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 50.00
Mow Babcock TOTAL 600.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 50.00
Mow Bandera TOTAL 600.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 50.00
Mow Barbet 1 TOTAL 600.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 40.00
Mow Bascum TOTAL 480.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 40.00
Mow Basse TOTAL 480.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 40.00
Mow Basse Lift TOTAL 480.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 50.00
Mow Braun TOTAL 600.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 50.00
Mow Braun Tank TOTAL 600.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 50.00
Mow Brighten Oaks TOTAL 600.00 No Bid

 UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 50.00
Mow Brooks Tank TOTAL 600.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 50.00
Mow BSR 1 and 2 TOTAL 600.00 No Bid
 UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 50.00
Mow Bulverde TOTAL 600.00 No Bid
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UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 40.00
Mow Cadillac TOTAL 480.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 40.00
Mow Cagnon TOTAL 480.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 50.00
Mow Callaghan TOTAL 600.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 50.00
Mow Caro Winds TOTAL 600.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 50.00
Mow Cash Mountain TOTAL 600.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 50.00
Mow Cedar Creek TOTAL 600.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 40.00
Mow Cedar Creek Booster TOTAL 480.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 40.00
Mow Cedar Park TOTAL 480.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 50.00
Mow Heating & Cooling Plant TOTAL 600.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 50.00
Mow Commanche Park 1 TOTAL 600.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 50.00
Mow Commanche Park 2 TOTAL 600.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 60.00
Mow Commercial Chaveneaux TOTAL 720.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 50.00
Mow commercial Villaret TOTAL 600.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 50.00
Mow Concept Therapy TOTAL 600.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 40.00
Mow Concord TOTAL 480.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 40.00
Mow Copperfield TOTAL 480.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 50.00
Mow Corner Stone 162 TOTAL 600.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 40.00
Mow Costco TOTAL 480.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 40.00
Mow Crown Meadows TOTAL 480.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 60.00
Mow Crown Ridge TOTAL 720.00 No Bid
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UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 100.00
Mow Defoste 1,2,3 TOTAL 1,200.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 50.00
Mow Dominion TOTAL 600.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 50.00
Mow Dwyer Tank TOTAL 600.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 60.00
Mow Edison TOTAL 720.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 50.00
Mow Fossil Ridge TOTAL 600.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 40.00
Mow Iron Horse TOTAL 480.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 100.00
Mow Octavia TOTAL 1,200.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 50.00
Mow Oliver Ranch TOTAL 600.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 50.00
Mow Woodland Hills TOTAL 600.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 50.00
Mow Triple S Lift Station TOTAL 600.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 40.00
Mow Medina Medio Creek WRC TOTAL 480.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 50.00
Mow Basse 2 TOTAL 600.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 50.00
Mow Basse 3 TOTAL 600.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 60.00
Mow Espada LS TOTAL 720.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 50.00
Mow Lomas Verdes LS TOTAL 600.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 50.00
Mow Toyota South LS TOTAL 600.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 100.00
Mow Heating & Cooling - 725 S. Cherry TOTAL 1,200.00 No Bid

UNIT
12 mows/year PRICE 40.00
Mow Rivinia TOTAL 480.00 No Bid

TOTAL 36,600.00 No Bid

Net
Terms 30 days
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Delivery Days

 1

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:  
 
3d Lawncare Demandstar
Basic Industries of South TX SAWS Website
Cantu Contracting, Inc.
Green Grass, Inc.
Horton Horticulture, Inc.
Landscaping By Design
Lou Miss Facilities Service
Milberger Landscape
P&T Lawn Service
Procut Landscaping
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