
06-0212
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Semi-Annual Contract for
FOR: Lubricants
TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2006)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., June 22, 2006  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Item 1 601062-00/MOBIL, EAL ARCTIC 32 (Drum - 55 gallon)
Price 1,190.00 1,190.20 No Bid
Total 2,380.00 2,380.40
Brand Name Syn Comp 32 Wright
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright
Estimated Annual Usage : 110 Gallons (2 Drums

Item 2 601070-00/MOBIL, EAL ARCTIC 46 (5 gallon pail)
Price 110.00 110.10 No Bid
Total 1,100.00 1,101.00
Brand Name Syn Comp 46 Wright
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright
Estimated Annual Usage : 60 Gallons (10 Pails

Item 3 7500 MONOLEC power fluid ALLISON C4-11420289 (5 gallon pail)
Price 30.95 31.00 91.15

61.90 62.00 182.30
Brand Name C-4 Torque Fluid Wright LE's 7500
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun Oil LE 
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright LE
Estimated Annual Usage : 10 Gallons or 2 Pail

Item 4 AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID (DEXRON III/MERCON)(Bulk)(55 gallon drum)
Price/Bulk: (To include transport delivery) 5.85/gal 7.85/gal 17.87/gal
Total 1,170.00 1,570.00 3,574.00
Price/55 Gallon Drum: (To include transport delivery) 6.19/gal 431.75/drum 1,026.30
Total 1,702.00 2,159.00 5,132.00
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun Oil LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright LE
Supplier Wright LE
Estimated Usage Bulk:  200 Gallons
Estimated Usage Bulk:  5 Drums

Item 5 CIRRO HYDRAULIC OIL 200 (DRUM)
Price: (To include transport delivery 321.00 322.30 827.20
Total 1,284.00 1,289.20 3,308.80
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun Oil LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright LE
Supplier Wright LE
Estimated Annual Usage:  220 Gallons (4 Drums
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Item 6 DIESEL SUPREME MOTOR OIL 15W40 (Bulk) & (Drum)
Price/Bulk: (To include transport delivery 5.75/gal 5.96/gal 24.84/gal
Total 17,250.00 17,880.00 44,520.00
Price/55 Gallon Drum: (To include transport delivery 332.00 353.10 838.20
Total 13,280.00 14,124.00 33,528.00
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Oil LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright LE
Supplier Wright LE
Estimated Usage Bulk:  3,000 Gallons
Estimated Usage Drum:  2,200 Gallons or 40 Drums

Item 7 GEAR SELECT (GEAR OIL) FPGL-5 85/140 WEIGHT (KEG - 15 gallons)
Price/Keg: (To include transport delivery 115.00 118.08 411.60
Total 345.00 354.24 1,234.80
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun Oil LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright LE
Supplier Wright LE
Estimated Usage Drum:  3 (Kegs)

Item 8 HD MULTIGEAR SELECT LUBRICATING GEAR OIL,
MIL-2105D GL4, 90 WT (DRUM) & (PAIL)
Price/Drum: (To include transport delivery 348.00 350.90 1,533.00
Total 1,044.00 1,053.00 4,599.00
Price/Pail: (To include transport delivery 32.00 33.86 132.30
Total 96.00 102.00 397.00
Manufacturer of Base Stock GL-4 90 wt Wright LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Sun Sun Oil LE
Supplier Troco Wright LE
Estimated Usage Bulk:  3 Drums
Estimated Usage Drum:  3 Pails

Item 9 HIGH VI NON-DETERGENT MOTOR OIL SAE 10 DRUM
Price/Drum: (To include transport delivery 307.00 308.00 787.05
Total 1,228.00 1,232.00 3,148.20
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun Oil LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright LE
Supplier Wright LE
Estimated Usage: 4 Drums
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Item 10 HIGH VI NON-DETERGENT MOTOR OIL SAE 20 (Drum)
(also called "High Premium")
Price/Drum: (To include transport delivery 307.00 308.00 787.05
Total 3,684.00 3,696.00 9,444.60
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun Oil LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright LE
Supplier Wright LE
Estimated Usage: 12 Drums

Item 11 HIGH NON-DETERGENT MOTOR OIL SAE 30 (DRUM)
Price/Drum: (To include transport delivery 307.00 308.00 787.05
Total 1,842.00 1,848.00 4,722.30
Brand Name Troco Wright LE
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun Oil LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright LE
Estimated Usage: 6 Drums

Item 12 HYDRAULIC OIL 851 SAE10 WEIGHT (DRUM)
Price/Drum: (To include transport delivery 281.00 282.70 787.05
Total 281.00 282.70 787.05
Manufacturer of Base Stock Troco Sun Oil LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Sun Wright LE
Supplier Troco Wright LE
Estimated Usage: 1 Drum

Item 13 HYDRAULIC OIL FORD 134D (BULK) & (DRUM) & (PAIL)
Price/Bulk: (To include transport delivery 5.65 5.94/gal 16.47/gal
Total 6,780.00 7,128.00 19,764.00
Price/Drum: (To include transport delivery 329.45 352.00 931.15
Total 3,295.00 3,520.00 9,312.00
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun Oil LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright LE
Supplier Wright LE
Estimaged Usage Bulk:  1200 Gallons
Estimated Usage Drum:  10 Drums

Item 14 INLUBE 68 AGMA 2-EP INDUSTRIAL GEAR OIL (5 GALLON PAIL) 
Price/Pail: (To include transport delivery 35.00 35.36 131.60
Total 700.00 707.20 2,632.00
Brand Name Inlube 68 Wright LE
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun Oil LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright LE
Estimated Usage:  20 Pails
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Item 15 INLUBE 220 AGMA EP-5 INDUSTRIAL GEAR OIL (DRUM) PRODUCT CODE: 284
Price/Drum: (To include transport delivery 342.00 343.50 1,533.00
Total 3,078.00 3,091.50 13,797.00
Brand Name Inlube 220 Wright LE
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun Oil LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright LE
Supplier
Estimated Usage: 9 Drums

Item 16 INLUBE 320 AGMA EP-6 INDUSTRIAL GEAR OIL 
(DRUM - 55 Gallons) & (5 GALLON PAIL)
Price/Drum: (To include transport delivery 342.00 343.50 1,533.00
Total 4,104.00 4,122.00 18,396.00
Price/Pail: (To include transport delivery 35.00 35.20 132.30
Total 2,100.00 2,112.00 7,938.00
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun Oil LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright LE
Supplier Wright LE
Estimated:  12 Drum
Estimated Usage:  60 Pails

Item 17 INLUBE 460 AGMA EP-7 INDUSTRIAL GEAR OIL (DRUM)
Price/Drum: (To include transport delivery 346.00 342.90 1,533.00
Total 2,076.00 2,057.40 9,198.00
Brand Name Inlube 460 Wright LE
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun Oil LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright LE
Estimated Usage:  6 Drums

Item 18 INLUBE 680 AGMA EP-8 INDUSTRIAL GEAR OIL (DRUM)
Price/Drum: (To include transport delivery 366.00 368.80 1,533.00
Total 1,098.00 1,106.40 4,599.00
Brand Name Inlube 680 Wright LE
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun Oil LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright LE
Estimated Usage:  3 Drums
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Item 19 KI KEROSENE 3 UN1223 PG11 FLAMMABLE LIQUID (DRUM)
Price/Drum: (To include transport delivery 219.00 219.45 No Bid
Total 657.00 658.35
Brand Name Dyed K-1 Kerosene
Manufacturer of Base Stock AGE
Manufacturer of Blending Package AGE
Estimated Usage:  3 Drums

Item 20 MEROPA 320 (DRUM)
Price/Drum: (To include transport delivery 342.00 343.50 1,533.00
Total 684.00 687.00 3,066.00
Brand Name Inlube 320 Wright Inlube 320 LE
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun Oil LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright LE
Estimated Usage:  2 Drums

Item 21 MOBILE DTE 11M (5 Gallon Pail)
Price/Pail: (To include transport delivery 37.00 37.40 97.50
Total 148.00 149.60 390.00
Brand Name Fina Hyd-HI VI/5 Wright LE
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun Oil LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright LE
Estimated Usage:  4 Pails

Item 22 MOBIL RARUS 427 (5 Gallon Pail)
Price/Pail: (To include transport delivery 32.50 32.70 78.98
Total 32.50 32.70 78.95
Brand Name Cirro 100 Wright Cirro 100 LE
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun Oil LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright LE
Estimated Usage:  1 Pails

Item 23 MOBIL SHC 626 (5 Gallon Pail)
Price/Pail: (To include transport delivery 107.00 107.60 192.05

2,675.00 2,690.00 4,801.25
Brand Name Syn Comp 68 Monarch Syn Comp 68 LE
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun Oil LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright LE
Estimated Usage:  25 Pails
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Item 24 MOBIL SHC 629 (55 Gallon Drums)
Price/Drum: (To include transport delivery 1,134.00 1,135.20 2,060.30
Total 3,402.00 3,405.60 6,180.90
Brand Name Syn Comp 150 Wright LE
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun  LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright LE
Estimated Usage:  3 Drums

Item 25 MOBIL SHC 630 (55 Gallon Drums)
Price/Drum: (To include transport delivery 1,266.00 1,267.20 2,145.55
Total 6,330.00 6,336.00 10,727.75
Brand Name Syn Comp 220 Wright LE
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright LE
Estimated Usage:  5 Drums

Item 26 MOBIL SHC 634 (55 Gallon Drums)
Price/Drum: (To include transport delivery 1,360.00 1,360.70 2,145.55

2,720.00 2,721.40 4,291.10
Brand Name Syn Comp 460 Wright LE
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright LE
Estimated Usage:  2 Drums

Item 27 MOBIL SHC 636 (5 Gallon Pails)
Price/Pail: (To include transport delivery No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total
Brand Name
Manufacturer of Base Stock
Manufacturer of Blending Package
Estimated Usage:  6 Pails

Item 28 MOBILGEAR 630 (5 Gallon Pails)
Price/Pail: (To include transport delivery 35.00 35.20 132.30
Total 210.00 211.20 793.80
Brand Name Inlube 220 Wright Inlube 220 LE
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun Oil LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright LE
Estimated Usage:  6 Pails

Item 29 PETROLEUM SOLVENT (Drum)
Price/Drum: (To include transport delivery 329.00 329.45 No Bid

658.00 658.90
Brand Name Safety Solvent
Manufacturer of Base Stock
Manufacturer of Blending Package
Estimated Usage:  2 Drums
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Item 30 ROYAL 760 POLYPLATE EP GREASE NO 1 (55 Gallon Drums)
Price/Drum: (To include transport delivery 427.00 428.00 2,095.80
Total 2,135.00 2,140.00 10,479.00
Brand Name Royal 760 #1 Troco LE
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun Oil LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright LE
Estimated Usage:  5 drums

Item 31 ROYAL 760 POLYPLATE EP GREASE NO. 2 (Drums),(Pails), & (Tubes)
Price/Drum: (To include transport delivery 427.00 428.00 2,095.80
Total 2,135.00 2,140.00 10,479.00
Price/Keg: (To include transport delivery 136.00 136.80 612.00
Total 408.00 410.00 1,836.00
Price/Pail: (To include transport delivery 39.00 39.20 180.25
Total 117.00 118.00 541.00
Price/Tube or case of tubes: (To include transport delivery 66.00 67.00 324.13
Total 132.00 134.00 648.00
Brand Name Royal 760 #2 Troco LE
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun Oil LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright LE
Estimaged Usage Bulk:  5 Drums
Estimated Usage Drum:  3 Keys
Estimated Usage 3 pails
Esimated Usage Pail:  20 Tubes of 2 Cases

Item 32 ROZEP ISO 32 HYDRAULIC OIL (Drum)
Price/Drum: (To include transport delivery 249.99 288.50 828.85
Total 2,499.90 2,885.00 8,288.50
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun Oil LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright LE
Supplier Wright LE
Estimated Usage:  10 drums

Item 33 ROZEP ISO 68 HYDRAULIC OIL (Pail)
Price/Pail: (To include transport delivery 27.00 27.60 79.10
Total 2,700.00 2,760.00 7,910.00
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun Oil LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright LE
Supplier Wright LE
Estimated Usage:  100 Pails

7



06-0212
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Semi-Annual Contract for
FOR: Lubricants
TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2006)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., June 22, 2006  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY  W

rig
ht

 O
il 

C
o.

43
21

 P
ro

fit
Sa

n 
A

nt
on

io
, T

X
 7

82
19

D
ix

ie
 O

il 
C

o.
P.

O
. B

ox
 8

27
1

Sa
n 

A
nt

on
io

, T
X

 7
82

08

Lu
br

ic
at

io
n 

En
gi

ne
er

s, 
In

c.
30

0 
B

ai
le

y 
A

ve
.

Fo
rt 

W
or

th
, T

X
 7

61
07

Item 34 SHELL, OMALA.RL Oil 150 (5 Gallon Pails)
Price/Pail: (To include transport delivery 35.00 35.20 192.05
Total 280.00 281.60 1,536.40
Brand Name Inlube 150 Wright Inlube 150 LE
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun Oil LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright LE
Estimated Usage:  40 Gallons (8 Pails

Item 35 SHELL, OMALA.RL Oil 220 (5 Gallon Pails)
Price/Pail: (To include transport delivery 35.00 35.20 132.30
Total 210.00 211.20 793.80
Brand Name Inlube  Wright Inlube 220 LE
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun Oil LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright LE
Estimated Usage:  6 Pails

Item 36 SHELL PELLA Mineral Oil (Drum)
Price/Drum: (To include transport delivery 200.00 200.75 No Bid
Total 200.00 200.75
Brand Name 40 pale 40 Pale
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun Oil
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright
Estimated Usage:  1 Drum

Item 37 SHELL RETINAX GREASES LC (TUBES - 10 per case)
Price/Case: (To include transport delivery 25.00 73.00 324.13
Total 50.00 146.00 648.26
Brand Name Royal 98 Troco LE
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun Oil LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright LE
Estimated Usage:  2 Cases (10 per case)

Item 38 SHELL TELLUS FLUID HD 68 (55 Gallon Drum)
Price/Drum: (To include transport delivery 287.00 288.50 2,060.30
Total 574.00 577.00 4,120.60
Brand Name Rozep 68 Wright Royce 68 LE
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun Oil LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright LE
Estimated Usage:  2 Drums

Item 39 SUPER SELECT LUBRICATING MOTOR OIL SAE 30 WT (Drum)
Price/Drum: (To include transport delivery 313.00 349.00 787.05
Total 1,252.00 1,396.00 3,148.20
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun Oil LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco LE
Supplier Wright LE
Estimated Usage:  220 Gallons (4 Drums)
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Item 40 TERESSTIC 100 (55 Gallon Drums)
Price/Drum: (To include transport delivery 301.00 315.20 1,058.20
Total 1,505.00 1,576.00 5,291.00
Brand Name Cirro 100 Cirro 100 LE
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Sun Oil LE
Manufacturer of Blending Package Troco Wright LE
Estimated Usage:  5 Drums

Item 41 VARIOUS PURPOSE GEAR LUBRICANT 604 OR 604 ALMASOL (PAIL)
Price/Pail: (To include transport delivery No Bid 31.10 132.30
Total 373.20 1,587.60
Manufacturer of Base Stock Sun Oil LE
Supplier Wright LE
Estimated Usage:  12 Pails

TOTAL 101,692.80 105,876.57 287,850.07

 Net Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days

Delivery Days 5-7 days 7 days 3-5 days
 
 1
 

BIDS WERE MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Dixie Oil SAWS Website
Genuine Parts Co.
Lubrication Engineers
Steagall Oil Co
Wright Oil
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