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Item | UNIT
100 ea. PRICE 267.50 260.42 284.00 399.40 386.37 347.74
a. Cast Iron 400 Ibs. Watertight Manhole Rings and Covers TOTAL 26,750.00 26,042.00 28,400.00 39,940.00 38,637.00 34,774.00
UNIT
50 ea. PRICE 123.00 135.42 156.00 172.20 193.19 347.74
b. Watertight covers only for cast iron rings as specifiec TOTAL 6,150.00 6,771.00 7,800.00 8,610.00 9,659.50 17,387.00
Total Item | TOTAL 32,900.00 32,813.00 36,200.00 48,550.00 48,296.50 52,161.00
Item 11 UNIT *
100 ea. PRICE 313.65 333.33 399.40 A w 348.10
a. Cast Iron 400 Ibs. Vented Manhole Rings and Covers TOTAL 31,365.00 33,333.00 No Bid 39,940.00 5 'LI_J E 34,810.00
UNIT Z<a
50 ea. PRICE 136.35 166.67 172.20 a) 5 % 348.10
b. Vented covers only for cast iron rings as specifiec TOTAL 6,817.50 8,333.50 No Bid 8,610.00 m g % 17,405.00
<
Total Item 11 TOTAL 38,182.50 41,666.50 No Bid 48,550.00 52,215.00
Item 111 *
350 ea. 343.75 340.20 375.00 375.00
a. Hinged Type Design Manhole Rings and Covers with locks No Bid 120,312.50 119,070.00 No Bid 131,250.00 131,250.00
Item 1V *
350 ea. 350.90 515.63 510.30 474.20 460.75 562.50
a. Non-Hinged Type Designs watertight manhole ring: 122,815.00 180,470.50 178,605.00 165,970.00 161,262.50 196,875.00
Delivery Days 45 days 60 days 84 days 45 days 10-15 days 84 days
Net Net Net Net 0% Net
Terms 20 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 20 days 30 days
*DENOTES LOW BIDDER
BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY
Act Pipe & Supply Demandstar
Alamo Iron Works SAWS Website

East Jordan Iron Works
Ferguson Enterprise

HD Supply Waterworks
Morrison Supply Co.

Municipal Water Works Supply
PMI Steel Pipe

Williams Supply




