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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for
FOR: Meter & Valve Box Components
TIME & (Date of Award through May 31, 2012)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., March 30, 2010  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

I. RECTANGULAR METER BOXES AND TRAFFIC BEARING STEEL LIDS UNIT
300 ea. PRICE 144.79 156.20 169.50 177.17

a. #2 Meter Box complete (SAWS #9858) TOTAL 43,437.00 46,860.00 50,850.00 53,151.00 NO BID
UNIT

100 ea.          PRICE 78.95 82.50 90.25 92.39
b. #1 Meter Box Lid (SAWS #13581) TOTAL 7,895.00 8,250.00 9,025.00 9,239.00 NO BID

UNIT
150 ea. PRICE 100.00 110.00 119.50 135.87

c. #2 Meter Box Lid (SAWS #13582) TOTAL 15,000.00 16,500.00 17,925.00 20,380.50 NO BID
  *  
INTIAL AWARD PERIOD 2 YEARS    

 TOTAL GROUP I (1st year) TOTAL 66,332.00 71,610.00 77,800.00 82,770.50 NO BID

TOTAL GROUP I (2nd year) TOTAL 66,332.00

TOTAL INITIAL AWARD 2 YEARS TOTAL 132,664.00

EXTENSION 1 TOTAL 66,332.00

EXTENSION 2 TOTAL 66,332.00

EXTENSION 3 TOTAL 66,332.00
II. OVAL METER BOXES UNIT

600 ea. PRICE 22.01 24.09 25.00 23.80
a. Oval Meter Box (SAWS #9853) TOTAL 13,206.00 14,454.00 15,000.00 14,280.00 NO BID

UNIT
1,000 ea. PRICE 21.72 23.68 30.65 23.40

b. Oval Lid (SAWS #13577) TOTAL 21,720.00 23,680.00 30,650.00 23,400.00 NO BID
   *
 INTIAL AWARD PERIOD 2 YEARS  
 TOTAL GROUP II (1st year) TOTAL 34,926.00 38,134.00 45,650.00 37,680.00 NO BID

TOTAL GROUP II (2nd year) TOTAL 34,926.00

TOTAL INITIAL AWARD 2 YEARS 69,852.00

EXTENSION 1 TOTAL 34,926.00

EXTENSION 2 TOTAL 34,926.00

EXTENSION 3 TOTAL 34,926.00
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III. VALVE BOX COMPONENTS UNIT
 250 ea. PRICE 24.49 26.40 30.55 26.09
a. Valve Box only, size 6" (SAWS #9877) TOTAL 6,122.50 6,600.00 7,637.50 6,522.50 NO BID

UNIT
250 ea. PRICE 8.16 8.80 10.55 8.70

b. Valve Box only, size 6" (SAWS #10273) TOTAL 2,040.00 2,200.00 2,637.50 2,175.00 NO BID
UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 14.29 15.40 18.43 15.22
c. 9" Valve Box Extension size 6" x 9" (SAWS #9833 TOTAL 7,145.00 7,700.00 9,215.00 7,610.00 NO BID

UNIT
300 ea. PRICE 18.27 19.80 27.75 19.57

d. 15" Valve Box Extension size 6" x 15" (SAWS #9834) TOTAL 5,481.00 5,940.00 8,325.00 5,871.00 NO BID
UNIT

100 ea.          PRICE 41.84 44.00 48.43 44.57
e. 10" Monument Box Traffic bearing, sewer cleanout DI (SAWS #15893 TOTAL 4,184.00 4,400.00 4,843.00 4,457.00 NO BID

  *
INTIAL AWARD PERIOD 2 YEARS  
TOTAL GROUP III (1st year) TOTAL 24,972.50 26,840.00 32,658.00 26,635.50 NO BID

TOTAL GROUP III (2nd year) TOTAL 24,972.50

TOTAL INITIAL AWARD 2 YEARS TOTAL 49,945.00

EXTENSION 1 TOTAL 24,972.50

EXTENSION 2 TOTAL 24,972.50

EXTENSION 3 TOTAL 24,972.50

Net 2% 0% Net
 Terms 30 days 20 days 20 days 30 days

Delivery 7-14 days 21 days 10-15 days  

*DENOTES LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
 
Act Pipe & Supply Municipal Water Works Demandstar
Cascade Water Works PMI Steel Pipe SAWS Website
Ferguson William Supply
HD Supply  
Morrison Supply
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