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A. ADAPTER, CORPORATION UNIT *
10 ea. PRICE 111.06
Size 3/4 TOTAL 1,110.60
1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Reed/Ford, DMCA75/C04-33 No Bid
UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 111.06
Size 1" TOTAL 1,110.60
2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Reed/Ford, DMCA100/C04-44 No Bid
UNIT
30 ea. PRICE 147.47
Size 1-1/2" TOTAL 4,424.10
3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Reed/Ford, DMCA100/C04-44 No Bid
Total for Item A TOTAL No Bid No Bid No Bid 6,645.30 No Bid
B. BAR, ALIGNING PRY: UNIT *
10 ea. PRICE 8.71 14.18 13.10
Size 1/2" x 16" TOTAL 87.10 141.80 131.00
1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Proto, 2116 Stanley Tool, 2126 Armstrong, 70-503 No Bid No Bid No Bid
UNIT
45 ea. PRICE 12.10 11.46 15.38
Size 5/8" x 18" TOTAL 544.50 515.70 692.10
2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Proto, 2120 Wright Tool Co., 9576 Armstrong, 70-521 No Bid No Bid No Bid
UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 16.13 20.28 17.44
Size 3/4" x 24" TOTAL 161.30 202.80 174.40
3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Proto, 2124 Wright Tool Co., 9M472 Armstrong, 70-50% No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total for Item B TOTAL 792.90 860.30 997.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
C. CHISEL: UNIT *
50 ea. PRICE 3.85 2.67 2.30
Cold, Size 1/2" TOTAL 192.50 133.50 115.00
1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Proto, 86A - 7/16 DASCO, 405-0 NAPA, 925A No Bid No Bid No Bid
50 ea. PRICE 5.47 2.88 3.65
Cold, Size 3/4" TOTAL 273.50 144.00 182.50
2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Proto, 86A-5/8 DASCO, 408-0 NAPA, 927 No Bid No Bid No Bid
100 ea. PRICE 8.56 5.16 5.09
Cold, Size 1" TOTAL 856.00 516.00 509.00
3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Proto, 86A 7/8 x 8 DeWalt, DW5953B15 NAPA, 929 No Bid No Bid No Bid
5ea. PRICE 20.86 13.08
Cold, 4 Piece Set, Length 12" TOTAL 104.30 65.40
4. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Proto, 86C No Bid NAPA, 304C No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 ea. PRICE 9.81 9.78
Wood, 1-1/2" Blade TOTAL 98.10 97.80
5. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Stanley, 16-980 Irwin Tools, M444, 1-1/2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5ea. PRICE 45.85 22.81
Wood, Set, 1/4" - 1" Blade TOTAL 229.25 114.05
6. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Stanley, 16-971 Irwin Tools, M444/S4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE
Total for Item C TOTAL 1,753.65 1,005.35 871.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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D. PLIERS: UNIT *
40 ea. PRICE 17.07 18.81 10.31
All Purpose Electrician, Size 8-3/4 TOTAL 682.80 752.40 412.40
1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Proto, 268G Klein Tools, D2038N NAPA, P27 No Bid No Bid No Bid
15 ea. PRICE 6.41 15.00 7.38
Channel, Size 7" TOTAL 96.15 225.00 110.70
2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Cooper, R27CV Snapon, 8223+8 Armstrong, 67777 No Bid No Bid No Bid
60 ea. PRICE 6.46 18.36 10.85 8.50
Channel, Size 9-1/2" TOTAL 387.60 1,101.60 651.00 510.00
3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Proto, R210CV Snapon, 8224+8 NAPA, P607 Channelock, 420 No Bid No Bid
5ea. PRICE 13.91 17.64 27.65 16.00
Channel, Size 16" TOTAL 69.55 88.20 138.25 80.00
4. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Cooper, R216CV Channelock, 460 NAPA, P33 Channelock, No Bid No Bid
4ea. PRICE 10.46 13.14 12.66 11.40
Long Needle Nose Size 7' TOTAL 41.84 52.56 50.64 45.60
5. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Proto, 222G Snapon, 2533-7 Armstrong, 67367 Channelock, 317 No Bid No Bid
INCOMPLETE
Total for Item C TOTAL 1,277.94 2,219.76 1,362.99 635.60 No Bid No Bid
E. DRILL BIT, HIGH SPEED: UNIT *
60 ea. PRICE 2.06 0.78
Size, 1/8" TOTAL 123.60 46.80
1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL No Bid Basch, 12658 NAPA, HSD508 No Bid No Bid No Bid
40 ea. PRICE 4.08 1.46
Size, 1/4" TOTAL 163.20 58.40
2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL No Bid Bosch, 12666 NAPA, HSD 524 No Bid No Bid No Bid
15 ea. PRICE 14.27 5.18
Size, 1/2" TOTAL 214.05 77.70
3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL No Bid Bosch, 12682 NAPA, HSD 556 No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 ea. PRICE 12.25
Size, 5/8" TOTAL 122.50
4. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL No Bid No Bid NAPA, HSD159 No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 ea. PRICE 15.54
Size, 3/4" TOTAL 155.40
5. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL No Bid No Bid NAPA, HSD161 No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 ea. PRICE 18.30
Size, 7/8" TOTAL 183.00
6. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL No Bid No Bid NAPA, HSD163 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total for Item E TOTAL No Bid 500.85 643.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
F. DRILL BIT, GENERAL PURPOSE: UNIT *
20 ea. PRICE 0.53 0.75
Size, 1/8" TOTAL 31.80 15.00
1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL No Bid Irwin Tools, 63508 NAPA, HSD708 No Bid No Bid No Bid
70 ea. PRICE 1.02 1.45
Size, 1/4" TOTAL 71.40 101.50
2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL No Bid Irwin Tools, 63516 NAPA, HSD724 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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20 ea. PRICE 3.86 5.24
Size, 1/2" TOTAL 77.20 104.80
3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL No Bid Irwin Tools, 63532 NAPA, HSD75€ No Bid No Bid No Bid
5ea. PRICE 1.64 12.25
Size, 5/8" TOTAL 8.20 61.25
4. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL No Bid Irwin Tools, 88810 NAPA, HSD15¢ No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 ea. PRICE 1.67 15.34
Size, 3/4" TOTAL 16.70 153.40
5. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL No Bid Irwin Tools, 88812 NAPA, HSD161 No Bid No Bid No Bid
50 sets PRICE 44.22 136.05
General Purpose, 29 Piece Set, Size 1/16" to 1/2' TOTAL 2,211.00 6,802.50
6. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL No Bid Champion Cutting Tools, P29C NHT, CD29 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total for Item F TOTAL No Bid 2,416.30 7,238.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid
G. DRILL BIT, MASONARY : UNIT *
10 ea. PRICE 111
Size, 1/8" TOTAL 11.10
1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL No Bid Bosch, HCBGO01 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
70 ea. PRICE 1.86
Size, 1/4" TOTAL 130.20
2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL No Bid Bosch, HCBG06 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 ea. PRICE 2.96
Size, 1/2" TOTAL 59.20
3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL No Bid Bosch, HCBG16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5ea. PRICE 513
Size, 5/8" TOTAL 25.65
4. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL No Bid HCBG20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 ea. PRICE 10.52
Size, 3/4" TOTAL 105.20
5. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL No Bid Bosch, HCBG22 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total for Item C TOTAL No Bid 331.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
H. SAW UNIT *
100 ea. PRICE 15.00 10.06 13.87 16.65
Hand, Size 18", CUTS PVC TOTAL 1,500.00 1,006.00 1,387.00 1,665.00
1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Ridgid, 50522 DeWalt, DW3993 No Bid Reed, PPS18 Reed, PPS18 No Bid
40 ea. PRICE 15.00 13.90
Hand 8 Point, Size 26" TOTAL 600.00 556.00
2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Cooper, NS3001 Irwin Tools, XP201-65C No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total for Item H TOTAL 2,100.00 1,562.00 No Bid No Bid 1,665.00 No Bid
TOTAL FOR ITEMS A-H TOTAL 5,924.49 8,895.91 No Bid No Bid 8,310.30 No Bid
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I Klein Price List (Est. Annual Usage $7,000) *
Price List Catalog Numbel Cat. No. 99800 99800 99800
Discount Off Price List (%) Discount 43.2 -37% 35%
Multiplier for Discount Discount (x.568) 0.63 0.65
Effective Date of Price Lis Date 1/6/07 1/6/07 No Bid 1/6/07
J. Copper Price List (Estimated Annual Usage $7,000) *
Price List Catalog Numbel Cat. No. 01010SHT1U 040106HT1U 0401068HPIU
Discount Off Price List (%) Discount 43.2 40% 35%
Multiplier for Discount Discount (x.568) 0.6 0.6500
Effective Date of Price Lis Date 4/1/06 4/1/06 No Bid 4/1/06
K. Reed Price List (Est. Annual Usage $7,000) *
Price List Catalog Numbel Cat. No. No Bid 01004
Discount Off Price List (%) Discount 25% 10%
Multiplier for Discount Discount 0.75 .90
Effective Date of Price Lis Date 7/1/06 7/1/06
Net 0% 2% Net Net 0%
Terms 30 days 20 days 20 days 30 days 30 days 20 days
Delivery Day: 14 days 1 day 5-10 days 7 days
*DENOTES LOW BIDDER
BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP B\
Alamo Iron Works NAPA Demandstar
Carlton Bates Co. Rex Supply Co. SAWS Website

Grainger
Morris Machine Tool & Supply, Inc.
MSC Industrial Supply

Royall Matthiessen
Tool Mart, Inc.

United Tool & Fastener, Inc




