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BAR, ALIGNING PRY UNIT
15 ea. PRICE 8.88 9.91 10.20 10.36 No Bid
Size 1/2" x 16" TOTAL 133.20 148.65 153.00 155.40 a
1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Proto MSC #J2116 Armstrong 70-501 Proto 2116 JH Williams JHWC-82 “,_J - w
UNIT <z
10 ea. PRICE 12.25 17.78 14.20 16.17 No Bid 5‘ “§J o
Size 5/8" x 18" Rolling Heac TOTAL 122.50 177.80 142.00 161.70 g% = ':(
2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Proto J2120 Armstrong 70-521 Proto 2120 JH Williams JHWC-71¢ = g 8]
UNIT [~
5ea. PRICE 1632 1836 18.90 14.18 No Bid g
Size 3/4" x 24" TOTAL 81.60 91.80 94.50 . s 8 %
3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Proto J2124 Armstrong 70-505 Proto 2124 JH Williams JHWC-80A U'_J
* E
Total for Item 1 TOTAL 337.30 418.25 389.50 388.00 No Bid
2. BLADE UNIT
5ea. PRICE 2.27 1.94 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cutting, Size 6, TPI 7, Wood TOTAL 11.35 9.70
1 Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Milwaukee 48-00-5035 | Amer. Saw 20560-606R
UNIT
5ea. PRICE 2.27 1.93 1.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cutting, Size 6, TPI 10, Fine Wooc TOTAL 11.35 X 7.50 [a)
2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Milwaukee 48-00-5092 Dewalt DW 4806-2 Morse RB610 I-'I_J 2‘
UNIT
5ea. PRICE 1.92 1.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid i %
Cutting, Size 4-1/8", TPI 6, Wood TOTAL X 8.25 8 =
3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Milwaukee 48-00-5461 Amer. Saw BT486J <0
UNIT - =
10 ea. PRICE 3.50 3.25 2.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid = O
Hacksaw, Size 9, TIP 10 TOTAL 35.00 32.50 26.40 [ON&]
4. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL | Milwaukee 48-00-5713 | Amer. Saw 20597-960R MILW 48-01-7713 g a
UNIT S m
15 ea. PRICE 2.05 0.85 1.25 17.33 No Bid No Bid o
Hacksaw, Size 12, TIP 24 TOTAL 30.75 12.75 18.75 259.95
5. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Cooper 62826 Cooper 62706 Morse HHB1214 Snap On HSBM1214B
UNIT
40 ea. PRICE 1.25 0.85 1.25 17.33 No Bid 1.19
Hacksaw, Size 12, TIP 24 TOTAL 50.00 34.00 50.00 693.20 47.60
6. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Cooper 62749 Cooper 62832 Morse HHB1224 Snap On HSBM 1224B lvy Classic 28424
UNIT
700 ea. PRICE 1.25 0.85 1.25 17.33 No Bid 1.19
Hacksaw, Size 12, TPI 32 TOTAL 875.00 595.00 875.00 12,131.00 833.00
7. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Cooper 62776 Cooper 62839 Morse HHB1232 Snap On HSBM1232B lvy Classic 28432
UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 1.40 1.45 1.30 No Bid No Bid 1.65
Jigsaw, Size 4, TPI 32 TOTAL 14.00 14.50 13.00 16.50
8. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Milwaukee 48-00-5090 Dewalt DW3710H2 Morse SB3610T25 lvy Classic 28202
UNIT
60 ea. PRICE 22.25 7.75 8.62 No Bid No Bid No Bid
PVC Pipe Saw, Size 18, TPI 11 TOTAL 1,335.00 465.00 517.20
9. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Ridgid 50522 Amer. Saw 20981 Reed PPS18B
* Incomplete No Bid Incomplete No Bid Incomplete No Bid
Item No. 3 Item No. 1-4, 8,9 Item No. 1-5, 9
Total for Item 2 TOTAL 2,372.05 1,181.35 1,507.85 13,084.15 No Bid 897.10
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ITEMNO.  DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY S48 <o n a0 [N [ IR ] o~ o I -
DRILL BIT, HIGH SPEED
25 ea. PRICE 0.64 0.93 0.74 1.70 No Bid 0.64
Size 1/16" TOTAL 16.00 23.25 18.50 42.50 16.00
1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL USA JGBF01.12MC Precison Twist 010204 Champion USA 705 SP-1116 Snap On DBF 1/16C Norseman 05580
35ea. PRICE 0.49 0.97 0.84 1.70 No Bid 0.82
Size 1/8" TOTAL 17.15 33.95 29.40 59.50 28.70
2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL USA 368108 Precision Twist 010208 Champion USA 705 SP-1/8 Snap On DBF 1/8C Norseman 5620
20 ea. PRICE 0.97 1.79 1.50 3.15 No Bid 1.53
Size 1/4" TOTAL 19.40 35.80 30.00 63.00 30.60
3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL USA 36811€ Precision Twist 010216 Champion USA 705 SP-1/4 Snap On DBF 1/4C Norseman 05700
15 ea. PRICE 3.75 6.70 5.75 9.51 No Bid 5.60
Size 1/2" TOTAL 56.25 100.50 86.25 142.65 84.00
4. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL USA 368132 Precision Twist 010232 Champion USA 705 SP-1/2 Snap On DBF 1/2C Norseman 05860
15 ea. PRICE 0.85 1.22 1.05 221 No Bid 1.16
Size 3/16" TOTAL 12.75 18.30 15.75 33.15 17.40
5. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL USA JGBF09.12MC Precision Twist 010212 Champion USA 705 SP-3/16 Snap On DBF 3/16C Norseman 05660
10 ea. PRICE 0.94 0.93 0.74 1.70 No Bid 0.67
Size 3/32" TOTAL 9.40 9.30 7.40 17.00 6.70
6. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL JGBF03.12MC Precision Twist Champion USA 705 SP-3/32 Snap On DBF 3/32C Norseman 0560
[a]
10 ea. PRICE 271 391 3.40 5.80 No Bid 3.32 |-'|_J -
Size 3/8" TOTAL 27.10 39.10 34.00 58.00 33.20 < <Z(
7. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL USA JGBF21.06MC Precision Twist 010224 Champion USA 705 SP-3/8 Snap On DBF 3/8C Norseman 05780 51 o)
=
20 ea. PRICE 1.87 2.74 2.30 3.65 No Bid 220 '2 a
Size 5/16" TOTAL 37.40 54.80 46.00 73.00 44.00 - =z
8. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL USA JGBF17.06MC Precision Twist 010220 Champion USA 705 SP-5/16 Snap On DBF 5/16C Norseman 05740 5 (@)
o
10 ea. PRICE 1.05 1.02 1.00 1.70 No Bid 0.90 z a
Size 5/32" TOTAL 10.50 10.20 10.00 17.00 9.00 Om
9. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL USA JGBF07.12MC Precision Twist Champion USA 705 ASP-5/32 Snap On DBF 5/32C Norseman 05640 o
10 ea. PRICE 5.49 5.33 4.50 8.03 No Bid 4.20
Size 7/16" TOTAL 54.90 53.30 45.00 80.30 42.00
10. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL USA JGBF25.06MC Precision Twist 010228 Champion USA 705 SP-7/16 DBF 7/16C Norseman 05820
10 ea. PRICE 1.62 1.55 1.30 221 No Bid 1.20
Size 7/32" TOTAL 16.20 15.50 13.00 22.10 12.00
11. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL USA JGBF11.12MC Precision Twist 010214 Champion USA 705 SP-7/32 Snap On DBF 7/32C Norseman 05680
10 ea. PRICE 0.93 0.96 0.80 1.61 No Bid 0.70
Size 7/64" TOTAL 9.30 . 8.00 16.10 7.00
12. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL JGBF04.12MC Precision Twist 010207 Champion USA 705 SP-7/64 Snap On DBF 7/64C Norseman 05610
10 ea. PRICE 2.28 214 1.90 3.65 No Bid 1.80
Size 9/32" TOTAL 22.80 21.40 19.00 36.50 18.00
13. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL USA JGBF15.12MC Precision Twist 010218 Champion USA 705 SP-9/32 Snap On DBF 9/32C Norseman 05720
10 ea. PRICE 0.97 1.01 0.95 1.70 No Bid 0.80
Size 9/64" TOTAL . 10.10 . 17.00 8.00
14. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL USA JGBF06.12MC Precision Twist 010209 Champion USA SP 9/6< Snap On DBF 9/64C Norseman 05630
10 ea. PRICE 3.57 3.47 2.90 517 No Bid 2.80
Size 11/32" TOTAL 35.70 34.70 29.00 51.70 28.00
15. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL USA JGBF19.06MC Precision Twist 010222 Champion USA 705 SP-11/32 | Snap On DBF 11/32C Norseman 05760
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10 ea. PRICE 1.10 1.09 0.95 1.70 No Bid 0.90
Size 11/64" TOTAL 11.00 10.90 9.50 17.00 9.00
16. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL JGBF08.12MC Precision Twist 010211 Champion USA 705 SP-11/64 Snap On DBF 11/64 Norseman 05650
10 ea. PRICE 5.00 4.64 4.00 6.58 No Bid 3.60
Size 13/32" TOTAL 50.00 46.40 40.00 65.80 36.00
17. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL USA JGBF23.06MC Precision Twist 010226 Champion USA 705 SP-13/32 | Snap On DBF 13/32C Norseman 05800
10 ea. PRICE 141 1.35 1.15 221 No Bid 1.20
Size 13/64" TOTAL 14.10 13.50 11.50 22.10 12.00
18. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL USA JGBF10.12MC Precisiton Twist 010213 | Champion USA 705 SP-13/64 | Snap On DBF 13/64C Norseman 05670
10 ea. PRICE 6.63 6.34 5.45 8.03 No Bid 5.20
Size 15/32" TOTAL 66.30 63.40 54.50 80.30 52.00
19. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL USA JGBF27.06MC Precision Twist 010230 Champion USA 705 SP-15/32 | Snap On DBF 15/32C Norseman 05840
10 ea. PRICE 1.73 1.74 1.40 3.15 No Bid 1.30
Size 15/64" TOTAL 17.30 17.40 14.00 31.50 13.00
20. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL USA JGBF12.12MC Precision Twist 010215 Champion USA 705 SP-15/64 | Snap On DBF 15/64C Norseman 05690
10 ea. PRICE 215 213 1.78 3.15 No Bid 1.70
Size 17/64" TOTAL 21.50 21.30 17.80 31.50 17.00
21. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL USA JGBF14.12MC Precision Twist 010217 Champion USA 705 SP-17/64 | Snap On DBF 17/64C Norseman 05710 a
* o
=<
Total for Item 3 TOTAL 534.75 642.70 548.10 9717.70 No Bid 523.60 5 =z
4. DRILL BIT, GENERAL PURPOSE =) o
50 ea. PRICE 0.49 0.78 0.74 1.70 No Bid 0.60 mE=
Size 1/16" TOTAL 24.50 39.00 37.00 85.00 30.00 <A
1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL USA JGBF05.12MC Precision Twist 010004 Champion 705 SP-/16 Snap On DBF 1/16C Norseman 02780 :: %
10 ea. PRICE 5.46 477 4.50 8.03 No Bid 4.10 % 8
Size 7/16" TOTAL 54.60 47.70 45.00 80.30 41.00 Al
2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL USA JGBF25.06MC Precision Twist 010028 | Champion 705 SP-7/16 Snap On DBF 7/16C Norseman 03020 o
10 ea. PRICE 14.82 16.12 12.30 23.34 No Bid 11.80
Size 9/16" x 1/2" SHANK TOTAL 148.20 161.20 123.00 233.40 118.00
3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Michigan 303-9116 Precision Twist 091536 Champion US12-9/16 Snap On CSE365R Norseman 29160
5ea. PRICE 8.75 18.14 13.50 24.76 No Bid 13.00
Size 5/8" x 1/2" SHANK TOTAL 43.75 90.70 67.50 123.80 65.00
4. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Michigan 303-5/8 Precision Twist 091540 Champion US-12-5/8 Snap On CSE 405B Norseman 29200
10 ea. PRICE 11.85 22.18 16.50 32.10 No Bid 19.60
Size 3/4" TOTAL 118.50 221.80 165.00 321.00 196.00
5. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Michigan 303-3/4 Precision Twist 091548 Champion US12-3/4 Snap On CSE485B Norseman 24310
10 ea. PRICE 13.85 26.71 20.00 35.72 No Bid 24.50
Size 7/8" TOTAL 138.50 267.10 200.00 357.20 245.00
6. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Michigan 303-7/8 Precision Twist 091556 Champion US12-7/8 Snap On CSE565B Norseman 24390
10 ea. PRICE 38.27 35.12 25.90 46.65 No Bid 31.60
Size 1" TOTAL 382.70 351.20 259.00 466.50 316.00
7. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Michigan 303-1 Precision Twist 091564 Champion US12-1 Snap On CSE 645B Norseman 24470
*
Total for Item 4 TOTAL 910.75 1,178.70 896.50 1,667.20 No Bid 1,011.00
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DRILL BIT, MASONRY
15 ea. PRICE 0.92 0.63 2.25 No Bid No Bid 1.80
Size 1/4" TOTAL 13.80 9.45 33.75 27.00
1 Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Trucut W2504 Drill America DAM 4x1/4 Dewalt DW5224 Norseman 45840
10 ea. PRICE 3.81 1.08 2.90 No Bid No Bid 2.50
Size 3/8" TOTAL 38.10 10.80 29.00 25.00
2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Trucut W3754 Drill America DAM 4x3/8 Dewalt DW5230 Norseman 45880
10 ea. PRICE 3.50 0.81 2.50 No Bid No Bid 2.30
Size 5/16" TOTAL 35.00 8.10 25.00 23.00
3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Trucut W3124 Drill America DAM 4X5/16 Dewalt DW5228 Norseman 45860
5 ea. PRICE 421 1.74 5.40 No Bid No Bid 2.70
Size 7/16" TOTAL 21.05 8.70 27.00 13.50
4. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Trucut W4376 Drill America DAM 4x7/1€ Dewalt DW5234 Norseman 45900
5 ea. PRICE 6.28 2.15 7.12 No Bid No Bid 4.20
Size 9/16" TOTAL 31.40 10.75 35.60 21.00
5. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Trucut W5626 Drill America DAM 6x9/16x3/8 Dewalt DW5217 Norseman 45940
5 ea. PRICE 4.75 5.83 14.25 No Bid No Bid 7.10
Size 3/4" TOTAL 23.75 29.15 71.25 35.50 [a)
6. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Trucut W7506 Drill America DAM 6x3/4 dewalt DW5244 Norseman 45970 I-'I_J 2‘
5ea. PRICE 10.56 6.26 29.00 No Bid No Bid 9.80 5 %
Size 7/8" TOTAL 52.80 31.30 145.00 49.00 g =
7. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL W8756 Drill America DAM 6x7/8 Dewalt DW5219 Norseman 45980 <0
[y
10 ea. PRICE 3.22 0.56 2.70 No Bid No Bid 2.00 = %
Size 3/16" x 4" TOTAL 32.20 5.60 27.00 20.00 O O
8. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL W2504 Drill America DAM 4x3/16 Dewalt DW5223 Norseman 45820 g [a]
j=ga1]
5 ea. PRICE 3.45 2.86 No Bid No Bid No Bid 7.80 o
Size 5/8" x 8", W 3/8" SHANK TOTAL 17.25 14.30 39.00
9. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL W6256-3/8 Drill America DAM 6x5/8x3/8 lvy Classic
5ea. PRICE 19.24 5.48 11.38 No Bid No Bid 20.50
Size 5/8" x 12" TOTAL 96.20 27.40 56.90 102.50
10. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Vermont Amer 14130 | Drill America DAM 13x5/8x1/2 Dewalt DW5242 Norseman 45740
5 ea. PRICE 16.03 4.16 9.70 No Bid No Bid 7.90
Size 1/2" x 12" TOTAL 80.15 20.80 48.50 39.50
11. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Vermont 14129 Prill Amer DAM 13x1/2x3/! Dewalt DW5236 Norseman 45720
5 ea. PRICE 18.09 6.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.70
Size 1/2" x 16" w/ 3/8" SHANK TOTAL 90.45 32.70 48.50
12. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Tru-Cut 18" X50018 prill Amer DAM 18x 1/2x3/] Norseman 45540
5 ea. PRICE 22.24 8.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.90
Size 3/4" x 13" CARBIDE TIP TOTAL 111.20 41.10 54.50
13. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Vermont 14131 Drill Amer DAM 13x3/4 Norseman 45750
5 ea. PRICE 32.31 13.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Size 1" x 10", w/1/2" SHANK TOTAL 161.55 66.10
14. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Tru-Cut 13" X100013 Drill Amer DAM 13x1
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5ea. PRICE 35.33 13.22 30.00 No Bid No Bid 14.00
Size 1" x 12" TOTAL 176.65 66.10 150.00 70.00
15. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Vermont 14133 Dril Amer DAM 13x1 Dewalt DW5249 Norseman 45770
* Incomplete No Bid Incomplete No Bid
Items 9, 11-14 Item 14
Total for Item 5 TOTAL 981.55 382.35 649.00 No Bid No Bid 568.00
6. DRILL BIT HAMMER, MASONRY
5ea. PRICE 46.54 20.39 18.55 No Bid No Bid 17.70
Size 3/8" x 11" SPLINE TOTAL 232.70 101.95 92.75 88.50
1 Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Rawl 1402 Dewalt DWS700 Milwaukee 48-20-4037 Norseman 33270
10 ea. PRICE 12.03 9.80 7.75 No Bid No Bid 10.00
Size 3/8" x 12" SD< TOTAL 120.30 98.00 77.50 100.00
2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Bosch HC2064 Dewalt DWS5430 Milwaukee 48-20-7454 Norseman 33080
5 ea. PRICE 20.06 20.60 21.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Size 3/8" x 20" SD< TOTAL 100.30 103.00 109.25
3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Bosch HC2067 Dewalt DWS432 Milwaukee 48-20-7459
10 ea. PRICE 13.28 23.34 9.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Size 1/2" x 12" TOTAL 132.80 233.40 95.00
4. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Bosch HC2084 Dewalt DWS703 Milwaukee 48-20-7474
5 ea. PRICE 52.77 24.20 21.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Size 1/2" x 16" SPLINE TOTAL 263.85 121.00 107.50 [a)
5. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Rawl 1409 Dewalt DWS704 Milwaukee 48-20-4051 I-'I_J 2‘
5ea. PRICE 71.76 29.90 26.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid i %
Size 1/2" x 23" SPLINE TOTAL 358.80 149.50 132.50 g =
6. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Rawl 1412 Dewalt DWS705 Milwaukee 48-20-4052 <0
[y
5ea. PRICE 182.70 82.20 74.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid = %
Size 11/2" x 23" SPLINE TOTAL 913.50 411.00 371.00 O O
7. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Rawl 1477 Dewalt DWS732 Milwaukee 48-20-4151 z [a]
* Incomplete No Bid Sl
Items 3-7 o
Total for Item 6 TOTAL 2,122.25 1,217.85 985.50 No Bid No Bid 188.50
7. FILES
10 ea. PRICE 235 4.14 4.70 3.90 No Bid 2.90
Size 6", BASTARLC TOTAL 23.50 41.40 47.00 39.00 29.00
1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Cooper 08354 Cooper 03467 Nicholson 03467 Snap On 6MA lvy Classic 12100
15 ea. PRICE 2.99 5.16 5.82 4.54 No Bid 3.90
Size 8", BASTARLC TOTAL 44.85 77.40 87.30 68.10 58.50
2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Cooper 08497 Cooper 03566 Nicholson 03566 Snap On 8MA lvy Classic 12101
15 ea. PRICE 3.90 6.37 7.24 5.80 No Bid 4.40
Size 10", BASTARL TOTAL 58.50 95.55 108.60 87.00 66.00
3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Cooper 08642 Cooper 03665 Nicholson 03665 Snap On 10MA lvy Classic 12102
15 ea. PRICE 6.30 8.72 9.89 9.70 No Bid No Bid
Size 12", BASTARL TOTAL 94.50 130.80 148.35 145.50
4. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Cooper 08737 Cooper 03764 Nicholson 03764 Snap On 12MA
20 ea. PRICE 8.65 12.03 13.60 13.60 No Bid No Bic
Size 14", BASTARL TOTAL 173.00 240.60 272.00 272.00
5. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Cooper 08832 Cooper 03863 Nicholson 03863 Snap On 14MA
15 ea. PRICE 6.25 331 3.90 4.70 No Bid 3.00
Size 16", BASTARD ROUNL TOTAL 93.75 49.65 58.50 70.50 45.00
6. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Cooper 11716N Cooper 11716 Nicholson 11716 Snap On 6R lvy Classic 12106
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10 ea. PRICE 9.36 4.90 5.78 7.05 No Bid 4.00
Size 10", BASTARD ROUNL TOTAL 93.60 49.00 57.80 70.50 40.00
7. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Cooper 12019 Cooper 12019 Nicholson 12019 Snap On 10R lvy Classic 12108
40 ea. PRICE 38.20 16.29 21.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Size 14", RASP HORSE TOTAL 1,528.00 651.60 847.20
8. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Cooper 19493N Cooper 18057N Nicholson 18057
* Incomplete No Bid Incomplete No Bid
Item 8 Items 4,5, 8
Total for Item 7 TOTAL 2,109.70 1,336.00 1,626.75 752.60 No Bid 238.50
8. CHISELS
15 ea. PRICE 4.59 2.45 4.75 4.48 No Bid No Bid
Size 1/2", COLD TOTAL 68.85 36.75 71.25 .
1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Proto JB6A7116 Stanley 16-287 Proto 86A 7/16 JH Williams JHWC-1€
25 ea. PRICE 6.53 2.57 6.75 6.16 No Bid No Bid
Size 3/4", COLD TOTAL 163.25 64.25 168.75 154.00
2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Proto J86A 5/8 Stanley 16-289 Proto 86A 5/8 JH Williams JHWC-24
35ea. PRICE 10.24 3.89 10.50 9.73 No Bid No Bid
Size 1" x 7 1/2" COLD TOTAL 358.40 136.15 367.50 340.55
3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Proto JB6A1X8 Stanley 16-290 Proto 86A 7/8 x 8 JH Williams JHWC-32 a
10 ea. PRICE 9.23 11.21 10.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid LII—J :(I
Size 1-1/2", WOOD TOTAL 92.30 112.10 103.00 5 =z
4. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Stanley 16-980 Stanley 16-980 Stanley 16-324 =) ©]
* Tncomplete No Bid mE
Item 4 <A
Total for Item 8 TOTAL 682.80 349.25 710.50 561.75 No Bid No Bid -z
9 [SAW 58
100 ea. PRICE 22.25 14.39 14.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid Zn
Hand, Size 18" Cuts PVC TOTAL 2,225.00 1,439.00 1,456.00 Al
1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Ridgid 50522 Amer Saw 2090 Reed PPS18 o
40 ea. PRICE 28.37 9.14 7.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hand 8 Point, Size 26" TOTAL 1,134.80 365.60 288.00
2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Cooper NS3001 Cooper NS1501 Stanley 15-726
*
Total for Item 9 TOTAL 3,359.80 1,804.60 1,744.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
10. MISCELLANEOUS TOOLS
15 ea. PRICE 27.89 43.09 No Bid 25.77 No Bid No Bid
Size 18" x 8" x 9", Tool Box TOTAL 418.35 646.35 386.55
1. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Waterloo HM2050 Klein 54402 Snap On YA483
10 ea. PRICE 15.20 52.74 30.00 35.94 No Bid 69.95
Size 20" x 8-1/2" x 9-1/2", Tool Box TOTAL 152.00 527.40 300.00 359.40 699.50
2. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Waterloo HM2051 Klein 54401 Proto 9975 Snap On YA484 INB 26 x 8 3/4x 9
20 ea. PRICE 4.53 8.96 4.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Size 26", Saw, Standard Cable McMaster Carr 39705A31 or approved equal [TOTAL 90.60 179.20 80.00
3. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL General 858
30 ea. PRICE 9.96 4.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Size 46", saw, standard cable McMaster Carr 39705A32 or approved equal |TOTAL 298.80 138.00
4. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL No Bid
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20 ea. PRICE 109.69 48.76 58.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Measuring Wheel, Tape, Size 0 - 9999 Feel TOTAL 2,193.80 975.20 1,160.00
5. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Rola Tape 32-3005 Cooper MW38TP
5 sets PRICE 125.50 105.39 No Bid 119.00 No Bid No Bid
Holesaw, 1/4" Arbor ADPT Metal Journeymans Sel TOTAL 627.50 526.95 595.00
6. Manufacturer/Model MFG/MODEL Milwaukee 49-22-4175 Klein 31635 Snap On LHS608B
Incomplete No Bid * Incomplete No Bid Incomplete No Bid Incomplete No Bid
Item 4 Item 1, 6 Items 3-5 Items 1, 3-6
Total for Item 10 TOTAL 3,482.25 3,153.90 1,678.00 1,340.95 No Bid 699.50
TOTAL FOR ITEMS 1 THRU 1C TOTAL 16,893.20 11,664.95 10,735.70 18,772.35 No Bid 4,126.20
11. Proto Price List (Estimated Annual Usage $25,000) * Wright
Price List Catalog Number Cat. No. PR-0908 U149 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Discount Off Price List (%) Discount 56.5% 55%
Multiplier for Discount Discount 435 0.45
Effective Date of Price List Date 09/1/08 Aug. 2008
12. Goldblatt (Stanley) Price List (Estimated Annual Usuage $10,000) *
Price List Catalog Number Cat. No. No Bid SIT-0908 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Discount Off Price List (%) Discount 50.2% [a)
Multiplier for Discount Discount 498 w
Effective Date of Price List Date 9/1/08 ':( <Z(
13. Ridgid Price List (Estimated Annual Usage $7,000) * 40
Price List Catalog Number Cat. No. No Bid 708 No Bid 708 No Bid 8 =
Discount Off Price List (%) Discount 12% 0% <0
Multiplier for Discount Discount .88 0 - =z
Effective Date of Price List Date 7/08 7/1/08 = O
14. Kiein Price List (Estimated Annual Usage $7,000) * O O
Price List Catalog Number Cat. No. No Bid Klein 2009 No Bid 99002 No Bid z a
Discount Off Price List (%) Discount 41.2% 10% Sl
Multiplier for Discount Discount .588 .90 o
Effective Date of Price List Date 1/1/09 1/1/09
15. Cooper Price List (Estimated Annual Usage $7,000) *
Price List Catalog Number Cat. No. No Bid 090108HTLP No Bid 0901008HTLP No Bid
Discount Off Price List (%) Discount 50% 10%
Multiplier for Discount Discount 5 .90
Effective Date of Price List Date 9/1/08 10/1/08
16. Reed Price List (Estimated Annual Usage $7,000)
Price List Catalog Number Cat. No. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Discount Off Price List (%) Discount
Multiplier for Discount Discount
Effective Date of Price List Date
17. Craftsman Price List (Estimated Annual Usage $7,000) *
Price List Catalog Number Cat. No. No Bid Armstrong 89081-55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Discount Off Price List (%) Discount 57.7%
Multiplier for Discount Discount 423
Effective Date of Price List Date 1/1/09
18. Urrea Price List (Estimated Annual Usage $3,000) *
Price List Catalog Number Cat. No. No Bid No Bid No Bid PL09 No Bid
Discount Off Price List (%) Discount 40%
Multiplier for Discount Discount .60
Effective Date of Price List Date 2009
Net Net Net Net Net 2%
Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 20 days
Delivery Days 14 days 1-5 days 7 days 10 days
*LOW BIDDER
BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY
Alamo Iron Works NAPA
David Douglas Sales Rex Supply

Grainger

Hilti, Inc.

Morris Machine Tool & Supply
MSC Industrial Supply

Royall Matthiessen
Snap On Industrial
Tool Mart, Inc.

Unted Tools & Fastener




