
07-0403
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for 
FOR: Novelty Items and Tee-Shirts
TIME & (January 1, 2008 through December 31, 2008)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., October 25, 2007
  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

BID ITEM 1:  Promotional Items UNIT *
All promotional type items (except tee shirts and hats listed below) PRICE

1. Percent of Markup over cost TOTAL 9% 9.3% 9.275% 15% .94% 35%
BID ITEM 2: Tee-Shirts Screen Print UNIT
 PRICE

 Solid colors only, printed on one side only TOTAL
A. 50/50 Blend:  Base Item Color Code - Light  *
1. 50 - 1,500 Children Sizes  
 1 Color PRICE 2.65 2.70 3.27 2.50 No Bid 4.38

2 Colors PRICE 2.77 2.80 3.42 2.83 No Bid 4.97
3 Colors PRICE 2.89 2.90 3.76 3.25 No Bid 5.64
4 Colors PRICE 2.94 2.95 4.01 3.63 No Bid 6.31
Adult Sizes SM-XL  
1 Color PRICE 2.68 2.70 3.23 2.50 No Bid 4.44
2 Colors PRICE 2.79 2.80 3.48 2.83 No Bid 5.03
3 Colors PRICE 2.89 2.90 3.83 3.25 No Bid 5.70

 4 Colors PRICE 2.94 2.95 3.97 3.63 No Bid 6.37
2. 1,501 and up Children Sizes  

1 Color PRICE 2.59 2.70 2.95 2.10 No Bid 3.54
2 Colors PRICE 2.63 2.80 3.20 2.15 No Bid 4.13
3 Colors PRICE 2.79 2.90 3.45 2.30 No Bid 4.80

 4 Colors PRICE 2.81 2.95 3.70 2.40 No Bid 5.43
Adult Sizes SM-XL
1 Color PRICE 2.62 2.70 2.91 2.10 No Bid 3.60
2 Colors PRICE 2.66 2.80 3.16 2.15 No Bid 4.18
3 Colors PRICE 2.80 2.90 3.51 2.30 No Bid 4.86

 4 Colors PRICE 2.83 2.95 3.65 2.40 No Bid 5.49
B. 100% Cotton, Base Item Color - Light  
1. 50-1,500  Children Sizes

1 Color PRICE 2.64 2.70 3.17 2.50 No Bid 4.31
 2 Colors PRICE 2.73 2.80 3.42 2.83 No Bid 4.90

3 Colors PRICE 2.87 2.90 3.67 3.25 No Bid 5.57
 4 Colors PRICE 2.92 2.95 3.92 3.63 No Bid 6.24

Adult Sizes SM-XL  
1 Color PRICE 2.68 2.70 3.13 2.50 No Bid 4.40
2 Colors PRICE 2.79 2.80 3.38 2.83 No Bid 4.98
3 Colors PRICE 2.90 2.90 3.73 3.25 No Bid 5.66

 4 Colors PRICE 2.95 2.95 3.88 3.63 No Bid 6.33
2. 1,501 and up Children Sizes  

1 Color PRICE 2.53 2.70 2.85 2.10 No Bid 3.47
2 Colors PRICE 2.62 2.80 3.10 2.15 No Bid 4.06
3 Colors PRICE 2.77 2.90 3.35 2.30 No Bid 4.73

 4 Colors PRICE 2.80 2.95 3.60 2.40 No Bid 5.31
Adult Sizes SM-XL
1 Color PRICE 2.62 2.70 2.81 2.10 No Bid 3.56
2 Colors PRICE 2.66 2.80 3.06 2.15 No Bid 4.14
3 Colors PRICE 2.81 2.90 3.41 2.30 No Bid 4.82
4 Colors PRICE 2.83 2.95 3.56 2.40 No Bid 5.45
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ADDITIONAL ITEMS:  
PRICE/

a. Additional one color print (front or back) (Qty. 50 -500) PRINT 0.55 0.50 0.90 0.60 No Bid 2.66
 

PRICE/
Additional one color print (front or back) (Qty. 501 and up) PRINT 0.55 0.50 0.63 0.60 No Bid 1.82

 
 PRICE/

b. Solid white tee-shirts a deduct from bas bid price per shirt SHIRT 0.40 0.40 -.45 0.00 No Bid 2.44

PRICE/
c. Dark color tee-shirts addition per shirt SHIRT 0.40 0.50 +.30 1.05 No Bid 3.51

PRICE/
d. Extra charge for 2X plus per shirt SHIRT 1.05 0.80 +.80 0.65 No Bid 5.40

BID ITEM 3:  CAPS
Cap: SAWS logo on front of cap (embroidered) with waving  
American Flag on Side of cap (embroidered) Size:  Adjustable  *
Material: Brushed, Lightweight Cotton (35%) Polyester (55%) PRICE/
Type:  Sandwich bill, 6 Panel, Color: Black Cap with Royal Blue Bill Cap 3.90 3.78 4.75 6.50 No Bid 6.30

.25% Net 0% Net Net Net
Terms 20 days 30 days 20 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

 
 

Delivery  7 working days 7-20 days 21 days

*DENOTES LOW BIDDER
1

BID INVITATIONS WERE MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY

Alamo Tees & Advertising Lee Wayne Corp. SAWS Website
Awards Mart Logo Outfitters
Barbara LaGatta Promotional Products Lone Star Special Tees
Boundless Network Osiris USA Print, Inc.
BTX Press Sew Texas
Business Envelopes, Inc Stamped
Forum Printing and Specialties Texas Trophies
Four Seasons Embroidery, Inc You Name It Specialties
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