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ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY E S’? U‘gJ o S Ug) Lt 2 T E ) % o L‘E :I“ Ug)
1,500 Rolls Price 0.03 12.50
2 x 10 Mil Pipe Tape, Size 2" x 100", color blacl TOTAL 4,050.00 18,750.00
Manufacturer Mfr. Winmore 3M No Bid
1. Model Model 413 Scotchwrap 50
400 Rolls Price 0.81 37.53
6 x 10 Mil Pipe Tape, Size 6" x 100", color blacl TOTAL 3,240.00 15,012.00
Manufacturer Mfr. Winmore 3M No Bid
2. Model Model 413 Scotchwrap 50
20,000 feet Price 0.675 0.71
Poly Wrap, Size 20", Thickness 4 Mi TOTAL 13,500.00 14,200.00
Manufacturer Mfr. Van Leer Van Leer
Model Model Valeron Valeron No Bid
3. Quantity Descriptior Description 500'/roll 500'/roll
20,000 feet Price 0.768 0.81
Poly Wrap, Size 24", Thickness 4 Mil, Size 24" x 500, color blacl TOTAL 15,360.00 16,200.00
Manufacturer Mfr. Van Leer Van Leer
Model Model Valeron Valeron a a No Bid
4. Quantity Descriptior Description 500'/roll 500'/roll E ) E )
7,000 feet Price 0.849 0.89 < m < m
Poly Wrap, Size 27", Thickness 4 Mi TOTAL 5,943.00 6,230.00 = w = w
Manufacturer Mir. Van Leer Van Leer 8 E 8 E
Model Model Valeron Valeron < i < i No Bid
5. Quantity Descriptior Description 500'/roll 500'/roll :: S :: S
2,000 feet Price 1.128 1.17 o O o O
Poly Wrap, Size 37", Thickness 4 Mi TOTAL 2,256.00 2,340.00 =4 % =4 %
Manufacturer M. Van Leer Van Leer o= o=
Model Model Valeron Valeron m m No Bid
6. Quantity Descriptior Description 500'/roll 500'/roll
1,500 feet Price 1.198 1.250
Poly Wrap, Size 41", Thickness 4 Mi TOTAL 1,797.00 1,875.00
Manufacturer Mfr. Van Leer Van Leer
Model Model Valeron Valeron No Bid
7. Quantity Descriptior Description 500'/roll 500'/roll
1,500 feet Price 1.547 1.61
Poly Wrap, Size 54", Thickness 4 Mi TOTAL 2,320.50 2,415.00
Manufacturer Mfr. Van Leer Van Leer
Model Model Valeron Valeron No Bid
8. Quantity Descriptior Description 500'/roll 500'/roll
500 feet Price 1.954 2.03
Poly Wrap, Size 67", Thickness 4 v TOTAL 977.00 1,015.00
Manufacturer Mfr. Van Leer Van Leer
Model Model Valeron Valeron No Bid
9. Quantity Descriptior Description 500'/roll 500'/roll
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ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY E g U‘g) o S chJ Lt 2 T E ) % o L‘E ;‘ U‘gJ
2,000 feet Price 2.326 2.40
Poly Wrap, Size 81" x 500", Thickness 4 Mi TOTAL 4,652.00 4,800.00
Manufacturer Mfr. Van Leer Van Leer
Model Model Valeron Valeron No Bid
10. Quantity Descriptior Description 500'/roll 500'/roll
2,000 feet Price 0.279 0.946
Poly Wrap, Size 18", Thickness 8 Mil, Color Purpl TOTAL 558.00 1,986.60
Manufacturer Mfr. Van Leer Hi Tech Plastics
Model Model Valeron 37" PPT AWWA/ANSI ' ' No Bid
11. Quantity Descriptior Description 200'/roll 180'/roll B a B a
2,000 feet Price 0.431 1.60 = = = =
Poly Wrap, Size 27", Thickness 8 Mil, Color Purpl: TOTAL 862.00 3,456.00 < « < «
Manufacturer Mfr. Van Leer Hi Tech Plastics oy Y ==
Model Model Valeron 37" PPT AWWA/ANSI 2 w 2 w No Bid
12. Quantity Descriptior Description 200'/roll 180"/roll [Ingyal [Ingyal
2,000 feet Price 057 .99 == ==
Poly Wrap, Size 37", Thickness 8 Mil, Color Purpli TOTAL 1,140.00 4,298.40 28 28
Manufacturer Mfr. Van Leer a z a z
Model Model Valeron 81" PPT AWA/ANSI o o No Bid
13. Quantity Descriptior Description 200'/roll 180'/roll
500 ea.
Lubricant, Pipe Joint (a.k.a. flax soap), Size Quart, Mfr. Black Swar |Price 2.95 3.95
14. Mfr. Part No. 4055 Total 1,475.00 1,975.00 No Bid
250 ea.
Lubricant, Pipe Joint (a.k.a. flax soap), Size 8 Pound Tul Price 8.15 7.35
15. Mfr. CSR/Delta Pipe Products, Mfr. Part No. C1-/ Total 2,037.50 1,837.50 No Bid
Total for Items Nos. 1-15 TOTAL 60,168.00 96,390.50
Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days
Delivery Days 10-14 days
1
BIDS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
All Pro Fasteners SAWS Website
Fastener Service & Supply Demandstar

Frank W. Winne & Sons
Hughes Supply

Morrison Supply Co.

Municipal Water Works Supply
National Waterworks

Quality Fasteners




