
05-0118
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for 
FOR: Prescription Safety Eyewear Program
TIME & (Date of Award ending May 31, 2007)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 3, 2005  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

 180 ea. Single Vision UNIT
Clear PRICE 40.00 59.00 12.00 116.00 118.50 20.00

1. Total TOTAL 7,200.00 10,620.00 2,160.00 20,880.00 21,330.00 3,600.00
180 ea. Single Vision UNIT
Tint PRICE 40.00 69.00 19.50 116.00 133.50 30.00
Total TOTAL 7,200.00 12,420.00 3,510.00 20,880.00 24,030.00 5,400.00
  

 Transition  60.00 109.00 72.00 150.60 218.50 85.00
120 ea. Bi-Focal UNIT
Clear PRICE 50.00 79.00 30.00 127.50 138.50 85.00

2. Total TOTAL 6,000.00 9,480.00 3,600.00 15,300.00 16,620.00 10,200.00
120 ea. Bi-Focal UNIT
Tint PRICE 50.00 89.00 37.50 127.50 153.50 95.00
Total TOTAL 6,000.00 10,680.00 4,500.00 15,300.00 18,420.00 11,400.00

Transition 80.00 129.00 90.00 162.10 248.50 150.00
10 ea. Trifocal UNIT
Clear PRICE 65.00 99.00 30.00 140.10 158.50 115.00

3. Total TOTAL 650.00 990.00 300.00 1,401.00 1,585.00 1,150.00
10 ea. Trifocal UNIT
Tint PRICE 65.00 109.00 67.50 140.70 173.50 125.00
Total TOTAL 650.00 1,090.00 675.00 1,407.00 1,735.00 1,250.00

Transition 100.00 149.00 90.00 174.70 258.50 180.00
110 ea. Progressive UNIT
Clear PRICE 100.00 129.00 108.00 160.40 198.50 110.00

4. Total TOTAL 11,000.00 14,190.00 11,880.00 17,644.00 21,835.00 12,100.00
110 ea. Progressive UNIT
Tint PRICE 100.00 139.00 115.50 160.40 213.50 120.00
Total TOTAL 11,000.00 15,290.00 12,705.00 17,644.00 23,485.00 13,200.00

Transition 120.00 179.00 168.00 195.00 298.50 175.00
UNIT

2 ea. PRICE 100.00  
5. Full Face Mask TOTAL 200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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 UNIT
1 ea. PRICE  

6. Welder's Helmet TOTAL 100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
UNIT

420 ea. PRICE 12.00 12.00 30.00 Included 28.00 47.00
Plastic Frames TOTAL 5,040.00 5,040.00 12,600.00 in lense price 11,760.00 19,740.00

UNIT
420 ea. PRICE 30.00 12.00 65.00 36.00 28.00 None
Metal Frames TOTAL 12,600.00 5,040.00 27,300.00 15,120.00 11,760.00 Offered

UNIT
840 ea. PRICE 20.00
Dispensing Fees TOTAL 0.00 0.00 16,800.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

GRAND TOTAL 67,640.00 84,840.00 96,030.00 125,576.00 152,560.00 78,040.00

Net Net Net 2% Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 15 days 30 days 30 days

 
Delivery Days 7 days 5 days 7-10 days

 1

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY
 
Alamo City Optical Independent Eye Care Rochester Optical MBE Demandstar
Alamo Iron Works Korrect Optical Safety Supply SAWS Website
AO Safety Lab Safety Supply, Inc. Vision Advantage
Briggs-Weaver, Inc. Med Co. Medical Supply Walmart
Eyemasters My Econo's

 Gould Pump Pro-Tec Optical

2


