
09-0069
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for 
FOR: PVC Pipe, Series (C900), (C905) and (C909)
TIME & (Date of Award through May 31, 2011)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., March 19, 2009  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

ITEM 1 PVC C900 Pipe Class 150 (DR18)  
  PRICE

1,500 ft. EACH 1.70 1.79 1.81 1.885 No Bid
1. 4" PVC (C900) Pipe  (SAWS #14781) TOTAL 2,550.00 2,685.00 2,715.00 2,827.50
  PRICE

15,000 ft. EACH 3.34 3.52 3.57 3.708 No Bid
2. 6" PVC (C900) Pipe  (SAWS #14788) TOTAL 50,100.00 52,800.00 53,550.00 55,620.00
  PRICE

15,000 ft. EACH 5.69 6.01 6.20 6.427 No Bid
3. 8" PVC (C900) Pipe  (SAWS #14792) TOTAL 85,350.00 90,150.00 93,000.00 96,405.00
  PRICE

1,000 ft. EACH 8.68 9.16 9.29 9.640 No Bid
4. 10" PVC (C900) pipe  (SAWS #14758) TOTAL 8,680.00 9,160.00 9,290.00 9,640.00
  PRICE

7,500 ft. EACH 12.24 12.91 13.11 13.606 No Bid
5. 12" PVC (C900) Pipe  (SAWS #14758) TOTAL 91,800.00 96,825.00 98,325.00 102,045.00
   *

  No Bid
 Total for Item No. 1 TOTAL 238,480.00 251,620.00 256,880.00 266,537.50
ITEM 2 PVC (C905) Pipe Class 235 (DR18)
  PRICE

15,000 ft. EACH 24.00 22.84 23.07 24.780 No Bid
1. 16" PVC (C905) Pipe  (SAWS #14726) TOTAL 360,000.00 342,600.00 346,050.00 371,700.00
  PRICE

1,000 ft. EACH 37.00 35.76 37.29 39.655 No Bid
2. 20" PVC (C905) Pipe  (SAWS #14727) TOTAL 37,000.00 35,760.00 37,290.00 39,655.00

 PRICE
3,000 ft. EACH 53.00 52.79 56.64 58.628 No Bid

3. 24" PVC (C905) Pipe  (SAWS #14725) TOTAL 159,000.00 158,370.00 169,920.00 175,884.00
 *

  No Bid
 Total for Item No. 2 TOTAL 556,000.00 536,730.00 553,260.00 587,239.00
ITEM 3 PVC (C909) Pipe Class 150

PRICE
3,000 ft. EACH 3.34 3.65 3.57 3.708 No Bid

1. 6" PVC (C909) Pipe  (SAWS #22391) TOTAL 10,020.00 10,950.00 10,710.00 11,124.00
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PRICE
6,000 ft. EACH 5.69 6.23 6.20 6.437 No Bid

2. 8" PVC (C909) Pipe  (SAWS #22392) TOTAL 34,140.00 37,380.00 37,200.00 38,622.00
PRICE

500 ft. EACH 8.68 9.49 9.29 9.682 No Bid
3. 10" PVC (C909) Pipe  (SAWS #22393) TOTAL 4,340.00 4,745.00 4,645.00 4,841.00

PRICE
1,000 ft. EACH 12.24 13.39 13.11 13.596 No Bid

4. 12" PVC (C909) Pipe  (SAWS #22394) TOTAL 12,240.00 13,390.00 13,110.00 13,596.00
*

No Bid
Total for Item No. 3 TOTAL 60,740.00 66,465.00 65,665.00 68,183.00

No Bid
TOTAL ITEMS 1-3 TOTAL 855,220.00 854,815.00 875,805.00 921,959.50

*

Discount Price 838,115.60

Price Index, Industrial Standard, or other PVC Resin
to be used Mfg.  

2% Net 0% Net
Terms 20 days 30 days 20 days 30 days

Delivery Days 7 to 10 days 7 days 7-15 days
 

 *DENOTES LOW BIDDER 1

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY

Act Pipe & Supply Morrison Supply Co. Demandstar
Cascade Water Works Municipal Water Works Supply SAWS Website
Ferguson PMI Steel Pipe
HD Supply Water Works Williams Supply
John Holloway
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