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A. SCHEDULE 40 PVC PRESSURE PIPE UNIT
(SUPPLIED IN 20' LENGTHS) PRICE
TOTAL
UNIT *
5,000 feet PRICE 0.12 0.16 0.12
1. 1/2" sch 40 PVC (Item No. 3767) TOTAL 600.00 800.00 No Bid 600.00 No Bid
UNIT *
10,000 feet PRICE 0.155 0.20 0.16
2. 3/4" sch 40 PVC (Item No. 3770) TOTAL 1,550.00 2,000.00 No Bid 1,600.00 No Bid
UNIT *
5,000 feet PRICE 0.24 0.29 0.26
3. 1" sch 40 PVC (Item No. 3768) TOTAL 1,200.00 1,450.00 No Bid 1,300.00 No Bid
UNIT *
3,000 feet PRICE 0.32 0.41 0.32
4. 1-1/4" sch 40 PVC (Item No. 3766) TOTAL 960.00 1,230.00 No Bid 960.00 No Bid
UNIT *
3,000 feet PRICE 0.34 0.46 0.37
5. 1-1/2" sch 40 PVC (Item No. 3745) TOTAL 1,020.00 1,380.00 No Bid 1,110.00 No Bid
UNIT *
5,000 feet PRICE 0.45 0.61 0.50
6. 2" sch 40 PVC (Item No. 3746) TOTAL 2,250.00 3,050.00 No Bid 2,500.00 No Bid
UNIT *
2,000 feet PRICE 0.83 1.01 0.98
7. 2-1/2" Schedule 40 PVC (Item No. 3769) TOTAL 1,660.00 2,020.00 No Bid 1,960.00 No Bid
UNIT *
3,000 feet PRICE 0.93 1.25 1.02
8. 3" Schedule 40 PVC (Item No. 3747) TOTAL 2,790.00 3,750.00 No Bid 3,060.00 No Bid
UNIT *
2,000 feet PRICE 1.25 1.75 1.59
9. 4" Schedule 40 PVC (Item No. 3771) TOTAL 2,500.00 3,500.00 No Bid 3,180.00 No Bid
*
TOTAL FOR ITEM NOS 1-9 TOTAL 14,530.00 19,180.00 No Bid 16,270.00 No Bid
UNIT
SCHEDULE 40 PVC PRESSURE FITTINGS PRICE
A1. Estimated Usage $30,000 TOTAL
UNIT *
PRICE Sears Sears Sears Charlotte
Manufacturer TOTAL 40-1-1204 140-1 40-1-1204 P-1204-PF Lasco
UNIT
PRICE
Discount off Manufacturer List TOTAL 75.5% 50% 67.1% 79% 67.5%
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UNIT
PRICE
Multiplier for Discount TOTAL x.245 50 x.329 x.21 0.325
UNIT
PRICE
Effective Date TOTAL Dec. 6, 2004 11/4/04 Dec. 6, 2004 Dec. 6, 2004 02/01/05
B. SCHEDULE 80 PVC PRESSURE PIPE UNIT
(SUPPLIED IN 20' LENGHTYS) PRICE
TOTAL
UNIT *
5,000 feet PRICE 0.22 0.25
1. 1/2" Schedule 80 PVC (Item No. 3774) TOTAL 1,100.00 1,250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
UNIT *
10,000 feet PRICE 0.425 0.49
2. 1" Schedule 80 PVC (Item No. 3775) TOTAL 4,250.00 4,900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
UNIT *
2,000 feet PRICE 0.58 0.69
3. 1-1/4" Schedule 80 PVC (Item No. 3773) TOTAL 1,160.00 1,380.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
UNIT *
2,000 feet PRICE 0.66 0.82
4. 1-1/2" Schedule 80 PVC (Item No. 3772) TOTAL 1,320.00 1,640.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
UNIT *
10,000 feet PRICE 0.93 1.12
5. 2" Schedule 80 PVC (Item No. 3777) TOTAL 9,300.00 11,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
UNIT *
2,000 feet PRICE 1.53 1.72
6. 2-1/2" Schedule 80 PVC (Item No. 3776) TOTAL 3,060.00 3,440.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
UNIT *
2,000 feet PRICE 1.90 2.28
7. 3" Schedule 80 PVC (Item No. 3779) TOTAL 3,800.00 4,560.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
UNIT *
2,000 feet PRICE 2.75 3.37
8. 4" Schedule 80 PVC (Item No. 3780) TOTAL 5,500.00 6,740.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
UNIT *
2,000 feet PRICE 5.36 6.53
9. 6" Schedule 80 PVC (Item No. 3744) TOTAL 10,720.00 13,060.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
UNIT *
1,000 feet PRICE 8.00 10.13
10. 8" Schedule 80 PVC (Item No. 18268) TOTAL 8,000.00 10,130.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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*
TOTAL FOR ITEM NOS. 1-10 TOTAL 48,210.00 58,300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
UNIT
SCHEDULE 80 PVC PRESSURE FITTINGS PRICE
B1. Estimated Usage $20,000 TOTAL
UNIT * Spears 80-1-1204A
PRICE Spears Spears NPL-1-1204
Manufacturer TOTAL 80-1-1204A 80-1 V-1-0501C No Bid Lasco
UNIT 69.5%
PRICE 53%
Price Sheet TOTAL 77% 52% 47.1% No Bid '60%
UNIT x.305
PRICE x.47
Discount TOTAL 0.23 0.48 x.529 No Bid 4
UNIT Dec. 6, 2004
PRICE Dec. 6, 2004
Date TOTAL Dec. 6, 2004 11/4/04 May 8, 2001 No Bid 02/01/05
PVC DRAIN, WASTE, AND VENT (DWYV) UNIT
FITTINGS, NON-PRESSURE APPLICATIONS PRICE
C. Estimated Usage $20,000 TOTAL
UNIT *
PRICE Mueller Spears
Manufacturer TOTAL DWV1104P GPK MDWV-1-1104A Charlotte NDS
UNIT
PRICE
Price Sheet TOTAL 81.5% 45% 64.7% 78% 65%
UNIT
PRICE
Discount TOTAL 0.185 0.55 x.353 x.22 0.35
UNIT
PRICE
Date TOTAL Nov. 1, 2004 Nov. 1, 2004 Nov. 1, 2004 Nov. 1, 2004 02/01/05
D. SECTION D DELETED
E. PVC CEMENT GLUE, HEAVY-DUTY
400 pint UNIT Item Not
PVC Cement, used for 1/2" to 12" PVC PRICE 3.95 9.75 Tabulated 4.20 4.014
1. Pipe, Gray in color (Item No. 11650) TOTAL 1,580.00 3,900.00 Conditional Item 1,680.00 1,605.60
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UNIT
200 quart PRICE 6.50 9.39 5.46 7.75 6.671
2. PVC Cement, Blue in Color (Item No. 10555) TOTAL 1,300.00 1,878.00 1,092.00 1,550.00 1,334.20
UNIT
600 pint PRICE 3.85 5.46 3.20 3.59 3.857
3. PVC Cement, Blue in Color (Item No. 10556) TOTAL 2,310.00 3,276.00 1,920.00 2,154.00 2,314.20
UNIT *
PRICE
TOTAL FOR ITEM NOS. 1-3 TOTAL 5,190.00 9,054.00 3,012.00 5,384.00 5,254.00
UNIT
PRICE
F. PVC PRIMER TOTAL
200 quart UNIT *
Type Surface Cleaner, Purple in Color PRICE 3.50 7.33 3.45 4.27 4.372
1. (Item No. 10557) TOTAL 700.00 1,466.00 690.00 854.00 874.40
UNIT *
600 pint PRICE 3.50 4.39 2.19 2.61 3.632
2. Type PVC Cleaner (Item No. 10447) TOTAL 2,100.00 2,634.00 1,314.00 1,566.00 2,179.20
*
TOTAL FOR ITEM NOS 1-2 TOTAL 2,800.00 4,100.00 2,004.00 2,420.00 3,053.60
2% Net Net Net 0%
TERMS 20 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 20 days
DELIVERY DAYS 5-15 days 5-15 days 14 days 1 day
*DENOTES LOW BIDDER
BIDS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
Alamo Iron Works MS Techline Pipe Demandstar
AMC Industrial MS Techline Pipe LLP SAWS Website

Ferguson Enterprises, Inc.
Hughes Supply, Inc.
Moore Supply Co.
Morrison Supply Co.

PMI
Ryan Harco
Water Zone South JV




