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A. SCHEDULE 40 PVC PRESSURE PIPE
(SUPPLIED IN 20' LENGTHS)
MFG. Charlotte Northern & Charlotte
Manufacturer Name NAME JM/N. American Ipex JM Eagle Silverline Pipe
PRICE
Price Sheet SHEET N/A
EFF. DATE
Effective Date of Schedule OF SCH. N/A
DISC. OFF
Discount off Manufacturer Price List MFG. PRICE N/A
UNIT
1,300 feet PRICE 0.28 0.30 0.20 0.31 0.21
1. 1/2" sch 40 PVC (Item No. 14755) TOTAL 364.00 NO BID 390.00 NO BID NO BID 260.00 < 403.00 273.00
UNIT o
2,500 feet PRICE 0.32 0.33 0.26 8 0.35 0.24
2. 3/4" sch 40 PVC (Item No. 14776) TOTAL 800.00 NO BID 825.00 NO BID NO BID 650.00 4 875.00 600.00
UNIT o
1,000 feet PRICE 0.51 0.53 0.38 ; 0.57 0.39
3. 1" sch 40 PVC (Item No. 14768) TOTAL 510.00 NO BID 530.00 NO BID NO BID 380.00 E 570.00 390.00
UNIT [a)
500 feet PRICE 0.62 0.63 0.50 E 0.70 0.48
4. 1-1/4" sch 40 PVC (Item No. 14762) TOTAL 310.00 NO BID 315.00 NO BID NO BID 250.00 § 350.00 240.00
UNIT
760 feet PRICE 0.58 0.62 0.56 0.65 0.46
5. 1-1/2" sch 40 PVC (Item No. 14760) TOTAL 440.80 NO BID 471.20 NO BID NO BID 425.60 494.00 349.60
UNIT
1,300 feet PRICE 0.79 0.85 0.75 0.88 0.62
6. 2" sch 40 PVC (ltem No. 14770) TOTAL 1,027.00 NO BID 1,105.00 NO BID NO BID 975.00 1,144.00 806.00
UNIT
500 feet PRICE 1.58 1.62 1.25 1.76 1.27
7. 2-1/2" Schedule 40 PVC (Item No. 14771) TOTAL 790.00 NO BID 810.00 NO BID NO BID 625.00 880.00 635.00
UNIT
760 feet PRICE 1.68 1.71 1.55 1.85 1.32
8. 3" Schedule 40 PVC (ltem No. 14775) TOTAL 1,276.80 NO BID 1,299.60 NO BID NO BID 1,178.00 1,406.00 1,003.20
UNIT
500 feet PRICE 2.30 2.34 2.25 2.55 1.80
9. 4" Schedule 40 PVC (ltem No. 14782) TOTAL 1,150.00 NO BID 1,170.00 NO BID NO BID 1,125.00 1,275.00 900.00
*
TOTAL FOR ITEM NOS 1-9 TOTAL 6,668.60 NO BID 6,915.80 NO BID NO BID 5,868.60 7,397.00 5,196.80
Al. SCHEDULE 40 PVC PRESSURE FITTINGS
MFG. INCOMPLETE
Manufacturer Name NAME Lasco Dura Lasco GROUP Charlotte
PRICE INCOMPLETE
Price Sheet SHEET Sch 40 09/26/10 Lasco 2/11 GROUP




F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 11-0275

>
SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM g g
P. 0. BOX 2449 i - - @
~ 1%} ~ o et ¢ @ o L ]
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 w S £ d . RN 2N 5 K S 5 B o N
TABULATION OF BIDS 3R = R 8500 50R g‘tﬁ z R §2; EEB 8 R
_ 28 x g, 238 EEX 5 2 X 28 E0 3 B > x 8o X
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for PVC Schedule 40 and 80 SDR-26Pipe and S 0" 85 2 £ = =3 = g -~ SEZ g5 s g -
. K - . 599 © O S5 = Falif) S S o o =TI S 5 O
FOR: Fittings, Drain-Waste-Vent Fittings, Solvent Cement and Primer 2= I S E » g X = S g Sk > ¢ 205 Zed w g g
TivE & (June 1, 2011 through May 31, 2012) 5§22 g2 g g3 g8 ¢2 =82 g3 2 ges 88D R
oATE: 3:00 p.m., April 30, 2008 £5< & o< £33 2 < g << » 3 < cw g 2o 8 a3 <
oS < 5 d < =5 28 = N o 8 Mo an s £ D gmo = =4
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY = fg 8 < ':r 8 ; o0 s 3 % < g % T3 % ] 30 =3 L3 8
EFF. DATE INCOMPLETE
Effective Date of Schedule OF SCH. 9/26/10 9/26/10 9/26/10 GROUP
DISC. OFF INCOMPLETE
Discount off Manufacturer Price List MFG. PRICE Net Varias 73% GROUP
INCOMPLETE
SCHEDULE 40 PVC FITTING (COLOR WHITE) GROUP
50 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 1/2", end type female threaded x slip on PRICE 0.14 0.14 0.15 INCOMPLETE 0.18 0.14
1. (Item No. 9148) TOTAL 7.00 NO BID 7.00 NO BID NO BID 7.50 GROUP 9.00 7.00
50 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 1/2", end type male threaded x slip on PRICE 0.11 0.11 0.12 INCOMPLETE 0.15 0.11
2. (Item No. 9171) TOTAL 5.50 NO BID 5.50 NO BID NO BID 6.00 GROUP 7.50 5.50
100 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 3/4", end type female threaded x slip on PRICE 0.18 0.18 0.18 INCOMPLETE 0.23 0.17
3. (Item No. 9152) TOTAL 18.00 NO BID 18.00 NO BID NO BID 18.00 GROUP 23.00 17.00
100 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 3/4", end type male threaded x slip on PRICE 0.12 0.12 0.13 INCOMPLETE 0.15 0.12
4. (Item No. 9174) TOTAL 12.00 NO BID 12.00 NO BID NO BID 13.00 GROUP 15.00 12.00
100 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 1", end type female threaded x slip on PRICE 0.20 0.20 0.22 INCOMPLETE 0.26 0.20
5. (Item No. 9149) TOTAL 20.00 NO BID 20.00 NO BID NO BID 22.00 GROUP 26.00 20.00
100 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 1", end type male threaded x slip on PRICE 0.22 0.22 0.23 INCOMPLETE 0.28 0.22
6. (Item No. 9168) TOTAL 22.00 NO BID 22.00 NO BID NO BID 23.00 GROUP 28.00 22.00
30 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 1 1/4", end type female threaded x slip on PRICE 0.32 0.32 0.33 INCOMPLETE 0.36 0.31
7. (Item No. 9147) TOTAL 9.60 NO BID 9.60 NO BID NO BID 9.90 GROUP 10.80 9.30
30 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 1 1/4", end type female threaded x slip on PRICE 0.27 0.27 0.28 INCOMPLETE 0.34 0.27
8. (Item No. 9170) TOTAL 8.10 NO BID 8.10 NO BID NO BID 8.40 GROUP 10.20 8.10
UNIT
DUPLICATE PRICE INCOMPLETE
9. TOTAL GROUP
30 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 1 1/2", end type female threaded x slip on PRICE 0.36 0.36 0.37 INCOMPLETE 0.45 0.41
10. (Item No. 9165) TOTAL 10.80 NO BID 10.80 NO BID NO BID 11.10 GROUP 13.50 12.30
50 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 1 1/2", end type male threaded x slip on PRICE 0.36 0.36 0.37 INCOMPLETE 0.45 0.42
11. (Item No. 9169) TOTAL 18.00 NO BID 18.00 NO BID NO BID 18.50 GROUP 22.50 21.00
30 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 2", end type female threaded x slip on PRICE 0.48 0.49 0.50 INCOMPLETE 0.58 0.69
12. (Item No. 9151) TOTAL 14.40 NO BID 14.70 NO BID NO BID 15.00 GROUP 17.40 20.70
30 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 2", end type male threaded x slip on PRICE 0.47 0.47 0.49 INCOMPLETE 0.58 0.55
13. (Item No. 9173) TOTAL 14.10 NO BID 14.10 NO BID NO BID 14.70 GROUP 17.40 16.50
30 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 3", end type female threaded x slip on PRICE 1.64 1.65 1.68 INCOMPLETE 1.89 1.85
14. (Item No. 9153) TOTAL 49.20 NO BID 49.50 NO BID NO BID 50.40 GROUP 56.70 55.50
20 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 3", end type male threaded x slip on PRICE 2.03 2.05 2.10 INCOMPLETE 2.36 1.57
15. (Item No. 9175) TOTAL 40.60 NO BID 41.00 NO BID NO BID 42.00 GROUP 47.20 31.40
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50 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 3/4" x 1/2" end type slip on x slip on PRICE 0.13 0.13 0.13 INCOMPLETE 0.18 0.13
16. (Item No. 10092) TOTAL 6.50 NO BID 6.50 NO BID NO BID 6.50 GROUP 9.00 6.50
50 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 1" x 1/2", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 0.24 0.23 0.24 INCOMPLETE 0.29 0.23
17. (Item No. 10074) TOTAL 12.00 NO BID 11.50 NO BID NO BID 12.00 GROUP 14.50 11.50
50 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 1" x 3/4", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 0.24 0.23 0.24 INCOMPLETE 0.29 0.23
18. (Item No. 10094) TOTAL 12.00 NO BID 11.50 NO BID NO BID 12.00 GROUP 14.50 11.50
30 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 1 1/4" x 3/4", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 0.32 0.32 0.33 INCOMPLETE 0.38 0.31
19. (Item No. 9991) TOTAL 9.60 NO BID 9.60 NO BID NO BID 9.90 GROUP 11.40 9.30
50 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 1 1/4" x 1", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 0.32 0.32 0.33 INCOMPLETE 0.38 0.31
20. (Item No. 9990) TOTAL 16.00 NO BID 16.00 NO BID NO BID 16.50 GROUP 19.00 15.50
50 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 1 1/2" x 1 1/4", end type slip on x slipon  [PRICE 0.33 0.33 0.34 INCOMPLETE 0.38 0.33
21. (Item No. 9988) TOTAL 16.50 NO BID 16.50 NO BID NO BID 17.00 GROUP 19.00 16.50
50 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 2" x 1/2", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 0.55 0.55 0.57 INCOMPLETE 0.68 0.54
22. (tem No. 10091) TOTAL 27.50 NO BID 27.50 NO BID NO BID 28.50 GROUP 34.00 27.00
50 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 2" x 3/4", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 0.55 0.55 0.57 INCOMPLETE 0.68 0.54
23. (Item No. 10090) TOTAL 27.50 NO BID 27.50 NO BID NO BID 28.50 GROUP 34.00 27.00
50 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 2" x 1", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 0.55 0.55 0.57 INCOMPLETE 0.68 0.54
24. (Item No. 10106) TOTAL 27.50 NO BID 27.50 NO BID NO BID 28.50 GROUP 34.00 27.00
50 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 2" x 1 1/2", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 0.55 0.55 0.57 INCOMPLETE 0.68 0.54
25. (Item No. 10075) TOTAL 27.50 NO BID 27.50 NO BID NO BID 28.50 GROUP 34.00 27.00
20 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 2 1/2" x 2" end type slip on x slip on PRICE 0.88 0.89 0.91 INCOMPLETE 1.06 0.88
26. (Item No. 10073) TOTAL 17.60 NO BID 17.80 NO BID NO BID 18.20 GROUP 21.20 17.60
20 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 3" x 2 1/2", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 1.30 1.30 1.34 INCOMPLETE 1.49 1.29
27. (Item No. 10076) TOTAL 26.00 NO BID 26.00 NO BID NO BID 26.80 GROUP 29.80 25.80
75 ea. UNIT
Cap, size 1", end type slip on PRICE 0.20 0.20 0.21 INCOMPLETE 0.25 0.20
28. (Item No. 10250) TOTAL 15.00 NO BID 15.00 NO BID NO BID 15.75 GROUP 18.75 15.00
30 ea. UNIT
Cap, size 1 1/4", end type slip on PRICE 0.29 0.29 0.29 INCOMPLETE 0.35 0.29
29. (Item No. 10249) TOTAL 8.70 NO BID 8.70 NO BID NO BID 8.70 GROUP 10.50 8.70
30 ea. UNIT
Cap, size 1 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 0.32 0.32 0.33 INCOMPLETE 0.38 0.31
30. (Item No. 10248) TOTAL 9.60 NO BID 9.60 NO BID NO BID 9.90 GROUP 11.40 9.30
20 ea. UNIT
Cap, size 2", end type slip on PRICE 0.38 0.38 0.39 INCOMPLETE 0.45 0.38
31. (Item No. 10244) TOTAL 7.60 NO BID 7.60 NO BID NO BID 7.80 GROUP 9.00 7.60
20 ea. UNIT
Cap, size 3", end type slip on PRICE 131 1.32 1.36 INCOMPLETE 1.53 131
32. (Item No. 10252) TOTAL 26.20 NO BID 26.40 NO BID NO BID 27.20 GROUP 30.60 26.20
100 ea. UNIT
Coupling, size 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 0.08 0.08 0.09 INCOMPLETE 0.10 0.08
33. (Item No. 11100) TOTAL 8.00 NO BID 8.00 NO BID NO BID 9.00 GROUP 10.00 8.00




F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

11-0275

>
SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM g g
P. 0. BOX 2449 - . - = = a
e - — 3 ° 2 B X< =1
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 w S £ & . 2 o | 2N 5 K S 5 . 9 o N
TABULATION OF BIDS 3R = R 8500 50R g%ﬁ z R §2; EEB 8 R
_ 28 x g, 238 EEX 5 2 X 28 E0 3 B > x 8o X
erorosaL  Annual Contract for PVC Schedule 40 and 80 SDR-26Pipe and S5 S5 S S g+ =3" S - F S ST g5 s 55k
e X " X 5 oo =) S S>g O g ;oo -4 90 =TT S 5 o
FOR: Fittings, Drain-Waste-Vent Fittings, Solvent Cement and Primer 2= I S E 2= 5 = S g § [ g _: 2 g g %’J 5 Zed u g é
TivES (June 1, 2011 through May 31, 2012) §2 2 282 E3 s sE g =R £ g5 £ ggs 280 S EE
DATE: 3:00 p.m., April 30, 2008 o< g g < £33 3~ < £ L < 58 < cw 2 a8 23 <
oS < 5 d < =5 28 = N o 8 Mo an s £ D gmo = =4
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY = fg 8 < ':r 8 ; o0 e 3 % < g % T3 % ] 30 =3 L3 8
100 ea. UNIT
Coupling, size 3/4", end type slip on PRICE 0.11 0.11 0.12 INCOMPLETE 0.13 0.11
34. (Item No. 11120) TOTAL 11.00 NO BID 11.00 NO BID NO BID 12.00 GROUP 13.00 11.00
100 ea. UNIT
Coupling, size 1", end type slip on PRICE 0.20 0.20 0.21 INCOMPLETE 0.25 0.19
35. (Item No. 11134) TOTAL 20.00 NO BID 20.00 NO BID NO BID 21.00 GROUP 25.00 19.00
30 ea. UNIT
Coupling, size 1 1/4", end type slip on PRICE 0.27 0.27 0.28 INCOMPLETE 0.33 0.27
36. (Item No. 11099) TOTAL 8.10 NO BID 8.10 NO BID NO BID 8.40 GROUP 9.90 8.10
30 ea. UNIT
Coupling, size 1 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 0.29 0.29 0.29 INCOMPLETE 0.34 0.29
37. (Item No. 11121) TOTAL 8.70 NO BID 8.70 NO BID NO BID 8.70 GROUP 10.20 8.70
30 ea. UNIT
Coupling, size 2", end type slip on PRICE 0.44 0.44 0.46 INCOMPLETE 0.51 0.44
38. (Item No. 11102) TOTAL 13.20 NO BID 13.20 NO BID NO BID 13.80 GROUP 15.30 13.20
20 ea. UNIT
Coupling, size 3", end type slip on PRICE 151 1.53 1.57 INCOMPLETE 1.75 151
39. (Item No. 11123) TOTAL 30.20 NO BID 30.60 NO BID NO BID 31.40 GROUP 35.00 30.20
30 ea. UNIT
Coupling, compression, size 1 1/4" PRICE 4.24 3.07 4.38 INCOMPLETE 4.88 251
40. (Item No. 11117) TOTAL 127.20 NO BID 92.10 NO BID NO BID 131.40 GROUP 146.40 75.30
30 ea. UNIT
Coupling, compression, size 1 1/2" PRICE 437 4.22 4.52 INCOMPLETE 5.12 3.18
41. (Item No. 11110) TOTAL 131.10 NO BID 126.60 NO BID NO BID 135.60 GROUP 153.60 95.40
30 ea. UNIT
Coupling, compression, size 2" PRICE 5.75 5.98 5.92 INCOMPLETE 6.65 4.44
42. (Item No. 11113) TOTAL 172.50 NO BID 179.40 NO BID NO BID 177.60 GROUP 199.50 133.20
20 ea. UNIT
Coupling, compression, size 3" PRICE 14.01 16.70 14.47 INCOMPLETE 16.05 13.34
43. (Item No. 11115) TOTAL 280.20 NO BID 334.00 NO BID NO BID 289.40 GROUP 321.00 266.80
30 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 1/2", end type slip on x slip on, degree 45 PRICE 0.20 0.20 0.21 INCOMPLETE 0.25 0.20
44. (Item No. 11704) TOTAL 6.00 NO BID 6.00 NO BID NO BID 6.30 GROUP 7.50 6.00
50 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 1/2", end type slip on x slip on, degree 90 PRICE 0.12 0.12 0.13 INCOMPLETE 0.15 0.12
45. (Item No. 11719) TOTAL 6.00 NO BID 6.00 NO BID NO BID 6.50 GROUP 7.50 6.00
30 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 3/4", end type slip on x slip on, degree 45 PRICE 0.32 0.32 0.33 INCOMPLETE 0.38 0.31
46. (Item No. 11707) TOTAL 9.60 NO BID 9.60 NO BID NO BID 9.90 GROUP 11.40 9.30
100 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 3/4", end type slip on x slip on, degree 90 PRICE 0.14 0.14 0.14 INCOMPLETE 0.18 0.14
47. (Item No. 11728) TOTAL 14.00 NO BID 14.00 NO BID NO BID 14.00 GROUP 18.00 14.00
50 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 1", end type slip on x slip on, degree 45 PRICE 0.38 0.38 0.39 INCOMPLETE 0.46 0.38
48. (Item No. 11702) TOTAL 19.00 NO BID 19.00 NO BID NO BID 19.50 GROUP 23.00 19.00
100 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 1", end type slip on x slip on, degree 90 PRICE 0.25 0.25 0.26 INCOMPLETE 0.30 0.25
49. (Item No. 11693) TOTAL 25.00 NO BID 25.00 NO BID NO BID 26.00 GROUP 30.00 25.00
30 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 1 1/4", end type slip on x slip on, degree 45 PRICE 0.53 0.53 0.54 INCOMPLETE 0.63 0.52
50. (Item No. 11703) TOTAL 15.90 NO BID 15.90 NO BID NO BID 16.20 GROUP 18.90 15.60
50 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 1 1/4", end type slip on x slip on, degree 90 PRICE 0.44 0.44 0.46 INCOMPLETE 0.51 0.43
51. (Item No. 11725) TOTAL 22.00 NO BID 22.00 NO BID NO BID 23.00 GROUP 25.50 21.50
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30 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 1 1/2", end type slip on x slip on, degree 45 PRICE 0.66 0.66 0.68 INCOMPLETE 0.78 0.43
52. (Item No. 11700) TOTAL 19.80 NO BID 19.80 NO BID NO BID 20.40 GROUP 23.40 12.90
50 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 1 1/2", end type slip on x slip on, degree 90 PRICE 0.47 0.47 0.48 INCOMPLETE 0.58 0.44
53. (Item No. 11724) TOTAL 23.50 NO BID 23.50 NO BID NO BID 24.00 GROUP 29.00 22.00
30 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 2", end type slip on x slip on, degree 45 PRICE 0.86 0.86 0.89 INCOMPLETE 1.01 0.62
54. (Item No. 11706) TOTAL 25.80 NO BID 25.80 NO BID NO BID 26.70 GROUP 30.30 18.60
50 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 2", end type slip on x slip on, degree 90 PRICE 0.73 0.74 0.76 INCOMPLETE 0.89 0.69
55. (Item No. 11727) TOTAL 36.50 NO BID 37.00 NO BID NO BID 38.00 GROUP 44.50 34.50
30 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 3", end type slip on x slip on, degree 45 PRICE 3.47 3.50 3.58 INCOMPLETE 3.98 1.82
56. (Item No. 11718) TOTAL 104.10 NO BID 105.00 NO BID NO BID 107.40 GROUP 119.40 54.60
20 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 3", end type slip on x slip on, degree 90 PRICE 2.67 2.69 2.75 INCOMPLETE 3.08 2.04
57. (Item No. 11729) TOTAL 53.40 NO BID 53.80 NO BID NO BID 55.00 GROUP 61.60 40.80
50 ea. UNIT
Plug, size 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 0.27 0.27 0.28 INCOMPLETE 0.33 0.27
58. (Item No. 14899) TOTAL 13.50 NO BID 13.50 NO BID NO BID 14.00 GROUP 16.50 13.50
50 ea. UNIT
Plug, size 3/4", end type slip on PRICE 0.32 0.32 0.33 INCOMPLETE 0.38 0.31
59. (Item No. 14907) TOTAL 16.00 NO BID 16.00 NO BID NO BID 16.50 GROUP 19.00 15.50
30 ea. UNIT
Plug, size 1", end type slip on PRICE 0.38 0.38 0.39 INCOMPLETE 0.45 0.38
60. (Item No. 14898) TOTAL 11.40 NO BID 11.40 NO BID NO BID 11.70 GROUP 13.50 11.40
30 ea. UNIT
Plug, size 1 1/4", end type slip on PRICE 0.50 0.51 0.52 INCOMPLETE 0.59 0.44
61. (Item No. 14903) TOTAL 15.00 NO BID 15.30 NO BID NO BID 15.60 GROUP 17.70 13.20
50 ea. UNIT
Plug, size 1 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 0.64 0.64 0.66 INCOMPLETE 0.75 0.64
62. (Item No. 14902) TOTAL 32.00 NO BID 32.00 NO BID NO BID 33.00 GROUP 37.50 32.00
50 ea. UNIT
Plug, size 2", end type slip on PRICE 0.79 0.80 0.82 INCOMPLETE 0.94 0.79
63. (Item No. 14904) TOTAL 39.50 NO BID 40.00 NO BID NO BID 41.00 GROUP 47.00 39.50
20 ea. UNIT
Plug, size 3" end type slip on PRICE 1.79 1.80 1.85 INCOMPLETE 2.09 1.78
64. (Item No. 14947) TOTAL 35.80 NO BID 36.00 NO BID NO BID 37.00 GROUP 41.80 35.60
30 ea. UNIT
Tee, size 1/2" end type slip on PRICE 0.15 0.15 0.16 INCOMPLETE 0.19 0.15
65. (Item No. 16544) TOTAL 4.50 NO BID 4.50 NO BID NO BID 4.80 GROUP 5.70 4.50
100 ea. UNIT
Tee, size 3/4", end type slip on PRICE 0.18 0.18 0.18 INCOMPLETE 0.22 0.17
66. (Item No. 16577) TOTAL 18.00 NO BID 18.00 NO BID NO BID 18.00 GROUP 22.00 17.00
100 ea. UNIT
Tee, size 1", end type slip on PRICE 0.33 0.33 0.34 INCOMPLETE 0.39 0.33
67. (Item No. 16536) TOTAL 33.00 NO BID 33.00 NO BID NO BID 34.00 GROUP 39.00 33.00
30 ea. UNIT
Tee, size 1 1/4", end type slip on PRICE 0.51 0.52 0.53 INCOMPLETE 0.61 0.51
68. (Item No. 16532) TOTAL 15.30 NO BID 15.60 NO BID NO BID 15.90 GROUP 18.30 15.30
50 ea. UNIT
Tee, size 1 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 0.62 0.63 0.64 INCOMPLETE 0.74 0.62
69. (Item No. 16530) TOTAL 31.00 NO BID 31.50 NO BID NO BID 32.00 GROUP 37.00 31.00




F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

11-0275

>
SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM g g
P. 0. BOX 2449 . - - @
~ 1%} ~ o et ¢ @ o L ]
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 w S £ d . RN 2N 5 K S 5 B o N
TABULATION OF BIDS 3R = R 8500 50R g%ﬁ z R §2; EEB 8 R
_ 28 x g, 238 EEX 5 2 X 28 E0 3 B > x 8o X
prorosaL  Annual Contract for PVC Schedule 40 and 80 SDR-26Pipe and 2o 0" 85 2 £ = z8" g -~ SET g5 s g akF
e X " X 5 oo © O S5 = Falif) S S o o O =TI S 5 O
FOR: Fittings, Drain-Waste-Vent Fittings, Solvent Cement and Primer 2= I S E » g X = S g Sk > ¢ 205 Zed w g g
e (June 1, 2011 through May 31, 2012) §2 2 g8 e gzt S5 2 =R £ g3 2 g8 5 £80 &2
. 2 = < =} @ W [=} > ow = ERZ2ErY [z}
DATE: 3:00 p.m., April 30, 2008 2o < g g < £33 3~ < £ L < 58 < cw 2 a8 23 <
oS < 5 d < =5 28 = N o 8 Mo an s £ D gmo = =4
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY = fg 8 < ':r 8 ; o0 e 3 % < g % T3 % ] 30 =3 L3 8
50 ea. UNIT
Tee, size 2", end type slip on PRICE 0.90 0.91 0.93 INCOMPLETE 1.08 0.90
70. (Item No. 16566) TOTAL 45.00 NO BID 45.50 NO BID NO BID 46.50 GROUP 54.00 45.00
20 ea. UNIT
Tee, size 3", end type slip on PRICE 3.91 3.95 4.04 INCOMPLETE 4.48 3.91
71. (Item No. 16573) TOTAL 78.20 NO BID 79.00 NO BID NO BID 80.80 GROUP 89.60 78.20
*
INCOMPLETE
TOTAL FOR ITEM NOS. 1-71 TOTAL 2,121.60 NO BID 2,148.40 NO BID NO BID 2,193.75 GROUP 2,506.35 1,900.70
B. SCHEDULE 80 PVC PRESSURE PIPE (SUPPLIED IN 20*
LENGTHS) INCOMPLETE
GROUP
MFG. INCOMPLETE
Manufacturer Name NAME NO BID Ipex NO BID NO BID JM Eagle GROUP Charlotte
PRICE INCOMPLETE
Price Sheet SHEET NO BID N/A NO BID NO BID N/A GROUP
EFF. DATE INCOMPLETE
Effective Date of Schedule OF SCH. NO BID N/A NO BID NO BID N/A GROUP
DISC. OFF INCOMPLETE
Discount Off Mfg. Price List MFG. PRICE NO BID N/A NO BID NO BID N/A GROUP
1,000 ft. UNIT
1/2" Schedule 80 PVC PRICE 0.34 0.24 INCOMPLETE 0.42 0.35
1. (Item No. 14756) TOTAL NO BID NO BID 340.00 NO BID NO BID 240.00 GROUP 420.00 350.00
1,500 ft. UNIT
1" Schedule 80 PVC PRICE 0.65 0.48 INCOMPLETE 0.83 0.69
2. (Item No. 14769) TOTAL NO BID NO BID 975.00 NO BID NO BID 720.00 GROUP 1,245.00 1,035.00
500 ft. UNIT
1 1/4" Schedule 80 PVC PRICE 0.91 0.66 INCOMPLETE 1.15 0.97
3. (Item No. 14763) TOTAL NO BID NO BID 455.00 NO BID NO BID 330.00 GROUP 575.00 485.00
500 ft. UNIT
11/2" Schedule 80 PVC PRICE 1.02 0.80 INCOMPLETE 1.28 1.07
4. (Item No. 14761) TOTAL NO BID NO BID 510.00 NO BID NO BID 400.00 GROUP 640.00 535.00
1,500 ft. UNIT
2" Schedule 80 PVC PRICE 1.42 1.09 INCOMPLETE 1.70 1.50
5. (Item No. 14774) TOTAL NO BID NO BID 2,130.00 NO BID NO BID 1,635.00 GROUP 2,550.00 2,250.00
500 ft. UNIT
2 1/2" Schedule 80 PVC PRICE 2.33 1.75 INCOMPLETE 2.90 2.48
6. (Item No. 14772) TOTAL NO BID NO BID 1,165.00 NO BID NO BID 875.00 GROUP 1,450.00 1,240.00
500 ft. UNIT
3" Schedule 80 PVC PRICE 2.87 2.23 INCOMPLETE 3.60 3.05
7. (Item No. 14778) TOTAL NO BID NO BID 1,435.00 NO BID NO BID 1,115.00 GROUP 1,800.00 1,525.00
500 ft. UNIT
4" Schedule 80 PVC PRICE 4.11 3.25 INCOMPLETE 5.15 4.38
8. (Item No. 14783) TOTAL NO BID NO BID 2,055.00 NO BID NO BID 1,625.00 GROUP 2,575.00 2,190.00
300 ft. UNIT
6" Schedule 80 PVC PRICE 7.91 6.18 INCOMPLETE 9.91 8.44
9. (Item No. 14786) TOTAL NO BID NO BID 2,373.00 NO BID NO BID 1,854.00 GROUP 2,973.00 2,532.00
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300 ft. UNIT
8" Schedule 80 PVC PRICE 11.94 9.31 INCOMPLETE 14.95 12.72
10. (Item No. 14794) TOTAL NO BID NO BID 3,582.00 NO BID NO BID 2,793.00 GROUP 4,485.00 3,816.00
*
INCOMPLETE
TOTAL FOR ITEM NOS. 1-10 TOTAL NO BID NO BID 15,020.00 NO BID NO BID 11,587.00 GROUP 18,713.00 15,958.00
B1. SCHEDULE 80 PVC PRESSURE FITTINGS
MFG. INCOMPLETE
Manufacturer Name NAME Lasco Spears Mfg. NO BID NO BID Lasco GROUP Spears-Dura Charlotte
PRICE INCOMPLETE
Price Sheet SHEET Sch 80 80-1 NO BID NO BID Lasco Sch 80 GROUP
EFF. DATE INCOMPLETE
Effective Date of Schedule OF SCH. 9/26/10 9/26/10 NO BID NO BID 9/26/10 GROUP
DISC. OFF INCOMPLETE
Discount Off Mfg. Price List MFG. PRICE Net Varas NO BID NO BID 70% GROUP
50 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 1/2", end type female threaded x slip on PRICE 1.23 1.06 1.27 INCOMPLETE 1.19 0.88
1. (SAWS No. 9156) TOTAL 61.50 NO BID 53.00 NO BID NO BID 63.50 GROUP 59.50 44.00
30 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 1/2", end type male threaded x slip on PRICE 1.54 1.33 1.59 INCOMPLETE 1.47 1.10
2. (SAWS No. 9178) TOTAL 46.20 NO BID 39.90 NO BID NO BID 47.70 GROUP 44.10 33.00
50 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 3/4", end type female threaded x slip on PRICE 1.83 1.58 1.88 INCOMPLETE 1.75 1.30
3. (SAWS No. 9159) TOTAL 91.50 NO BID 79.00 NO BID NO BID 94.00 GROUP 87.50 65.00
50 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 3/4", end type male threaded x slip on PRICE 1.69 1.46 1.75 INCOMPLETE 1.60 1.21
4. (SAWS No. 9182) TOTAL 84.50 NO BID 73.00 NO BID NO BID 87.50 GROUP 80.00 60.50
50 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 1", end type female threaded x slip on PRICE 2.69 2.33 2.78 INCOMPLETE 2.55 1.92
5. (SAWS No. 9145) TOTAL 134.50 NO BID 116.50 NO BID NO BID 139.00 GROUP 127.50 96.00
50 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 1", end type male threaded x slip on PRICE 293 2.53 3.02 INCOMPLETE 2.77 2.09
6. (SAWS No. 9179) TOTAL 146.50 NO BID 126.50 NO BID NO BID 151.00 GROUP 138.50 104.50
50 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 1 1/4", end type female threaded x slip on PRICE 4.36 3.77 4.50 INCOMPLETE 4.08 311
7. (SAWS No. 9155) TOTAL 218.00 NO BID 188.50 NO BID NO BID 225.00 GROUP 204.00 155.50
50 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 1 1/4", end type male threaded x slip on PRICE 343 2.96 3.53 INCOMPLETE 3.26 2.45
8. (SAWS No. 9177) TOTAL 171.50 NO BID 148.00 NO BID NO BID 176.50 GROUP 163.00 122.50
30 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 1 1/2", end type female threaded x slip on PRICE 5.35 4.63 5.52 INCOMPLETE 4.98 3.82
9. (SAWS No. 9154) TOTAL 160.50 NO BID 138.90 NO BID NO BID 165.60 GROUP 149.40 114.60
50 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 1 1/2", end type male threaded x slip on PRICE 4.92 4.26 5.08 INCOMPLETE 4.60 351
10. (SAWS No. 9176) TOTAL 246.00 NO BID 213.00 NO BID NO BID 254.00 GROUP 230.00 175.50
20 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 2", end type female threaded x slip on PRICE 9.32 8.07 9.63 INCOMPLETE 8.67 6.66
11. (SAWS No. 9158) TOTAL 186.40 NO BID 161.40 NO BID NO BID 192.60 GROUP 173.40 133.20
30 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 2", end type male threaded x slip on PRICE 7.11 6.16 7.35 INCOMPLETE 6.59 5.08
12. (SAWS No. 9181) TOTAL 213.30 NO BID 184.80 NO BID NO BID 220.50 GROUP 197.70 152.40
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20 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 3", end type female threaded x slip on PRICE 16.57 14.35 17.12 INCOMPLETE 15.37 11.84
13. (SAWS No. 9160) TOTAL 331.40 NO BID 287.00 NO BID NO BID 342.40 GROUP 307.40 236.80
20 ea. UNIT
Adapter, size 3", end type male threaded x slip on PRICE 8.97 7.77 9.27 INCOMPLETE 8.35 6.41
14. (SAWS No. 9183) TOTAL 179.40 NO BID 155.40 NO BID NO BID 185.40 GROUP 167.00 128.20
20 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 3/4" x 1/2", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 0.42 0.37 0.43 INCOMPLETE 0.42 0.30
15. (SAWS No. 10087) TOTAL 8.40 NO BID 7.40 NO BID NO BID 8.60 GROUP 8.40 6.00
20 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 1" x 1/2", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 121 1.05 1.25 INCOMPLETE 117 0.87
16. (SAWS No. 10081) TOTAL 24.20 NO BID 21.00 NO BID NO BID 25.00 GROUP 23.40 17.40
15ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 1" x 1/2", end type NP threads PRICE 2.54 2.20 2.63 INCOMPLETE 2.38 0.87
17. (SAWS No. 10143) TOTAL 38.10 NO BID 33.00 NO BID NO BID 39.45 GROUP 35.70 13.05
20 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 1" x 3/4", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 121 1.05 1.25 INCOMPLETE 1.18 0.87
18. (SAWS No. 10082) TOTAL 24.20 NO BID 21.00 NO BID NO BID 25.00 GROUP 23.60 17.40
10 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 1 1/4" x 1", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 1.90 1.64 1.97 INCOMPLETE 1.86 1.36
19. (SAWS No. 10080) TOTAL 19.00 NO BID 16.40 NO BID NO BID 19.70 GROUP 18.60 13.60
20 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 1 1/2" x 3/4", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 2.59 2.24 2.67 INCOMPLETE 2.45 1.85
20. (SAWS No. 10079) TOTAL 51.80 NO BID 44.80 NO BID NO BID 53.40 GROUP 49.00 37.00
30 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 1 1/2" x 1", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 2.59 2.24 2.67 INCOMPLETE 2.45 1.85
21. (SAWS No. 10078) TOTAL 77.70 NO BID 67.20 NO BID NO BID 80.10 GROUP 73.50 55.50
20 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 1 1/2" x 1 1/4", end type slip on x slipon  [PRICE 2.59 2.24 2.67 INCOMPLETE 2.45 1.85
22. (SAWS No. 10077) TOTAL 51.80 NO BID 44.80 NO BID NO BID 53.40 GROUP 49.00 37.00
10 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 2" x 1/2", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 3.69 3.19 3.82 INCOMPLETE 3.47 2.64
23. (SAWS No. 10084) TOTAL 36.90 NO BID 31.90 NO BID NO BID 38.20 GROUP 34.70 26.40
30 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 2" x 3/4", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 3.69 3.19 3.82 INCOMPLETE 3.47 2.64
24. (SAWS No. 10086) TOTAL 110.70 NO BID 95.70 NO BID NO BID 114.60 GROUP 104.10 79.20
30 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 2" x 1", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 3.69 3.19 3.82 INCOMPLETE 3.47 2.64
25. (SAWS No. 10085) TOTAL 110.70 NO BID 95.70 NO BID NO BID 114.60 GROUP 104.10 79.20
20 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 2" x 1 1/4", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 3.69 3.19 3.82 INCOMPLETE 3.47 2.64
26. (SAWS No. 10097) TOTAL 73.80 NO BID 63.80 NO BID NO BID 76.40 GROUP 69.40 52.80
30 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 2" x 1 1/2", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 3.69 3.19 3.82 INCOMPLETE 3.47 2.64
27. (SAWS No. 10083) TOTAL 110.70 NO BID 95.70 NO BID NO BID 114.60 GROUP 104.10 79.20
15ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 2 1/2" x 2", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 6.40 5.55 6.62 INCOMPLETE 5.98 4.58
28. (SAWS No. 10093) TOTAL 96.00 NO BID 83.25 NO BID NO BID 99.30 GROUP 89.70 68.70
10 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 3" x 2", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 10.16 8.80 10.50 INCOMPLETE 9.45 7.26
29. (SAWS No. 10111) TOTAL 101.60 NO BID 88.00 NO BID NO BID 105.00 GROUP 94.50 72.60
15ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 3" x 2 1/2", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 10.16 8.80 10.50 INCOMPLETE 9.45 7.26
30. (SAWS No. 10088) TOTAL 152.40 NO BID 132.00 NO BID NO BID 157.50 GROUP 141.75 108.90
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10 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 4" x 2", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 14.07 12.18 14.53 INCOMPLETE 13.50 10.05
31. (SAWS No. 10112) TOTAL 140.70 NO BID 121.80 NO BID NO BID 145.30 GROUP 135.00 100.50
10 ea. UNIT
Bushing, reducer, size 4" x 3", end type slip on x slip on PRICE 14.07 12.18 14.53 INCOMPLETE 13.50 10.05
32. (SAWS No. 10089) TOTAL 140.70 NO BID 121.80 NO BID NO BID 145.30 GROUP 135.00 100.50
20 ea. UNIT
Cap, size 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 1.29 111 1.33 INCOMPLETE 1.29 0.92
33. (SAWS No. 10256) TOTAL 25.80 NO BID 22.20 NO BID NO BID 26.60 GROUP 25.80 18.40
30 ea. UNIT
Cap, size 3/4", end type slip on PRICE 1.35 1.17 1.40 INCOMPLETE 1.29 0.97
34. (SAWS No. 10260) TOTAL 40.50 NO BID 35.10 NO BID NO BID 42.00 GROUP 38.70 29.10
30 ea. UNIT
Cap, size 1", end type slip on PRICE 2.40 2.08 2.48 INCOMPLETE 2.28 172
35. (SAWS No. 10257) TOTAL 72.00 NO BID 62.40 NO BID NO BID 74.40 GROUP 68.40 51.60
10 ea. UNIT
Cap, size 1 1/4", end type slip on PRICE 2.90 251 3.00 INCOMPLETE 2.75 2.07
36. (SAWS No. 10255) TOTAL 29.00 NO BID 25.10 NO BID NO BID 30.00 GROUP 27.50 20.70
20 ea. UNIT
Cap, size 1 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 2.90 251 3.00 INCOMPLETE 2.75 2.07
37. (SAWS No. 10254) TOTAL 58.00 NO BID 50.20 NO BID NO BID 60.00 GROUP 55.00 41.40
20 ea. UNIT
Cap, size 2", end type slip on PRICE 573 4.96 5.92 INCOMPLETE 4.98 4.09
38. (SAWS No. 10259) TOTAL 114.60 NO BID 99.20 NO BID NO BID 118.40 GROUP 99.60 81.80
10 ea. UNIT
Cap, size 3", end type slip on PRICE 13.69 11.85 14.14 INCOMPLETE 12.70 9.78
39. (SAWS No. 10261) TOTAL 136.90 NO BID 118.50 NO BID NO BID 141.40 GROUP 127.00 97.80
10 ea. UNIT
Cap, size 4", end type slip on PRICE 23.08 19.99 23.85 INCOMPLETE 21.55 16.48
40. (SAWS No. 10262) TOTAL 230.80 NO BID 199.90 NO BID NO BID 238.50 GROUP 215.50 164.80
20 ea. UNIT
Coupling, size 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 131 114 1.36 INCOMPLETE 1.29 0.94
41. (SAWS No. 11126) TOTAL 26.20 NO BID 22.80 NO BID NO BID 27.20 GROUP 25.80 18.80
30 ea. UNIT
Coupling, size 3/4", end type slip on PRICE 1.78 1.54 1.84 INCOMPLETE 1.68 1.27
42. (SAWS No. 11130) TOTAL 53.40 NO BID 46.20 NO BID NO BID 55.20 GROUP 50.40 38.10
50 ea. UNIT
Coupling, size 1", end type slip on PRICE 1.83 1.58 1.89 INCOMPLETE 1.75 1.30
43. (SAWS No. 11127) TOTAL 91.50 NO BID 79.00 NO BID NO BID 94.50 GROUP 87.50 65.00
30 ea. UNIT
Coupling, size 1 1/4", end type slip on PRICE 2.78 241 2.88 INCOMPLETE 2.59 1.99
44. (SAWS No. 11125) TOTAL 83.40 NO BID 72.30 NO BID NO BID 86.40 GROUP 77.70 59.70
20 ea. UNIT
Coupling, size 1 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 2.99 2.60 3.10 INCOMPLETE 2.89 2.14
45. (SAWS No. 11133) TOTAL 59.80 NO BID 52.00 NO BID NO BID 62.00 GROUP 57.80 42.80
30 ea. UNIT
Coupling, size 2", end type slip on PRICE 3.22 2.79 3.33 INCOMPLETE 3.05 2.30
46. (SAWS No. 11129) TOTAL 96.60 NO BID 83.70 NO BID NO BID 99.90 GROUP 91.50 69.00
20 ea. UNIT
Coupling, size 3", end type slip on PRICE 9.10 7.88 9.40 INCOMPLETE 8.49 6.50
47. (SAWS No. 11131) TOTAL 182.00 NO BID 157.60 NO BID NO BID 188.00 GROUP 169.80 130.00
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20 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 1/2", end type slip on x slip on, degree 45 PRICE 1.37 1.18 141 INCOMPLETE 1.29 0.98
48. (SAWS No. 11711) TOTAL 27.40 NO BID 23.60 NO BID NO BID 28.20 GROUP 25.80 19.60
40 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 1/2", end type slip on x slip on, degree 90 PRICE 0.73 0.64 0.75 INCOMPLETE 0.72 0.52
49. (SAWS No. 11732) TOTAL 29.20 NO BID 25.60 NO BID NO BID 30.00 GROUP 28.80 20.80
20 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 3/4", end type slip on x slip on, degree 45 PRICE 2.08 1.81 2.15 INCOMPLETE 1.99 1.49
50. (SAWS No. 11715) TOTAL 41.60 NO BID 36.20 NO BID NO BID 43.00 GROUP 39.80 29.80
50 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 3/4", end type slip on x slip on, degree 90 PRICE 0.93 0.82 0.96 INCOMPLETE 0.88 0.66
51. (SAWS No. 11736) TOTAL 46.50 NO BID 41.00 NO BID NO BID 48.00 GROUP 44.00 33.00
20 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 1", end type slip on x slip on, degree 45 PRICE 3.12 271 3.23 INCOMPLETE 2.95 2.23
52. (SAWS No. 11712) TOTAL 62.40 NO BID 54.20 NO BID NO BID 64.60 GROUP 59.00 44.60
50 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 1", end type slip on x slip on, degree 90 PRICE 1.50 1.30 1.55 INCOMPLETE 1.39 2.23
53. (SAWS No. 11733) TOTAL 75.00 NO BID 65.00 NO BID NO BID 77.50 GROUP 69.50 111.50
20 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 1 1/4", end type slip on x slip on, degree 45 PRICE 3.98 3.45 411 INCOMPLETE 3.75 2.85
54. (SAWS No. 11710) TOTAL 79.60 NO BID 69.00 NO BID NO BID 82.20 GROUP 75.00 57.00
40 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 1 1/4", end type slip on x slip on, degree 90 PRICE 2.00 1.74 2.07 INCOMPLETE 1.89 1.43
55. (SAWS No. 11731) TOTAL 80.00 NO BID 69.60 NO BID NO BID 82.80 GROUP 75.60 57.20
20 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 1 1/2", end type slip on x slip on, degree 45 PRICE 4.71 4.08 4.87 INCOMPLETE 4.38 3.36
56. (SAWS No. 11709) TOTAL 94.20 NO BID 81.60 NO BID NO BID 97.40 GROUP 87.60 67.20
50 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 1 1/2", end type slip on x slip on, degree 90 PRICE 2.14 1.87 2.22 INCOMPLETE 2.05 1.53
57. (SAWS No. 11730) TOTAL 107.00 NO BID 93.50 NO BID NO BID 111.00 GROUP 102.50 76.50
20 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 2", end type slip on x slip on, degree 45 PRICE 6.10 5.29 6.32 INCOMPLETE 5.69 4.36
58. (SAWS No. 11714) TOTAL 122.00 NO BID 105.80 NO BID NO BID 126.40 GROUP 113.80 87.20
40 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 2", end type slip on x slip on, degree 90 PRICE 2.59 2.25 2.67 INCOMPLETE 2.45 1.85
59. (SAWS No. 11735) TOTAL 103.60 NO BID 90.00 NO BID NO BID 106.80 GROUP 98.00 74.00
20 ea. UNIT
Elbow, size 3", end type slip on x slip on, degree 45 PRICE 15.60 13.51 16.12 INCOMPLETE 14.49 11.15
60. (SAWS No. 11716) TOTAL 312.00 NO BID 270.20 NO BID NO BID 322.40 GROUP 289.80 223.00
10 ea. UNIT
Elobw, size 3", end type slip on x slip on, degree 90 PRICE 6.80 5.90 7.03 INCOMPLETE 6.35 4.86
61. (SAWS No. 11737) TOTAL 68.00 NO BID 59.00 NO BID NO BID 70.30 GROUP 63.50 48.60
10 ea. UNIT
Plug, size 1/2" end type slip on PRICE 144 1.04 1.55 INCOMPLETE 121 114
62. (SAWS No. 14950) TOTAL 14.40 NO BID 10.40 NO BID NO BID 15.50 GROUP 12.10 11.40
50 ea. UNIT
Plug, size 3/4", end type slip on PRICE 1.34 1.16 1.38 INCOMPLETE 1.28 1.26
63. (SAWS No. 14909) TOTAL 67.00 NO BID 58.00 NO BID NO BID 69.00 GROUP 64.00 63.00
20 ea. UNIT
Plug, size 1", end type slip on PRICE 151 131 1.55 INCOMPLETE 1.42 1.43
64. (SAWS No. 14951) TOTAL 30.20 NO BID 26.20 NO BID NO BID 31.00 GROUP 28.40 28.60
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10 ea. UNIT
Plug, size 1 1/4", end type slip on PRICE 1.52 1.67 1.55 INCOMPLETE 1.88 1.81
65. (SAWS No. 14949) TOTAL 15.20 NO BID 16.70 NO BID NO BID 15.50 GROUP 18.80 18.10
20 ea. UNIT
Plug, size 1 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 211 1.83 2.18 INCOMPLETE 2.00 1.99
66. (SAWS No. 14948) TOTAL 42.20 NO BID 36.60 NO BID NO BID 43.60 GROUP 40.00 39.80
30 ea. UNIT
Plug, size 2", end type slip on PRICE 2.79 2.42 2.89 INCOMPLETE 2.62 2.63
67. (SAWS No. 14905) TOTAL 83.70 NO BID 72.60 NO BID NO BID 86.70 GROUP 78.60 78.90
20 ea. UNIT
Plug, size 2 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 16.98 16.99 9.75 INCOMPLETE 6.10 15.93
68. (SAWS No. 14952) TOTAL 339.60 NO BID 339.80 NO BID NO BID 195.00 GROUP 122.00 318.60
10 ea. UNIT
Plug, size 3", end type threaded PRICE 9.43 20.50 9.75 INCOMPLETE 7.35 19.20
69. (SAWS No. 14906) TOTAL 94.30 NO BID 205.00 NO BID NO BID 97.50 GROUP 73.50 192.00
10 ea. UNIT
Tee, size 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 2.04 1.77 212 INCOMPLETE 1.95 1.46
70. (SAWS No. ) TOTAL 20.40 NO BID 17.70 NO BID NO BID 21.20 GROUP 19.50 14.60
30 ea. UNIT
Tee, size 3/4", end type slip on PRICE 214 1.86 2.22 INCOMPLETE 2.00 1.53
71. (SAWS No. 16578) TOTAL 64.20 NO BID 55.80 NO BID NO BID 66.60 GROUP 60.00 45.90
20 ea. UNIT
Tee, size 1", end type slip on PRICE 2.68 2.32 2.78 INCOMPLETE 2.55 1.92
72. (SAWS No. 16537) TOTAL 53.60 NO BID 46.40 NO BID NO BID 55.60 GROUP 51.00 38.40
10 ea. UNIT
Tee, size 1 1/4", end type slip on PRICE 7.36 6.38 7.61 INCOMPLETE 6.90 5.26
73. (SAWS No. 16533) TOTAL 73.60 NO BID 63.80 NO BID NO BID 76.10 GROUP 69.00 52.60
10 ea. UNIT
Tee, size 1 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 7.36 6.38 7.61 INCOMPLETE 6.90 5.26
74. (SAWS No. 16531) TOTAL 73.60 NO BID 63.80 NO BID NO BID 76.10 GROUP 69.00 52.60
20 ea. UNIT
Tee, size 2", end type slip on PRICE 9.21 7.97 9.51 INCOMPLETE 8.59 6.58
75. (SAWS No. 16567) TOTAL 184.20 NO BID 159.40 NO BID NO BID 190.20 GROUP 171.80 131.60
10 ea. UNIT
Tee, size 3", end type slip on PRICE 12.52 10.84 12.93 INCOMPLETE 11.65 8.94
76. (SAWS No. 16574) TOTAL 125.20 NO BID 108.40 NO BID NO BID 129.30 GROUP 116.50 89.40
20 ea. UNIT
Tee, reducer, size 2" x 2" x 1" PRICE 6.23 5.40 6.45 INCOMPLETE 5.86 4.45
77. (SAWS No. 16653) TOTAL 124.60 NO BID 108.00 NO BID NO BID 129.00 GROUP 117.20 89.00
15ea. UNIT
Union, size 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 2.63 2.30 2.73 INCOMPLETE 2.55 1.45
78. (SAWS No. 16965) TOTAL 39.45 NO BID 34.50 NO BID NO BID 40.95 GROUP 38.25 21.75
15ea. UNIT
Union, size 3/4", end type slip on PRICE 3.42 2.92 3.53 INCOMPLETE 3.22 1.85
79. (SAWS No. 16990) TOTAL 51.30 NO BID 43.80 NO BID NO BID 52.95 GROUP 48.30 27.75
15ea. UNIT
Union, size 1", end type slip on PRICE 3.90 3.34 4.03 INCOMPLETE 3.61 212
80. (SAWS No. 16959) TOTAL 58.50 NO BID 50.10 NO BID NO BID 60.45 GROUP 54.15 31.80
15ea. UNIT
Union, size 1 1/4", end type slip on PRICE 7.75 6.63 8.00 INCOMPLETE 7.15 419
81. (SAWS No. 16954) TOTAL 116.25 NO BID 99.45 NO BID NO BID 120.00 GROUP 107.25 62.85
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15 ea. UNIT
Union, size 1 1/2", end type slip on PRICE 8.77 7.50 9.12 INCOMPLETE 8.10 4.75
82. (SAWS No. 16953) TOTAL 131.55 NO BID 112.50 NO BID NO BID 136.80 GROUP 121.50 71.25
15ea. UNIT
Union, size 2", end type slip on PRICE 11.89 10.18 12.29 INCOMPLETE 10.95 6.44
83. (SAWS No. 16981) TOTAL 178.35 NO BID 152.70 NO BID NO BID 184.35 GROUP 164.25 96.60
10 ea. UNIT
Union, size 3", end type slip on PRICE 22.15 18.94 22.88 INCOMPLETE 20.30 11.98
84. (SAWS No. 16985) TOTAL 221.50 NO BID 189.40 NO BID NO BID 228.80 GROUP 203.00 119.80
*
INCOMPLETE
TOTAL FOR ITEM NOS. 1-84 TOTAL 8,392.50 NO BID 7,431.70 NO BID NO BID 8,517.45 GROUP 7,661.35 6,161.95
C. PVC DRAIN, WASTE AND VENT (DWV) FITTINGS, NON-
PRESSURE APPLICATIONS
MFG.
Manufacturer Name NAME NO BID NO BID Lasco GPK & Trend
PRICE
Price Sheet SHEET NO BID NO BID Series D
EFF. DATE
Effective Date of Schedule OF SCH. NO BID NO BID 12/13/10
DISC. OFF
Discount Off Mfg. Price List MFG. PRICE NO BID NO BID 71%
D. SDR-26 PRESSURE PIPE FOR SEWER (SUPPLIED IN 14
LENGTHS)
MFG. Napco North American
Manufacturer Name NAME N. American JM Eagle Diamond Plastics JM Eagle Crestline Northern Diamond
PRICE
Price Sheet SHEET N/A N/A www.crestline.com
EFF. DATE
Effective Date of Schedule OF SCH. 6/1/11 N/A
DISC. OFF Current Block
Discount Off Mfg. Price List MFG. PRICE Net +10% N/A N/A 50-60%
3,500 feet UNIT
4" SDR-26 PRICE 1.10 0.94 1.18 0.95 INCOMPLETE 1.01
1. (SAWS No. 14780) TOTAL 3,850.00 3,290.00 NO BID 4,130.00 NO BID 3,325.00 GROUP 3,535.00 NO BID
15,000 feet UNIT
6" SDR-26 PRICE 2.34 197 2.56 1.99 INCOMPLETE 2.14
2. (SAWS No. 14787) TOTAL 35,100.00 29,550.00 NO BID 38,400.00 NO BID 29,850.00 GROUP 32,100.00 NO BID
12,000 feet UNIT
8" SDR-26 PRICE 4.21 3.56 4.62 3.60 INCOMPLETE 3.86
3. (SAWS No. 14791) TOTAL 50,520.00 42,720.00 NO BID 55,440.00 NO BID 43,200.00 GROUP 46,320.00 NO BID

12



http://www.crestline.com/
http://www.crestline.com/

F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 11-0275

>
SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM g g
P. 0. BOX 2449 . - - @
S g 5 2 3 L 03 f X g
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 w S s . 2 o | < & 5 K S 5 . 9 o N
TABULATION OF BIDS 3R = R 8500 50R gﬁﬁ z R §§;‘ EEE s R
_ 28 x g, 238 EEX 5 2 X 28 E0 3 B > x 8o X
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for PVC Schedule 40 and 80 SDR-26Pipe and S 0" 85 2 £ = =3 = g -~ SEZ g5 s g -
. K - . 599 © O S5 = Falif) S S o o =TI S 5 O
FOR: Fittings, Drain-Waste-Vent Fittings, Solvent Cement and Primer UEJ S E =l E ? g 5 % % g § S g _: 3z g g ;’ 5 Ze2 g S é
TIME & (June 1, 2011_thr0ugh May 31, 2012) Sz E g8/ ¢ £ a3 5 S E Sk E s S £ &S 3 = g (@) s 2 E
DATE: 3:00 p.m., April 30, 2008 2o < g g < £33 3~ < £ L < 58 < cw 2 a8 23 <
S35 38 & S3 8 595 S35 ob & £8¢2 388 So %
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY =00 << W ; — O L < n <o 0 T S wn S8 30 S0 Ww - 0
2,500 feet UNIT
10" SDR-26 PRICE 6.60 5.58 7.24 5.64 INCOMPLETE 6.05
4. (SAWS No. 14757) TOTAL 16,500.00 13,950.00 NO BID 18,100.00 NO BID 14,100.00 GROUP 15,125.00 NO BID
1,400 feet UNIT
12" SDR-26 PRICE 9.41 7.95 10.31 8.03 INCOMPLETE 8.62
5. (SAWS No. 14764) TOTAL 13,174.00 11,130.00 NO BID 14,434.00 NO BID 11,242.00 GROUP 12,068.00 NO BID
800 feet UNIT
18" SDR-26 PRICE 22.43 18.99 21.54 17.94 INCOMPLETE 19.70
6. (SAWS No. 14800) TOTAL 6,729.00 5,697.00 NO BID 6,462.00 NO BID 5,382.00 GROUP 5,910.00 NO BID
300 feet UNIT
21" SDR-26 PRICE 30.33 25.77 30.26 24.38 INCOMPLETE 28.10
7. (SAWS No. 14801) TOTAL 9,099.00 7,731.00 NO BID 9,078.00 NO BID 7,314.00 GROUP 8,430.00 NO BID
300 feet UNIT
24" SDR-26 PRICE 38.26 32.42 38.20 30.60 INCOMPLETE 35.80
8. (SAWS No. 14802) TOTAL 11,478.00 9,726.00 NO BID 11,460.00 NO BID 9,180.00 GROUP 10,740.00 NO BID
*
INCOMPLETE
TOTAL FOR ITEM NOS. 1-8 TOTAL 146,450.00 123,794.00 NO BID 157,504.00 NO BID 123,593.00 GROUP 134,228.00 NO BID
D1. SDR-26 PRESSURE PIPE FOR SEWER (SUPPLIED IN 20*
LENGTHS)
MFG. Napco Napco &
Manufacturer Name NAME N. American JM Eagle Diamond Plastics JM Eagle Northern Diamond
PRICE
Price Sheet SHEET N/A N/A
EFF. DATE
Effective Date of Schedule OF SCH. 6/1/11 N/A
DISC. OFF
Discount Off Mfg. Price List MFG. PRICE Net Current Block +10% N/A N/A
500 feet UNIT
4" SDR-26 PRICE 117 1.01 1.18 0.95 1.01
1. (SAWS No. 14784) TOTAL 585.00 505.00 NO BID 590.00 NO BID 475.00 NO BID 505.00 NO BID
500 feet UNIT
6" SDR-26 PRICE 252 214 2.56 1.99 2.14
2. (SAWS No. 14789) TOTAL 1,260.00 1,070.00 NO BID 1,280.00 NO BID 995.00 NO BID 1,070.00 NO BID
500 feet UNIT
8" SDR-26 PRICE 4.29 3.85 4.62 3.60 3.86
3. (SAWS No. 14793) TOTAL 2,145.00 1,925.00 NO BID 2,310.00 NO BID 1,800.00 NO BID 1,930.00 NO BID
300 feet UNIT
10" SDR-26 PRICE 6.65 6.04 7.24 5.64 6.05
4. (SAWS No. 14759) TOTAL 1,995.00 1,812.00 NO BID 2,172.00 NO BID 1,692.00 NO BID 1,815.00 NO BID
1,000 feet UNIT
12" SDR-26 PRICE 9.38 8.61 10.31 8.03 8.62
5. (SAWS No. 14766) TOTAL 9,380.00 8,610.00 NO BID 10,310.00 NO BID 8,030.00 NO BID 8,620.00 NO BID
*
TOTAL FOR ITEM NOS. 1-5 TOTAL 15,365.00 13,922.00 NO BID 16,662.00 NO BID 12,992.00 NO BID 13,940.00 NO BID
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D2. SDR-26 PRESSURE FITTINGS FOR SEWER
MFG. Plastic Trends
Manufacturer Name NAME Plastic Trends Plastic Trends Plastic Trends Harco GPK & Trend
PRICE
Price Sheet SHEET SDR 26 HW Series H SDR26 12/13/10 Series H
EFF. DATE
Effective Date of Schedule OF SCH. 12/13/2010 12/13/10 6-01-11 12/13/10
DISC. OFF
Discount Off Mfg. Price List MFG. PRICE Net 65% N/A 66%
15ea. UNIT
Cap PVC Gasketed 4" PRICE 8.01 8.45 8.201 1.74 9.50
1. (SAWS No. 10242) TOTAL 120.15 126.75 NO BID 123.02 NO BID 116.10 NO BID 142.50 NO BID
50 ea. UNIT
Cap PVC Gasketed 6" PRICE 18.73 19.74 19.172 18.07 18.65
2. (SAWS No. 10243) TOTAL 936.50 987.00 NO BID 958.60 NO BID 903.50 NO BID 932.50 NO BID
10 ea. UNIT
Cap PVC Slip On 8" PRICE 27.74 29.23 12.071 26.76 27.50
3. (SAWS No. 10247) TOTAL 277.40 292.30 NO BID 120.71 NO BID 267.60 NO BID 275.00 NO BID
10 ea. UNIT
Coupling Sewer 4" PRICE 9.88 10.41 8.806 9.52 9.85
4. (SAWS No. 11107) TOTAL 98.80 104.10 NO BID 88.06 NO BID 95.20 NO BID 98.50 NO BID
20 ea. UNIT
Coupling Sewer 6" PRICE 27.91 29.41 16.83 26.76 14.25
5. (SAWS No. 11108) TOTAL 558.20 588.20 NO BID 336.60 NO BID 535.20 NO BID 285.00 NO BID
15 ea. UNIT
Copling Sewer 8" PRICE 33.43 35.23 40.56 32.25 33.85
6. (SAWS No. 11109) TOTAL 501.45 528.45 NO BID 608.40 NO BID 483.75 NO BID 507.75 NO BID
5 ea. UNIT
Coupling Sewer 10" PRICE 49.70 52.37 50.85 47.94 49.20
7. (SAWS No. 11101) TOTAL 248.50 261.85 NO BID 254.25 NO BID 239.70 NO BID 246.00 NO BID
5ea. UNIT
Coupling Pressure 8" PRICE 33.43 35.23 40.56 32.25 33.85
8. (SAWS No. 11119) TOTAL 167.15 176.15 NO BID 202.80 NO BID 161.25 NO BID 169.25 NO BID
450 ea. UNIT
Elbow PVC 22 1/2 Deg 6" PRICE 22.42 23.63 22.94 21.63 17.15
9. (SAWS No. 11688) TOTAL 10,089.00 10,633.50 NO BID 10,323.00 NO BID 9,733.50 NO BID 7,717.50 NO BID
200 ea. UNIT
Elbow PVC 45 Deg 4" PRICE 8.96 9.44 9.16 8.65 6.85
10. (SAWS No. 11690) TOTAL 1,792.00 1,888.00 NO BID 1,832.00 NO BID 1,730.00 NO BID 1,370.00 NO BID
800 ea. UNIT
Elbow PVC 45 Deg 6" PRICE 16.45 17.33 16.83 15.87 15.50
11. (SAWS No. 11691) TOTAL 13,160.00 13,864.00 NO BID 13,464.00 NO BID 12,696.00 NO BID 12,400.00 NO BID
15 ea. UNIT
Elbow PVC 45 Deg 8" PRICE 39.65 41.78 40.56 38.24 39.30
12. (SAWS No. 11692) TOTAL 594.75 626.70 NO BID 608.40 NO BID 573.60 NO BID 589.50 NO BID
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50 ea. UNIT
Elbow PVC 90 Deg 4" PRICE 15.93 16.78 16.29 15.36 15.75
13. (SAWS No. 11694) TOTAL 796.50 839.00 NO BID 814.50 NO BID 768.00 NO BID 787.50 NO BID
10 ea. UNIT
Elbow PVC 90 Deg 8" PRICE 74.31 78.30 76.87 71.68 75.35
14. (SAWS No. 11695) TOTAL 743.10 783.00 NO BID 768.70 NO BID 716.80 NO BID 753.50 NO BID
100 ea. UNIT
Elbow PVC Gasket 90 Deg 6" PRICE 17.70 18.65 18.11 17.08 17.10
15. (SAWS No. 11696) TOTAL 1,770.00 1,865.00 NO BID 1,811.00 NO BID 1,708.00 NO BID 1,710.00 NO BID
5 ea. UNIT
Elbow PVC PRS/45 Deg 6" PRICE 12.15 17.33 12.43 15.87 17.15
16. (SAWS No. 11697) TOTAL 60.75 86.65 NO BID 62.15 NO BID 79.35 NO BID 85.75 NO BID
5ea. UNIT
Elbow PVC PRS/90 Deg 6" PRICE 17.70 18.65 18.11 17.08 17.10
17. (SAWS No. 11698) TOTAL 88.50 93.25 NO BID 90.55 NO BID 85.40 NO BID 85.50 NO BID
10 ea. UNIT
Reducer 10x8 SOC PVC PRICE 93.46 98.47 95.61 90.14 92.50
18. (SAWS No. 15120) TOTAL 934.60 984.70 NO BID 956.10 NO BID 901.40 NO BID 925.00 NO BID
10 ea. UNIT
Tee 8" PVC PRICE 60.23 63.45 61.61 58.09 57.60
19. (SAWS No. 16595) TOTAL 602.30 634.50 NO BID 616.10 NO BID 580.90 NO BID 576.00 NO BID
10 ea. UNIT
Tee Pressure 8" PVC PRICE 60.23 63.45 61.61 58.09 57.60
20. (SAWS No. 16649) TOTAL 602.30 634.50 NO BID 616.10 NO BID 580.90 NO BID 576.00 NO BID
25 ea. UNIT
Tee Sanitary 4" PVC PRICE 24.57 25.89 25.13 23.71 26.50
21. (SAWS No. 16654) TOTAL 614.25 647.25 NO BID 628.25 NO BID 592.75 NO BID 662.50 NO BID
400 ea. UNIT
Tee Sanitary 6" PVC PRICE 37.86 39.89 38.74 36.53 37.09
22. (SAWS No. 16655) TOTAL 15,144.00 15,956.00 NO BID 15,496.00 NO BID 14,612.00 NO BID 14,836.00 NO BID
10 ea. UNIT
Tee Sanitary 8" PVC PRICE 93.87 98.90 61.67 90.54 92.10
23. (SAWS No. 16657) TOTAL 938.70 989.00 NO BID 616.70 NO BID 905.40 NO BID 921.00 NO BID
30 ea. UNIT
Tee Sanitary 6" x 4" PVC PRICE 28.89 30.44 29.55 27.87 28.60
24. (SAWS No. 16656) TOTAL 866.70 913.20 NO BID 886.50 NO BID 836.10 NO BID 858.00 NO BID
30 ea. UNIT
Tee Sanitary 8" x 6" PVC End Type Gasket PRICE 41.71 43.95 42.67 40.23 40.85
25. (SAWS No. 17643) TOTAL 1,251.30 1,318.50 NO BID 1,280.10 NO BID 1,206.90 NO BID 1,225.50 NO BID
100 ea. UNIT
Tee Straight 4" PVC PRICE 21.71 22.31 21.66 20.43 20.80
26. (SAWS No. 16664) TOTAL 2,171.00 2,231.00 NO BID 2,166.00 NO BID 2,043.00 NO BID 2,080.00 NO BID
20 ea. UNIT
Tee Straight 6" x 4" PVC PRICE 26.22 27.63 26.827 25.29 25.95
27. (SAWS No. 16665) TOTAL 524.40 552.60 NO BID 536.54 NO BID 505.80 NO BID 519.00 NO BID
120 ea. UNIT
Tee Straight 6" PVC PRICE 28.98 30.54 29.65 27.96 28.45
28. (SAWS No. 16666) TOTAL 3,477.60 3,664.80 NO BID 3,558.00 NO BID 3,355.20 NO BID 3,414.00 NO BID
160 ea. UNIT
Tee Straight 8" x 6" PVC PRICE 40.70 42.88 41.64 39.26 39.95
29. (SAWS No. 16667) TOTAL 6,512.00 6,860.80 NO BID 6,662.40 NO BID 6,281.60 NO BID 6,392.00 NO BID
50 ea. UNIT
Tee Compo Wye 10" x 6" PVC includes 1/8 Bend PRICE 121.08 127.57 123.88 116.78 118.60
30. (SAWS No. 16599) TOTAL 6,054.00 6,378.50 NO BID 6,194.00 NO BID 5,839.00 NO BID 5,930.00 NO BID
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30 ea. UNIT
Wye 8" x 6" PVC PRICE 42.78 45.08 43.77 41.26 42.35
31. (SAWS No. 17629) TOTAL 1,283.40 1,352.40 NO BID 1,313.10 NO BID 1,237.80 NO BID 1,270.50 NO BID
50 ea. UNIT
Wye Sewer 6" PVC PRICE 32.96 34.73 33.72 31.80 30.20
32. (SAWS No. 17632) TOTAL 1,648.00 1,736.50 NO BID 1,686.00 NO BID 1,590.00 NO BID 1,510.00 NO BID
10 ea. UNIT
Wye Sewer 8" PVC PRICE 74.95 78.97 76.684 72.29 73.50
33. (SAWS No. 17633) TOTAL 749.50 789.70 NO BID 766.84 NO BID 722.90 NO BID 735.00 NO BID
40 ea. UNIT
Wye Tee 6" x 4" PVC PRICE 38.10 40.14 38.97 27.87 29.25
34. (SAWS No. 17642) TOTAL 1,524.00 1,605.60 NO BID 1,558.80 NO BID 1,114.80 NO BID 1,170.00 NO BID
5ea. UNIT
Wye Tee 15" x 6" PVC PRICE 230.34 242.69 235.66 222.17 225.60
35. (SAWS No. 17634) TOTAL 1,151.70 1,213.45 NO BID 1,178.30 NO BID 1,110.85 NO BID 1,128.00 NO BID
100 ea. UNIT
Adapter Bush 4" Sch 40 x 4" SDR 26 PRICE 10.95 11.55 11.20 10.57 7.75
36. (SAWS No. 9112) TOTAL 1,095.00 1,155.00 NO BID 1,120.00 NO BID 1,057.00 NO BID 775.00 NO BID
100 ea. UNIT
Adapter Bush 6" SCH 40 x 6" SDR 26 PRICE 20.96 22.09 21.45 20.22 27.40
37. (SAWS No. 9125) TOTAL 2,096.00 2,209.00 NO BID 2,145.00 NO BID 2,022.00 NO BID 2,740.00 NO BID
350 ea. UNIT
Bushing Reducer 6" x 4" PRICE 16.99 17.90 17.38 16.39 16.70
38. (SAWS No. 9994) TOTAL 5,946.50 6,265.00 NO BID 6,083.00 NO BID 5,736.50 NO BID 5,845.00 NO BID
100 ea. UNIT
Bushing Sewing Reducing 8" x 6" PRICE 34.08 35.91 34.87 36.67 33.55
39. (SAWS No. 9995) TOTAL 3,408.00 3,591.00 NO BID 3,487.00 NO BID 3,667.00 NO BID 3,355.00 NO BID
20 ea. UNIT
Bushing Reducer 8" x 6" PRICE 34.08 35.91 34.37 32.88 3351
40. (SAWS No. 16666) TOTAL 681.60 718.20 NO BID 687.40 NO BID 657.60 NO BID 670.20 NO BID
400 ea. UNIT
Cleanout 6" SDR-26 PVC 2-Way Heavy Wall PRICE 107.41 113.17 109.89 103.60 105.25
41. (SAWS No. 31633) TOTAL 42,964.00 45,268.00 NO BID 43,956.00 NO BID 41,440.00 NO BID 42,100.00 NO BID
50 ea. UNIT
Elbow PVC 22.50 Deg 4" PRICE 11.89 12.53 12.16 11.47 6.85
42. (SAWS No. 33165) TOTAL 594.50 626.50 NO BID 608.00 NO BID 573.50 NO BID 342.50 NO BID
*
TOTAL FOR ITEM NOS. 1-42 TOTAL 134,838.10 142,039.60 NO BID 137,268.97 NO BID 130,063.85 NO BID 128,711.95 NO BID
E. PVC CEMENT GLUE, HEAVY DUTY
100 Pint UNIT
PVC Cement, used for 1/2" to 12" PVC Pipe, Gray in Color PRICE 6.80 6.44 7.47 11.15 8.551 6.65
1. (SAWS No. 12990) TOTAL NO BID NO BID 680.00 644.00 747.00 1,115.00 855.10 665.00 NO BID
300 Quart UNIT
PVC Cement, Blue in Color PRICE 11.95 10.55 12.00 16.72 13.703 11.65
2. (SAWS No. 10311) TOTAL NO BID NO BID 3,585.00 3,165.00 3,600.00 5,016.00 4,110.90 3,495.00 NO BID
200 Pint UNIT
PVC Cement, Blue in Color PRICE 6.12 6.59 6.77 12.75 8.163 5.89
3. (SAWS No. 12992) TOTAL NO BID NO BID 1,224.00 1,318.00 1,354.00 2,550.00 1,632.60 1,178.00 NO BID
*
TOTAL FOR ITEM NOS. 1-3 TOTAL NO BID NO BID 5,489.00 5,127.00 5,701.00 8,681.00 6,598.60 5,338.00 NO BID
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F. PVC PRIMER
100 Quart UNIT
Type Surface Cleaner, Purple in color PRICE 5.82 6.81 12.74 1451 7.15
1. (SAWS No. 15022) TOTAL NO BID NO BID 582.00 681.00 1,274.00 1,451.00 NO BID 715.00 NO BID
250 Pint UNIT
Type PVC Cleaner PRICE 4.14 6.42 7.75 9.69 5.75
2. (SAWS No. 10492) TOTAL NO BID NO BID 1,035.00 1,605.00 1,937.50 2,422.50 NO BID 1,437.50 NO BID
*
TOTAL FOR ITEM NOS. 1-2 TOTAL NO BID NO BID 1,617.00 2,286.00 3,211.50 3,873.50 NO BID 2,152.50 NO BID
EXTENSION 1 123,794.00 13,259.45 29,579.00 128,711.95
EXTENSION 2 123,794.00 13,259.45 29,579.00 128,711.95
EXTENSION 3 123,794.00 13,259.45 29,579.00
Net 2% Net Net Net Net Net 0% Net
Terms 30 days 10 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days
Delivery Days 15 days 30 days 14 days 7-10 days 1-7 days 7-10 days
*DENOTES LOW BIDDER
BIDS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
John Deere Landscapes
Act Pipe & Supply Moore Supply Demandstar
Alamo Iron Works Morrison Supply SAWS Website

All Tex Pipe & Supply
AMC Industries

Big Country Waterworks
Ferguson Enterprises
Ferguson Waterworks

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.

Municipal Water Works Supply
PMI Steel Pipe

Ryan Herco

Techline Pipe, LLP

Williams Supply Co.
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