
04-0275
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for PVC Schedule 40 and 80 Pipe and Fittings
FOR: Drain-Waste-Vent Fittings and SDR-26 Pipe and Fittings
TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2005)
DATE:   3:00 p.m., December 16, 2004  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

A. SCHEDULE 40 PVC PRESSURE PIPE UNIT
(SUPPLIED IN 20' LENGTHS) PRICE

  TOTAL
UNIT

 PRICE
Manufacturer TOTAL No Bid

UNIT
 PRICE
Price Sheet TOTAL No Bid

UNIT
PRICE

Date TOTAL No Bid
UNIT
PRICE

Discount TOTAL No Bid
 UNIT
5,000 feet PRICE

1. 1/2" sch 40 PVC (Item No. 3767) TOTAL No Bid
 UNIT
10,000 feet PRICE

2. 3/4" sch 40 PVC (Item No. 3770) TOTAL No Bid
 UNIT  
5,000 feet PRICE

3. 1" sch 40 PVC (Item No. 3768) TOTAL No Bid
 UNIT
3,000 feet PRICE

4. 1-1/4" sch 40 PVC (Item No. 3766) TOTAL No Bid
 UNIT
3,000 feet PRICE

5. 1-1/2" sch 40 PVC (Item No. 3745) TOTAL No Bid
UNIT

5,000 feet PRICE
6. 2" sch 40 PVC (Item No. 3746) TOTAL No Bid

M
S 

Te
ch

lin
e 

Pi
pe

 L
LP

43
14

 D
iv

id
en

d 
D

r.
Sa

n 
A

nt
on

io
, T

X
 

B
ID

 N
O

T 
TA

B
U

LA
TE

D
-

C
O

PY
 W

A
S 

SU
B

M
IT

TE
D

A
ct

 P
ip

e 
&

 S
up

pl
y 

C
o.

47
19

  D
od

ge
 S

t.
Sa

n 
A

nt
on

io
, T

X
 7

82
17

1



04-0275
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for PVC Schedule 40 and 80 Pipe and Fittings
FOR: Drain-Waste-Vent Fittings and SDR-26 Pipe and Fittings
TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2005)
DATE:   3:00 p.m., December 16, 2004  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY M
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UNIT
2,000 feet PRICE

7. 2-1/2" Schedule 40 PVC (Item No. 3769) TOTAL No Bid
 UNIT
3,000 feet PRICE

8. 3" Schedule 40 PVC (Item No. 3747) TOTAL No Bid
 UNIT
2,000 feet PRICE

9. 4" Schedule 40 PVC (Item No. 3771) TOTAL No Bid
  

 
 TOTAL FOR ITEM NOS 1-9 TOTAL No Bid
  UNIT

PRICE
A1. SCHEDULE 40 PVC PRESSURE FITTINGS TOTAL
  UNIT

 PRICE
 Manufacturer TOTAL No Bid

 UNIT

PRICE  
 Price Sheet TOTAL No Bid

 UNIT
PRICE  

 Date TOTAL No Bid
 UNIT

PRICE  
 Discount TOTAL No Bid
B. SCHEDULE 80 PVC PRESSURE PIPE UNIT

(SUPPLIED IN 20' LENGHTS) PRICE
  TOTAL

 UNIT
 PRICE  

 Manufacturer TOTAL No Bid
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TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for PVC Schedule 40 and 80 Pipe and Fittings
FOR: Drain-Waste-Vent Fittings and SDR-26 Pipe and Fittings
TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2005)
DATE:   3:00 p.m., December 16, 2004  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY M
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UNIT
 PRICE  

 Price Sheet TOTAL No Bid
UNIT
PRICE  

Date TOTAL No Bid
UNIT
PRICE  

Discount TOTAL No Bid
UNIT

5,000 feet PRICE  
1. 1/2" Schedule 80 PVC (Item No. 3774) TOTAL No Bid

 UNIT
10,000 feet PRICE  

2. 1" Schedule 80 PVC (Item No. 3775) TOTAL No Bid
 UNIT
2,000 feet PRICE  

3. 1-1/4" Schedule 80 PVC (Item No. 3773) TOTAL No Bid
 UNIT
2,000 feet PRICE  

4. 1-1/2" Schedule 80 PVC (Item No. 3772) TOTAL No Bid
UNIT

10,000 feet PRICE  
5. 2" Schedule 80 PVC (Item No. 3777) TOTAL No Bid

UNIT

2,000 feet PRICE  
6. 2-1/2" Schedule 80 PVC (Item No. 3776) TOTAL No Bid

UNIT

2,000 feet PRICE  
7. 3" Schedule 80 PVC (Item No. 3779) TOTAL No Bid
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PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for PVC Schedule 40 and 80 Pipe and Fittings
FOR: Drain-Waste-Vent Fittings and SDR-26 Pipe and Fittings
TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2005)
DATE:   3:00 p.m., December 16, 2004  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY M
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  UNIT
2,000 feet PRICE  

8. 4" Schedule 80 PVC (Item No. 3780) TOTAL No Bid
 UNIT

2,000 feet PRICE  
9. 6" Schedule 80 PVC (Item No. 3744) TOTAL No Bid
  UNIT

1,000 feet PRICE  
10. 8" Schedule 80 PVC (Item No. 18268) TOTAL No Bid

   
 TOTAL FOR ITEM NOS. 1-10 TOTAL No Bid
  UNIT

 PRICE
B1. SCHEDULE 80 PVC PRESSURE FITTINGS TOTAL

 UNIT
 PRICE  

 Manufacturer TOTAL No Bid
UNIT

 PRICE  
 Price Sheet TOTAL No Bid

UNIT
 PRICE  

 Date TOTAL No Bid
 UNIT
 PRICE  

 Discount TOTAL No Bid
 UNIT
PVC DRAIN, WASTE, AND VENT (DWV) PRICE

C. FITTINGS, NON-PRESSURE APPLICATIONS TOTAL
 UNIT
 PRICE  

 Manufacturer TOTAL No Bid
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UNIT
 PRICE  

 Price Sheet TOTAL No Bid
UNIT

 PRICE  
 Date TOTAL No Bid

 UNIT

 PRICE  
 Discount TOTAL No Bid
  

SDR-26 PIPE FOR SEWER 
D. (SUPPLIED IN 13' LENGTHS)

UNIT
 PRICE
Manufacturer TOTAL No Bid

  UNIT

 PRICE  
 Price Sheet TOTAL No Bid

UNIT

PRICE  
Date TOTAL No Bid

UNIT

PRICE  
Discount TOTAL No Bid
 UNIT

10,000 feet PRICE 1.04
1. 4" SDR-26 (Item No. 3761) TOTAL 10,400.00
  UNIT

12,000 feet PRICE 2.18
2. 6" SDR-26 (Item No. 3784) TOTAL 26,160.00
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FOR: Drain-Waste-Vent Fittings and SDR-26 Pipe and Fittings
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ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY M
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 UNIT

15,000 feet PRICE 3.93
3. 8" SDR-26 (Item No. 3764) TOTAL 58,950.00

 UNIT

4,000 feet PRICE 6.17
4. 10" SDR-26 (Item No. 3757) TOTAL 24,680.00

UNIT

3,000 feet PRICE 20.98
5. 18" SDR-26 (Item No. 12211) TOTAL 62,940.00

  

 TOTAL FOR ITEM NOS. 1-5 TOTAL 183,130.00
  UNIT

SDR-26 PIPE FOR SEWER PRICE

D1. (SUPPLIED IN 20' LENGTHS) TOTAL

 UNIT

 PRICE North Amer.
 Manufacturer TOTAL JM Pipe

UNIT

 PRICE  
 Price Sheet TOTAL

Date

Discount
UNIT

2,000 feet PRICE 1.11
1. 4" SDR-26 (Item No. 3762) TOTAL 2,220.00
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FOR: Drain-Waste-Vent Fittings and SDR-26 Pipe and Fittings
TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2005)
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ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY M
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 UNIT

2,000 feet PRICE 2.34
2. 6" SDR-26 (Item No. 3763) TOTAL 4,680.00

 UNIT

2,000 feet PRICE 4.22
3. 8" SDR-26 (Item No. 3765) TOTAL 8,440.00

 UNIT

1,000 feet PRICE 6.62
4. 10" SDR-26 (Item No. 3781) TOTAL 6,620.00

UNIT

1,000 feet PRICE 9.44
5. 12" SDR-26 (Item No. 3782) TOTAL 9,440.00

TOTAL FOR ITEM NOS 1-5 TOTAL 31,400.00
  UNIT
  PRICE
D2. SDR-26 FITTINGS FOR SEWER TOTAL

 UNIT
 PRICE

 Manufacturer TOTAL Plastic Trends
 UNIT
 PRICE

 Price  Sheet TOTAL
 UNIT
 PRICE

 Date TOTAL 38,159.00
 UNIT
 PRICE

 Discount TOTAL 56%
 UNIT
 PRICE

E. PVC CEMENT GLUE, HEAVY-DUTY TOTAL
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TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2005)
DATE:   3:00 p.m., December 16, 2004  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY M
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400 pint UNIT
PVC Cement, used for 1/2" to 12" PVC PRICE

1. Pipe, Gray in color (Item No. 11650) TOTAL No Bid
UNIT

200 quart PRICE
2. PVC Cement, Blue in Color (Item No. 10555) TOTAL No Bid

 UNIT
600 pint PRICE

3. PVC Cement, Blue in Color (Item No. 10556) TOTAL No Bid
  
  

 TOTAL FOR ITEM NOS. 1-3 TOTAL No Bid
 UNIT

PRICE
F. PVC PRIMER TOTAL
 200 quart UNIT

Type Surface Cleaner, Purple in Color   PRICE
1. (Item No. 10557) TOTAL No Bid

 UNIT
600 pint PRICE

2. Type PVC Cleaner (Item No. 10447) TOTAL No Bid

TOTAL FOR ITEM NOS. 1-2 TOTAL No Bid

TERMS Net 30 days

DELIVERY DAYS Stk 30 days
 

BIDS WERE MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Act Pipe & Supply Morrison Supply Co. Demandstar
AMC Industrial PMI SAWS website
Ferguson Enterprices, Inc. Ryan Herco
Hughes Supply US Filter Dist.
Moore Supply Co.
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