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GROUP | STANDARD REPAIR CLAMPS, MULTIPLE BAND B
10 ea. (SAWS #10397)
Clamp, full circle repair, size 4" x 12", Range A PRICE 55.38 59.99 94.38 89.84 86.49
4.74-5.57, material stainelss steel TOTAL 553.80 599.90 943.80 898.40 864.90
1. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 227-000-48012-000 Smith Blair 227 Powerseal 3122-4BX12 Ford F2-557-125 Ford F2-557x12.5
100 ea. (SAWS #10403) UNIT
Clamp, full circle repair, size 6" x 15", Range A 6.62- PRICE 65.92 71.81 120.73 107.79 109.75
7.42, material stainless steel TOTAL 6,592.00 7,181.00 12,073.00 10,779.00 10,975.00
2. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 227-000-66315-000 Smith Blair 227 Powerseal 3122-6AX16 Ford F2-742-15 F2-742x15
150 ea. (SAWS #10379) UNIT
Clamp, full circle repair, size 6" x 15", Range B 7.20- PRICE 68.38 74.48 120.73 113.06 115.00
8.00, material stainless steel TOTAL 10,257.00 11,172.00 18,109.50 16,959.00 17,250.00
3. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 227-000-72015-000 Smith Blair 227 Powerseal 3122-6XX16 Ford F2-800-15 F2-800-15
30 ea. (SAWS #10401) UNIT
Clamp, full circle repair, size 8" x 15", Range A 8.50- PRICE 74.38 80.58 128.05 122.56 121.00
9.37, material stainless steel TOTAL 2,231.40 2,417.40 3,841.50 3,676.80 3,630.00
4, Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 227-00085015-000 Smith Blair 227 Powerseal 3122-8AX16 Ford F2-942-15 F2-942x15
10 ea. (SAWS #10402) UNIT
Clamp, full circle repair, size 8" x 15", Range B 9.25- PRICE 84.86 91.92 128.05 134.83 129.75
10.05, material stainless steel TOTAL 848.60 919.20 1,280.50 1,348.30 1,297.50
5. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 227-00092515-000 Smith Blair 227 Powerseal 3122-8XX16 Ford F2-1005-15 F2-1005x15
5ea. (SAWS #10380) UNIT
Clamp, full circle repair, size 10" x 15", Range A PRICE 84.78 92.31 141.93 169.78 163.75
11.04 - 12.24, material stainless steel TOTAL 423.90 461.55 709.65 848.90 818.75
6. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 227-00111015-050 Smith Blair 227 Powerseal 3122-10CX16 Ford F2W-1224-15 F2W-1224x15
10 ea. (SAWS #10383) UNIT
Clamp, full circle repair, size 12" x 15", Range PRICE 92.20 100.43 149.96 183.37 176.95
A13.14-14.34, material stainless steel TOTAL 922.00 1,004.30 1,499.60 1,833.70 1,769.50
7. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 227-00132015-050 Smith Blair 227 Powerseal 3122-12CX16 Ford F2W-1434-15 F2W-1434x15
10 ea. (SAWS #10382) UNIT
Clamp, full circle repair, size 12" x 15", Range B PRICE 92.52 100.76 149.96 216.19 208.75
13.64 - 14.85, material stainless steel TOTAL 925.20 1,007.60 1,499.60 2,161.90 2,087.50
8. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 227-00136515-050 Smith Blair 227 Powerseal 3122-12DX16 Ford F3-1485-15 F3-1485x15
20 ea. (SAWS #10384) UNIT
Clamp, full circle repair, size 16" x 10", Range A PRICE 97.32 100.40 104.90 141.78 139.75
18.08 - 18.84, material stainless steel TOTAL 1,946.40 2,008.00 2,098.00 2,835.60 2,795.00
9. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 228-20180810-000 Smith Blair 228 Powerseal 3122-16AX10 Ford F2-1880-10 F2-1884x10
25 ea. (SAWS #10385) UNIT
Size 16" x 20", Range B 17.15 - 17.90, material PRICE 215.70 222.53 232.50 265.63 275.00
stainless steel TOTAL 5,392.50 5,563.25 5,812.50 6,640.75 6,875.00
10. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 228-20171520-000 Smith Blair 228 Powerseal 16BX20 Ford F2-1790-20 F2-1790x20
10 ea. (SAWS #10386) UNIT
Clamp, full circle repair, size 16" x 20", Range C PRICE 229.72 237.00 247.67 275.40 270.00
18.46 - 19.21, material stainless steel TOTAL 2,297.20 2,370.00 2,476.70 2,754.00 2,700.00
11. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 228-20184620-000 Smith Blair 228 Powerseal 3122-16CX20 Ford F2-1921-20 F2-1921x20
10 ea. (SAWS #10389) UNIT
Clamp, full circle repair, size 20" x 10", Range A PRICE 234.20 241.62 260.14 157.33 162.00
22.90 - 23.65, material stainless steel TOTAL 2,342.00 2,416.20 2,601.40 1,573.30 1,620.00
12. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 228-20229010-000 Smith Blair 228 Powerseal 3122-20AX10 Ford F2-2365-10 F2-2365x10
10 ea. (SAWS #10390) UNIT
Full circle repair, size 20" x 20", Range B 21.52 - 22.27, PRICE 248.74 256.60 268.09 296.56 295.00
material stainless steel TOTAL 2,487.40 2,566.00 2,680.90 2,965.60 2,950.00
13. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 228-20215220-000 Smith Blair 228 Powerseal 3122-20BX20 Ford F2-2227-20 F2-2227-20
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5ea. (SAWS #10387) UNIT
Clamp, full circle repair, size 20" x 20", Range C PRICE 236.68 242.94 253.87 306.82 294.58
23.21 - 23.97, material stainless steel TOTAL 1,183.40 1,214.70 1,269.35 1,534.10 1,472.90
14, Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair Smith Blair 228 Powerseal 3122-20CX20 Ford F2-2397-20 F2-2397-20
5 ea. (SAWS #10392) UNIT
Clamp, full circle repair, size 24" x 10", Range A PRICE 241.75 249.42 260.65 299.23 287.95
27.28 - 28.34, material stainless steel TOTAL 1,208.75 1,247.10 1,303.25 1,496.15 1,439.75
15. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair Smith Blair 228 Powerseal 3123-24XX10 Ford F3-2834-10 F3-2834-10
5ea. (SAWS #10394) UNIT
Clamp, full circle repair, size 24" x 20", Range B PRICE 313.16 323.08 337.51 548.95 595.00
25.70 - 26.80, material stainless steel TOTAL 1,565.80 1,615.40 1,687.55 2,744.75 2,975.00
16. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 228-20257020-00 Smith Blair 228 Powerseal 3123-24XX20 Ford F3-2680-20 F3-26880x20
10 ea. (SAWS #10391) UNIT
Clamp, full circle repair, size 24" x 20", Range C PRICE 335.42 346.03 361.60 583.51 579.00
27.65-28.75, material stainless steel TOTAL 3,354.20 3,460.30 3,616.00 5,835.10 5,790.00
17. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 228-20276520-000 Smith Blair 228 Powerseal 3123-24XX20 Ford F3-2875-20 F3-2875x20
TOTAL GROUP | TOTAL 44,531.55 47,223.90 63,502.80 66,885.35 67,310.80
GROUP Il |[STANDARD TAPPED CLAMP COUPLINGS *
20 ea. (SAWS #10462) UNIT
Clamp, tapped, size 6" x 2" IP, Range A 6.62 - 7.42, PRICE 198.00 126.52 134.99 131.17 128.50
material stainless steel TOTAL 3,960.00 2,530.40 2,699.80 2,623.40 2,570.00
1. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 239-00066315-014 Smith Blair 239 Powerseal 3132-6AX16X2ip Ford F2-742-15-1P7 F2-742-15-1P7
20 ea. (SAWS #10461) UNIT
Clamp, tapped, size 6" x 2" IP, Range B 7.20 - 8.00, PRICE 125.85 126.52 134.99 138.07 135.25
material stainless steel TOTAL 2,517.00 2,530.40 2,699.80 2,761.40 2,705.00
2. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 239-00072015-XXX Smith Blair 239 Powerseal 3132-6XX16X2ip Ford F2-800-15-1P7 F2-800-15-1P7
15ea. (SAWS #10463) UNIT
Clamp, tapped, size 8" x 2" IP, Range A 8.50 - 9.37, PRICE 130.92 132.29 141.15 145.61 142.50
material stainless steel TOTAL 1,963.80 1,984.35 2,117.25 2,184.15 2,137.50
3. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 239-00085015-014 Smith Blair 239 Powerseal 3132-8AX16X2ip Ford F2-942-15-1P7 F2-942-15-1P7
15ea. (SAWS #10464) UNIT
Clamp, tapped, size 8" x 2" IP, Range B 9.25 - 10.05, PRICE 130.92 132.29 141.15 383.20 142.50
material stainless steel TOTAL 1,963.80 1,984.35 2,117.25 5,748.00 2,137.50
4. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 239-00092515-014 Smith Blair 239 Powerseal 3132-8XX16X2ip Ford F2-1005-15-1P7 F2-1005-15-1P7
5ea. (SAWS #10457) UNIT
Clamp, tapped, size 10" x 2" IP, Range A11.04- PRICE 148.84 147.34 159.64 642.65 218.15
12.24, material stainless steel TOTAL 744.20 736.70 798.20 3,213.25 1,090.75
5. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 230-40003804-012 Smith Blair 230 Powerseal 3132-10CX16X2ip | Ford F2W-1224-15-1P7 F2W-1224-15-1P7
10 ea. (SAWS #10458) UNIT
Clamp, tapped, size 12" x 2" IP, Range A13.14- PRICE 155.40 157.02 167.54 687.97 235.50
14.34, material stainless steel TOTAL 1,554.00 1,570.20 1,675.40 6,879.70 2,355.00
6. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 230-40003804-010 Smith Blair 230 Powerseal 3132-12CX16X2ip | Ford F2W-1434-15-1P7 F2W-1434-15-1P7
10 ea. (SAWS #10459) UNIT
Clamp, Tapped, size 12" x 2" IP, Range B 13.65- PRICE 162.74 164.43 167.54 797.45 273.40
14.85, material stainless steel TOTAL 1,627.40 1,644.30 1,675.40 7,974.50 2,734.00
7. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 230-40003804-017 Smith Blair 230 Powerseal 3132-12XX16X2ip Ford F3-1485-15-1P7 F3-1485-15-1P7
TOTAL GROUP I TOTAL 14,330.20 12,980.70 13,783.10 31,384.40 15,729.75
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GROUP 11l |[STANDARD DUCTILE IRON COUPLING =
UNIT
200 ea. (SAWS #10992) PRICE 12.96 13.26 14.10 15.26 15.85
Coupling, cast, size 2", Range 2.34" - 2.6" TOTAL 2,592.00 2,652.00 2,820.00 3,052.00 3,170.00
1. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 441-00000263-900 Smith Blair 441 Powerseal 3501-2 Ford FC1-263-263 FC1-263x263
UNIT
25 ea. (SAWS #11000) PRICE 31.24 31.91 33.68 27.13 26.75
Coupling, cast, size 4", Range 4.80-5.10 TOTAL 781.00 797.75 842.00 678.25 668.75
2. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 441-00000510-900 Smith Blair 441 Powerseal 3501-4 Ford FC1-510-510 FC1-510x510
UNIT
100 ea. (SAWS #11002) PRICE 44.80 45.75 48.30 37.01 37.25
Coupling, cast, size 6", Range A 6.90-7.22 TOTAL 4,480.00 4,575.00 4,830.00 3,701.00 3,725.00
3. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 441-00000722-900 Smith Blair 441 Powerseal 3501-6 Ford FC1-720-720 FC1-720x720
UNIT
30 ea. (SAWS #11003) PRICE 61.22 62.53 66.03 49.39 51.50
Coupling, cast, size 8", Range A 9.05-9.45 TOTAL 1,836.60 1,875.90 1,980.90 1,481.70 1,545.00
4, Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 441-00000945-900 Smith Blair 441 Powerseal 3501-8 Ford FC1-940-940 FC1-940x940
UNIT
4 ea. (SAWS #10987) PRICE 72.38 72.41 69.95 74.32 79.00
Coupling, cast, size 10", Range A 11.10-11.60 TOTAL 289.52 289.64 279.80 297.28 316.00
5. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 441-00001160-900 Smith Blair 441 Powerseal 3501-10 Ford FC1-1146-1146 FC1-1146x1146
UNIT
20 ea. (SAWS #10988) PRICE 93.04 94.99 112.52 98.00 95.50
Coupling, cast, size 12", Range A 13.20-13.50 TOTAL 1,860.80 1,899.80 2,250.40 1,960.00 1,910.00
6. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 441-00001350-900 Smith Blair 441 Powerseal 3501-12 Ford FC1-1356-1356 FC1-1356x1356
UNIT
6 ea. (SAWS #10989) PRICE 103.34 106.56 112.52 94.10 95.75
Coupling, cast, size 12", Range B 13.78-14.38 TOTAL 620.04 639.36 675.12 564.60 574.50
7. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 441-14201375-900 Smith Blair 441 Powerseal 3501-12 Ford FC2A-1438-1438 FC2A-1438x1438
UNIT
10 ea. (SAWS #10990) PRICE 196.86 176.73 175.50 181.89 262.81
Coupling, cast, size 16", Range A 17.40-17.80 TOTAL 1,968.60 1,767.30 1,755.00 1,818.90 2,628.10
8. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 441-00001780-900 Smith Blair 441 Powerseal 3501-16 Ford FC2A-1780-1780 FC2A-1780x1780
UNIT
10 ea. (SAWS #10991) PRICE 164.72 168.16 175.50 181.89 262.81
Coupling, cast, size 16", Range B 18.46-19.00 TOTAL 1,647.20 1,681.60 1,755.00 1,818.90 2,628.10
9. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 441-19201890-000 Smith Blair 441 Powerseal Ford FC2A-1897-1897 FC2A-1897x1897
UNIT
10 ea. (SAWS #10993) PRICE 204.90 204.91 232.00 292.16 346.00
Coupling, cast, size 20", Range A 21.35-21.75 TOTAL 2,049.00 2,049.10 2,320.00 2,921.60 3,460.00
10. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 411-00216007-003 Smith Blair 411 Powerseal 3501-20 Ford FC2A-2206-2206 FC2A-2206x2206
UNIT
10 ea. (SAWS #10994) PRICE 203.18 203.18 232.00 292.16 346.00
Coupling, cast, size 20", Range B 21.75-22.25 TOTAL 2,031.80 2,031.80 2,320.00 2,921.60 3,460.00
11. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 411-00220607-000 Smith Blair 411 Powerseal 3501-20 Ford FC2A-2206-2206 FC2A-2206x2206
UNIT
5ea. (SAWS #10995) PRICE 306.00 305.93 325.00 496.83 482.00
Coupling, cast, size 24", Range A 25.00-25.80 TOTAL 1,530.00 1,529.65 1,625.00 2,484.15 2,410.00
12. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 413-25802-500 Smith Blair 413 Powerseal 3501-24 Ford FC2A-2632-2632 FC2A-2632x2632
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UNIT
5ea. (SAWS #10996) PRICE 287.00 286.99 325.00 496.83 482.00
Coupling, cast, size 24", Range B 26.10-26.32 TOTAL 1,435.00 1,434.95 1,625.00 2,484.15 2,410.00
13. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 411-00263208-003 Smith Blair 411 Powerseal 3501-24 Ford FC2A-2632-2632 FC2A-2632x2632
TOTAL GROUP Il TOTAL 23,121.56 23,223.85 25,078.22 26,184.13 28,905.45
GROUPV [BELL JOINT LEAK CLAMPS UNIT *
40 ea. (SAWS #10375) PRICE 109.96 111.12 118.56 122.34 165.00
Clamp, bell joint leak, size 6", material ductile iron TOTAL 4,398.40 4,444.80 4,742.40 4,893.60 6,600.00
epoxy coated, includes gaskets, nuts & bolts range
6.90-7.10 Smith Blair
1. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL 274-00000690-000 Smith Blair 274 Powerseal 3232-6 JCM 143-0690E 516-740 BJLC
15ea. (SAWS #10376) UNIT
Clamp, bell joint leak, size 8", material ductile iron PRICE 151.92 153.51 163.80 154.25 224.00
epoxy coated, includes gaskets, nuts & bolts range TOTAL 2,278.80 2,302.65 2,457.00 2,313.75 3,360.00
9.05-9.30 Smith Blair
2. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL 274-00000905-000 Smith Blair 274 Powerseal 3232-8 JCM 143-0905-E 516-930 BJLC
6 ea. (SAWS #10369) UNIT
Clamp, bell joint leak, size 10", material ductile iron PRICE 190.89 189.94 205.82 202.13 305.00
epoxy coated, includes gaskets, nuts & bolts range TOTAL 1,145.34 1,139.64 1,234.92 1,212.78 1,830.00
11.10-11.40 Smith Blair
3. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL 274-00001110-000 Smith Blair 274 Powerseal 3232-10 JCM 143-1110-E 516-1140 BJLC
6 ea. (SAWS #10370) UNIT
Clamp, bell joint leak, size 12", material ductile iron PRICE 206.48 208.62 222.61 228.72 322.00
epoxy coated, includes gaskets, nuts & bolts range TOTAL 1,238.88 1,251.72 1,335.66 1,372.32 1,932.00
13.20 - 13.50 Smith Blair
4, Make and Model MAKE/MODEL 274-00001320-000 Smith Blair 274 Powerseal 3232-12 JCM 143-1320-E 516-1365 BJLC
3ea. (SAWS #10371) UNIT
Clamp, bell joint leak, size 16", material ductile iron PRICE 322.42 320.81 347.59 651.06 649.50
epoxy coated, includes gaskets, nuts & bolts range TOTAL 967.26 962.43 1,042.77 1,953.18 1,948.50
17.40 - 17.80 Smith Blair
5. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL 274-0001740-000 Smith Blair 274 Powerseal 3232-16 JCM 143-1740-E 418-1780 BJLC
2 ea. (SAWS #10372) UNIT
Clamp, bell joint leak, size 20", material ductile iron PRICE 520.32 517.71 560.93 841.49 875.00
epoxy coated, includes gaskets, nuts & bolts range TOTAL 1,040.64 1,035.42 1,121.86 1,682.98 1,750.00
21.60 - 22.06 Smith Blair
6. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL 274-00002160-000 Smith Blair 274 Powerseal 3232-20 JCM 143-2160-E 418-2206 BJLC
5ea. (SAWS #10373) UNIT
Clamp, bell joint leak, size 24" material ductile iron PRICE 592.58 589.59 638.85 945.75 935.00
epoxy coated, includes gaskets, nuts & bolts range TOTAL 2,962.90 2,947.95 3,194.25 4,728.75 4,675.00
25.80 - 26.32 Smith Blair
7. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL 274-0002580-000 Smith Blair 274 Powerseal 3232-24 JCM 143-2580-E 418-2632 BJLC
TOTAL GROUP V TOTAL 14,032.22 14,084.61 15,128.86 18,157.36 22,095.50
GROUP VI |REDI CLAMPS UNIT *
25 ea. (SAWS #10437) PRICE 4.05 4.02 13.17 4.15 9.39
Clamp, Redi, size 1/2", length 3", material stainless steel TOTAL 101.25 100.50 329.25 103.75 234.75
1. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 245-00008403-000 Smith Blair 245 Powerseal 3151 - 1/2 x 3 JCM 110-0084-3 FLSC-084-3 Ford
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100 ea. (SAWS #10443) PRICE 4.12 4.12 13.32 4.20 9.75
Clamp, Redi, size 3/4", length 3", material stainless steel TOTAL 412.00 412.00 1,332.00 420.00 975.00
2. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 245-00010503-000 Smith Blair 245 Powerseal 3151- 3/4 x 3 JCM 110-0105-3 FLSC-084-3 Ford
UNIT
40 ea. (SAWS #10436) PRICE 4.56 4.54 13.92 4.68 9.95
Clamp, Redi, size 1", length 3", material stainless steel TOTAL 182.40 181.60 556.80 187.20 398.00
3. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 245-00013203-000 Smith Blair 245 Powerseal 3151-1 x 3 JCM 110-0132-3 FLSC-105-3
UNIT
20 ea. (SAWS #10438) PRICE 4,94 4.95 15.74 511 10.10
Clamp, Redi, size 1-1/2", length 3", material stainless steel TOTAL 98.80 99.00 314.80 102.20 202.00
4, Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 245-00019003-000 Smith Blair 245 Powerseal 3151- 1 1/2 x 3 JCM 110-0190-3 FLSC-132-3
UNIT
10 ea. (SAWS #10439) PRICE 4.82 4.74 14.01 4.89 9.94
Clamp, Redi, size 1-1/4", length 3", material stainless steel TOTAL 48.20 47.40 140.10 48.90 99.40
5. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 245-00016603-000 Smith Blair 245 Powerseal 3151- 1 1/4 x 3 JCM 110-0166-3 FLSC-190-3
UNIT
50 ea. (SAWS #10440) PRICE 10.10 10.10 31.38 10.43 23.45
Clamp, Redi, size 2", length 6", material stainless steel TOTAL 505.00 505.00 1,569.00 521.50 1,172.50
6. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 245-00023806-000 Smith Blair 245 Powerseal 3151- 2 x 6 JCM 110-0238-3 FLSC-166-3
UNIT
10 ea. (SAWS #10441) PRICE 13.80 13.81 35.99 14.25 26.05
Clamp, Redi, size 2-1/2", length 6", material stainless steel TOTAL 138.00 138.10 359.90 142.50 260.50
7. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 245-00028806-000 Smith Blair 245 Powerseal 3151- 2 1/2 x 6 JCM 110-0288-6 FLSC-238-6
UNIT
10 ea. (SAWS #10442) PRICE 14.82 14.85 37.38 15.32 27.95
Clamp, Redi, size 3", length 6", material stainless steel TOTAL 148.20 148.50 373.80 153.20 279.50
8. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 245-00035006-000 Smith Blair 245 Powerseal 3151- 3 x 6 JCM 110-0350-6 FLSC-288-6
UNIT
10 ea. (SAWS #10445) PRICE 15.76 15.77 39.47 16.28 28.95
Clamp, Redi, size 4, length 6", material stainless steel TOTAL 157.60 157.70 394.70 162.80 289.50
9. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 245-00045006-000 Smith Blair 245 Powerseal 3151- 4 x 6 JCM 110-0450-6 FLSC-350-6
TOTAL GROUP VI TOTAL 1,791.45 1,789.80 5,370.35 1,842.05 3,911.15
GROUP X [TRANSITION COUPLING *
5ea. (SAWS #11243) UNIT
Coupling, transition, size 10", range DI 11.10 - 11.50 x PRICE No Bid 65.58 69.95 77.12
AC 11.60 - 12.12 TOTAL 327.90 349.75 8 385.60
1. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 441 Powerseal 3501-10BXC = FC2A1140-1212
20 ea. (SAWS #11232) UNIT S
Coupling, transition, size 12", range DI 13.20 - 13.50 PRICE No Bid 100.12 112.52 B E 99.95
AC 13.90 - 14.2 TOTAL 2,002.40 2,250.40 < 4 1,999.00
2. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 441 Powerseal 3501-12BXC :: % FC2A-1350-1438
5 ea. (SAWS #11234) UNIT o Q
Coupling, transition, size 16", range 17.40 - 17.40 to PRICE No Bid 176.73 177.62 E (2) 175.00
17.40-17.80 TOTAL 883.65 888.10 ) 875.00
3. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 441 Powerseal 3501-16B 8 FC2A-1780-1780
5ea. (SAWS #11235) UNIT o
Coupling, transition, size 16", range 17.40 - 17.80 x PRICE No Bid 176.73 177.62 175.00
18.46 - 19.00 TOTAL 883.65 888.10 875.00
4. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 441 Powerseal 3501-16BXC FC2A-1780-1897
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3ea. (SAWS #11237) UNIT
Coupling, transition, size 20", range 21.60 - 22.06 PRICE No Bid 219.88 234.54 315.00
TOTAL 659.64 703.62 945.00
5. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 413 Powerseal 3501-20B FC2A-2206-2206
3ea. (SAWS #11229) UNIT
Coupling, tranisition, size 20", range 21.50 - 22.17 x PRICE No Bid 219.88 234.54 379.00
23.35-23.92 TOTAL 659.64 703.62 8 1,137.00
6. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 413 Powerseal-20BXC = FC5-2580-2632-A10R
3ea. (SAWS #11239) UNIT E w
Coupling, transition, size 24", range 25.30 - 25.80 x PRICE No Bid 301.25 329.79 B E 379.00
26.10 26.32 TOTAL 903.75 989.37 < 4 1,137.00
7. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 413 Powerseal 3501-24AXB :: % FC5-2580-2632-A10R
3ea. (SAWS #11230) UNIT o Q
Coupling, transition, size 24", range 25.75 - 26.42 x PRICE No Bid 309.08 329.79 E (2) 2,025.00
27.95 -28.62 TOTAL 927.24 989.37 ) 6,075.00
8. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 413 Powerseal 3501-24BXC 8 Romac RTC400
3ea. (SAWS #11238) UNIT o
Coupling, transition, size 24", range 25.80 x 26.32, PRICE No Bid 301.25 329.79 379.00
material steel TOTAL 903.75 989.37 1,137.00
9. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair Powerseal 3501-24A FC5-2580-2632-A10R
No Bid
TOTAL GROUP X TOTAL 8,151.62 8,751.70 14,565.60
GROUP XI |DRESSER COUPLING UNIT *
65 ea. (SAWS #11011) PRICE 10.30 5.67 No Bid 5.98 9.50
Coupling, 65B Dresser, size 1/2", material galvanized range TOTAL 669.50 368.55 388.70 617.50
1. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 525-00008400-003 Smith Blair 525 JCM 220-0084-L Romac 702-0.84
140 ea. (SAWS #10971) UNIT
Coupling, dresser, size 3/4", end type comp x comp, material  [PRICE 6.32 6.34 No Bid 6.99 10.25
galvanized, style 65 long range TOTAL 884.80 887.60 978.60 1,435.00
2. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 525-00010500-003 Smith Blair 525 JCM 220-0105-L Romac 702-1.05
100 ea. (SAWS #11010) UNIT
Coupling, dresser, size 1", end type comp x comp material PRICE 8.54 8.56 No Bid 9.43 11.70
galvanized, style 65B long range TOTAL 854.00 856.00 943.00 1,170.00
3. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 525-00013200-003 Smith Blair 525 JCM 220-0132-L Romac 702-1.32
UNIT
30 ea. (SAWS #10968) PRICE 11.86 11.86 No Bid 13.07 16.25
Coupling, 65B Dresser, size 1-1/2", material galvanized range [TOTAL 355.80 355.80 392.10 487.50
4, Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 525-00019000-003 Smith Blair 525 JCM 220-0190-L Romac 702-1.90
UNIT
20 ea. (SAWS #10969) PRICE 14.42 10.41 No Bid 11.48 14.35
Coupling, 65B dresser, size 1-1/4", material galvanized range  [TOTAL 288.40 208.20 229.60 287.00
5. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 525-00016600-003 Smith Blair 525 JCM 220-0166-L Romac 702-1.66
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ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY L < »n TS wn < <t 0 E n 0 E ©
UNIT
50 ea. (SAWS #10970) PRICE 14.60 14.61 No Bid 18.30 20.75
coupling, 65B dresser, size 2", material galvanized range TOTAL 730.00 730.50 915.00 1,037.50
6. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 525-00023800-003 Smith Blair 525 JCM 220-0238-L Romac 702-2.38
No Bid
TOTAL GROUP XI TOTAL 3,782.50 3,406.65 3,847.00 5,034.50
Net Net 2% Net 0%
Terms 30 days 30 days 20 days 30 days 20 days
Delivery Days 7-10 days 7-10 days 10 days 5-7 days 7-21 days
*DENOTES LOW BIDDER
BIDS INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
Act Pipe & Supply Mueller Co. Demastar
Cascade Water Works Municipal Water Works Supply SAWS Website
Ferguson Waterworks PMI Steel Pipe

HD Supply Waterworks
Morrison Supply Co.

Romac Industries
William Supply Co.




