
04-0019A
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for 
FOR: Repair Clamps, Couplings and Saddles
TIME & (Date of Award through May 31, 2006)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., March 30, 2004  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

GROUP I REPAIR CLAMPS, MULTIPLE BAND
210 ea.   (SAWS #6345) *

Clamp, full circle repair, size 4" x 12", Range PRICE 46.24 47.09 48.64 72.45 54.96 62.67
A4.74-5.57, material stainless steel TOTAL 9,710.40 9,888.90 10,214.40 15,214.50 11,541.60 13,160.70

1. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3122 Powerseal 3122 Powerseal 3122 JCM 102-048-12 S/B 227-048012-000 CDR2-557-12.5
1,450 ea.   (SAWS #6348) UNIT  
Clamp, full circle repair, size 6" x 12", Range PRICE 70.06 71.37 73.72 74.49 79.28 87.90

 A6.62-7.42, mateiral stainless steel TOTAL 101,587.00 103,486.50 106,894.00 108,010.50 114,956.00 127,455.00
2. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3122 Powerseal 3122 Powerseal 3122 JCM 102-0663-12 S/B 227-066315-000 CDR2-742-15

3,000 ea.   (SAWS #6349) UNIT  
Clamp, full circle repair, size 6" x 15", Range PRICE 70.06 71.37 73.72 74.49 85.57 94.50
B7.20-8.00, material stainless steel TOTAL 210,180.00 214,110.00 221,160.00 223,470.00 256,710.00 283,500.00

3. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3122 Powerseal 3122 Powerseal 3122 JCM 102-0750-15 S/B 227-072015-000 CDR2-800-15
300 ea.   (SAWS #6352) UNIT  
Clamp, fill circle repair, size 8" x 15", Range PRICE 71.70 73.00 75.41 84.69 92.29 100.61
A8.50-9.37, material stainless steel TOTAL 21,510.00 21,900.00 22,623.00 25,407.00 27,687.00 30,183.00

4. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3122 Powerseal 3122 Powerseal 3122 JCM 102-0863-15 S/B 227-085015-000 CDR2-937-15
800 ea.   (SAWS #6353) UNIT  
Clamp, fill circle repair, size 8" x 15", Range PRICE 71.68 73.00 75.41 107.14 112.06 130.68
B9.25-10.05, material stainless steel TOTAL 57,344.00 58,400.00 60,328.00 85,712.00 89,648.00 104,544.00

5. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3122 Powerseal 3122 Powerseal 3122 JCM 102-0940-15 S/B 227-092515-000 CDR2-1005-15
 60 ea.   (SAWS #6331) UNIT  

Clamp, full circle repair, size 10" x 15", Range PRICE 117.86 118.83 122.75 117.35 129.78 131.24
A 11.04-12.24, material stainless steel TOTAL 7,071.60 7,129.80 7,365.00 7,041.00 7,786.80 7,874.40

6. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3122 Powerseal 3123 Powerseal 3122 JCM 102-1110-15 S/B 227-111015-050 CDR3-1224-15
100 ea.   (SAWS #6332) UNIT  
Clamp, full circle repair, size 12" x 15", Range PRICE 119.32 121.51 125.52 122.45 140.33 231.27
A13.14-14.34, material stainless steel TOTAL 11,932.00 12,151.00 12,552.00 12,245.00 14,033.00 23,127.00

7. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3122 Powerseal 3123 Powerseal 3122 JCM 102-1320-15 S/B 227-132015-050 CDR3-1434-15
150 ea.   (SAWS #6333) UNIT  
Clamp, full circle repair, size 12" x 15", Range PRICE 119.30 121.51 125.52 124.49 142.45 232.90
B13.64-14.85, material stainless steel TOTAL 17,895.00 18,226.50 18,828.00 18,673.50 21,367.50 34,935.00

8. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3122 Powerseal 3123 Powerseal 3122 JCM 102-1365-15 S/B 227-136515-050 CDR3-1485-15
 20 ea.   (SAWS #6331) UNIT  

Clamp, full circle repair, size 16" x 10", Range PRICE 87.24 87.93 90.83 183.67 148.21 155.05
A18.08-18.84, material stainless steel TOTAL 1,744.80 1,758.60 1,816.60 3,673.40 2,964.20 3,101.00

9. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3122 Powerseal 3122 Powerseal 3122 JCM 102-1846-12 S/B 228-20180810-000 CDR2-1884-10
50 ea.   (SAWS #6335) UNIT  
Clamp, full circle repair, size 16" x 20", Range PRICE 169.22 172.36 178.04 193.08 282.09 290.71
B17.15-17.90, material stainless steel TOTAL 8,461.00 8,618.00 8,902.00 9,654.00 14,104.50 14,535.50

10. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3122 Powerseal 3122 Powerseal 3122 JCM 102-1740-18 S/B 228-171520-000 CDR2-1790-20
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P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for 
FOR: Repair Clamps, Couplings and Saddles
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25 ea.  (SAWS #6364) UNIT *  
Clamp, full circle repair, size 16" x 20", Range PRICE 169.22 172.36 178.04 198.98 291.71 301.47
C18.46-19.21, material stainless steel TOTAL 4,230.50 4,309.00 4,451.00 4,974.50 7,292.75 7,536.75

11. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3122 Powerseal 3122 Powerseal 3122 JCM 102-1846-18 S/B 228-184620-000 CDR2-1921-20
10 ea.   (SAWS #6336) UNIT  
Clamp, full circle repair, size 20" x 10", Range PRICE 98.80 98.56 101.80 183.67 166.95 172.17
A22.90-23.65, material stainless steel TOTAL 988.00 985.60 1,018.00 1,836.70 1,669.50 1,721.70

12. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3122 Powerseal 3122 Powerseal 3122 JCM 102-2260-12 S/B 228-229010-000 CDR2-2365-10
10 ea.   (SAWS #6337) UNIT  
Clamp, full circle repair, size 20" x 20", Range PRICE 101.79 101.51 203.48 270.41 314.65 324.59
B21.52-22.27, material stainless steel TOTAL 1,017.90 1,015.10 2,034.80 2,704.10 3,146.50 3,245.90

13. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3122 Powerseal 3122 Powerseal 3122 JCM 102-2140-18 S/B 228-215220-000 CDR2-2227-20
 5 ea.   (SAWS #6338) UNIT  

Clamp, full circle repair, size 20" x 20", Range PRICE 193.44 197.00 203.48 275.51 540.07 339.15
C23.21-23.97, material stainless steel TOTAL 967.20 985.00 1,017.40 1,377.55 2,700.35 1,695.75

14. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3122 Powerseal 3122 Powerseal 3122 JCM 102-2260-18 S/B 228-30232020-000 CDR2-2397-20
5 ea.   (SAWS #6340) UNIT  
Clamp, full circle repair, size 24" x 10", Range PRICE 133.32 134.47 138.80 219.39 577.30 320.25
A27.28-28.34, material stainless steel TOTAL 666.60 672.35 694.00 1,096.95 2,886.50 1,601.25

15. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3122 Powerseal 3122 Powerseal 3123 JCM 102-2800-12 S/B 228-272810-000 CDR3-2834-10
5 ea.   (SAWS #6341) UNIT  
Clamp, full circle repair, size 24" x 20", Range PRICE 236.02 237.90 245.74 306.12 538.22 604.29
B25.70-26.80, material stainless steel TOTAL 1,180.10 1,189.50 1,228.70 1,530.60 2,691.10 3,021.45

16. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3122 Powerseal 3123 Powerseal 3123 JCM 102-2580-12 S/B 228-30257020-000 CDR3-2680-20
 10 ea.  (SAWS #6339) UNIT  

Clamp, full circle repair, size 24" x 20", Range PRICE 236.02 237.90 245.74 306.12 572.25 638.89
C27.65-28.75, material stainless steel TOTAL 2,360.20 2,379.00 2,457.40 3,061.20 5,722.50 6,388.90

17. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3122 Powerseal 3123 Powerseal 3123 JCM 102-2800-18 S/B 228-276520-000 CDR3-2875-20

TOTAL GROUP I TOTAL 458,846.30 467,204.85 483,584.30 525,682.50 586,907.80 667,627.30
 UNIT

PRICE
A. Percent of discount offered TOTAL 50% 50% 35% 66%

 UNIT
 PRICE

B. Product identification (Mfg.) TOTAL Powerseal Powerseal Powerseal Smith Blair
  UNIT

 PRICE Powerseal
C. Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc. TOTAL Dealer Price Book List Mfg. List
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 UNIT
 PRICE *

D. Price schedule number TOTAL July 1, 2001 N/A July 1, 2001
 UNIT
 PRICE

E. Date of price schedule TOTAL July 1, 2001 July 1, 2001 July 1, 2001 Sept. 30, 2002
  UNIT

Price schedule column on which discoun PRICE 66% Off List
F. is based (I.e., distributor, net, wholesale TOTAL Distributor Wholesale  X.34 Mut.
GROUP II TAPPED CLAMP COUPLINGS

400 ea.  (SAWS #6365) UNIT  
Clamp, tapped, size 6" x 2" IP, Range A6.62 PRICE 80.92 81.58 84.27 107.14 98.50 90.98
7.42, material stainless steel TOTAL 32,368.00 32,632.00 33,708.00 42,856.00 39,400.00 36,392.00

1. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3132 Powerseal 3132 Powerseal 3132 JCM 104-0663-7X14 S/B 239-066315-014 CDRT2-742-12.5-21P
400 ea.  (SAWS #6327) UNIT  
Clamp, tapped, size 6" x 2" IP, Range B7.20 PRICE 80.92 81.58 84.27 107.14 104.79 99.08
8.00 material stainless steel TOTAL 32,368.00 32,632.00 33,708.00 42,856.00 41,916.00 39,632.00

2. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3132 Powerseal 3132 Powerseal 3132 JCM 104-0720-7X14 S/B 239-072015-014 CDRTZ-800-12.5-21P
250 ea.  (SAWS #6328) UNIT  
Clamp, tapped, size 8" x 2" IP, Range A8.50 PRICE 82.58 83.25 85.99 141.84 107.74 99.52
9.37, material stainless steel TOTAL 20,645.00 20,812.50 21,497.50 35,460.00 26,935.00 24,880.00

3. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3132 Powerseal 3132 Powerseal 3132 JCM 104-0863-7X14 S/B 239-085015-014 CDRTZ2-937-12.5-21P
100 ea.  (SAWS #6329) UNIT  
Clamp, tapped, size 8" x 2" IP, Range B9.25 PRICE 82.58 83.25 85.99 141.84 127.83 126.12
10.05, material stainless steel TOTAL 8,258.00 8,325.00 8,599.00 14,184.00 12,783.00 12,612.00

4. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3132 Powerseal 3132 Powerseal 3132 JCM 104-0740-7X14 S/B 239-092515-014 CDRT2-1005-12.5-21P
10 ea.  (SAWS #6326) UNIT  
Clamp, tapped, size 10" x 2" IP, Range A11.04 PRICE 94.62 95.39 98.53 153.06 137.17 194.71
12.24, material stainless steel TOTAL 946.20 953.90 985.30 1,530.60 1,371.70 1,947.10

5. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3132 Powerseal 3132 Powerseal 3132 JCM 104-1110-12X14 S/B 230-40003804-012 CDRT3-1224-12.5-21P
100 ea.  (SAWS #6324) UNIT  
Clamp, tapped, size 12" x 2" IP, Range A13.14 PRICE 102.28 104.19 107.62 162.25 148.36 194.71
14.34, material stainless steel TOTAL 10,228.00 10,419.00 10,762.00 16,225.00 14,836.00 19,471.00

6. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3132 Powerseal 3132 Powerseal 3132 JCM 104-1320-12X14 S/B 230-40003804-010 CDRT3-1434-12.5-21P
70 ea.  (SAWS #6325) UNIT  
Clamp, Tapped, size 12" x 2" IP, Range B13.65- PRICE 102.28 104.19 107.62 163.27 149.52 217.48
14.85, material stainless steel TOTAL 7,159.60 7,293.30 7,533.40 11,428.90 10,466.40 15,223.60

7. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3132 Powerseal 3132 Powerseal 3132 JCM 104-1365-12X14 S/B 230-4000-3804-017 CDRT3-1485-12.5-21P
   
  *

 TOTAL GROUP II TOTAL 111,972.80 113,067.70 116,793.20 164,540.50 147,708.10 150,157.70

3



04-0019A
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for 
FOR: Repair Clamps, Couplings and Saddles
TIME & (Date of Award through May 31, 2006)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., March 30, 2004  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY C
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 UNIT
PRICE *

A. Percent of discount offered TOTAL 50% 50% 35% 66%
 UNIT
 PRICE

B. Product identification (Mfg.) TOTAL Poweseal Poweseal Poweseal Smith Blair
  UNIT

 PRICE Powerseal
C. Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc. TOTAL Dealer Price Book List Mfg. List

 UNIT
 PRICE

D. Price schedule number TOTAL July 1, 2001 N/A July 1, 2001
 UNIT
 PRICE

E. Date of price schedule TOTAL July 1, 2001 July 1, 2001 July 1, 2001 Sept. 30, 2002
  UNIT  

Price schedule column on which discoun PRICE  66% Off List
F. is based (I.e., distributor, net, wholesale TOTAL Distributor Wholesale  X.34 Mut.
GROUP III DUCTILE IRON COUPLING   

 UNIT
300 ea.  (SAWS #5002) PRICE 9.14 9.30 10.13 11.74 12.96 18.43
Coupling, cast, size 2", Range 2.34" - 2.6" TOTAL 2,742.00 2,790.00 3,039.00 3,522.00 3,888.00 5,529.00

1. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3501 Powerseal 3501 Powerseal 3501 JCM 210-0250 S/B 441-0263-900 CRC-2-2.32-2.87
 UNIT
100 ea.  (SAWS #5074) PRICE 19.64 20.00 21.19 20.41 26.61
Coupling, cast, size 4", Range 4.80-5.10 TOTAL 1,964.00 2,000.00 2,119.00 2,041.00 2,661.00 No Bid 

2. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3501 Powerseal 3501 Powerseal 3501 JCM 210-0480 S/B 441-0510-900  
 UNIT
2,400 ea.  (SAWS #5075) PRICE 25.36 25.86 27.39 39.80 34.14
Coupling, cast, size 6", Range A6.90-7.22 TOTAL 60,864.00 62,064.00 65,736.00 95,520.00 81,936.00 No Bid 

3. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3501 Powerseal 3501 Powerseal 3501 JCM 210-0690 S/B 441-0722-900  
 UNIT
300 ea.  (SAWS #5076) PRICE 34.12 34.73 36.80 39.80 43.16
Coupling, cast, size 8", Range A9.05-9.45 TOTAL 10,236.00 10,419.00 11,040.00 11,940.00 12,948.00 No Bid 

4. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3501 Powerseal 3501 Powerseal 3501 JCM 210-0905 S/B 441-0945-900  
 UNIT
30 ea.  (SAWS #5069) PRICE 59.62 60.12 63.69 61.23 59.92
Coupling, cast, size 10", Range A11.10-11.60 TOTAL 1,788.60 1,803.60 1,910.70 1,836.90 1,797.60 No Bid 

5. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3501 Powerseal 3501 Powerseal 3501 JCM 210-1110 S/B 441-1160-900  
 UNIT
200 ea.  (SAWS #5070) PRICE 77.07 78.50 83.17 69.39 72.15
Coupling, cast, size 12", Range A13.20-13.5 TOTAL 15,414.00 15,700.00 16,634.00 13,878.00 14,430.00 No Bid 

6. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3501 Powerseal 3501 Powerseal 3501 JCM 210-1320 S/B 441-1350-900  

4
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 UNIT *
75 ea.  (SAWS #5071) PRICE 77.07 78.50 83.17 81.63 72.15
Coupling, cast, size 12", Range B13.78-14.38 TOTAL 5,780.25 5,887.50 6,237.75 6,122.25 5,411.25 No Bid 

7. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3501 Powerseal 3501 Powerseal 3501 JCM 210-1420 S/B 441-1420-900  
 UNIT
60 ea.  (SAWS #5072) PRICE 158.22 161.17 170.75 147.96 161.42
Coupling, cast, size 16", Range A17.40-17.80 TOTAL 9,493.20 9,670.20 10,245.00 8,877.78 9,685.20 No Bid 

8. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3501 Powerseal 3501 Powerseal 3501 JCM 210-1780 S/B 441-1780-900  
 UNIT
50 ea.  (SAWS #5073) PRICE 158.22 161.17 170.75 230.65 161.42
Coupling, cast, size 16", Range B18.46-19.00 TOTAL 7,911.00 8,058.50 8,537.50 11,532.50 8,071.00 No Bid 

9. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3501 Powerseal 3501 Powerseal 3501 Romac 501-1297 S/B 441-1890-900  
 UNIT
50 ea.  (SAWS #5038) PRICE 176.41 179.68 190.36 265.67 217.48
Coupling, cast, size 20", Range A21.35-21.75 TOTAL 8,820.50 8,984.00 9,518.00 13,283.50 10,874.00 No Bid 

10. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3501 Powerseal 3501 Powerseal 3501 Romac 501-2175 S/B 411-216007-003  
 UNIT
50 ea.  (SAWS #5039) PRICE 176.41 179.68 190.36 265.67 220.92
Coupling, cast, size 20", Range B21.75-22.25 TOTAL 8,820.50 8,984.00 9,518.00 13,283.50 11,046.00 No Bid 

11. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3501 Powerseal 3501 Powerseal 3501 Romac 501-2225 S/B 411-220607-003  
 UNIT
50 ea.  (SAWS #5041) PRICE 272.68 277.71 294.21 405.16 315.17
Coupling, cast, size 24", Range A25.00-25.80 TOTAL 13,634.00 13,885.50 14,710.50 20,258.00 15,758.50 No Bid 

12. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3501 Powerseal 3501 Powerseal 3501 Romac 501-25-80 S/B 411-258008-003  
 UNIT
10 ea.  (SAWS #5044) PRICE 272.68 277.71 294.21 405.16 325.97
Coupling, cast, size 24", Range B26.10-26.32 TOTAL 2,726.80 2,777.10 2,942.10 4,051.60 3,259.70 No Bid 

13. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Powerseal 3501 Powerseal 3501 Powerseal 3501 Romac 501-26-32 S/B 411-263208-003  
  
  *

 TOTAL GROUP III TOTAL 150,194.85 153,023.40 162,187.55 206,147.03 181,766.25 5,529.00
 UNIT

PRICE  
A. Percent of discount offered TOTAL 40% 50% 35% 66%

 UNIT
 PRICE  

B. Product identification (Mfg.) TOTAL Powerseal Powerseal Powerseal Smith Blair
  UNIT

 PRICE  Powerseal     
C. Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) TOTAL Dealer Pirce Book List  Mfg. List  

 UNIT
 PRICE       

D. Price schedule number TOTAL July 1, 2001 N/A July 1, 2001    
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for 
FOR: Repair Clamps, Couplings and Saddles
TIME & (Date of Award through May 31, 2006)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., March 30, 2004  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY C
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 UNIT
 PRICE *      

E. Date of price schedule TOTAL July 1, 2001 July 1, 2001 July 1, 2001  Sept. 30, 2002  
  UNIT

Price schedule column on which discount PRICE     66% Off List  
F. is based (I.e., distributor, net, wholesale) TOTAL Distributor Wholesale   X.34 Mut.  

Terms Net Net Net Net Net Net
30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

Delivery Days 7-10 days 8-10 days 7-28 days 7-10 days 5-10 days  

1
*DENOTES LOW BIDDER

BIDS INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Act Pipe & Supply Mueller Co. Demastar
Cascade Waterworks National Waterworks SAWS Website
Ferguson Waterworks Powerseal
Hughes Supply Romac Industries
James Jones Co.
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