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ITEMNO.  DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY [ ] S a0 = o 0 << Wn Z0n 4K =60
ITEM1 |Approx. 2,500 per year UNIT 1%
Bowl #609450, Caroma, dual gravity flush sydney smart re¢ PRICE 8 _ 118.00 No Bid No Bid
outlet toilet bowl TOTAL x XS 295,000.00
Approx. 2,500 per year UNIT oM
Tank #622322, Caroma, dual gravity flush sydney smart re: PRICE % E E 40.70 No Bid No Bid
outlet toilet tank TOTAL 4E5 101,750.00
T
o
TOTAL ITEM I - ONE YEAR TOTAL = 396,750.00 No Bid No Bid
*
TOTAL ITEM I - TWO YEARS TOTAL 793,500.00 (@] (@)
ITEM II [Approx. 2,500 per year UNIT E = E a
Sloan 8186-0.5 battery powered optima urinal flush valve witl PRICE 221.15 232.00 226.80 224.00 < <Z( < @
smart sense featur TOTAL 552,875.00 580,000.00 567,000.00 560,000.00 35 3 353
Approx. 2,500 per year UNIT m o mZ
Item #3982628, Sloan, Regal 186-0.5-XL 1/2 gpf manual urine PRICE 56.98 59.50 58.30 59.60 |<£ = |<£ ®)
flush valve with sweat adapter kit and set screw escutcheo TOTAL 142,450.00 148,750.00 145,750.00 149,000.00 — 8 — =
Approx. 2,500 per year UNIT o = o0
Item #3301081, Sloan, manual urinal flush valve A43A 0.5 gr PRICE 14.93 15.40 15.10 16.50 Z Ie) Z %
diaphragm replacement ki TOTAL 37,325.00 38,500.00 37,750.00 41,250.00 Q Pz Q O
Approx. 2,500 per year UNIT [a1] [a1]
Item #3325003, Sloan, optima battery powered EBV-1023-A PRICE 21.56 22.25 21.80 23.25
0.5 gpf diaphragm replacement ki TOTAL 53,900.00 55,625.00 54,500.00 58,125.00
Approx. 2,500 per year UNIT
Item #K4960, Kohler, white bardon wall hung 1.0 gpf to| PRICE 105.63 110.00 108.25 109.00
spud VC urinal TOTAL 264,075.00 275,000.00 270,625.00 272,500.00
Approx. 2,500 per year UNIT
Item #K5016, Kohler, white dexter wall hung 1.0 gpf to| PRICE 63.91 66.00 64.95 68.00
spud VC urinal TOTAL 159,775.00 165,000.00 162,375.00 170,000.00
TOTAL ITEM Il -1 YEAR TOTAL 1,210,400.00 1,262,875.00 1,238,000.00 1,250,875.00
*
TOTAL ITEM II - 2 YEARS TOTAL 2,420,800.00 2,525,750.00 2,476,000.00 2,501,750.00
Net Net Net 2%
Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 20 days
Delivery Day:
*DENOTES LOW BIDDER 1
BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY
Act Pipe & Supply Moore Supply Co. Demandstat
Allen & Allen Morrison Supply Co. SAWS Website

Ferguson Enterprise
HD Supply

Native Nations Procurement Serv., Inc




