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ITEM | |SAFETY VEST
UNIT
350 ea. PRICE 6.75 7.97 7.63 8.06 8.06 8.63 8.20 8.20 10.33 10.50 12.80 15.65 15.80 16.60 18.12 20.00|
1. Safety Vest in Size Mediun TOTAL 2,362.50] 2,789.50] 2,670.50] 2,821.00] 2,821.00] 3,020.50] 2,870.00] 2,870.00] 3,615.50] 3,675.00] 4,480.00 5,477.50] 5,530.00] 5,810.00] 6,342.00| 7,000.00|
UNIT
900 ea. PRICE 6.95 8.19 7.84 8.28 8.28 8.69 8.45 8.43 10.33 10.50 12.80 15.65 15.80 16.60 18.12 20.00|
2. Safety Vest in Size Large TOTAL 6,255.00] 7,371.00] 7,056.00 7,452.00] 7,452.00] 7,821.00] 7,605.00 7,587.00] 9,297.00] 9,450.00] 11,520.00 14,085.00 14,220.00 14,940.00 16,308.00| 18,000.00|
UNIT
1,400 ea. PRICE 7.00 8.25 7.89 8.33 8.34 8.71 8.50 8.49 10.33 10.50 12.80 15.65 15.80 16.60 18.12 20.00|
3. Safety Vest in Size X Large TOTAL 9,800.00| 11,550.00 11,046.00 11,662.00 11,676.00 12,194.00 11,900.00 11,886.00 14,462.00 14,700.00 17,920.00 21,910.00 22,120.00 23,240.00 25,368.00 28,000.00
UNIT
1,000 ea. PRICE 7.20 8.47 8.10 8.56 8.56 9.05 8.70 8.71 11.37 10.50 12.80 15.65 16.30 16.60 19.06 22.00]
4. Safety Vest in Size XX Large TOTAL 7,200.00] 8,470.00] 8,100.00| 8,560.00] 8,560.00] 9,050.00 8,700.00] 8,710.00] 11,370.00 10,500.00 12,800.00 15,650.00 16,300.00 16,600.00 19,060.00| 22,000.00
UNIT
300 ea. PRICE 7.70 9.02 8.63 9.11 9.12 9.64 9.25 9.28 12.40 10.50 14.90 16.77 16.80 16.60 20.00] 24.00]
5. Safety Vest in Size XXX Large TOTAL 2,310.00] 2,706.00] 2,589.00] 2,733.00] 2,736.00] 2,892.00] 2,775.00] 2,784.00] 3,720.00] 3,150.00 4,470.00 5,031.00] 5,040.00] 4,980.00 6,000.00| 7,200.00|
UNIT
150 ea. PRICE 8.00 9.35 8.94 9.44 9.45 9.99 9.60 9.62 13.44 10.50 14.90 17.89 17.30 16.60 20.94] 26.00]
6. Safety Vest in Size XXXX Large TOTAL 1,200.00 1,402.50 1,341.00 1,416.00 1,417.50 1,498.50 1,440.00 1,443.00 2,016.00] 1,575.00 2,235.00] 2,683.50] 2,595.00 2,490.00] 3,141.00| 3,900.00|
UNIT
200 ea. PRICE 8.50 9.90 9.45 10.00 10.00 10.58 10.15 10.18 14.47 10.50 14.90 19.01 17.80 16.60 21.88] 30.00]
|7. Safety Vest in Size XXXXX Large TOTAL 1,700.00 1,980.00 1,890.00 2,000.00] 2,000.00] 2,116.00| 2,030.00] 2,036.00] 2,894.00] 2,100.00] 2,980.00] 3,802.00] 3,560.00] 3,320.00] 4,376.00 6,000.00|
UNIT
5ea. PRICE 10.45]
Safety Vest in Size XXXXXX Large TOTAL 52.25]
Iron Iron Iron Iron Iron Samsan
Horse Horse Horse Horse Horse Occunomix 2W Int'l Corp. OK-1 Extreme Design Brand Ergodyne ML Occunomix
Make and Model Quoting TEXDOT/SAWS [ TEXDOT/SAWS | TEXDOT/SAW<S TEXDOT/SAWE | TEXDOT/SAWSE (nuline) MN522C-2 #OKAV2LM Part # SVSAWS #890LM245 82302 KISHE60 LUX-SSFX
=
TOTAL TOTAL 30,827.50 36,321.25 34,692.50 36,644.00 36,662.50 38,592.00 37,320.00 37,316.00 47,374.50 45,150.00 56,405.00 68,639.00 69,365.00 71,380.00 80,595.00 92,100.00
ITEM I1|HARD HATS
UNIT
200 ea. PRICE 14.90 11.25 10.50 12.91 11.99 11.48 10.74 9.99 14.56 9.30 17.25
1. Hat Safety Brim VV-Gard Yellow with Ratchet Suspensior TOTAL NO BID NO BID 2,980.00 NO BID 2,250.00 2,100.00] 2,582.00] 2,398.00] 2,296.00] 2,148.00] 1,998.00 NO BID 2,912.00] 1,860.00 3,450.00
UNIT
200 ea. PRICE 14.90 11.25 10.50 12.91 11.99 11.48 10.74 9.99 14.81 9.30 17.25
2. Hat Safety Brim White with Ratchet Suspension TOTAL NO BID NO BID 2,980.00 NO BID 2,250.00 2,100.00] 2,582.00] 2,398.00] 2,296.00] 2,148.00] 1,998.00 NO BID 2,962.00] 1,860.00 3,450.00
UNIT .
200 ea. PRICE 17.85 8.45 B 7.75 9.68 9.49 10.62 8.15 10.05 10.91 7.78 15.95
3. Cap Safety White ANSI/Z89.1 TOTAL NO BID NO BID 3,570.00] NO BID 1,690.00 ':( E 1,550.00 1,936.00 1,898.00 2,124.00] 1,630.00 2,010.00] NO BID 2,182.00 1,556.00 3,190.00
UNIT JF
200 ea. PRICE 17.85 8.45 8 w 7.75 9.68 9.49 10.62 8.15 10.05 10.91 7.78 15.95
4. Cap Safety Yellow ANSI/Z89.1 TOTAL NO BID NO BID 3,570.00] NO BID 1,690.00 f_( 5 1,550.00 1,936.00 1,898.00 2,124.00] 1,630.00 2,010.00] NO BID 2,182.00] 1,556.00 3,190.00]
UNIT =&
200 ea. PRICE 14.90 6.65 S = 6.55 8.07 7.07 8.08 4.38 7.34 6.96 12.15
5. Suspension Hat Brim-V-Locking Device TOTAL NO BID NO BID 2,980.00] NO BID 1,330.00 = 8 1,310.00 1,614.00 1,414.00 1,616.00 876.00 1,468.00 NO BID NO BID 1,392.00 2,430.00]
UNIT sz
200 ea. PRICE 14.90 6.65 U|:J 6.55 8.07 8.08 6.49 7.34 6.96 12.15
6. Suspension Cap Ratchet TOTAL NO BID NO BID 2,980.00] NO BID 1,330.00 1,310.00 1,614.00 NO BID 1,616.00 1,298.00 1,468.00 NO BID NO BID 1,392.00 2,430.00]
Jackson
MSA MSA MSA V-GARC Safety SC6 MSA
Make and Model Quoting 475360 V-Gard MSA MSA MSA Bullard & Accessories Blackhead V-Guard Bullard S71 Bullard
*
TOTAL TOTAL NO BID NO BID 19,060.00 NO BID 10,540.00 9,920.00 12,264.00 10,006.00 12,072.00 9,730.00 10,952.00 NO BID 10,238.00 9,616.00 18,140.00
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ITEM I1|EAR PLUGS
1,000 ea. UNIT
Ear Plugs corded with Case Howard Leight Model Airsoft PRICE 0.69 80.21] 0.70 0.79 73.03] 0.71 0.50 0.73 0.99
1. DPAS-30R (SPEC 600-24) TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 690.00 80,210.00 700.00 790.00| 73,030.00 710.00 NO BID NO BID 500.00 730.00 990.00
UNIT
1,000 ea. PRICE 0.16 18.71 0.167| 0.19 17.49 0.17 0.21 16.47 0.15
2. Ear Plugs pre shaped foam 100 Howard Leight Max 30 (Spec 600-23)  [TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 160.00 18,710.00 167.00 190.00 17,490.00 170.00 NO BID NO BID 210.00 16,470.00 150.00
UNIT
200 ea. PRICE 2.57 3.38 2.68 2.88 2.92 a 2.66 2.73 369.50
3. Ear Plugs quiet band hearing Howard Leight QB1 TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 514.00 676.00 536.00 576.00] 584.00 '<_( E 532.00 NO BID NO BID 546.00 739.00
)
UNIT SFE
200 ea. PRICE 1.26 1.68 1.30 1.45 28.65| g% w 1.30 1.33 361.28
4. Ear Plugs replacement pads Howard Leight QB2000 TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 252.00 336.00 260.00 290.00| 5,730.00| =0 260.00| NO BID NO BID 266.00 361.28
UNIT 57
o Qa
200 ea. PRICE 0.38 21.02] 0.38 0.10 18.69 z g 0.09 1.10 41.25 1.18
5. Ear Plugs reuse foma orange Howard Leight Max 33NRR TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 76.00] 4,204.00 76.00] 20.00 3,738.00] =0 18.00 NO BID NO BID 220.00 8,250.00 236.00
UNIT sz
100 ea. PRICE 13.45 13.45 7.13 14.53 Up:J 13.30 17.18 13.65 18.52
6. Earmuff model ultra light Mfg. Howard Leight Industries Part #LM 777 |TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1,345.00 NO BID 1,345.00 713.00] 1,453.00 1,330.00 NO BID NO BID 1,718.00 1,365.00 1,852.00
Howard Howard Howard Howard Leight Howard Howard
Make and Model Quoting Leight T3 Leight Leight As Specified Max-30 Leight Leight
=
TOTAL TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 3,037.00 104,136.00 3,084.00 2,579.00 102,025.00 3,020.00 NO BID NO BID 2,648.00 27,627.00 4,328.28
0% 0% Net Net Net Net Net Net Net Net Net 2% Net 15% Net Net
Terms 20 days 20 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 20 days 30 days 20 days 30 days 30 days
Delivery Days 10 days 12 days 12 days 12 days 15 days 7 days 12 days 10 days 7-10 days 7-10 days 12 days 5 days 1 day 7 days
1
BID INVITATIONS WERE MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY
Alamo Iron Works Medsafe SAWS Website
Alliance Suppliers, Inc MSC Industrial Supply Demandstar
C&H Dist., Inc. ORR Safety Corp.
Conney Safety Products Pathmark Traffic Products

Eco-Worx, Inc.

Globe Electric Co.

GT Dist.

Hub Solutions, LLC

Lawmen's & Shooters Supply, Inc.
Lone Star Safety

Loveline Ind., Inc.

Royall Matthiessen

Safety Supply

Saf-T-Glove, Inc.

Seton Identification Products
Stroud Safety Apparel

The Strong Group, Inc.
Utilicor




