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GROUP | SERVICE SADDLES FOR DUCTILE IRON & A/C PIPE
15ea. (SAWS #15549) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 4" x 3/4" IP, Range A 4.80-5.40 PRICE 54.72 54.96 60.70 66.51 76.09 72.06 76.07
with stainless steel straps TOTAL 820.80 824.40 910.50] 997.65| 1,141.35 1,080.90| 1,141.05
1. Make AY McDonald AY McDonalc Ford Mueller Smith Blait James Jones Mueller
15ea. (SAWS #15547 UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 4" x 1" IP, Range A 4.80-5.40 PRICE 54.72 54.96 60.70 66.51 76.09 72.06 76.07
with stainless steel straps TOTAL 820.80 824.40 910.50] 997.65| 1,141.35 1,080.90| 1,141.05
2. Make AY McDonald AY McDonalc Ford Mueller Smith Blait James Jones Mueller
15ea. (SAWS #15511) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 4" x 1-1/2" IP, Range A 4.80-5.40 PRICE 63.14 64.11 70.80 78.44] 76.09 84.99 89.71
with stainless steel straps TOTAL 947.10 961.65| 1,062.00| 1,176.60| 1,141.35 1,274.85 1,345.65
3. Make AY McDonald AY McDonalc Ford Mueller Smith Blait James Jones Mueller
50 ea. (SAWS #15548) UNIT 67.30 69.78 73.97 81.08 76.09 86.96 91.78
Saddle, Service, size 4" x 2" IP, Range A 4.80-5.40, PRICE 3,365.00 3,489.00| 3,698.50| 4,054.00| 3,804.50| 4,348.00| 4,589.00|
material w/stainless steel straps TOTAL
4. Make AY McDonald AY McDonalc Ford Mueller Smith Blait James Jones Mueller
125ea. (SAWS #15514) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 6" x 3/4" IP, Range A 6.80-7.35, PRICE 61.80 64.75 72.22 79.16 87.42 84.69 89.61
5. w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 7,725.00 8,093.7¢ 9,027.5C 9,895.0C 10,927.5C 10,586.2% 11,201.25
Make AY McDonald AY McDonald Ford Mueller Smith Blair James Jones Mueller
50 ea. (SAWS #15555) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 6" x 3/4" IP, Range B 6.90-7.45, PRICE 61.80 64.75 61.18 68.33 46.21 73.28 77.35
material w/bale straps TOTAL 3,090.00 3,237.50 3,059.00| 3,416.50| 2,310.50] 3,664.00| 3,867.50 [a) L,'_J
6. Make AY McDonald AY McDonalc Ford Mueller Smith Blait James Jones Mueller '-l'_J L_IIJ
70ea. (SAWS #15551) UNIT < o
Saddle, Service, size 6" x 1" IP, Range A 6.80-7.35 PRICE 61.80 64.75 72.22 79.16 87.42 84.69 89.61 5' =
w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 4,326.00 4,532.50 5,055.40 5,541.20] 6,119.40 5,928.30] 6,272.70] m 8
7. Make AY McDonald AY McDonalc Ford Mueller Smith Blait James Jones Mueller |<£ >
30ea. (SAWS #15550) UNIT [
Saddle, Service, size 6" x 1" IP, Range B 6.90-7.45, PRICE 61.80 64.75 61.17 68.33 46.21 73.28 77.35 O
w/bale straps, material bronze TOTAL 1,854.00 1,942.50| 1,835.10| 2,049.90| 1,386.30 2,198.40 2,320.50| zZ D
8. Make AY McDonald AY McDonalc Ford Mueller Smith Blait James Jones Mueller a) 8
25 ea. (SAWS #15513) UNIT M
Saddle, Service, size 6" x 1-1/2" IP, Range A 6.80-7.35, PRICE 66.48 74.02 81.75 90.51 94.94] 97.08 102.47|
w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 1,662.00 1,850.50] 2,043.75| 2,262.75| 2,373.50] 2,427.00| 2,561.75]
9. Make AY McDonald AY McDonalc Ford Mueller Smith Blait James Jones Mueller
15ea. (SAWS #15512) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 6" x 1-1/2" IP, Range B 6.90-7.45, PRICE 66.48 74.02 69.20 78.12 56.21 83.79 88.44]
material w/bale straps TOTAL 997.20 1,110.30| 1,038.00| 1,171.80| 843.15| 1,256.85 1,326.60|
10. Make AY McDonald AY McDonalc Ford Mueller Smith Blait James Jones Mueller
50 ea. (SAWS #15553) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 6" x 2" IP, Range A 6.80-7.35, PRICE 77.62 81.32 86.21 94.48 104.77, 101.33 109.96|
material w/stainless steel straps 3,881.00 4,066.00| 4,310.50| 4,724.00| 5,238.50) 5,066.50) 5,498.00|
11. Make TOTAL AY McDonald AY McDonalc Ford Mueller Smith Blait James Jones Mueller
50 ea. (SAWS #15554) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 6" x 2" IP, Range B 7.35-7.75, PRICE 80.10 81.32 76.83 85.89 56.97 92.11 97.24]
material w/bale straps TOTAL 4,005.00 4,066.00| 3,841.50) 4,294.50) 2,848.50) 4,605.50)| 4,862.00|
12. Make AY McDonald AY McDonalc Ford Mueller Smith Blait James Jones Mueller
150 ea. (SAWS #15562) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 8" x 3/4" IP, Range A 9.00-9.56 PRICE 76.48 80.13 89.40 97.98 103.29 104.79 110.92
w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 11,472.00 12,019.50 13,410.00 14,697.00 15,493.50) 15,718.50) 16,638.00)
13. Make AY McDonald AY McDonalc Ford Mueller Smith Blait James Jones Mueller
50 ea. (SAWS #15563) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 8" x 3/4" IP, Range A 8.99-9.57 PRICE 76.48 80.13 75.71 84.59 103.29 104.79 95.77
w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 3,824.00 4,006.50| 3,785.50) 4,229.50| 5,164.50| 5,239.50) 4,788.50)
14. Make AY McDonald AY McDonalc Ford Mueller Smith Blait James Jones Mueller
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5ea. (SAWS #15558) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 8" x 1" IP, Range A 8.63-9.62 PRICE 76.48 80.13 74.92 84.59 50.46 90.71 95.77
w/bale steel straps TOTAL 382.40 400.65| 374.60 422.95 252.30] 453.55 478.85
15. Make AY McDonald AY McDonalc Ford Mueller Smith Blait James Jones Mueller
10ea. (SAWS #15556) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 8" x 1-1/2" IP, Range A 8.63-9.62, PRICE 83.10 84.36 93.15 102.11] 111.78 110.64 116.78
w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 831.00 843.60) 931.50] 1,021.10| 1,117.80| 1,106.40| 1,167.80|
16. Make AY McDonald AY McDonalc Ford Mueller Smith Blait James Jones Mueller
20 ea. (SAWS #15561) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 8" x 2" IP, Range A 9.00-9.56, PRICE 87.66 91.83 96.35 106.14| 121.95 114.42 120.78
material w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 1,753.20 1,836.60| 1,927.00| 2,122.80| 2,439.00| 2,288.40 2,415.60|
17. Make AY McDonald AY McDonalc Ford Mueller Smith Blait James Jones Mueller
25ea. (SAWS #15560) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 8" x 2" IP, Range A 9.39 - 9.95, PRICE 87.66 91.83 85.85 96.07 121.95 114.42 109.88
material w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 2,191.50 2,295.75| 2,146.25| 2,401.75] 3,048.75| 2,860.50| 2,747.00]
18. Make AY McDonald AY McDonalc Ford Mueller Smith Blait James Jones Mueller
10ea. (SAWS #15522) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 10" x 3/4" IP, Range A 11.10-12.12, PRICE 95.75 99.27 109.65) 120.16| 122.77, 130.20] 137.42
w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 957.50 992.70] 1,096.50| 1,201.60| 1,227.70| 1,302.00| 1,374.20|
19. Make AY McDonald AY McDonalc Ford Mueller Smith Blait James Jones Mueller
10ea. (SAWS #15519) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 10" x 1" IP, Range A 11.10-12.12 PRICE 95.75 99.27 109.65) 120.16| 122.77, 130.20] 137.42
w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 957.50 992.70] 1,096.50| 1,201.60| 1,227.70| 1,302.00| 1,374.20| A w
20. Make AY McDonald AY McDonalc Ford Mueller Smith Blait James Jones Mueller w =
10ea (SAWS #15520) ONIT K u
Saddle, Service, size 10" x 1-1/2" IP, Range A 11.10-12.12, PRICE 104.08 109.03 120.40] 131.98 132.07| 143.00] 150.94] g%
w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 1,040.80 1,090.30| 1,204.00| 1,319.80| 1,320.70| 1,430.00| 1,509.40| 2 g
21. Make AY McDonald AY McDonalc Ford Mueller Smith Blair James Jones Mueller 2 O
10ea. (SAWS #15521) UNIT - Z
Saddle, Service, size 10" x 2" IP, Range A 11.05-12.00, PRICE 111.78 117.09 122.82 134.63 142.41] 145.87| 153.97| '5 —
w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 1,117.80 1,170.90| 1,228.20| 1,346.30| 1,424.10| 1,458.70| 1,539.70| = %
22. Make AY McDonald AY McDonalc Ford Mueller Smith Blair James Jones Mueller n O
15ea. (SAWS #15529) UNIT o %
Saddle, Service, size 12" x 3/4" IP, Range A 13.20-14.58, PRICE 110.90 116.18 121.90] 133.58] 142.88 144.74) 152.77|
w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 1,663.50 1,742.70| 1,828.50 2,003.70] 2,143.20| 2,171.10] 2,291.55]
23. Make AY McDonald AY McDonalc Ford Mueller Smith Blait James Jones Mueller
10ea. (SAWS #15530) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 12" x 3/4" IP, Range A 14.16 - 15.16, PRICE 110.90 116.18 108.64| 121.43 112.46) 131.57| 138.89
material w/bale straps TOTAL 1,109.00 1,161.80| 1,086.40| 1,214.30| 1,124.60| 1,315.70| 1,388.90|
24. Make AY McDonald AY McDonalc Ford Mueller Smith Blait James Jones Mueller
20 ea. (SAWS #15523) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 12" x 1" IP, Range B 13.20-14.38, PRICE 110.90 116.18 121.90] 133.58] 142.88 144.74) 152.77|
w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 2,218.00 2,323.60| 2,438.00] 2,671.60| 2,857.60| 2,894.80) 3,055.40
25. Make AY McDonald AY McDonalc Ford Mueller Smith Blait James Jones Mueller
10ea. (SAWS #15524) UNIT
Saddle, Service, Size 12" x 1" IP, Range A 14.16-15.16, PRICE 110.90 116.18 108.64| 121.43 112.46) 131.57| 138.89
material w/bale straps TOTAL 1,109.00 1,161.80| 1,086.40| 1,214.30| 1,124.60| 1,315.70| 1,388.90|
26. Make AY McDonald AY McDonalc Ford Mueller Smith Blait James Jones Mueller
10 ea. UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 12" x 1-1/2" IP, Range B 13.20-14.38, PRICE 125.08 131.03 137.45 150.68| 153.02 163.26) 172.33
w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 1,250.80 1,310.30| 1,374.50| 1,506.80 1,530.20| 1,632.60| 1,723.30|
27. Make AY McDonald AY McDonalc Ford Mueller Smith Blait James Jones Mueller
10ea. (SAWS #15526) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 12" x 1-1/2" IP, Range A 13.20-14.38, PRICE 125.08 131.03 122.53 136.96) 132.71 148.40 156.65)
w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 1,250.80 1,310.30| 1,225.30| 1,369.60| 1,327.10| 1,484.00| 1,566.50]
28. Make AY McDonald AY McDonalc Ford Mueller Smith Blait James Jones Mueller
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25ea. (SAWS #15527) UNIT w
Saddle, Service, size 12" x 2" IP, Range A 13.10-14.16, PRICE 127.32 133.39 139.95 155.01] 163.69 166.24| 175.48 B =
material w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 3,183.00 3,334.75] 3,498.75] 3,875.25] 4,092.25] 4,156.00] 4,387.00] '5 = E '-_'IJ
29. Make AY McDonald AY McDonalc Ford Mueller Smith Blait James Jones Mueller zZ 5 oo
15ea. (SAWS #15528) ONIT n>82
Saddle, Service, size 12" x 2" IP, Range B 14.16-15.16, PRICE 127.32 133.39 126.03 138.37] 177.36) 166.24| 159.50| m 2 ) 8
material w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 1,909.80 2,000.85] 1,890.45 2,075.55] 2,660.40] 2,493.60) 2,392.50] [ z
30. Make AY McDonald AY McDonalc Ford Mueller Smith Blait James Jones Mueller
UNIT
PRICE
31. ITEM DELETED TOTAL
UNIT
PRICE
TOTAL
32. ITEM DELETED
UNIT
PRICE
TOTAL
33. ITEM DELETED
UNIT
PRICE
TOTAL
34. ITEM DELETED
UNIT
PRICE
TOTAL
35. ITEM DELETED
UNIT
PRICE
TOTAL
36. ITEM DELETED
UNIT
PRICE
TOTAL
37. ITEM DELETED
UNIT
PRICE
TOTAL
38. ITEM DELETED
*
INITIAL AWARD PERIOD 2 YEARS
TOTAL GROUP 1 FOR ITEMS 1-30 (1st year) TOTAL 71,715.50 74,993.80 78,420.60 86,477.05 88,851.90 94,140.50 98,354.35
TOTAL GROUP 1 FOR ITEMS 1-30 (2nd year) TOTAL 71,715.50
TOTAL INITIAL AWARD 2 YEARS TOTAL 143,431.00
EXTENSION 1 71,715.50
EXTENSION 2 71,715.50
EXTENSION 3 71,715.50
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54.1% Mueller 30% off lig
A. Percent of discount offere: 25% (.459 multiplier) JCM 50% off list 30% 25% 0%
B. Product identification (Mfg. AY McDonalc AY McDonalc Mueller Smith Blait James Jones Mueller
Water Service
C. Price schedule numbel 4/16/08 Price List N/A 9/1/08 List Price
Mueller 2/11/08
D. Date of price schedule 4/16/08 4/16/08 JCM 12/15/0¢ 9/1/08 8/1/07
Price schedule column on which discount is based Mueller List Sheet
E. (l.e., distributor, net, wholesale Distributor Net JCM List Sheet Wholesale
Group Il PVC SERVICE SADDLES
25 ea. (SAWS #15517) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 6" x 3/4" NPT, Range 6.63-7.50, PRICE 69.00 72.31 61.20 23.44 NO BID 84.69 89.61
used for PVC C-900 TOTAL 1,725.00 1,807.75 1,530.00 586.00 2,117.25 2,240.25
1. Model AY McDonalc AY McDonalc Ford Mueller James Jones Mueller
10 ea. (SAWS #15552) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 6" x 1" NPT, Range 6.63-7.50, PRICE 69.00 72.31 61.20 23.44 84.69 89.61
used for PVC C-900 TOTAL 690.00 723.10 612.00 234.40 NO BID 846.90 896.10
2. Model AY McDonalc AY McDonalc Ford Mueller James Jones Mueller
25 ea. (SAWS #15564) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 8" x 3/4" NPT, Range 8.63-9.62, PRICE 85.44] 89.52 75.70 44.81 104.79 110.93 a
used for PVC C-900 TOTAL 2,136.00| 2,238.00| 1,892.50 1,120.25 NO BID 2,619.75 2,773.25 o
3. Model AY McDonalc AY McDonalc Ford Mueller James Jones Mueller o
50 ea. (SAWS #15557) UNIT Z
Saddle, Service, size 8" x 1" NPT, Range 8.63-9.62, PRICE 85.44] 89.52 75.70 98.48 NO BID 104.79 110.93 -
w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 4,272.00| 4,476.00| 3,785.00| 4,924.00 5,239.50) 5,546.50) -
4. Model AY McDonalc AY McDonalc Ford Mueller James Jones Mueller %
* @)
INITIAL AWARD PERIOD 2 YEARS %
TOTAL GROUP Il FOR ITEMS 1-4 (1st year) TOTAL 8,823.00| 9,244.85 7,819.50] 6,864.65 NO BID 10,823.40 11,456.10
TOTAL GROUP Il FOR ITEMS 1-4 (2nd year) TOTAL 6,864.65
TOTAL INITIAL AWARD 2 YEARS TOTAL 13,729.30
EXTENSION 1 TOTAL 6,864.65
EXTENSION 2 TOTAL 6,864.65
EXTENSION 3 TOTAL 6,864.65
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55.7% Mueller
A. Percent of discount offeret 25% (.443 multiplier) 30% off list NO BID 25% 0% o
o
B. Product identification (Mfg. 3846 AY McDonalc Mueller NO BID James Jones Mueller %
Water Service =
C. Price schedule numbel 4/16/08 Price List N/A NO BID List Price %
(@)
Mueller %
D. Date of price schedule 4/16/08 4/16/08 2/11/08 NO BID 8/1/07
Price schedule column on which discount is based Mueller
E. (l.e., distributor, net, wholesale Distributor Net List Sheet NO BID
Net Net 0% Net Net 2% 0%
Terms 30 days 30 days 20 days 30 days 30 days 20 days 20 days
Delivery Days 10 days 10 days 14 days 7-14 days 10 days 7-12 days
1
*DENOTES LOW BIDDER
BIDS INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
Act Pipe & Supply HD Supply Demandstar
Alamo Iron Works Mueller Co. SAWS Website

All Tex Pipe & Supply
AY McDonald

Big Country Waterworks Supply

Ferguson Enterprise
Ford Meter Box
Hays Lee Brass

Municipal Water Works Supply, LP
Morrison Supply Co.

PMI Steel Pipe

South Texas Facet Parts

William Supply Co.




