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1. SERVICE SADDLES FOR DUCTILE IRON & A/C PIPE
70 ea. (SAWS #6409 UNIT *
Saddle, Service, size 4" x 3/4" IP, Range A 4.80-5.40 PRICE 30.20 31.52 38.20 No Bid
1. with stainless steel straps TOTAL 2,114.00 2,206.40 2,674.00
70 ea. (SAWS #6410) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 4" x 1" IP, Range A 4.80-5.40 PRICE 30.20 31.52 38.20 No Bid
2. with stainless steel straps TOTAL 2,114.00 2,206.40 2,674.00
70 ea. (SAWS #6411) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 4" x 1-1/2" IP, Range A 4.80-5.40 PRICE 35.62 36.78 44.56 No Bid
3. with stainless steel straps TOTAL 2,493.40 2,574.60 3,119.20
50 ea. UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 4" x 2" IP, Range A 4.80-5.40, PRICE 36.45 37.62 46.08 No Bid
4. material w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 1,822.50 1,881.00 2,304.00
100 ea. (SAWS #6415) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 6" x 3/4" IP, Range A 6.80-7.35, PRICE 35.58 36.74 44.99 No Bid
5. w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 3,558.00 3,674.00 4,499.00 o)
75ea. (SAWS #6421) UNIT 84| a
Saddle, Service, size 6" x 3/4" IP, Range B 6.90-7.45, PRICE 30.49 36.74 38.87 No Bid : E
6. material w/bale straps TOTAL 2,286.75 2,755.50 2,915.25 =
100 ca. (SAWS #6417) UNIT 5 E
Saddle, Service, size 6" x 1" IP, Range A 6.80-7.35 PRICE 35.58 36.74 44.99 No Bid aa] m
7. w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 3,558.00 3,674.00 4,499.00 < —
75 ca. (SAWS #6422) UNIT -
Saddle, Service, size 6" x 1" IP, Range B 6.90-7.45, PRICE 30.49 36.74 38.87 No Bid 5 CED
8. wi/bale straps, material bronze TOTAL 2,286.75 2,755.50 2,915.25 Z O
100 ea. (SAWS #6419) UNIT N Z.
Saddle, Service, size 6" x 1-1/2" IP, Range A 6.80-7.35, PRICE 40.69 41.56 51.45 No Bid =
9. w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 4,069.00 4,156.00 5,145.00 aa]
75 ea. (SAWS #6423) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 6" x 1-1/2" IP, Range B 6.90-7.45, PRICE 35.10 41.56 44.44 No Bid
10. material w/bale straps TOTAL 2,632.50 3,117.00 3,333.00
75 ea. (SAWS #6413) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 6" x 2" IP, Range A 6.80-7.35, PRICE 42.48 43.38 53.70 No Bid
11. material w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 3,186.00 3,253.50 4,027.50
50 ea. (SAWS #6420) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 6" x 2" IP, Range B 7.35-7.75, PRICE 38.61 43.38 48.83 No Bid
12. material w/bale straps TOTAL 1,930.50 2,169.00 2,441.50
75 ea. (SAWS #6427) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 8" x 3/4" IP, Range A 9.00-9.56 PRICE 44.05 44.99 55.67 No Bid
13. w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 3,303.75 3,374.25 4,175.25
75 ea. (SAWS #6429) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 8" x 1" IP, Range A 8.63-9.62 PRICE 44.05 44.99 55.67 No Bid
14. w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 3,303.75 3,374.25 4,175.25
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75 ea. (SAWS #6431) UNIT *
Saddle, Service, size 8" x 1-1/2" IP, Range A 8.63-9.62 PRICE 46.38 47.88 58.63 No Bid
15. w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 3,478.50 3,591.00 4,397.25
50 ea. (SAWS #6425) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 8" x 2" IP, Range A 9.00-9.56, PRICE 47.95 48.99 60.63 No Bid
16. material w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 2,397.50 2,449.50 3,031.50
75 ea. (SAWS #6432) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 8" x 2" IP, Range A 9.39-9.95, PRICE 43.63 45.04 60.63 No Bid
17. material w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 3,272.25 3,378.00 4,547.25
40 ea. (SAWS #6375) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 10" x 3/4" IP, Range B 9.39-9.95, PRICE 54.58 56.99 69.01 No Bid
18. material w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 2,183.20 2,279.60 2,760.40
40 ea. (SAWS #6376) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 10" x 1" IP, Range A 11.10-12.12, PRICE 54.58 56.99 69.01 No Bid
19. w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 2,183.20 2,279.60 2,760.40
40 ea. (SAWS #6377) UNIT a
Saddle, Service, size 10" x 1-1/2" IP, Range A 11.10-12.12 PRICE 59.90 62.54 75.79 No Bid —~ a
20. w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 2,396.00 2,501.60 3,031.60 < m
40 ea. (SAWS #6374) UNIT = om
Saddle, Service, size 10" x 2" IP, Range A 11.05-12.00, PRICE 61.14 63.79 77.31 No Bid g —
21. material w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 2,445.60 2,551.60 3,092.40 < [ﬂ
35ea. (SAWS #6381) UNIT ~
Saddle, Service, size 12" x 3/4" IP, Range A 13.20-14.58, PRICE 60.67 62.62 76.71 No Bid —~ 2
22. material w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 2,123.45 2,191.70 2,684.85 oNe)
35ca. (SAWS #6387) UNIT Z O
Saddle, Service, size 12" x 3/4" IP, Range B 14.16-15.16, PRICE 55.16 56.94 66.74 No Bid o) a
23. material w/bale straps TOTAL 1,930.60 1,992.90 2,335.90 E
35ea. (SAWS #6383) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 12" x 1" IP, Range A 13.20 - 14.38, PRICE 60.67 62.62 76.71 No Bid
24. w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 2,123.45 2,191.70 2,684.85
35ea. (SAWS #6388) UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 12" x 1" IP, Range B 14.16-15.16, PRICE 47.12 50.80 69.74 No Bid
25. material w/bale straps TOTAL 1,649.20 1,778.00 2,440.90
35ea. (SAWS #6385) UNIT
Saddle, Service, Size 12" x 1-1/2" IP, Range A 13.20-14.38, PRICE 68.45 71.40 86.52 No Bid
26. w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 2,395.75 2,499.00 3,028.20
35 ea. UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 12" x 1-1/2" IP, Range B 14.16-15.16, PRICE 62.18 64.99 78.66 No Bid
27. material w/bale straps TOTAL 2,176.30 2,274.65 2,753.10
35 ea. UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 12" x 2" IP, Range A 13.10-14.16, PRICE 69.70 71.94 88.10 No Bid
28. material w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 2,439.50 2,517.90 3,083.50
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25 ea. UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 16" x 3/4" IP, Range A 17.35-18.35, PRICE 156.47 161.48 197.75 No Bid
29. w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 3,911.75 4,037.00 4,943.75
25 ea. UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 16" x 3/4" IP, Range B 18.35-19.35, PRICE 139.88 144.38 170.79 No Bid
30. material w/bale straps TOTAL 3,497.00 3,609.50 4,269.75
25 ea. UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 16" x 1" IP, Range A 17.35-18.35, PRICE 156.47 161.48 197.75 No Bid
31. w/stainless steel straps TOTAL 3,911.75 4,037.00 4,943.75
25 ea. UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 16" x 1" IP, Range B 17.40-19.19, PRICE 139.88 144.38 170.79 No Bid
32. material w/bale straps TOTAL 3,497.00 3,609.50 4,269.75
25 ea. UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 16" x 1-1/2" IP, Range A 17.35-18.25, PRICE 159.80 171.30 209.82 No Bid
33. material w/stainles steel straps TOTAL 3,995.00 4,282.50 5,245.50
25 ea. UNIT a
Saddle, Service, size 16" x 1-1/2" IP, Range B 18.35-19.35, PRICE 148.20 151.58 170.79 No Bid —~ E
34. material w/bale straps TOTAL 3,705.00 3,789.50 4,269.75 < m
25 ca. UNIT = om
Saddle, Service, size 16" x 2" IP, Range A 17.35-18.35, PRICE 164.02 167.99 170.79 No Bid g —
35. material w/bale straps TOTAL 4,100.50 4,199.75 4,269.75 < [ﬂ
il
* = =
TOTAL GROUP 1 TOTAL 98,471.40 103,212.90 123,741.30 C:,ZD 8
A. Percent of discount offered 60% off list 30% ) a
S—
B. Product identification (Mfg.) Mueller Mueller James Jones =
C. Price schedule number x.40 muit Feb. 23, 2004
D. Date of price schedule Feb. 23, 2004 Feb. 23, 2004
Price schedule column on which discount is based
E. (L.e., distributor, net, wholesale) List Distributor
II. PVC SERVICE SADDLES
75 ea. UNIT *
Saddle, Service, size 6" x 3/4" NPT, Range 6.63-7.50, PRICE 35.57 36.74 44.99 46.75
1. used for PVC C-900 TOTAL 2,667.75 2,755.50 3,374.25 3,506.25
20 ea. UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 6" x 1" NPT, Range 6.63-7.50, PRICE 35.57 36.74 44.99 46.75
2. used for PVC C-900 TOTAL 711.40 734.80 899.80 935.00
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75 ea. UNIT *
Saddle, Service, size 8" x 3/4" NPT, Range 8.63-9.62, PRICE 44.05 45.46 55.70 57.85
3. used for PVC C-900 TOTAL 3,303.75 3,409.50 4,177.50 4,338.75
20 ea. UNIT
Saddle, Service, size 8" x 1" NPT, Range 8.63-9.62, PRICE 44.05 45.46 55.70 57.85
4. used for PVC C-900 TOTAL 881.00 909.20 1,114.00 1,157.00
: :
TOTAL GROUP 11 TOTAL 7,563.90 7,809.00 9,565.55 9,937.00 [ a
< m
A. Percent of discount offered 60% Off List 30% 37% 5 m
[
B. Product identification (Mfg.) Mueller Mueller James Jones ﬁ [ﬂ
=
C. Price schedule number x.60 Muit. Feb. 23, 2004 1J-2-04 —~ 2
oNe)
D. Date of price schedule Feb. 23, 2004 Feb. 23, 2004 Feb. 28, 2004 Z O
=
Price schedule column on which discount is based E
E. (L.e., distributor, net, wholesale) List Distributor Distributor
Net Net Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days
Delivery Days 4-21 days 21 days 7-10 days 7-28 days
BIDS INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
Act Pipe & Supply Mueller Demandstar
Cascade Water Works National Waterworks SAWS Website
Ferguson Waterworks Powerseal
Hughes Supply Romac Industries

James Jones




