
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 10-1083

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for

FOR: Sewer Cleaning Nozzles Plus Accessories and Wear Items

TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2011)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., January 18, 2011
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

GROUP I Sewer Cleaning Nozzles        

14 ea. UNIT      

Standard Nozzle, 1" connection, for 6" to 14" diameter pipes, PRICE 292.30 353.10 351.16 419.44 428.00

80 gpm at 2000 psi TOTAL 4,092.20 4,943.40 4,916.24 5,872.16 5,992.00

1. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 30.100 Enz/30.100 Enz USA, Inc/30.100 Enz/30.100 Enz/30.100  

14 ea. UNIT

Grenade-Bomb Nozzle, 1" connection for 6" to 12" diameter pipes, PRICE 601.98 739.20 735.13 878.08 896.00

80 gpm at 2000 psi TOTAL 8,427.72 10,348.80 10,291.82 12,293.12 12,544.00

2. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 40.100A Enz/40.100A Enz USA, Inc/40.100A Enz/40.100A Enz/40.100A  

10 ea. UNIT

Chisel-Point Nozzle, 1" connection, for 6" to 16" diameter pipes, PRICE 846.09 969.38 964.03 1,151.50 1,175.00

80 gpm at 2000 psi TOTAL 8,460.90 9,693.80 9,640.30 11,515.00 11,750.00

3. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 60.100L Enz/60.100L Enz USA, Inc./60.100L Enz/60.100L Enz/60.100L  

10 ea. UNIT

KBR Rotating Combination Nozzle, 1" connection for 4" to 12" PRICE 684.93 767.25 1,292.22 911.40 930.00

diameter pipes, 80 gpm at 2000 psi TOTAL 6,849.30 7,672.50 12,922.20 9,114.00 9,300.00

4. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 04.060 Enz/04.060 Enz USA, Inc./04.060 Enz/04.060 Enz/04.060  

10 ea. UNIT

Standard Penetrator Nozzle, 1" connection,f or 4" to 12" diameter PRICE 376.04 411.68 409.41 489.02 499.00

pipes, 80 gpm at 2000 psi TOTAL 3,760.40 4,116.80 4,094.10 4,890.20 4,990.00

5. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 35.100 Enz/35.100 Enz USA, Inc/35.100 Enz/35.100 Enz/35.100  

2 ea. UNIT

Enz Model #01.100A or approved equal - RGS Radially Rotating PRICE 1,686.42 1,839.75 1,829.61 2,185.40 2,230.00

Nozzle, 1" connection, for 8" to 24" diameter pipes, 80 gpm at 2000 psi TOTAL 3,372.84 3,679.50 3,659.22 4,370.80 4,460.00

6. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 01.100A Enz/01.100A Enz USA, Inc/01.100A Enz/0.100A Enz/01.100A  

2 ea. UNIT

Bulldozer, 1" connection, for 12" to 60" diameter pipes, 80 gpm at PRICE 2,962.50 3,489.75 3,470.52 4,145.40 4,230.00

2000 psi TOTAL 5,925.00 6,979.50 6,941.04 8,290.80 8,460.00

7. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 50.100 Enz/50.100 Enz USA, Inc/50.100 Enz/50.100 Enz/50.100  

2 ea. UNIT      

Chain Scraper, 1" connection, for 6-10" diameter pipes, 80 gpm at PRICE 3,656.12 3,818.10 3,797.08 4,535.44 4,628.00

2000 psi TOTAL 7,312.24 7,636.20 7,594.16 9,070.88 9,256.00

8. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 10.150R Enz/10.150R Enz USA, Inc/10.150R Enz/10.150R Enz/10.150R  

1 ea. UNIT      

Chain Scraper, 1" connection, for 8-16" diameter pipes, 80 gpm at PRICE 5,688.00 6,237.00 6,202.63 7,408.00 7,560.00

2000 psi TOTAL 5,688.00 6,237.00 6,202.63 7,408.00 7,560.00

9. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 10.200R Enz/10.200R Enz USA, Inc/681-TBA Enz/10.200R Enz/10.200R  

1 ea. UNIT

Chain Scraper, 1" connection, for 16-32" diameter pipes, 80 gpm at PRICE 7,841.54 8,600.62 8,553.24 10,216.50 10,425.00

2000 psi TOTAL 7,841.54 8,600.62 8,553.24 10,216.50 10,425.00

10. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 10.400R Enz/10.400R Enz USA, Inc./10.400R Enz/10.400R Enz/10.400R  

10 ea. UNIT

Flounder, 1" connection, for 12-24" diameter pipes, 80 gpm at PRICE 1,264.00 1,386.00 1,378.36 1,646.40 1,680.00

2000 psi TOTAL 12,640.00 13,860.00 13,783.60 16,464.00 16,800.00

11. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 70.100 Enz/70.100 Enz USA, Inc./70.100 Enz/70.100 Enz/70.100  
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 10-1083

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for

FOR: Sewer Cleaning Nozzles Plus Accessories and Wear Items

TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2011)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., January 18, 2011
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY C
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1 ea. UNIT

Ejector, 1" connection, for 10-20" diameter pipes, 80 gpm at PRICE 3,752.50 4,116.75 4,094.07 4,890.20 4,990.00

2000 psi TOTAL 3,752.50 4,116.75 4,094.07 4,890.20 4,990.00

12. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 80.100 Enz/80.100 Enz USA, Inc/80.100 Enz/80.100 Enz/80.100  

1 ea. UNIT

Ejector, 1" connection, for 16-60" diameter pipes, 80 gpm at PRICE 3,946.05 4,945.87 4,918.63 5,875.10 5,995.00

2000 psi TOTAL 3,946.05 4,945.87 4,918.63 5,875.10 5,995.00

13. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 80.100A Enz/80.100A Enz USA, Inc/80.100A Enz/80.100A Enz/80.100A  

12 ea. UNIT

Bulldog, 1" connection for 5-16" diameter pipes, 80 gpm at PRICE 2,021.61 2,456.85 2,443.32 2,918.44 2,978.00

2000 psi TOTAL 24,259.32 29,482.20 29,319.84 35,021.28 35,736.00

14. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 400.080 Enz/400.080 Enz USA, Inc/400.080 Enz/400.080 Enz/400.080  

 UNIT *

 PRICE      

 TOTAL GROUP 1 Make/Model 106,328.01 122,312.94 126,931.09 145,292.04 148,258.00

Manufacturer Enz Enz USA, Inc. Enz USA Enz USA  

 

Pricing Depending

Price Sheet 2011 Price List on volume Enz List List Price Effec.  

Date January 2011  2011 Feb. 1, 2011  

20% off     

Discount Shipping Included Call for pricing 10% 2%  

GROUP 2 - ACCESSORIES AND WEAR ITEMS  

14 ea. UNIT      

Toolbox made of shock resistant plastic that can withstand high and low PRICE 200.88  209.22 249.90 255.00

temperature TOTAL 2,812.32  2,929.08 3,498.60 3,570.00

1. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 09.004 Enz/09.004 NO BID Enz/09.004 Enz/09.004  

2 yard UNIT

Pin bolt chain - Sold by the yard for use with Enz Wire Rope and Chain PRICE 58.32  59.07 51.94 85.00

Scraper Model 10.150R TOTAL 116.64  118.14 103.88 170.00

2. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 0010.150G Enz/0010.150G  NO BID Enz/0010.150G Enz/0010.150G  

2 yard UNIT

Pin bolt chain - Sold by the yard for use with Enz Wire Rope and Chain PRICE 67.23  75.48 90.16 92.00

Scraper Model 10.200R and 10.400R TOTAL 134.46  150.96 180.32 184.00

3 Make and Model quoting Make/Model Enz 12G/12G  NO BID Enz/129 Enz/12G  

1 set UNIT

1 set pin bolt chain - Sold by the set 6" for use with Enz wire rope and chain PRICE 63.99  64.82 77.42 89.00

Scraper Model 10.150R TOTAL 63.99  64.82 77.42 89.00

4. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 0010.150150G/0010.150150G  NO BID Enz/0010.150150G Enz/0010.150150G  
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 10-1083

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for

FOR: Sewer Cleaning Nozzles Plus Accessories and Wear Items

TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2011)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., January 18, 2011
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY C
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1 set UNIT

1 set pin bolt chain - Sold by the set 8" for use with Enz wire rope and chain PRICE 63.99  64.82 77.42 89.00

Scraper Model 10.150R TOTAL 63.99  64.82 77.42 89.00

5. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 0010.150200G Enz/0010.150200G  NO BID Enz/0010.150200G Enz/0010.150200G  

1 set UNIT

1 set pin bolt chain - Sold by the set 10" for use with Enz wire rope and chain PRICE 71.28  64.82 86.24 98.00

Scraper Model 10.150R TOTAL 71.28  64.82 86.24 98.00

6. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 0010.150250G/0010.150250G  NO BID Enz/0010.150250G Enz/0010.150250G  

1 set UNIT

1 set pin bolt chain - Sold by the set 8" for use with Enz wire rope and chain PRICE 300.51  221.52 264.60 270.00

Scraper Model 10.200R  TOTAL 300.51  221.52 264.60 270.00

7. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 12.200G Enz/12.200G  NO BID Enz/12.200G Enz/12.200G  

1 set UNIT

1 set pin bolt chain - Sold by the set 10" for use with Enz wire rope and chain PRICE 316.71  237.93 284.20 290.00

Scraper Model 10.200R TOTAL 316.71  237.93 284.20 290.00

8. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 12.750G Enz/12.250G  NO BID Enz/12.506 Enz/12.250G  

1 set UNIT

1 set pin bolt chain - Sold by the set 12" for use with Enz wire rope and chain PRICE 316.71  237.93 284.20 290.00

Scraper Model 10.200R TOTAL 316.71  237.93 284.20 290.00

9. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 12.300G Enz/12.300G  NO BID Enz/12.300G Enz/12.300G  

1 set UNIT

1 set pin bolt chain - Sold by the set 14" for use with Enz wire rope and chain PRICE 335.34  258.44 308.70 315.00

Scraper Model 10.200R TOTAL 335.34  258.44 308.70 315.00

10. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 12.350G Enz/12.350G  NO BID Enz/12.350G Enz/12.350G  

1 set UNIT

1 set pin bolt chain - Sold by the set 16" for use with Enz wire rope and chain PRICE 335.34  258.44 308.70 315.00

Scraper Model 10.200R TOTAL 335.34  258.44 308.70 315.00

11. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 12.401G Enz/12.401G  NO BID Enz/12.401G Enz/12.401G  

1 set UNIT

1 set pin bolt chain - Sold by the set 16" for use with the Enz wire rope and PRICE 316.71  237.93 284.20 290.00

chain Scraper Model 10.400R TOTAL 316.71  237.93 284.20 290.00

12. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 12.402G Enz./12.402G  NO BID Enz/12.402G Enz/12.402G  

1 set UNIT

1 set pin bolt chain - Sold by the set 18" for use with Enz wire rope and chain PRICE 335.34  258.44 308.70 315.00

Scraper Model 10.400R TOTAL 335.34  258.44 308.70 315.00

13. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 12.450G Enz/12.450G  NO BID Enz/12.450G Enz/12.450G  

1 set UNIT

1 set pin bolt chain - Sold by the set 20" for use with Enz wire rope and chain PRICE 335.34  258.44 308.70 315.00

Scraper Model 10.400R TOTAL 335.34  258.44 308.70 315.00

14. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 12.500G Enz/12.500G  NO BID Enz/12.500G Enz/12.500G  

1 set UNIT

1 set pin bolt chain - Sold by the set 24" for use with Enz wire rope and chain PRICE 364.50  287.16 343.00 350.00

Scraper Model 10.400R TOTAL 364.50  287.16 343.00 350.00

15. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 12.600G Enz/12.600G  NO BID Enz/12.600G Enz/12.600G  

B
ID

 N
O

T
 T

A
B

U
L

A
T

E
D

C
O

N
D

IT
IO

N
A

L
 B

ID

3



F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 10-1083

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
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1 set UNIT

1 set pin bolt chain - Sold by the set 28" for use with Enz wire rope and chain PRICE 383.13  307.67 367.50 375.00

Scraper Model 10.400R TOTAL 383.13  307.67 367.50 375.00

16. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 12.700G Enz/12.700G  NO BID Enz/12.700G Enz/12.700G  

1 set UNIT

1 set pin bolt chain - Sold by the set 32" for use with Enz wire rope and chain PRICE 407.43  328.18 392.00 400.00

Scraper Model 10.400R TOTAL 407.43  328.18 392.00 400.00

17. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 12.800G Enz/12.800G  NO BID Enz/12.800G Enz/12.800G  

1 set UNIT

1 set chain with bracket - Sold by the set for use with Enz wire rope and chain PRICE 76.95  77.94 93.10 105.00

Scraper Model 10.150R TOTAL 76.95  77.94 93.10 105.00

18. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 0010.1508R Enz/0010.1508R  NO BID Enz/0010.1508R Enz/0010.1508R  

1 set UNIT

1 set chain with bracket - Sold by the set for use with Enz wire rope and chain PRICE 81.60  82.66 117.60 120.00

Scraper Model 10.200R or 10.400R TOTAL 81.60  82.66 117.60 120.00

19. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 0010.2008R Enz/0010.2008R  NO BID Enz/0010.2008R Enz/0010.2008R  

2 ea. UNIT

Diamond Crown 6" for use with Enz wire rope and chain PRICE 769.50  818.82 978.04 998.00

Scraper Model 10.150R TOTAL 1,539.00  1,637.64 1,956.08 1,996.00

20. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 0010.150D Enz/0010.150D  NO BID Enz/0010.150D Enz/0010.150D  

2 ea. UNIT

Diamon Crown, 8" for use with Enz wire rope and chain PRICE 1,432.08  1,521.93 1,817.90 1,855.00

Scraper Model 10.150R or 10.200R TOTAL 2,864.16  3,043.86 3,635.80 3,710.00

21. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 0010.200D Enz/0010.200D  NO BID Enz/0010.200D Enz/0010.2000  

2 ea. UNIT

Diamond Crown 10" for use with Enz wire rope and chain PRICE 1,781.19  1,804.18 2,155.02 2,199.00

Scraper Model 10.200R TOTAL 3,562.38  3,608.36 4,310.04 4,398.00

22. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 0010.250D Enz/0010.250D  NO BID Enz/0010.250D Enz/0010.250D  

2 ea. UNIT

Diamond Crown 12" for use with Enz wire rope and chain PRICE 2,464.02  2,621.35 3,131.10 3,195.00

Scraper Model 10.200R TOTAL 4,928.04  5,242.70 6,262.20 6,390.00

23. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 0010.250D Enz/0010.250D  NO BID Enz/0010.300D Enz/0010.300D  

1 ea. UNIT

Center Head, 8" - 16 for use with Enz wire rope and chain PRICE 1,158.30  1,173.25 1,401.40 1,430.00

Scraper Model 10.200R TOTAL 1,158.30  1,173.25 1,401.40 1,430.00

24. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 0010.2004R Enz/0010.2004R  NO BID Enz/0010.2004D Enz/0010.2004R  

1 ea. UNIT

Center Head 16"- 32" for use with Enz wire rope and chain PRICE 1,603.80  1,624.50 1,940.40 1,980.00

Scraper Model 10.400R TOTAL 1,603.80  1,624.50 1,940.40 1,980.00

25. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 0010.4004R Enz/0010.4004R  NO BID Enz/0010.250D Enz  

3 ea. UNIT

JetMax ceramic round jet size 0mm and 0.5mm-3.0mm in increments PRICE 17.82  19.69 23.52 24.00

of 0.1mm TOTAL 53.46  59.07 70.56 72.00

26. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 22.06 Enz/22.06  NO BID Enz/22.06 Enz/22.06  
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3 ea. UNIT

JetMax ceramic round jet size 0mm and 1.0mm-3.0mm in increments of PRICE 20.25  21.33 25.48 26.00

0.1mm, and 3.22mm, 3.4mm TOTAL 60.75  63.99 76.44 78.00

27. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 22.08 Enz/22.08  NO BID Enz/22.08 Enz/22.08  

3 ea. UNIT

JetMax ceramic round jet size 0mm and 1.0mm-3.0mm in increments of PRICE 21.87  24.61 29.40 30.00

0.1mm and 3.2mm, 3.4mm, 3.6mm, 3.8mm, 4.0mm TOTAL 65.61  73.83 88.20 90.00

28. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 22.10 Enz/22.10  NO BID Enz/22.10 Enz/22.10  

3 ea. UNIT

JetMax ceramic round jet, size 0mm and 1.0mm-3.0mm in increments of PRICE 20.25  24.61 25.48 32.00

0.1mm and 3.2mm, 3.4mm, 3.6mm, 3.8mm, 4.0mm TOTAL 60.75  73.83 76.44 96.00

29. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 22.025 Enz/22.025  NO BID Enz/22.025 Enz/22.025  

3 ea. UNIT

FanJet ceramic flat jet, size 0mm and 1.0mm (=1.1 mm round jet) and PRICE 22.68  26.25 31.36 32.00

1.5 mm (=1.6 round jet) TOTAL 68.04  78.75 94.08 96.00

30. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 22.08F Enz/22.08F  NO BID Enz/22.08F Enz/22.08F  

3 ea.

FanJet ceramic flat jet, size 0mm and 1.0mm (=1.1 mm round jet)1.5mm (=1.6 UNIT

round jet)1.9mm(2.1 round jet) 2.2mm (=2.4mm round jet)2.5mm (=2.7mm round PRICE 26.73  28.72 34.30 35.00

jet) and 2.8mm (=3.0mm round jet) TOTAL 80.19  86.16 102.90 105.00

31. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 22.10F Enz/22.10F NO BID Enz/22.10F Enz/22.10F  

UNIT

2 ea. PRICE 14.58  14.77 17.64 18.00

Socket wrench, 3.5mm for replacing M4 jet inserts TOTAL 29.16  29.54 35.28 36.00

32. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 09.0935U Enz/09.0935U  NO BID Enz/09.0935U Enz/09.0935U  

 UNIT

2 ea. PRICE 14.58  14.77 17.64 18.00

Socket wrench, 5.0mm for replacing M6 jet inserts TOTAL 29.16  29.54 35.28 36.00

33. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 09.095U Enz/09.095U  NO BID Enz/09.095U Enz/09.095U  

UNIT

2 ea. PRICE 15.39  15.59 18.62 19.00

Socket wrench, 7.0mm for replacing M8 jet inserts TOTAL 30.78  31.18 37.24 38.00

34. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 09.097U Enz/09.097U  NO BID Enz/09.097U Enz/09.097U  

UNIT

20 ea. PRICE 53.46  57.43 68.60 70.00

Tip cleaning kit, for cleaning debris and jets TOTAL 1,069.20  1,148.60 1,372.00 1,400.00

35. Make and Model quoting Make/Model 09.500TC Enz/09.500TC  NO BID Enz/09.500TC Enz/09.500TC  

*

TOTAL GROUP 2 TOTAL 24,371.07 NO BID 24,450.12 29,183.42 29,901.00

Manufacturer Enz NO BID Enz Enz USA, Inc.  
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Price Sheet 2011 Price List NO BID Enz List List Price Effec.  

 

 

Date January 2011 NO BID 2011 Feb. 1, 2011  

 

Discount 20% NO BID 10% 2%  

EXTENSION 1 130,699.08

EXTENSION 2 130,699.08

Net 0% Net Net Net

 Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

Delivery Days

     

*LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Balar Equipment, Corp. Demandstar Website

CLS Sewer Equip. Co., Inc. SAWS Website

Enz USA, Inc.

Hose Power USA

Hydraquip, Inc.

Kinloch Equipment & Supply

Professional Sewer Tools

San Antonio Belting & Pulley

SunSource

Texas Municipal Equip.

Texas Underground

Vactor Mfr., Inc.
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