F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

08-8073

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM L o g .
P. 0. BOX 2449 = 4.8 S s o 8
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 ERS R o N 2 g S
TABULATION OF BIDS E R 2 0 x 2 R o R B o
Eg X x ok £ . X =5 X oW
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Electric Motor Repair < SF 5 &% z gF L9 = SE~
FOR: Small Motors (3-250 HP) and Large Motors (300 HP and Greater) 2 S 2 23 = 2 2 2 - S 2 s = o
TIVE & January 1, 2009 through December 31, 2009 £ 8 5Z29 2 g2 3 ; = L8 g
DATE: 3:00 p.m., October 31, 2008 <y < 59 3 g o< Eo < S>o &
cdc o N 5 S O M Cc o c 3 o %
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY g S g L S O 2 E S g g &' g E ﬂ -
ITEM 1 SMALL MOTOR REPAIR (UP TO 250 HP) UNIT 20,000.00 20,000.00 20,000.00
Purchase or Manufactured Parts PRICE +20% +20% +20%
Al. Parts purchased for repairs and invoiced to SAW S (Handling) TOTAL 24,000.00 24,000.00 24,000.00
UNIT 5,000.00 5,000.00 5,000.00
PRICE -10% -10% -10%
A2. Parts manufactured by motor service center and invoiced to SAWS  |TOTAL 4,500.00 4,500.00 4,500.00
UNIT 20,000.00 20,000.00 20,000.00
Replacements, new motors purchased in lieu of repair when at PRICE 20% 2% -25%
A3. SAWS discretion is more cost effective than repair (% discount) TOTAL 16,000.00 19,600.00 15,000.00
Shop and Field Service Requirements UNIT
Est. 300 hrs. PRICE 28.80 65.00 32.50
1. In Shop Repair Regular Time TOTAL 8,640.00 19,500.00 9,750.00 .
UNIT pd
Est. 40 hrs. PRICE 48.00 85.00 48.75 o —
2. In Shop Repair Overtime TOTAL 1,920.00 3,400.00 1,950.00 o) 'E B @)
UNIT wo EZ
i s
PRICE < L 25
3. ITEM DELETED TOTAL 3 Q 20
UNIT oo <2
< wn — w
PRICE E )
4. ITEM DELETED TOTAL = ﬁ o 9(
UNIT % S Z 5
Est. 80 hrs. PRICE 28.80 65.00 32.50 o= ; z
5. Machine Shop Labor Regular time TOTAL 2,304.00 5,200.00 2,600.00 o % i %
UNIT n E =
Est. 20 hrs. PRICE 48.00 85.00 48.75 g =
6. Machine Shop Labor Overtime TOTAL 960.00 1,700.00 975.00 la)
Recondition and Rewind UNIT
4 Units PRICE 535.00 150.00 266.22
7. Single-Phase, up to 10 HP Recondition TOTAL 2,140.00 600.00 1,064.88
UNIT
4 Units PRICE 1,119.00 600.00 484.03
8. Single-Phse, up to 10 HP Rewind TOTAL 4,476.00 2,400.00 1,936.12
UNIT
4 Units PRICE 323.00 300.00 266.22
9. Three-Phase, up to 10 HP Recondition TOTAL 1,292.00 1,200.00 1,064.88
UNIT
4 Units PRICE 612.00 600.00 484.03
10. Three-Phase, up to 10 HP Rewind TOTAL 2,448.00 2,400.00 1,936.12
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PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Electric Motor Repair < SF 5 &% z gF L9 = SE~
FOR: Small Motors (3-250 HP) and Large Motors (300 HP and Greater) 2 S 2 23 = 2 2 2 - S 2 s = o
TIVE & January 1, 2009 through December 31, 2009 £ 8 5Z29 2 g2 3 ; = L8 g
DATE: 3:00 p.m., October 31, 2008 <y < 59 3 g o< Eo < S>o &
c d c O N = S O Mmc o - c L o
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY 333 0S8 S <S8 £33 ERS
UNIT
4 Units PRICE 401.00 375.00 331.99
11. Three-Phase, 15 HP Recondition TOTAL 1,604.00 1,500.00 1,327.96
UNIT
4 Units PRICE 748.00 800.00 603.59
12. Three-Phase, 15 HP Rewind TOTAL 2,992.00 3,200.00 2,414.36
UNIT
4 Units PRICE 401.00 450.00 403.98
13. Three-Phase, 20 HP Recondition TOTAL 1,604.00 1,800.00 1,615.92
UNIT
4 Units PRICE 841.00 900.00 734.50
14. Three-Phase, 20 HP Rewind TOTAL 3,364.00 3,600.00 2,938.00 0
UNIT Z
4 Units PRICE 511.00 575.00 491.27 o —
15. Three-Phase, 25 HP Recondition TOTAL 2,044.00 2,300.00 1,965.08 a 'E B e)
UNIT W o I:: Z
4 Units PRICE 875.00 950.00 893.22 'E LL 32
16. Three-Phase, 25 HP Rewind TOTAL 3,500.00 3,800.00 3,572.88 5' 8 8 8
UNIT m o <2
4 Units PRICE 511.00 650.00 627.34 fj ﬁ :: %
17. Three-Phase, 30 HP Recondition TOTAL 2,044.00 2,600.00 2,509.36 ,6 ﬁ % <D(
UNIT
4 Units PRICE 983.00 1,000.00 1,056.11 E E Y %
18. Three-Phase, 30 HP Rewind TOTAL 3,932.00 4,000.00 4,224.44 o % E g
UNIT ==
4 Units PRICE 664.00 800.00 665.63 m =
19. Three-Phase, 40 HP Recondition TOTAL 2,656.00 3,200.00 2,662.52 8
UNIT
4 Units PRICE 1,203.00 1,200.00 1,210.23
20. Three-Phase, 40 HP Rewind TOTAL 4,812.00 4,800.00 4,840.92
UNIT
4 Units PRICE 664.00 950.00 819.52
21. Three-Phase, 50 HP Recondition TOTAL 2,656.00 3,800.00 3,278.08
UNIT
4 Units PRICE 1,392.00 1,500.00 1,490.03
22. Three-Phase, 50 HP Rewind TOTAL 5,568.00 6,000.00 5,960.12
UNIT
4 Units PRICE 829.00 1,150.00 766.96
23. Three-Phase, 60 HP Recondition TOTAL 3,316.00 4,600.00 3,067.84
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PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Electric Motor Repair < SF 5 &% z gF L9 = SE~
FOR: Small Motors (3-250 HP) and Large Motors (300 HP and Greater) 2 S 2 23 = 2 2 2 - S 2 s = o
TIVE & January 1, 2009 through December 31, 2009 £ 8 5Z29 2 g2 3 ; = L8 g
DATE: 3:00 p.m., October 31, 2008 <y < 59 3 g o< Eo < S>o &
cdc o N 5 S O M Cc o c 3 o %
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY g S g L S O 2 E S g E &' g E ﬂ -
UNIT
4 Units PRICE 1,630.00 1,800.00 1,704.34
24. Three-Phase, 60 HP Rewind TOTAL 6,520.00 7,200.00 6,817.36
UNIT
4 Units PRICE 829.00 1,300.00 946.90
25. Three-Phase, 75 HP Recondition TOTAL 3,316.00 5,200.00 3,787.60
UNIT
4 Units PRICE 1,669.00 1,950.00 1,893.79
26. Three-Phase, 75 HP Rewind TOTAL 6,676.00 7,800.00 7,575.16
UNIT
4 Units PRICE 952.00 1,500.00 1,258.50
27. Three-Phase, 100 HP Recondition TOTAL 3,808.00 6,000.00 5,034.00 0
UNIT Z
4 Units PRICE 2,076.00 2,100.00 2,517.00 o —
28. Three-Phase, 100 HP Rewind TOTAL 8,304.00 8,400.00 10,068.00 a 'E B e)
UNIT W o I:: Z
4 Units PRICE 1,172.00 1,600.00 1,338.93 'E LL 32
29. Three-Phase, 125 HP Recondition TOTAL 4,688.00 6,400.00 5,355.72 5' 8 8 8
UNIT m o <2
4 Units PRICE 2,476.00 2,500.00 2,975.40 fj g :: H
30. Three-Phase, 125 HP Rewind TOTAL 9,904.00 10,000.00 11,901.60 ,6 ﬁ % <D(
UNIT
4 Units PRICE 1,172.00 1,900.00 1,503.27 E E Y %
31. Three-Phase, 150 HP Recondition TOTAL 4,688.00 7,600.00 6,013.08 o % E g
UNIT ==
4 Units PRICE 2,646.00 2,850.00 3,340.60 m =
32. Three-Phase, 150 HP Rewind TOTAL 10,584.00 11,400.00 13,362.40 8
UNIT
2 Units PRICE 1,334.00 2,250.00 1,808.47
33. Three-Phase, 200 HP Recondition TOTAL 2,668.00 4,500.00 3,616.94
UNIT
2 Units PRICE 3,329.00 3,300.00 4,018.81
34. Three-Phase, 200 HP Rewind TOTAL 6,658.00 6,600.00 8,037.62
UNIT
2 Units PRICE 1,334.00 2,500.00 2,052.03
35. Three-Phase, 250 HP Recondition TOTAL 2,668.00 5,000.00 4,104.06
UNIT
2 Units PRICE 3,887.00 3,650.00 4,560.05
36. Three-Phase, 250 HP Rewind TOTAL 7,774.00 7,300.00 9,120.10
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P. 0. BOX 2449 = 4.8 S 5 8
;ST N 5 X L
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 £ R 229 ® S s 8 s
TABULATION OF BIDS E R 2 0 x 2 R o R B o
Egx @ sk £ X £ 8 X 5.0
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Electric Motor Repair < Sk 5 &% z gF L9 = SE~
FOR: Small Motors (3-250 HP) and Large Motors (300 HP and Greater) 2 S 2 23 = 2 2 2 - S 2 s = o
TIVE & January 1, 2009 through December 31, 2009 £ 8 5Z29 2 g2 3 ; = L8 g
DATE: 3:00 p.m., October 31, 2008 <y < 59 3 g o< Eo < S>o &
c d c O N = S O M C o - c L o
ITEM NO DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY 53 H ni=gs) =S 3 S £V S
Total Purchased or Manufactured Parts A
(A1+A2+A3) TOTAL 44,500.00 48,100.00 43,500.00 W 2
< u
Shop and Field Service Requirements 5' UEJ 8
(1 through 6) TOTAL 13,824.00 29,800.00 15,275.00 2 '5 5
o Z T
Recondition and Rewind Requirements 5 fo
(7 through 36) TOTAL 128,704.00 145,200.00 141,173.12 < 8 &
% % »
TOTAL CONTRACT AMOUNT TOTAL 187,028.00 223,100.00 199,948.12
ITEM I LARGE MOTOR REPAIR (300 HP AND UP) UNIT 20,000.00 20,000.00 20,000.00 20,000.00
Purchase or Manufactured Parts PRICE +20% +20% +20% No Bid +20%
Al. Parts purchased for repairs and invoiced to SAW S (Handling) TOTAL 24,000.00 24,000.00 24,000.00 24,000.00
UNIT 5,000.00 5,000.00 5,000.00 5,000.00
PRICE -10% -10% -10% No Bid -10%
A2. Parts manufactured by motor service center and invoiced to SAWS  |TOTAL 4,500.00 4,500.00 4,500.00 4,500.00
UNIT
PRICE
A3. ITEM DELETED TOTAL
Shop and Field Service Requirements UNIT
Est. 150 hrs. PRICE 28.80 65.00 32.50 No Bid 91.70
1. In Shop Repair Regular Time TOTAL 4,320.00 9,750.00 4,875.00 13,755.00
UNIT
Est. 20 hrs. PRICE 48.00 85.00 48.75 No Bid 119.71
2. In Shop Repair Overtime TOTAL 960.00 1,700.00 975.00 2,394.20
UNIT
PRICE
3. ITEM DELETED TOTAL
UNIT
PRICE
4. ITEM DELETED TOTAL
UNIT
Est. 40 hrs. PRICE 28.80 105.00 32.50 No Bid 95.00
5. Machine Shop Labor Regular time TOTAL 1,152.00 4,200.00 1,300.00 3,800.00
UNIT
Est. 10 hrs. PRICE 48.00 65.00 48.75 No Bid 123.00
6. Machine Shop Labor Overtime TOTAL 480.00 650.00 487.50 1,230.00
Recondition and Rewind UNIT
2 Units PRICE 2,578.00 2,800.00 4,591.17 No Bid 3,331.15
7. Three-Phase, 300 HP Recondition TOTAL 5,156.00 5,600.00 9,182.34 6,662.30
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PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Electric Motor Repair < SF 5 &% z gF L9 = EE~
FOR: Small Motors (3-250 HP) and Large Motors (300 HP and Greater) 2 S 2 23 = 2 2 2 g2 2 s = o
1%}
TIVE & January 1, 2009 through December 31, 2009 £ 8 SZz9 2 =22 3, B L8 g
DATE: 3:00 p.m., October 31, 2008 <y < 50 3 g o< Eo < S>o &
cdc o N = S O MCc = - c L o
T O © - o c O ®© < — © O <
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY N 4 v w s O 2 = - o N w» =
UNIT
2 Units PRICE 7,811.00 4,000.00 9,902.23 No Bid 14,366.70
8. Three-Phase, 300 HP Rewind TOTAL 15,622.00 8,000.00 19,804.46 28,733.40
UNIT
2 Units PRICE 2,578.00 3,200.00 5,297.37 No Bid 3,797.34
9. Three-Phase, 350 HP Recondition TOTAL 5,156.00 6,400.00 10,594.74 7,594.68
UNIT
2 Units PRICE 7,811.00 4,250.00 10,594.74 No Bid 16,089.92
10. Three-Phase, 350 HP Rewind TOTAL 15,622.00 8,500.00 21,189.48 32,179.84
UNIT
2 Units PRICE 2,606.00 3,600.00 6,136.07 No Bid 4,214.67
11. Three-Phase, 400 HP Recondition TOTAL 5,212.00 7,200.00 12,272.14 8,429.34
UNIT
2 Units PRICE 7,811.00 5,300.00 12,272.13 No Bid 18,180.57
12. Three-Phase, 400 HP Rewind TOTAL 15,622.00 10,600.00 24,544.26 36,361.14
UNIT
2 Units PRICE 2,775.00 4,150.00 6,377.14 No Bid 4,803.96
13. Three-Phase, 450 HP Recondition TOTAL 5,550.00 8,300.00 12,754.28 9,607.92
UNIT
2 Units PRICE 7,884.00 6,000.00 12,754.27 No Bid 20,543.40
14, Three-Phase, 450 HP Rewind TOTAL 15,768.00 12,000.00 25,508.54 41,086.80
UNIT
2 Units PRICE 2,932.00 5,000.00 7,817.37 No Bid 5,579.36
15. Three-Phase, 500 HP Recondition TOTAL 5,864.00 10,000.00 15,634.74 11,158.72
UNIT
2 Units PRICE 7,884.00 6,800.00 17,371.93 No Bid 23,213.59
16. Three-Phase, 500 HP Rewind TOTAL 15,768.00 13,600.00 34,743.86 46,427.18
UNIT
2 Units PRICE 3,024.00 5,800.00 8,702.04 No Bid 6,304.27
17. Three-Phase, 600 HP Recondition TOTAL 6,048.00 11,600.00 17,404.08 12,608.54
UNIT
2 Units PRICE 8,160.00 7,950.00 19,337.86 No Bid 26,462.82
18. Three-Phase, 600 HP Rewind TOTAL 16,320.00 15,900.00 38,675.72 52,925.64
UNIT
2 Units PRICE 3,100.00 6,000.00 9,712.47 No Bid 7,123.52
19. Three-Phase, 700 HP Recondition TOTAL 6,200.00 12,000.00 19,424.94 14,247.04
UNIT
2 Units PRICE 8,900.00 8,350.00 21,583.25 No Bid 28,150.00
20. Three-Phase, 700 HP Rewind TOTAL 17,800.00 16,700.00 43,166.50 56,300.00
UNIT
2 Units PRICE 3,374.00 6,450.00 10,570.66 No Bid 8,120.22
21. Three-Phase, 800 HP Recondition TOTAL 6,748.00 12,900.00 21,141.32 16,240.44
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TIVE & January 1, 2009 through December 31, 2009 £ 8 SZz9 2 =22 3, B L8 g
DATE: 3:00 p.m., October 31, 2008 <y < 50 3 g o< Eo < S>o &
c d c O N = S O M C o - c L o
T O © - o c O ®© < — © O <
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY (2= 2] w40 2 - - o N O =
UNIT
2 Units PRICE 9,630.00 9,000.00 23,490.35 No Bid 30,150.00
22. Three-Phase, 800 HP Rewind TOTAL 19,260.00 18,000.00 46,980.70 60,300.00
UNIT
2 Units PRICE 3,613.00 6,800.00 12,969.48 No Bid 9,175.60
23. Three-Phase, 900 HP Recondition TOTAL 7,226.00 13,600.00 25,938.96 18,351.20
UNIT
2 Units PRICE 10,455.00 10,250.00 28,821.05 No Bid 31,485.00
24. Three-Phase 900 HP Rewind TOTAL 20,910.00 20,500.00 57,642.10 62,970.00
UNIT
2 Units PRICE 3,800.00 7,500.00 14,684.42 No Bid 10,918.25
25. Three-Phase, 1000 HP Recondition TOTAL 7,600.00 15,000.00 29,368.84 21,836.50
UNIT
2 Units PRICE 11,082.00 12,000.00 32,632.63 No Bid 37,152.30
26. Three-Phase, 1000 HP Rewind TOTAL 22,164.00 24,000.00 65,265.26 74,304.60
UNIT
2 Units PRICE 4,488.00 10,000.00 18,252.24 No Bid 12,228.16
27. Three-Phase, 1750 HP Recondition TOTAL 8,976.00 20,000.00 36,504.48 24,456.32
UNIT
2 Units PRICE 14,030.00 17,750.00 45,630.60 No Bid 42,353.28
28. Three-Phase, 1750 HP Rewind TOTAL 28,060.00 35,500.00 91,261.20 84,706.56
Total Purchased or Manufactured Parts No Bid
(A1+A2+A3) TOTAL 28,500.00 28,500.00 28,500.00 28,500.00
Shop and Field Service Requirements No Bid
(1 through 6) TOTAL 6,912.00 16,300.00 7,637.50 21,179.20
*
Recondition and Rewind Requirements No Bid
(7 through 28) TOTAL 272,652.00 305,900.00 679,002.94 727,488.16
*
No Bid
TOTAL CONTRACT AMOUNT 308,064.00 350,700.00 715,140.44 777,167.36
Net 2% Net 2% Net
Terms 30 days 20 days 30 days 20 days 30 days
Delivery Days 20 days 6-8 days 20 days 10 days 20 days
*DENOTES LOW BIDDER 1
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PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Electric Motor Repair

FOR: Small Motors (3-250 HP) and Large Motors (300 HP and Greater)
TIME & January 1, 2009 through December 31, 2009

DATE: 3:00 p.m., October 31, 2008

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

San Antonio Armature Works

1015 N. Colorado

San Antonio, TX 78207

Electric Motor Rewind, L.P.
102 S. Navigation Blvd.

Corpus Christi, TX 78405

Massengale Armature Works,

Inc.

1031 Basse Rd.

San Antonio, TX 78212

Paramount Electric Motors

2114 S. Flores St.

San Antonio, TX 78204

Integrated Power Services

1500 East Main

LaPorte, TX 77571

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY

Electric Motor Rewind

Intgrated Power Services

Loyd Armature Works
Massengale Armature Works, Inc.
Paramount Electric Motors

San Antonio Armature Works

SAWS Website




