
 07-7064

F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Various Small Utility Type Vehicles and 
FOR: Various Types of Pickups
TIME &  
DATE: 3:00 p.m., October 5, 2007  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

3 ea. UNIT *
6,200 GVWR, 4x4 sport utility type vehicle, 8 cylinder, 4-door, PRICE 26,440.00 28,000.00

1. 4-wheel drive, per specification TOTAL 79,320.00 84,000.00 NO BID
 Chev. 
MFR. Trailblazer Ford

 Manufacturer Make/Mode MODEL CT15506 Explorer U73
4 ea. UNIT *
4,300 GVWR, 4x2 sport utility type vehicle, 6 cylinder, PRICE 23,400.00 22,500.00

2. 4-door, 2-wheel drive, per specification TOTAL 93,600.00 90,000.00 NO BID
 Chev. 
MFR. Trailblazer Ford

Manufacturer Make/Model MODEL CS15506 Escape U03
10 ea. UNIT *
6,300 GVWR (minimum) wide and long type bed (no fender outside) PRICE 19,187.75 18,943.00 19,240.00

3. standard cab pickup, per specification TOTAL 191,877.50 189,430.00 192,400.00 NO BID
 Chev. 
MFR. 08 Ford Silverado Ford

Manufacturer Make/Model MODEL F150 CC10903 F150 F12
4 ea. UNIT *
9,000 GVWR (minimum) 4x4 wide and short type bed (no fender outside) PRICE 37,440.00 37,200.00

4. crew cab/quad cab pickup, per specification TOTAL 149,760.00 148,800.00 NO BID
 Chev. Ford 
MFR. Silverado F250 

Manufacturer Make/Model MODEL CK20743 Crewcab
3 ea. UNIT *
9,000 GVWR (minimum) wide and long type bed (no fender outside) single PRICE 27,035.92 28,141.00 28,194.38 34,800.00 31,200.00 26,728.00

5. rear wheel, extended/club/super cab pickup trucks, per specification TOTAL 81,107.76 84,423.00 84,583.14 104,400.00 93,600.00 80,184.00
 
MFR. 08 Dodge Dodge Ram 08 Ford Chev. Ford Ford

Manufacturer Make/Model MODEL DH2L42 D13L42 F250 Ext Cab F250 F250 XL
 

Net Net Net Net Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

  
 
Delivery 70-75 days 160 days 90 days As Specified As Needed 21 days

*DENOTES LOW BIDDER

  BID INVITATIONS WERE MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Alamo Toyota Jordan Ford Demandstar
Ancira Motor Co. McKinney Dodge SAWS Website
Bluebonnet Chrysler Dodge Northside Ford
Brown Chevrolet Planet Ford 6
Caldwell Country Chev. Red Mccombs Dodge
Cavender Chev. Red McCombs Ford
Columbus Country Red McCombs Toyota/Ford
Dodge Superstore Southway Ford
Fiesta One Lincoln Mercury, Ltd. Tom Benson Chev.
Grande Ford Universal Toyota
Jennings Anderson Ford
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