
 09-5053

F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Pump Repairs
FOR: Submersible Sump Pump and Centrifugal Pumps
TIME & (Date of Award through September 30, 2010)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., September 17, 2009  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Item 1 ELECTRIC SUBMERSIBLE/SUMP PUMPS UNIT *  
Approximately 600 hours PRICE 32.50 62.50 No Bid 83.00

1. Standard Labor Rate TOTAL 19,500.00 37,500.00 49,800.00
 UNIT
Approximately 40 hours PRICE 46.50 72.50 No Bid 124.00

2. Overtime Labor Rate (Prior approval of SAWS) TOTAL 1,860.00 2,900.00 4,960.00
*

TOTAL TOTAL 21,360.00 40,400.00 No Bid 54,760.00

Parts & Material COST
Cost Plus PLUS 30% 20% No Bid 15%

Item 2 CENTRIFUGAL PUMPS UNIT *
Approximately 200 hours PRICE 32.50 62.50 65.00 83.00
Standard Labor Rate TOTAL 6,500.00 12,500.00 13,000.00 16,600.00

UNIT
Approximately 20 hrs. PRICE 46.40 72.50 97.50 124.00
Overtime Labor Rate (Prior approval of SAWS) TOTAL 928.00 1,450.00 1,950.00 2,480.00

*

TOTAL TOTAL 7,428.00 13,950.00 14,950.00 19,080.00

Parts & Material COST
Cost Plus PLUS 30% 20% 15% 15%

Net 1% Net Net
 Terms 30 days 20 days 30 days 30 days

Delivery Days

*DENOTES LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY

Austin Armature Works ITT Water & Wastewater USA SAWS Website
B&P Process Equipment Loyd Armature Works
DXP Massengale Armature Works
Electric Motor Rewind Odessa Pumps & Equipment
Integrated Power Services San Antonio Armature Works
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