
 08-8029

F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL

FOR: Purchase of Trailers
TIME &

DATE: 3:00 p.m., June 12, 2008  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

UNIT *
1 ea. PRICE

1. Trailer, 35 Ton, per specification TOTAL 39,625.00 42,900.00 43,539.00 52,280.00 64,418.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
 

 Mfr. Pitts Ent. Evans 35-Ton McLendon Trailers  Trail-Eze Trailers Twamco  
 Manufacturer and Mode MODEL HD35 Hyd. Tail Lowboy HT-35 TE70HT STLBHTHT2

UNIT *
54 ea. PRICE 18,100.00 17,900.00 17,497.00 22,140.00  15,200.00 16,659.00 17,000.00 19,743.00

2. Trailer for Tractor-Loader Backhoe, complete, per specification TOTAL 977,400.00 966,600.00 944,838.00 1,195,560.00 No Bid 820,800.00 899,586.00 918,000.00 1,066,122.00
 
Mfr. Pitts Ent. Evans 35-Ton McLendon Trail-Eze Trailers SW Gooseneck Interstate Trailers Ace Welding  Felling Trailers

Manufacturer and Model MODEL TA20 DO15A TE24R PHD2486222.5KA 40DLA A-8-12 FT-30-2

0% Net Net Net Net Net 0% Net 2%
Terms 20 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 20 days 30 days 20 days

 Before
Delivery 90 days 11/15/08 110 days 120 days By 12/15/08 180 days  12/15/08

*DENOTES LOW BIDDER
 
BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Ace Trailer Pitts Trailers Demandstar 
AG-Con Equipment Pitts Trailers SAWS Website
Cooper Equip. Co. Royall Matthiessen Equip.
Fruehauf Trailer Operations RSC
Green Mountain Equip. & Rental Southwest Gooseneck
Holt Co. of TX Southwest Trailer
Interstate Trailers, Inc. Texana Machinery
John Evans Mfg. Co. Twamco Trailer Co.
KP Trailer Washington County Tractor, Inc.
Magnum Trailer Parts & Equip.
McLendon Trailers
NES Industrial Service
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