
08-8038
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Purchase of Ultrasonic Data Collector SDT170MD Hand Held Instrument and 
FOR: All-Test IV PRO 2000 Unit with the Emcat Pro 2005 Software Suite 
TIME &  
DATE: 3:00 p.m., July 16, 2008
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2 ea. UNIT (*Included inKit)
SDT 170 MD Multi Functional Data Collector Kit PRICE 8,000.00

I. Part No. FS170MDUS analysis system or and approved equal TOTAL 16,000.00 NO BID
 UNIT  
 PRICE  

 SDT 170 Mult Functional/Data Collector; Part No. FU170MD TOTAL *Included NO BID
 UNIT  
 PRICE  

 Power Pack; Part No. FUBP170MH2 TOTAL *Included NO BID
 UNIT  
 PRICE  

 Broadband Contact Probe with cable; Part No. FSSON170US TOTAL *Included NO BID
 UNIT  
 PRICE  

 Headphone - Neckband or Standard; Part No. FUHEADPH1 TOTAL *Included NO BID
 UNIT  
 PRICE  

 Power Charger 110V; Part No. FUPS170US TOTAL *Included NO BID
UNIT  

 PRICE  
 Sholder Strap; Part No. FUSTRAP TOTAL *Included NO BID

 UNIT  
 PRICE  

 Cable RS232 to PC (Serial); Part No. FUCABRS232/170 TOTAL *Included NO BID
UNIT  

 PRICE  
 Carrying Case; Part No. FUSUITSYS3-2 TOTAL *Included NO BID

UNIT  
 PRICE  

 Precision Indicator; Part No. FSPRECIND TOTAL *Included NO BID
 UNIT  
 PRICE  

 CD-Rom Data Manager Software; Part No. FUSOFTDATAMAN1 TOTAL *Included NO BID
 UNIT  
 PRICE  

 Recommended Accessores TOTAL NO BID
 UNIT  
 PRICE 195.00

 Leather Belt Holster SDT170; Part No. FSBELT170 TOTAL 390.00 NO BID
UNIT  

 PRICE 575.00
 Flexible Sensor (21-inch/55 mm); Part No. FSFLEX556/170 TOTAL 1,150.00 NO BID
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UNIT  
PRICE 595.00

Magnetic Sensor; Part No. FSSENSMAG/BNC/170 TOTAL 1,190.00 NO BID
UNIT  
PRICE 200.00

Acoustic Grease Gun Adaptor; Part No. FSLUBADP1 TOTAL 400.00 NO BID
UNIT  
PRICE 295.00

Extended Distance Sensor; Part No. FUEDS01 TOTAL 590.00 NO BID
UNIT  

Acoustic Vibration Monitor (AVM) Ultraanalysis Kit - Time Waveform and PRICE 995.00
Spectra Analysis; Part No. FSAVM05US TOTAL 1,990.00 NO BID

UNIT  
PRICE  

SDT 2 1/2 day Ultrasound Training (see Pg. 5 for description) TOTAL 6,895.00 NO BID
*

TOTAL ITEM I 28,605.00
All-Test Pro IV 2000 UNIT *

PRICE 9,955.00
II. All-Test IV PRO 2000 Accessory Kit 115V TOTAL NO BID 19,910.00

UNIT
PRICE

Table Top Charger TOTAL NO BID
UNIT
PRICE

Battery Charger TOTAL NO BID
UNIT
PRICE

Test Leads with Clamps TOTAL NO BID
UNIT
PRICE

Interface Cable TOTAL NO BID
 UNIT

PRICE
CD which includes ATIV Manual, Trend Software TOTAL NO BID

UNIT
PRICE

MCA Analysis Manual TOTAL NO BID
UNIT
PRICE

Hard Shell Case with Foam Pockets TOTAL NO BID
UNIT
PRICE 3,745.00

EMCAT PRO 2005 TOTAL NO BID 7,490.00
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UNIT
3 Day (factory representative) training to be held at a San Antonio Water PRICE
System Head Quarters facility TOTAL NO BID 12,470.00

*

TOTAL TOTAL  39,870.00

Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days

Delivery Days 15-17 days 14 days
 

*DENOTES LOW BIDDER

BIDS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY

All-Test Pro, LLC Demandstar
Astar, LLC SAWS Website
Kemp Instruments, Inc.
Reliability Point
SDT North America
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