
09-9039
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Purchase of Various Trucks with Mounted Service Body and 
FOR: Other Equipment
TIME &  
DATE: 3:00 p.m., June 11, 2009  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

2 ea. *

8,600 GVWR Cargo Van complete, per specifications UNIT PRICE 23,613.64 24,565.00 23,746.00 24,440.00 24,908.00 25,581.74 26,155.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid
 TOTAL 47,227.28 49,130.00 47,492.00 48,880.00 49,816.00 51,163.48 52,311.90    

1. State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Ford E250 2009 E250 Chev Express Van Ford E250 Ford E150 2010 Ford E250 2010 CG23405 Chev    
9 ea. *

9,600 GVWR (minimum), single rear wheel, two wheel drive, regular cab truc UNIT PRICE 25,011.05 24,199.00 26,930.00 26,116.00 26,355.00 27,110.77 28,195.22 No Bid No Bid 28,269.00
with installed service body, complete, per specifications TOTAL 225,099.45 217,791.00 242,370.00 235,044.00 237,195.00 243,996.93 253,756.98   254,421.00

2. State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Ford F250 2010 Ford F350 Chev. CC30903 Ford F350 Ford F350 2010 Ford F350 Chev CC30903   Ford F350
6 ea.  3 ea Uninverted * No Inverter No Inverter  
19,000 GVWR (minimum) 84" CA, cab chassis with installed reinforced utility UNIT PRICE 65,526.23 62,929.00 No Bid 63,971.0 66,482.0 64,749.99 No Bid 96,825.0 71,939.81 68,498.00
bed, 6,000 pound corner mounted crane TOTAL 196,578.69 377,574.00 383,826.00 199,446.00 194,249.97  580,950.00 431,638.86 410,988.00
State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Ford F550 2010 Ford F550 Ford F550 Ford F550 2010 Ford F550  2009 GMC TC5500  Ford F550

 3 ea Inverted  With Inverter With Inverter     
UNIT PRICE 66,135.58 67,092.00 65,531.99     
TOTAL 198,406.74 201,276.00 196,595.97     
MAKE/MODEL Ford F550 Ford F550 2010 Ford F550     

 
3. TOTAL  394,985.43 400,722.00 390,845.94     

1 ea.  *
9,600 GVWR (minimum), single rear wheel, two wheel drive, extended cab UNIT PRICE

truck with installed service body, complete, per specification TOTAL 34,356.17 32,857.00 36,116.00 34,947.00 35,664.00 36,663.67 37,833.93 No Bid No Bid 36,998.00
4. State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Ford F350 2010 Ford F250 Chev. CC30953 Ford F250 Ford F350 2010 Ford F350 Chev CC30953   Ford F350

1 ea.  *
9,600 GVWR (minimum), single rear wheel two wheel drive, standard ca UNIT PRICE

truck with installed service body, and 1,300 lb powered lift gate complete, per specification TOTAL 33,694.09 32,397.00 No Bid 35,884.0 35,172.00 36,872.67 No Bid No Bid No Bid 37,110.00
5. State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Ford F350 2010 Ford F350 Ford F350 Ford F350 2010 Ford F350    Ford F350

1 ea.  *
9,600 GVWR (minimum), single rear wheel , two wheel drive, standard cab truck with UNIT PRICE

installed service body and canopy, per specifications TOTAL 32,030.57 30,717.00 No Bid 33,741.00 33,491.00 35,192.67 No Bid No Bid No Bid 40,310.00
6. State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Ford 2010 Ford F350 Ford F350 Ford F350 2010 Ford F350    Ford F350

6 ea.  *
9,600 GVWR (minimum), single rear wheel, two wheel drive, standard cab truck with UNIT PRICE 31,968.57 30,617.00 No Bid 31,584.00 33,392.00 33,962.67 No Bid No Bid No Bid 34,698.00
installed service body, complete, per specifications TOTAL 191,811.42 183,702.00 189,504.00 200,352.00 203,776.02    208,188.00

7. State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Ford F350 2010 F350 Ford F350 Ford F350 2010 Ford F350    Ford F350

Net Net Net Net 0% Net Net Net Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 20 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

Delivery Days 60-90 days 120-180 days As Specified As Specified 90-120 days 90-120 days 65 days 150 days 100-140 days

*DENOTES LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS WERE MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY
 
Alamo Toyota Grande Truck Center Demandstar
Ancira Motor Co. Jennings Anderson Ford Sales, Ltd. SAWS Website
Bluebonnet Motors, Inc. Jordan Ford
Brown Chevrolet Planet Ford
Caldwell Country Chevrolet Red McCombs Dodge
Cavender Chev Red McCombs Toyota/Ford
Columbus Country Rush Truck Centers of TX
Dodge Superstore Southway Ford
Equipment Technology, LLC Tom Benson Chevrolet
Grand Prairie Ford Universal Toyota
Grande Ford Wolfe Ford Dodge
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