
08-8041
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  
FOR: Various Types of Large Trucks
TIME &  
DATE: 3:00 p.m., July 11, 2008  
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

1 ea. *

19,000 GVWR (minimum) 84" CA, cab chassis with installed reinforced UNIT PRICE      
utility bed, 6,000 lb. corner mounted crane and a mounted air compressor TOTAL 66,311.00 74,493.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

1. State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL 09 Ford F550 Ford F550   
2 ea. *
25,000 GVWR cab chassis crew cab, 84" CA with installed body and UNIT PRICE 86,941.00
2,000 lb. crane TOTAL 173,882.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

2. State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL 09 Ford F750  
1 ea. UNIT PRICE *
33,000 GVWR cab chassis with mounted two man aerial lift body (single cab) TOTAL 130,327.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

3. State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL 09 Ford F750  
2 ea. *
50,000 GVWR cab chassis with mounted hydraulic dump body and other UNIT PRICE 80,951.00 82,847.00 79,685.00 80,565.00
equipment (10 cubic yard water level capacity) single cab TOTAL 161,902.00 NO BID 165,694.00 159,370.00 161,130.00

4. State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL 09 Sterling Acterra  Int'l 7400 Freightliner M2-106 Sterling Acterra
1 ea. *
65,000 GVWR tractor cab and chassis with installed air slide fifth wheel, UNIT PRICE   
wet kit (single cab) TOTAL 109,945.00 NO BID 117,962.00 117,973.00 109,519.00

5. State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL 09 Sterling LT9500  Int'l 7600 Freightliner FLD 120 Sterling LT9500

Net Net Net Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

Delivery Days 120-190 days As Specified 190 days

*DENOTES LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS WERE MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY
 
Alamo Toyota Jennings Anderson Frd Demandstar
Ancira Motor Co. Jordan Ford SAWS Website
Bluebonnet Chrysler Dodge Planet Ford
Brown Chev. Red McCombs Dodge
Caldwell Country Chev. Red McCombs Toyota/Ford
Cavender Chev. Santex Truck Center
Columbus Country Southway Ford
Dodge Superstore Sterling & Western Star of Austin, Ltd.
Freightliner of SA Tom Benson Chev.
Grande Ford Universal Toyota
Grande Truck Center
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