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2 ea. X
6,300 GVWR (minimum) 4x4 wide and short type bed (no fender UNIT PRICE 24,242.00 28,325.00 24,702.75 NO BID 25,460.00 25,941.00
outside) crew cab/quad cab/double cab/super crew cab pickup TOTAL 48,484.00 56,650.00 49,405.50 50,920.00 51,882.00
1. State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Dodge Ram 2500 08 Ford F150 super crew | Chev CK10543 Chev. CK10543 Ford F150 W14
lea. ALTERNATE BID *
9,000 GVWR (minimum) wide and long type bed (no fender outside UNIT PRICE
single rear wheel, crew cab/quad cab pickup trucl TOTAL 28,344.00 29,510.00 28,077.00 29,231.16 28,838.00 29,741.00 26,437.00
2. State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Dodge Ram 2500 Dodge Ram 2500 | 08 Ford F250 crew cab Chev. 08 Ford F350 XL| Chev. CC20943 Ford F250 W20
6 ea. *
9,600 GVWR (minimum) single rear wheel, two wheel drive, regular UNIT PRICE NO BID 25,284.00 25,204.02 28,146.00 27,672.00 25,591.00
cab truck with installed serivce bod: TOTAL 151,704.00 151,224.12 168,876.00 166,032.00 153,546.00
3. State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL 08 Ford F350 reg cab | Chev. CC30903 [09 Ford F350 XL | Chev CC30903 Ford F350 F30
1ea. *
11,400 GVWR (minimum) dual-rear wheel, 2x4 extended cab trucl UNIT PRICE
with installed service bod' TOTAL 36,549.00 36,823.00 37,425.29 38,904.00 39,733.00 37,336.00
4. State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Dodge Ram 2500 C/C 08 Ford F350 ext cab 09 Ford F350 Chev. CC30953 Ford F350 X36
1ea. *
15,000 GVWR (minimum) 60" CA cab chassis with installed utility UNIT PRICE NO BID NO BID
bed and a mounted gasoline powered welder TOTAL 46,915.00 48,176.00 53,330.00 47,373.00
5. State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL 08 Ford F450 09 Ford F450 Chev. CC40042 Ford F450 F46
0% Net Net Net Net Net
Terms 20 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days
Delivery Days 120 days 60-120 days 90-110 days 105 days 105 days
*DENOTES LOW BIDDER
BID INVITATIONS WERE MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
Alamo Toyota Jennings Anderson Frd Demandstar
Ancira Motor Co. Jordan Ford SAWS Website

Bluebonnet Chrysler Dodge
Brown Chev.

Caldwell Country Chev
Cavender Chev.

Columbus Country

Dodge Superstore

Grande Ford

Grande Truck Center

Mission Chrysler, Jeep, Dodge

Planet Ford

Red McCombs Dodge

Red McCombs Toyota/Ford
Southway Ford

Tom Benson Chev.
Universal Toyote




