
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 10-1036
 

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  

FOR: Purchase of Various Types of Vehicles and Trucks

TIME &  

DATE: 3:00 p.m., June 11, 2010
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

13 ea. *    

5,700 GVWR, 4x2 sport utility type vehicle, 6 cylinder, 4 door, 2 wheel drive, UNIT PRICE 19,597.00 19,961.00 20,266.75 23,900.00

per specifications TOTAL 254,761.00 259,493.00 263,467.75 310,700.00 NO BID

A. State Make, Model MAKE/MODEL 2010 Ford Explorer Ford U6D Explorer 2010 Ford U6D Chev. Equinox

2 ea. *

6,300 GVWR (minimum) 4x4 wide and short type bed (no fender outside), UNIT PRICE 22,179.00 22,181.00 22,616.75 23,600.00

extended, club, super club pickup truck, per specifications TOTAL 44,358.00 44,362.00 45,233.50 47,200.00 NO BID

B. State Make, Model MAKE/MODEL 2010 Ford F150 Ford F150 2010 Ford F150 Chev 1500 Silverado

1 ea. *

6,300 GVWR (minimum) 4x2 wide and short type bed (no fender outside), club, UNIT PRICE     

super cab pickup truck, per specifications TOTAL 26,369.00 18,940.00 19,611.75 19,880.00 NO BID

C. State Make, Model MAKE/MODEL 2010 Ford F150 Ford F150 2010 Ford F150 Chev Silverado

10 ea. *

6,400 GVWR (minimum) wide and short type bed (no fender outside) extended UNIT PRICE 18,899.00 18,890.00 19,704.75 19,770.00

club, super cab pickup truck, per specifications TOTAL 188,990.00 188,900.00 197,047.50 197,700.00 NO BID

D. State Make, Model MAKE/MODEL 2010 Ford F150 Ford F150 2010 Ford F150 Chev 1500  

2 ea. *

6,400 GVWR (minimum) wide and long type bed (no outside fenders) standard UNIT PRICE 17,247.00 16,937.00 17,719.75 18,600.00

cab pickup, per specifications TOTAL 34,494.00 33,874.00 35,439.50 37,200.00 NO BID

E. State Make, Model MAKE/MODEL 2010 Ford F150 Ford F150 Ford F150 Chev 1500

3 ea. *

9,600 GVWR (minimum) single rear wheel, two wheel drive, regular cab truck UNIT PRICE 25,443.00 25,331.00 24,850.75 27,100.00

with installed service body, per specifications TOTAL 76,329.00 75,993.00 74,552.25 81,300.00 NO BID

F. State Make, Model MAKE/MODEL 2010 Ford F250 Ford F250 2011 F250 Chev 3500

Net Net Net Net

Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

Delivery Days

*DENOTES LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS WERE MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

 

Alamo Toyota Hertz Equipment Rental Demandstar

Ancira Motor Co. Holiday Ford SAWS Website

Blubonnet Chrysler Dodge Jennings Anderson Ford

Brown Chevrolet Jordan Ford

Caldwell Country Chevrolet Planet Ford

Cavender Chevrolet Red McCombs Dodge

Columbus Country Red McCombs Toyota/Ford

Dodge Superstore Southway Ford

Grande Ford Tom Benson Chevrolet

Grande Truck Center Universal Toyota
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