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150 ea. (SAWS #16282; UNIT 186.00 215.0C 197.61 302.81
Strainer for 2" turbine water metet PRICE 27,900.00 32,250.0C 29,641.5C No Bid 45,421.5C
1. Make & Model Quoting TOTAL Elster-HSB5921 Bronze Strainer Badger Plate Strainer Eliptical Bronze AMCO HSB5921 Neptune
40 ea. (SAWS #16283 UNIT 271.00 277.0C 370.75 435.63
Strainer for 3" turbine water metet PRICE 10,840.00 No Bid 11,080.0C 14,830.0C 17,425.2C
2. Make & Model Quoting TOTAL Elster-HSB5922 Bronze Strainer AMCO HSD5922 Hersey Brz Neptune
25ea. (SAWS #16284 UNIT 162.84 433.50 553.2C 563.13
Strainer for 4" turbine water metet PRICE 4,071.00 No Bid 10,837.5C 13,830.0C 14,078.25
3. Make & Model Quoting TOTAL Elster-HSE5922 Bronze Strainer AMCO HSE5922 Hersey Brz Neptune
15 ea. (SAWS #16285, UNIT 677.0C 625.00 669.5C 886.6C 1,073.12
Strainer for 6" turbine water metet PRICE 10,155.0C 9,375.00 10,042.5C 13,299.0C 16,096.95
4. Make & Model Quoting TOTAL Elster-HSG5922 Bronze Strainer AMCO HSG5922 Hersey Brz Neptune
5ea. (SAWS #16286) UNIT DOES NOT DOES NOT 1,252.00 1,962.77 [a) [a)
Strainer for 8" turbine water metet PRICE MEET No Bid MEET 6,260.00 9,813.85 ) )
5. Make & Model Quoting TOTAL SPECIFICATIONS SPECIFICATIONS Hersey CI Neptune (@) (@)
=z =z
2ea. (SAWS #16281) UNIT DOES NOT DOES NOT NOT NOT
Strainer for 10" turbine water metel PRICE MEET No Bid MEET APPROVED APPROVED
6. Make & Model Quoting TOTAL SPECIFICATIONS SPECIFICATIONS
Neptune
Manufacturer Alster AMCO Water, Inc. Badger Meter, Inc. AMCO Water Hersey Meters Technology
Price Sheet Upon Request Disc. 2009 Retail Price Shee
Date March 29, 201(C April 5, 201C July 1, 2008
Discount N/A 35% 20%
TOTAL ITEMS
1,2&3 TOTAL ITEM 4 TOTAL ITEM 5
TOTAL TOTAL 42,811.00 9,375.00 6,260.00
EXTENSION 1 42,811.00 9,375.00 6,260.00
EXTENSION 2 42,811.00 9,375.00 6,260.00
EXTENSION 3 42,811.00 9,375.00 6,260.00
Net Net Net 2% Net
Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 20 days 30 days
Delivery Days Stk 30 days ARO 10 days 15 days 14-21 days
*DENOTES LOW BIDDER
BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY
Act Pipe & Supply Mueller Systems Demandstar
Badger Meter, Inc. Municipal Water Works SAWS Website

Elster AMCO Water, Inc.
Ferguson

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.
Hersey Meters

Master Meter

Morrison Supply

Neptune Technology Group
Performance Meter, Inc.
PMI Steel Pipe

USA Blue Book

William Supply Co.




